SISLER-MAGGARD ENGINEERING, PLLC
220 EAST REYNOLDS ROAD, SUITE A3

LEXINGTON, KY 40517
e (859) 271-2978
%,,neemq',& Fax (859) 271-5670 RECE|\/ED
Email: sme@sislermaggard.com
0CT 17 2016
Public Service
October 14, 2016 Commission

Kentucky Public Service Commission
211 Sower Blvd.

PO Box 615

Frankfort, Ky. 40602

Attn: Ms. Renee Smith, Docket Branch Manager

Re: Case No. 2015-00040
Rattlesnake Ridge Water District
SME #13020 McConnell Branch Water Tank Replacement

Dear Ms. Smith:

Per your request to Mr. Randy Jones, Bond Counsel, we have enclosed
herewith, the following:

1) Email of Douglas Hoff — RDS at Rural Development- Morehead with
statement of total project cost of $670,000.

2) Sisler-Maggard Engineering, PLLC certification letter of construction
completion.

3) Record Drawings on disc with hard copy.

If you have any questions, please don'’t hesitate to call.
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Enclosures

Cc: Randy Jones w/letter
W.C. Gilbert w/letter
Doug Hoff



SISLER-MAGGARD ENGINEERING, PLLC
220 EAST REYNOLDS ROAD, SUITE A3
LEXINGTON, KY 40517
(859) 271-2978
Fax (859) 271-5670
Email: sme@sislermaggard.com

October 11, 2016

Commonwealth of Kentucky RECE\\IED

Natural Resources and Environmental Protection Cabinet

Division of Water, Infrastructure Branch 0CT 117 016
Drinking Water Branch . BehicD
300 Sower Blvd., 3" Floor publie S0
Frankfort, KY 40601 P

Attn: Terry Humphries, P.E.
Ref: DW # 0220555-14-001
Rattlesnake Ridge Water District — Phase X Water System Improvements
100,000 Gallon Elevated Water Tank Replacement
SME #13020
To Whom it May Concern:
Please reference your approval letter of November 14, 2014.
We hereby certify to the best of our knowledge and belief that this project
has been constructed substantially in accordance with the approved plans,
specifications, and change orders.

We have enclosed herewith a DVD of the Record Drawings of Contract |-1
for your files.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call.

enclosure

JFS/jm

cc/RRWD, PSC w/enclosure disk



joe

—
From: (\m@ RD, Morehead, KY <douglas.hoff@ky.usda.gov>

Sent: Thursday, October 6, 2016 2:19 PM

To: joe

Subject: RE: Case No. 2015-00040 Rattlesnake Ridge Water District - Information Due

RRWD shall file with the Commission documentation of the total costs of this project, including the cost of
construction and all other capitalized costs

S S

$670,000

From: joe [mailto:joe@sislermaggard.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 06, 2016 11:30 AM

To: Hoff, Douglas - RD, Morehead, KY <douglas.hoff@ky.usda.gov>

Subject: FW: Case No. 2015-00040 Rattlesnake Ridge Water District - Information Due
Importance: High

Good luck! Call me.

Joseph F. Sisler, P.E., P.L.S.
President

Sisler-Maggard Engineering, PLIC
220 East Reynolds Road, Suite A3
Lexington, KY 40517

Cell: (859) 509-3800

Phone: (859) 271-2978

Fax: (859) 271-5670

E-mail: Joe@SislerMaggard.com

From: Randy Jones [mailto:wrjones@rubinhays.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 6, 2016 11:15 AM

To: joe

Subject: FW: Case No. 2015-00040 Rattlesnake Ridge Water District - Information Due
Importance: High

Please respond to this PSC request.
Thanks

Randy Jones

W. Randall Jones, Esq.

Rubin & Hays

450 South Third Street, Suite 300
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
Phone: (502) 569-7534

Fax: (502) 569-7555

email: wrjones@rubinhays.com

From: Smith, Renee C (PSC) [mailto:ReneeC.Smith@ky.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 05, 2016 2:18 PM




To: Randy Jones; bernie.rrwd@windstream.net; rrwd@windstream.net
Subject: Case No. 2015-00040 Rattlesnake Ridge Water District - Information Due
Importance: High

Hello,
I am following up on information due pursuant to Final Order in Case No. 2015-00040.
Per Ordering Paragraph #7:
¢  RRWD shall file with the Commission documentation of the total costs of this project, including the cost of
construction and all other capitalized costs, (e.g., engineering, legal, and administrative) within 60 days of the
date that construction is substantially completed.
Per Ordering Paragraph #8:
e RRWD shall file a copy of the "as-built" drawings and a certified statement from the engineer that the
construction has been satisfactorily completed in accordance with the contract plans and specifications within
60 days of substantial completion of the construction certified herein.
Could you please advise when this information will be submitted to the Commission?

Thank you in advance for responding.

Renee Smith
Docket Branch Manager

This electronic message contains information generated by the USDA solely for the intended recipients. Any
unauthorized interception of this message or the use or disclosure of the information it contains may violate the
law and subject the violator to civil or criminal penalties. If you believe you have received this message in error,
please notify the sender and delete the email immediately.



