
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 

Andy Beshear 
Governor 
 
Rebecca W. Goodman 
Secretary 
Energy and Environment Cabinet 
 
 

Kent A. Chandler 
Chairman 

 
Mary Pat Regan 

Commissioner  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Commonwealth of Kentucky 
Public Service Commission 

211 Sower Blvd. 
P.O. Box 615 

Frankfort, Kentucky 40602-0615 
Telephone: (502) 564-3940 

Fax: (502) 564-3460 
psc.ky.gov 

 
 
 
 

October 24, 2022 
 
 
 
PARTIES OF RECORD 
 
Re: Case No. CASE NO. 2021-00206 
 
Notice is given to all parties that the attached email has been filed into the record of this 
proceeding.   
 
If you have any comments you would like to make regarding the contents of the email, 
please do so within five days of receipt of this letter.  If you have any questions, please 
contact Kurt Kruthoffer, Staff Attorney III at (502) 782-2517 or Kurt.Kruthoffer@ky.gov. 
 
 
 

Sincerely,  
 
 
 
Linda C. Bridwell, PE 
Executive Director 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attachment: Email 
 
 



:

From: mcwdshannon@gmail.com <mcwdshannon@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 12:05 PM
To: Kruthoffer, Kurt (PSC) <kurt.kruthoffer@ky.gov>
Subject: RE: Morgan County Water District

I hope your feeling better. I will get them paid.

Thank you.

Shannon

From: Kruthoffer, Kurt (PSC) <kurt.kruthoffer@ky.gov> 
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 12:02 PM
To: mcwdshannon@gmail.com
Subject: RE: Morgan County Water District

Shannon,

Morgan District requested permission to pay for 6 zone meter pits back in February 2022.  Scanned
Document (ky.gov)  

The Commission approved those 6 zone meter pits back on March 11, 2022.  Disbursement (ky.gov) 

You can file a request for clarification if you are unsure or pay the invoice so that it’s in the record. 

I apologize for the delay in responding as I’ve been out sick for several days.

Thanks,

Kurt Kruthoffer

From: mcwdshannon@gmail.com <mcwdshannon@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 17, 2022 12:18 PM
To: Kruthoffer, Kurt (PSC) <kurt.kruthoffer@ky.gov>
Subject: Morgan County Water District 
Importance: High

Kurt,
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Thank you for your help in getting our invoices approved from the surcharge account. There were
two others submitted back in May. Both were to Beartraxx for installation of zone meter pits. These
might have already been approved but I just wanted to make sure before I cut a check.
 
Thanks,
<>< 

Shannon W. Elam, MHA
General Manager
 

1009 HWY 172
West Liberty, KY 41472
 
606-743-1204 Office
606-743-9585 Fax
www.morgankywaterdistrict.com
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