KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Response to Staff’s Data Request Set One No. 14
Respondent: Tamaleh Shaeffer
COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.

RESPONSE TO STAFF’S FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION
DATED APRIL 24, 2024

Provide the following information concerning the costs for the preparation of this case:

a. A detailed schedule of expenses incurred to date for the following categories:

(1) Accounting;

(2) Engineering;

(3) Legal;

(4) Consultants; and

(5) Other Expenses (Identify separately).

b. For each category identified in Item 14a, the schedule should include the date of
each transaction, check number or other document reference, the vendor, the hours
worked, the rates per hour, amount, a description of the services performed, and the
account number in which the expenditure was recorded. Provide copies of contracts or
other documentation that support charges incurred in the preparation of this case.

Identify any costs incurred for this case that occurred during the base period.



c. An itemized estimate of the total cost to be incurred for this case. Expenses
should be broken down into the same categories as identified in Item 14a, with an
estimate of the hours to be worked and the rates per hour. Include a detailed explanation
of how the estimate was determined, along with all supporting workpapers and

calculations.

d. Provide monthly updates of the actual costs incurred in conjunction with this
rate case, reported in the manner requested in Items 14a and 14b, and a cumulative total
of cost incurred to date for each category. Updates will be due when Columbia Kentucky
tiles its monthly financial statements with the Commission, through the month of the

public hearing.

Response:

a., b., and c.
Please refer to KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092, Staff 1-14, Attachment A of the response
for the itemized estimate of the total cost to be incurred for this case, and an update
of the actual costs incurred as of May 24, 2024. Page 1 of the attachment presents the
information in the same format as cost-of-service Schedule F-9. The requested detail
for actual costs incurred are presented on Page 2. Please refer to KY PSC Case No.
2024-00092, Staff 1-14, Attachment B, for copies of the supporting invoices. Note,

Columbia anticipates that the majority of costs for this rate case will occur during the



base period. Columbia is deferring the costs for the preparation of this case, and
requesting a one-year amortization as shown in Schedule F-9 (Page 1 of Attachment
A to this response). Please refer to KY PSC Case No. 2024-000092, Staff 1-14,
Attachment C providing copies of the agreements for professional rate case services.
. Columbia will provide monthly updates for actual costs incurred as they become

available.
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KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092

Staff 1-14
Attachment A
Respondent: Shaeffer
Page 1 of 2
COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024 - 00092
TOTAL COMPANY DIRECT RATE CASE EXPENSE
BASE PERIOD: TWELVE MONTHS ENDED AUGUST 31, 2024
FORECASTED TEST PERIOD: TWELVE MONTHS ENDED DECEMBER 31, 2025
DATA:___X__ BASE PERIOD__ X FORECASTED PERIOD SCHEDULE F-9
TYPE OF FILING:___X__ ORIGINAL____ UPDATED PAGE 1 OF 1
WORKPAPER REFERENCE NO(S). WITNESS: SHAEFFER
CURRENT CURRENT
LINE CASE CASE
NO. ITEM OF EXPENSE ACTUALS ESTIMATED
1 CONSULTING:
2 Allocated Cost of Service Study & Rate Design Consulting $88,820 $157,250
3 Cost of Capital Study Consulting 0 55,000
4 Depreciation Study Consulting 33,054 60,000
5 Rate Case Preparation Consulting 495 15,000
6 Total Consulting Services $122,369 $287,250
7
8 LEGAL FEES (Estimated at 1,080.7 hours x $347/hour) $23,787 $375,000
9
10 CUSTOMER NOTIFICATIONS $0 $380,000
11
12 ALL OTHER (Advertising, Printing & Copying, Postage, Travel) $10 $100,000
13
14 TOTAL RATE CASE EXPENSE $146,166 $1,142,250
RATE CASE EXPENSE AMORTIZATION
TOTAL EXPENSE
RATE CASE TO BE AMORTIZED
15 PROJECTED RATE CASE EXPENSE $1,142,250
16 AMORTIZATION PERIOD (YEAR(S)) 1

17 AMORTIZATION EXPENSE 1,142,250




KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092

Staff 1-14
Attachment A
Respondent: Shaeffer
Page 2 of 2
Columbia Gas of Kentucky, Inc.
Case No. 2024-00092
TOTAL COMPANY DIRECT RATE CASE EXPENSE
AS OF MAY 24, 2024
Line Invoice Invoice FERC Payment Rates
No. Category Date Number Account Method Vendor Consultant Hours per Hour Support File Amount
$ $

1 Allocated Cost of Service Study & Rate Design Consulting 2/22/2024 0619-02 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032026270 ATRIUM ECONOMICS, LLC $7,758
2 3/14/2024 0619-03 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032026420 ATRIUM ECONOMICS, LLC See KY PSC Staff 1-14, Attachment B [1] $22,383
3 4/10/2024 0619-04 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032026626 ATRIUM ECONOMICS, LLC $58,680
4 Total Allocated Cost of Service Study & Rate Design Consulting $88,820
5  Cost of Capital Study Consulting No Activity as of May 24, 2024 $0
6  Total Cost of Capital Study Consulting $0
7  Depreciation Study Consulting 1/5/2024 31078 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032025941 GANNETT FLEMING VALUATION AND RATE $550
8 2/2/12024 32157 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032026093 GANNETT FLEMING VALUATION AND RATE See KY PSC Staff 1-14, Attachment B [1] $6,440
9 2/20/2024 32826 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032026267 GANNETT FLEMING VALUATION AND RATE $6,790
10 41112024 34411 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2032026553 GANNETT FLEMING VALUATION AND RATE $19,274
11 Total Depreciation Study Consulting $33,054
12  Rate Case Preparation Consulting 12/31/2023 COL9723682 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012047795 AGILE ONE $33
13 1/31/2024 COL9748591 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012048376 AGILE ONE See KY PSC Staff 1-14, Attachment B [1] $215
14 2/29/2024 COL9774287 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012048961 AGILE ONE $116
15 3/31/2024 COL9800270 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012049645 AGILE ONE $132
14  Total Rate Case Preparation Consulting $495
15 Legal Fees 2/5/2024 653 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012047773 HONAKER LAW OFFICE, PLLC $5,182
16 3/19/2024 738 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012048575 HONAKER LAW OFFICE, PLLC See KY PSC Staff 1-14, Attachment B [1] $6,159
17 4/3/2024 741 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur ACH # 2012048843 HONAKER LAW OFFICE, PLLC $12,446
18 Total Legal Fees $23,787
19 Customer Notifications No Activity as of May 24, 2024 $0
20 Total Customer Notifications $0
21 All Other 5/8/2024 309764 18235440 - NC Reg Asset Rate Case Non-Cur Employee Expense Reimbursement KENTUCKY SECRETARY OF STATE See KY PSC Staff 1-14, Attachment B [1] I $10
22 Total All Other $10
23 Total Rate Case Expenses $146,166

[1] Please see KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092, Staff 1-14, Attachment B for supporting invoice documentation.



ATTACHMENT B



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 1 of 78

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

ALLOCATED COST OF SERVICE
STUDY RATE DESIGN
CONSULTING INVOICES



To NiSource

Invoice

Invoice
Date Issued
Date Due
Currency
PO Number

From

Subject 0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case

Timesheets

Description Duration

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 2 of 78

Atrium-INV 0619-02
February 22 2024

April 7 2024

USD - United States Dollar
46765

Atrium Economics

10 Hospital Center Commons
Suite 400

Hilton Head Island, SC 29926

Unit Price Amount

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Total

Amount Due

Notes:

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Cody Kleckley (24 Jan 2024 - 01 Feb 1.0 (1:00)
2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Greg Macias (03 Jan 2024 - 01 Feb ~ 10.00 (10:00)
2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Ron Amen (03 Jan 2024 - 01 Feb 8.50 (8:30)
2024)
19.50
(19:30)
Subtotal

Total Amount

245.00 $ 245.00

390.00 $3,900.00

425.00 $3,612.50

$7,757.50

$7,757.50

$7,757.50

$7,757.50

10f1



To NiSource
Subject 0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case
Timesheets

Description

Invoice

Invoice
Date Issued
Date Due
Currency
PO Number

From

Duration

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 3 of 78

Atrium-INV 0619-03

March 12 2024

April 26 2024

USD - United States Dollar
46765

Atrium Economics

10 Hospital Center Commons
Suite 400

Hilton Head Island, SC 29926

Unit Price Amount

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Total

Amount Due

Notes:

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case -

Feb 2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case -

Mar 2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case -

2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case -

2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case -

2024)

Chris Hutchinson (08 Feb 2024 -29  23.50 (23:30)

Cody Kleckley (07 Feb 2024 - 01 16.50 (16:30)

Greg Macias (07 Feb 2024 - 02 Mar ~ 11.00 (11:00)

Kara Hounam (14 Feb 2024 - 22 Feb 12.00 (12:00)

Ron Amen (08 Feb 2024 - 29 Feb 8.00 (8:00)

71.00
(71:00)

Subtotal

Total Amount

300.00 $7,050.00
245.00 $4,042.50
390.00 $4,290.00
300.00 $3,600.00
425.00 $3,400.00
$ 22,382.50

$22,382.50

$ 22,382.50
$22,382.50

10f1



To NiSource
Subject 0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case
Timesheets

Description

Invoice

Invoice
Date Issued
Date Due
Currency

From

Duration

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 4 of 78

Atrium-INV 0619-04

April 10 2024

May 10 2024

USD - United States Dollar

Atrium Economics

10 Hospital Center Commons
Suite 400

Hilton Head Island, SC 29926

Unit Price Amount

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Timesheet

Total

Amount Due

Notes:

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Chris Hutchinson (04 Mar 2024 - 26
Mar 2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Cody Kleckley (04 Mar 2024 - 29
Mar 2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Dylan Speer (26 Mar 2024 - 28 Mar
2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Greg Macias (04 Mar 2024 - 29 Mar
2024)

20.75 (20:45)

71.50 (71:30)

12.50 (12:30)

57.50 (57:30)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Kara Hounam (06 Mar 2024 - 28 Mar 6.00 (6:00)

2024)

0619 - Columbia Gas KY 2024 Rate Case - Ron Amen (04 Mar 2024 - 29 Mar
2024)

18.00 (18:00)

186.25
(186:15)

Subtotal

Total Amount

300.00 $6,225.00
245.00 $17,517.50
245.00 $3,062.50
390.00 $22,425.00
300.00 $1,800.00
425.00 $7,650.00
$ 58,680.00

$ 58,680.00

$ 58,680.00

$ 58,680.00

10f1



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 5 of 78

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

COST OF CAPITAL STUDY
CONSULTING INVOICES

No Activity through May 24, 2024



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 6 of 78

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

DEPRECIATION STUDY
CONSULTING INVOICES



o] GANNETT

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 7 of 78

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC

F L E M I N G PO Box 829160, Philadelphia, PA 19182-9160 Federal EN: [ NN
ACH/EFT Payment Information:

Account Name: INEEEEEEEG— /¢ NI

Account No.: NG

Send Remit Info: AccountsReceivable@gfnet.com
Send Audit Inquiries: GovtContractAudit@gfnet.com

Charge to PO 47348/PR 66258.

All Other Inquires Contact the Project Team

NiSource - Columbia Gas of Kentucky Invoice : 0000031078
P.O. Box 117 Invoice Date: 1/5/2024
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 Due Date: 2/4/2024
UNITED STATES Project: 076650
Project Name : NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-
Depr
Bill Term: 01
For Professional Services Rendered Through 12/1/2023
Contract: GFC744550

Contract Name:

Contract Date :

Depreciation Study and Related Consulting Services re 2024 Rate Case

000 - Depreciation Study
Total :

Current Billings

Amount Due This Bill

John J Spanos

NiSource - Columbia Gas of
Kentucky-GFC744550
11/27/2023

Current

Billings
550.00

550.00

550.00
us 550.00




Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 8 of 78

Invoice : 0000031078

000 - Depreciation Study

Rate Labor
Class Hours Rate Amount
John J Spanos 1.50 320.000 480.00
Support Staff 0.50 140.000 70.00
Total Rate Labor 2.00 550.00
Total Bill Task : 000 - Depreciation Study 550.00
Total Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr 550.00

Page: 1



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 9 of 78

NiSource - Columbia Gas of Kentucky Invoice : 0000032157
P.O. Box 117 Invoice Date : 2/2/2024
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 Due Date: 3/3/2024
UNITED STATES Project: 076650
Project Name : NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-
Depr
Bill Term: 01

For Professional Services Rendered For 12/2/2023 Through 12/29/2023

Contract: GFC744550
Contract Name : NiSource - Columbia Gas of
Kentucky-GFC744550
Contract Date: 11/27/2023

Depreciation Study and Related Consulting Services re 2024 Rate Case

Current

Billings
000 - Depreciation Study 6,440.00

Total : 6,440.00

Current Billings 6,440.00
Amount Due This Bill us 6,440.00

John J Spanos

Outstanding Receivables Invoice Number Date Amount Balance Due
0000031078 1/5/2024 550.00 550.00
550.00




Project : 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 10 of 78

Invoice : 0000032157

000 - Depreciation Study

Rate Labor
Class Hours Rate Amount
Assistant Analyst |1 18.50 170.000 3,145.00
John J Spanos 3.00 320.000 960.00
Senior Analyst 9.50 210.000 1,995.00
Senior Technician 1.00 130.000 130.00
Support Staff 1.50 140.000 210.00
Total Rate Labor 33.50 6,440.00
Total Bill Task : 000 - Depreciation Study 6,440.00
Total Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr 6,440.00

Page: 1



o] GANNETT

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 11 of 78

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Cons
F L E M I N G PO Box 829160, Philadelphia, PA 19182-9160 Federal EIN:

Account Name:

nt Information:

" Account No.:

Send Remit Info: AccountsReceivable@gtnet.corn

PO47348/PR66258
Contact - Julie Wozniak - U461933

Send Audit Inquiries: GovtContractAudit@gfnet.com

All Other Inquires Contact the Project Team

NiSource - Columbia Gas of Kentucky Invoice : 0000032826
P.O. Box 117 Invoice Date: 2/20/2024
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 Due Date: 3/21/2024
UNITED STATES Project: 076650
Project Name : NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-
Depr
Bill Term: 01
For Professional Services Rendered For 12/30/2023 Through 1/26/2024
Contract: GFC744550

Contract Name:

Contract Date :
Depreciation Study and Related Consulting Services re 2024 Rate Case

NiSource - Columbia Gas of
Kentucky-GFC744550
11/27/2023

Current
Billings
000 - Depreciation Study 6,790.00
Total : 6,790.00
Current Billings 6,790.00
Amount Due This Bill us 6.790.00
John J Spanos
Outstanding Receivables Invoice Number Date Amount Balance Due
0000031078 1/5/2024 550.00 550.00
0000032157 2/2/2024 6,440.00 6,440.00

6,990.00




KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 12 of 78

Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr Invoice : 0000032826
000 - Depreciation Study
Rate Labor
Class Hours Rate Amount
Assistant Analyst Il 12.50 170.000 2,125.00
John J Spanos 5.00 320.000 1,600.00
Senior Analyst 9.50 210.000 1,995.00
Senior Technician 5.00 130.000 650.00
Support Staff 3.00 140.000 420.00
Total Rate Labor 35.00 6,790.00
Total Bill Task : 000 - Depreciation Study 6,790.00
Total Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr 6,790.00

Page: 1



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 13 of 78

& Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC
F L E M I N G PO Box 829160, Philadelphia, PA 19182 9160 Federal EIN: NN NN

ACH/EFT Payment Information:
Account Namezdﬁfr-

Account No.:
Send Remit Info: AccountsReceivable@gfnet.com
Send Audit Inquiries: GovtContractAudit@gfnet.com

P047348/PR652 58 All Other Inquires Contact the Project Team
Contact - Julie Wozniak - U461933

NiSource - Columbia Gas of Kentucky Invoice : 0000034411
P.O. Box 117 Invoice Date: 4/1/2024
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 Due Date: 5/1/2024
UNITED STATES Project: 076650
Project Name : NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-
Depr
Bill Term: 01

For Professional Services Rendered For 1/27/2024 Through 2/23/2024

Contract: GFC744550
Contract Name: NiSource - Columbia Gas of
Kentucky-GFC744550
Contract Date: 11/27/2023

Depreciation Study and Related Consulting Services re 2024 Rate Case

Current

Billings
000 - Depreciation Study 19,273.85

Total : 19,273.85

Current Billings 19,273.85
Amount Due This Bill us 19.273.85

John J Spanos

Outstanding Receivables Invoice Number Date Amount Balance Due
0000032826 2/20/2024 6,790.00 6,790.00
6,790.00




Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 14 of 78

Invoice : 0000034411

000 - Depreciation Study

Rate Labor
Class Hours Rate Amount
Assistant Analyst Il 27.50 170.000 4,675.00
John J Spanos 16.50 320.000 5,280.00
Senior Analyst 23.00 210.000 4,830.00
Senior Technician 6.00 130.000 780.00
Support Staff 2.00 140.000 280.00
Total Rate Labor 75.00 15,845.00
Expenses
Account / Vendor Cost Multiplier Amount
Meals and Meals Per Diem
Mackenzie P Neiderer 54.55 1.0000 54.55
Transportation - Airfare
M & T BANK, N.A. 3,064.10 1.0000 3,064.10
Transportation - Rental Car
EAN SERVICES LLC 310.20 1.0000 310.20
Total Expenses 3,428.85
Total Bill Task : 000 - Depreciation Study 19,273.85
Total Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr 19,273.85

Page: 1



World Travel, Inc.
1724 West Schuylkill Road
Douglassville, PA 19518

GANNETT FLEMING, INC.
207 Senate Avenue
Camp Hill PA 178011

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 15 of 78

INVOICE #: 193005037
Date: 1/24/2024
Account: 120072100
Page#: 1

PNR Locator: L35Q2G

Traveler Tkt#/Cf# Tvl Dt Itinerary PymtDue By Invoiced Amt Booked Amt
SPANOS/JOHN J 7958686013 02/05/24 MDT-CLT-LEX-PHL 01/24/24 P 1,193.70
VI XO0000000OKXXX0128 American Airlines
Airline Flight Origin Destination Depart  Arrive Depart
American Airlines 5904 Harrisburg PA (Harrisburg Intl) Charlotte NC 0323pP 0521P  02/05/24
American Airlines 5136 Charlotte NC Lexington KY 0615P 0741P  02/05/24
American Airlines 6131 Lexington KY Philadelphia PA 0353P 0550P  02/06/24
SPANOS/JOHN J 0885158812 02/05/24 Service Fee 01/24/24 P 25.00
VI OOOOOOOOOXKAKX0128 ARC Service Fee
Total Amount of Invoice 1,218.70
Less CC Payments or Payments not yet due 1,218.70
Less Cash Payments Received 0.00
Net Amount Due 0.00

This invoice is confidential.
Thank you for choosing World Travel, Inc. We make travel simple.

Email: Finance@worldtravelinc.com | Phone: 610-970-4030 ext 4



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer
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World Travel, Inc. INVOICE #: 193005105

1724 West Schuylkill Road Date: 1/24/2024

Douglassville, PA 19518 Account: 120072100
Page#: 1

PNR Locator: L36K34

GANNETT FLEMING, INC.
207 Senate Avenue
Camp Hill PA 178011

Traveler Tkt#/Cf# Tvl Dt Itinerary PymtDue By Invoiced Amt Booked Amt
JOHNSTONJR/FREDERICK B | 7958686052 02/05/24 MDT-CLT-LEX-PHL 01/24/24 P 897.70
VI XOO000O000OMXXXX0128 American Airlines
Airline Flight Origin Destination Depart  Arrive Depart
American Airlines 5904 Harrisburg PA (Harrisburg Intl) Charlotte NC 0323pP 0521P  02/05/24
American Airlines 5136 Charlotte NC Lexington KY 0615P 0741P  02/05/24
American Airlines 6131 Lexington KY Philadelphia PA 0353P 0550P  02/06/24
JOHNSTONJR/FREDERICK B 0885158852 02/05/24 Service Fee 01/24/24 P 25.00
VI OOOOOOOOOXKAKX0128 ARC Service Fee
Total Amount of Invoice 922.70
Less CC Payments or Payments not yet due 922.70
Less Cash Payments Received 0.00
Net Amount Due 0.00

This invoice is confidential.
Thank you for choosing World Travel, Inc. We make travel simple.
Email: Finance@worldtravelinc.com | Phone: 610-970-4030 ext 4



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer
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World Travel, Inc. INVOICE #: 193005106

1724 West Schuylkill Road Date: 1/24/2024

Douglassville, PA 19518 Account: 120072100
Page#: 1

PNR Locator: L36Q8G

GANNETT FLEMING, INC.
207 Senate Avenue
Camp Hill PA 178011

Traveler Tkt#/Cf# Tvl Dt Itinerary PymtDue By Invoiced Amt Booked Amt
NEIDERER/MACKENZIE PAL 37958686053 02/05/24 MDT-CLT-LEX-PHL 01/24/24 P 897.70
VI XO0000000OKXXX0128 American Airlines
Airline Flight Origin Destination Depart  Arrive Depart
American Airlines 5904 Harrisburg PA (Harrisburg Intl) Charlotte NC 0323pP 0521P  02/05/24
American Airlines 5136 Charlotte NC Lexington KY 0615P 0741P  02/05/24
American Airlines 6131 Lexington KY Philadelphia PA 0353P 0550P  02/06/24
NEIDERER/MACKENZIE PAI 0885158851 02/05/24 Service Fee 01/24/24 P 25.00
VI OOOOOOOOOXKAKX0128 ARC Service Fee
Total Amount of Invoice 922.70
Less CC Payments or Payments not yet due 92270
Less Cash Payments Received 0.00
Net Amount Due 0.00

This invoice is confidential.
Thank you for choosing World Travel, Inc. We make travel simple.
Email: Finance@worldtravelinc.com | Phone: 610-970-4030 ext 4



- Nztionzal,

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
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Rental Agreement # 778309001
Invoice # 70056629736

Renter Information

Trip Information

Renter Name
JOHN J SPANOS

Renter Address
MECHANICSBURG, PA 17055
USA

Contract
GANNETT FLEMING

Rental Credits
1 credit has been awarded for this

rental

Vehicle Information

4DR ALL-WHEEL DRIVE
License #: JOAB54
State/Province: KY

Unit #: 7WD8MY
Vehicle #: RU711678

Vehicle Class Driven
Standard Crossover AWD 5 door/

Automatic/Air

Vehicle Class Charged

Full Size SUV 5 door/Automatic/Air
Odometer Mileage/Kilometers
Starting: 3,041 Ending: 3,118

Total: 77

Fuel

Starting: Full Ending: Full

Thank you for renting

with National Car Rental

We appreciate your business!

Pickup Return
ey iy
i..i Monday, February 5, ey L.t Tuesday, February 6, F .,y
2024 -+ 7:38 PM 2024 wr 12:37 PM
LEXINGTON ARPT (LEX) ** LEXINGTON ARPT (LEX)
4000 TERMINAL DR 4000 TERMINAL DR
STE 103 STE 103
LEXINGTON, KY 40510 LEXINGTON, KY 40510
USA USA
Bill-To: GANNETT FLEMING
Rental Rate Time & Distance 1 Day at $90.00 / Day $90.00
Coverages Cdw-allocated Inclusive ($0.00 / Day) Included
Taxes and Fees Ky Veh Rental Excise Tax (6.00%) $6.38
Kentucky U-drive-it Tax 6 Pct (6.00%) $5.40
Contract Facility Charge $4.75/day ($4.75/
Day) $4.75
Vehicle Lic Cost Recov Fee 1.40/day ($1.40/
Day) $1.40
Concession Recovery Fee 11.11 Pct (11.11%) $10.15
Subtotal $118.08
Total $118.08
(Subject to audit)
Amount charged to BUSINESS ACCOUNT-APPLICANT ($118.08)
Amount Due $0.00
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Rental Agreement # 955748887
Invoice # 90156802228

Renter Information

Trip Information

Renter Name
JOHN J SPANOS

Renter Address
MECHANICSBURG, PA 17055
USA

Contract
GANNETT FLEMING

Rental Credits
1 credit has been awarded for this

rental

Vehicle Information

4DR FRONT-WHEEL DRIVE SEDAN
License #: BQF2630
State/Province: TN

Unit #: 8DFHEX

Vehicle #: PN389182

Vehicle Class Driven
Full Size 4 door/Automatic/Air

Vehicle Class Charged
Standard SUV 5 door/Automatic/Air

Odometer Mileage/Kilometers
Starting: 18,823 Ending: 18,964

Total: 141

Fuel

Starting: Full Ending: Full

Thank you for renting
with National Car Rental
We appreciate your business!

This email was automatically generated
from an unattended mailbox, so please

do not reply to this e-mail.

One Way Rental

{1 4:05 AM

HARRISBURG INTL ARPT (MDT) *"

Pickup Return

i | iy

i Tuesday, February 6, i i+ Wednesday, February 7,
2024 10:09 PM 2024

Start Charges 2 TERMINAL DR

7% Tuesday, February 6, P g STE 102

2024 «+10:10 PM

MIDDLETOWN, PA 17057

PHILADELPHIA INTL ARPT (PHL) “
1 ARRIVALS RD

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19153

USA

USA

Bill-To: GANNETT FLEMING

Rental Rate Time & Distance 1 Day at $85.00/ Day $85.00
Excess Distance Charge 141 Distance at
$0.40 / Distance $56.40
Coverages Cdw-allocated Inclusive ($0.00 / Day) Included
Add-Ons Toll Pass Device ($4.95 / Day) $4.95
Taxes and Fees Vehicle Rental Tax (2.00%) $3.25
Phil Vehicle Rental Tax 2 Pct (2.00%) $3.25
Phl Tax (2.00%) $3.25
Pta Fee 2.00/day ($2.00 / Day) $2.00
Concession Fee Recovery 11.11 Pct (11.11%) $16.26
Pa Tax (6.00%) $9.76
Customer Facility Charge 8.00/day ($8.00 /
Day) $8.00
Subtotal $192.12
Total $192.12
(Subject to audit)
Amount charged to BUSINESS ACCOUNT-APPLICANT ($192.12)
Amount Due $0.00
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Employee Expense Report

Backup
Employee: 34937 - Mackenzie P Neiderer l Expense Report Dates: 2/5/2024 - 2/6/2024
Expense Report: 395245 - Columbia Gas of Kentucky Trip Posting Date: 2/23/2024
Project: 076650 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY-Depr Client: 36414915 - NiSource - Columbia Gas of
Kentucky
Backup For: 000 - Depreciation Study
Transaction Details
Sequence Date Category Project Task Hierarchy Location Receipt Currency Quantity Amount
1 2/5/2024 Project- Other Food & 076650 000 Camp Hill PA (West 1 us 25.97
Beverage Building)
Field review and management meeting for Columbia Gas of Kentucky related to depreciation study, Lexington, KY
Proj O‘t{jgr Fm@”& 0?5650 000 Ca‘ Hm A (West 3

Field review and management meeting for Columbia Gas of Kentucky related to depreciation study, Lexington, KY

2 2/6/2024 Project- Breakfast 076650 000 Camp Hill PA (West 2 us 1.90
Building)

Field review and management meeting for Columbia Gas of Kentucky related to depreciation study, Lexington, KY

h d

Total 54.55
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g

922 0 Peppe2a1 9
:_;gg Xt ?lt Mwi\
223149
02/05/2924 i 3292%9 gn in: 6
R@mst?; e o [\amel -
T :79
o B
Total TR
Change Due = $0.00
S "

YUK XXXX XXKKX 5665 DISCOVER

093212
:lﬁglgg 00B40R REF 070090206240932

Disca 008000152’3010

. §715309390038BBC
NO ol(‘zNﬁTURE REQUIRED
SALE

Entry: CHIP
gatch: 7 Seq Num: 9
JOIN

MARATHON REWARDS
TODAY

I Hereby acknowledge receipt of this
invoice and the items purchased. I
understand that I must pay in accordance
to the agreement I entered into at the
time the card was issued, or to the terms
of any subsequent agreement

Qﬂmldef W

Scanned with CamScanner

nne
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PARADIES SHOPS - LEXINGTON
Lexington Airport
Lexington, KY
SALESPERSON # 517970
ICE MOUNTIAN 1 LITER 083346000111

4.79 T
OBERTO BEEF JERKY TE 070411613083

9.99 N
EXTRA SPEARMINT 022000008992

3.69 7
SUBTOTAL $18.47
#%09 $0.22
TOTAL $18.69
DISCOVER $18.69
EHRERARRNEAR RN PUQCHQSE ERAEENREENRNRRT Y

APPROVED

Total: $18 69

Card Type: DISCOVER

Card Entry: CHIP

Acet #: susnsnanwnaeNEES
Approval Code: 00B44R

,:iiu-ntwuwuu EMV PURCHASE wnasessasnwuw
- App Label: Ol scover
. Mode: Issuer

CUSTOMER COPY

TTENS 3
01:56PM
000554 (2 517970 3621

Thank You for Shopping at
The Paradies Shops
Laxington
(ELEBRATING 50 YEARS IN BUSINESS!1}

Scanned with CamScanner
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COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

RATE CASE PREPARATION
CONSULTING INVOICES
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() AgileOne Invoice

Customer Number : 00178119
Agile 1| 1999 West 190th Street | Torrance, CA 90504 Invoice Date : 12/31/2023
Phone : (310) 750-3400 | Email : Agile1 CorpAR@Agile1.com Invoice Number : COL9723682
Tax 10| Invoice Amount : $1,561,277.68
Terms : NET 30 DAYS
Vendor Number : 2000120789
Bill To: Remit To:
NiSource Agile 1
Attn: 1999 West 190th Street
290 W Nationwide Blvd Torrance, CA 90504

Columbus, OH 43215

08-Jan-2024 Page 1 of 38
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Tenure Tenure

Easter, Monica 12/17/2023 . STDOO . $0.00 $33.02

08-Jan-2024 Page 9 of 38
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Tenure Tenure

[ GRAND TOTAL | 20,055.98 $1,18645| |  s45464] $15612776
... =

If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use
Phone : (310) 750-3400
Email : Agile1CorpAR@Agile1.com

08-Jan-2024 Page 38 of 38



() AgileOne

Agile 1| 1999 West 190th Street | Torrance, CA 90504
Phone : (310) 750-3400 | Email : Agile1 CorpAR@Agile1.com

Tax ID: I

Bill To:

NiSource

Attn: I
290 W Nationwide Blvd
Columbus, OH 43215

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
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Invoice

Customer Number : 00178119

Invoice Date : 01/31/2024

Invoice Number : COL9748591

Invoice Amount : $1,213,654.23

Terms : NET 30 DAYS

Vendor Number : 2000120789
Remit To:

Agile 1

1999 West 190th Street
Torrance, CA 90504

06-Feb-2024

Page 1 of 29
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Tenure Tenure

Easter, Monica 01/07/2024 00012 2.00 66.04 STD0OO $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $132.08

Easter, Monica 01/14/2024 00012 0.50 66.04 STD0OO $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $33.02

Easter, Monica 01/21/2024 00012 0.75 66.04 STDOO $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $49.53

06-Feb-2024 Page 8 of 29
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Tenure Tenure

GRAND TOTAL | 1488648 2igetel — $262.43| $1.213.654.2
e :

If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use
Phone : (310) 750-3400
Email : Agile 1CorpAR@Agile 1.com

06-Feb-2024 Page 29 of 29



() AgileOne

Agile 1| 1999 West 190th Street | Torrance, CA 90504
Phone : (310) 750-3400 | Email : Agile1 CorpAR@Agile1.com

Tax 10: I

Bill To:

NiSource

ctn: |
290 W Nationwide Blvd
Columbus, OH 43215

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 32 of 78

Invoice

Customer Number : 00178119

Invoice Date : 02/29/2024

Invoice Number : COL9774287

Invoice Amount : $1,287,439.97

Terms : NET 30 DAYS

Vendor Number : 2000120789
Remit To:

Agile 1

1999 West 190th Street
Torrance, CA 90504

06-Mar-2024

Page 1 of 32
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| Tenure Tenure

Easter, Monica 01/28/2024 00012 0.75 66.04 STDOO $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $49.53

Easter, Monica 02/04/2024 00012 0.50 66.04 STDOO $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $33.02

Easter, Monica 02/11/2024 00012 0.50 66.04 STDOO $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $33.02

06-Mar-2024 Page 7 of 32
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Tenure Tenure

GRAND TOTAL | 16.580.80 s108538] = | $30107] $128/4399
7

If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use
Phone : (310) 750-3400
Email : Agile 1CorpAR@Agile1.com

06-Mar-2024 Page 32 0of 32



() AgileOne

Agile 1| 1999 West 190th Street | Torrance, CA 90504
Phone : (310) 750-3400 | Email : Agile1 CorpAR@Agile1.com

Tax 10

Bill To:

NiSource

Actn: [
290 W Nationwide Blvd
Columbus, OH 43215
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Invoice

Customer Number : 00178119

Invoice Date : 03/31/2024

Invoice Number : COL9800270

Invoice Amount : $1,175,215.79

Terms : NET 30 DAYS

Vendor Number : 2000120789
Remit To:

Agile 1

1999 West 190th Street
Torrance, CA 90504

05-Apr-2024

Page 1 of 22
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Tenure Tenure

Easter, Monica 02/25/2024 00012 66.04 STDOO $0.00 $0.00 $66.04
Easter, Monica 03/03/2024 00012 66.04 STDOO $0.00 $0.00 $33.02

Easter, Monica 03/10/2024 00012 66.04 STDOO $0.00 $0.00 $33.02

05-Apr-2024 Page 8 of 22
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Tenure Tenure

GRAND TOTAL | 14.460.20 £399.65| $1.175 215.7
9

If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use
Phone : (310) 750-3400
Email : Agile1CorpAR@Agile1.com

05-Apr-2024 Page 22 of 22
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COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

LEGAL FEE INVOICES



Vendor Details
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1795 Alysheba Way Suite 6202
Tax-0: [

Billing Address: Lexington
KY 40509

Header Information

Page 39 of 78

[nvoice NumBER | [iLunG sTART DATE |
653 1/1/24

[VENDOR |  [piLuinG enp DATE |
Honaker Law Office, PLLC 1/31/24

[nvoice pate | busmiTTeD TOTAL |
2/5/24 $5,182.00

[Receivep pate | busmITTED CURRENCY |
2/5/24 usb

[proseCT | lUnEITEM wARNINGS |
2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case None

[posTING sTATUS |

Posted

[WARNING: |

None

Tax Information

[TAX TYPE

us

[TAX RATE

0.00 %

Invoice Summary

Type Rate x Unit (-) Discount (-) Adjustment Tax
Fees $5,182.00 $0.00 $0.00
Expenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Invoice Total (USD) $5,182.00 $0.00 $0.00

Description

2023-009192

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

Amount

$5,182.00
$0.00

$5,182.00
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Comments to Requester

Line Items

View: AllLine Items
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Line Items 1 -57 of 57

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/3/24 Fee . Y & Y $290.00 0.20 $0.00 | $0.00  $58.00
Advice H
1
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Plan and prepare for application rate case witness testimony.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/15/24 Fee . y $320.00 0.10 $0.00 | $0.00  $32.00
Advice Allyson
2
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re witness contacts.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/3/24 Fee . Y & Y $290.00 0.20 $0.00 | $0.00  $58.00
Advice H
3
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review / Analyze email re: notes and plan for application prep from J. Gore.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/18/24 Fee . y $320.00 0.80 $0.00 | $0.00  $256.00
Advice Allyson
4

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in virtual meeting with K. Johnson, et. al. re rate case testimony.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/12/24 Fee Advi y H & y $290.00 0.30 $0.00 | S0.00 | $87.00
vice

5 Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Communicate (with client) meet with M. Girata re: testimony for weather normalization for rate

application.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/8/24 Fee . y $320.00 0.20 $0.00 | $0.00  $64.00
Advice Allyson
6
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review email and attached witness list from J. Ryan.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/12/24 Fee . y g Y $290.00 0.10 $0.00 | $0.00  $29.00
Advice H
7
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Communicate (with client) email to set up meeting for testimony preparation to M. Girata.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/12/24 Fee . y & Y $290.00 0.10 $0.00 | $0.00  $29.00
Advice H
8

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Communicate (with client) email to set up meeting for testimony preparation to C. Inscho.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/10/24 Fee . y g Y $290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00  $58.00
Advice H
9
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review / Analyze meeting notes sent by J. Gore for preparation for testimony for rate application.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/3/24 Fee . y $320.00 0.70  $0.00 $0.00  $224.00
Advice Allyson
10
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Participate in weekly rate case video conference with J. Ryan, et. al.
C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/26/24 Fee . Y P $275.00 0.10 $0.00 S0.00  $27.50
Advice S
11
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchanged emails with A.Honaker and J.Clark about access to documents for rate case.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/10/24 Fee . y & Y $290.00 0.20 $0.00 S0.00  $58.00
Advice H
12
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Communicate (with client) email from C. Inscho re: application preparation.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/11/24  Fee o analy g Y $29000 010 $0.00 $0.00  $29.00
Advice H
13
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Communicate (with client) email from C. Rickard re: preparation for application.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/12/24 Fee . Y g Y $290.00 0.30 $0.00 S0.00  $87.00
Advice H
14
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review / Analyze draft testimony from M. Girata in preparation of application testimony.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/12/24 Fee . Y 8 Y $290.00 040 $0.00 S$0.00 $116.00
Advice H
15

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review / Analyze draft testimony from C. Inscho in preparation of application testimony.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/29/24  Fee o Analy g ¥ $290.00 1.40 $0.00 $0.00  $406.00
Advice H
16 project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review / Analyze testimony and data responses from NiSource and Columbia witnesses in most recent
rate case in preparation for witness testimony for rate case application.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/3/24 Fee . y $320.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00
Advice Allyson

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange emails and texts with J. Ryan re witness list for case.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/26/24 Fee ) $320.00 0.50 $0.00  $0.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in virtual meeting with J. Ryan, et. al. re rate case.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/24/24 Fee Advi y H 8 y $290.00 0.80 $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Research rate case application issues for witnesses in preparation for testimony prep.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/22/24 Fee Advi y H 8 v $290.00 0.30 $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Page 43 of 78

Amt

$64.00

$160.00

$232.00

$87.00

Description: Plan and prepare for rate case application review of meeting notes for team meeting 1-17-24.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/29/24 Fee Advi y H 8 v $290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Communicate (with client) review email from J. Clark re: rate case meeting notes.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/29/24 Fee Advi y H 8 v $290.00 0.80 $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Research rate case application issues for witnesses in preparation for testimony prep.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/12/24 Fee . $320.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Email to J. Ryan for contact information for D. Roy to schedule meeting.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/29/24 Fee Advi y H 8 Y $290.00 0.50 $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review notes from rate case application meetings.

$116.00

$232.00

$32.00

$145.00



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 44 of 78

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/17/24 Fee Advi y S P $275.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $82.50
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Attended weekly rate case meeting.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/12/24 Fee ) $320.00 0.10 $0.00 S0.00  $32.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Send email to A. Vankleek re setting up meeting to discuss any issues.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/25/24 Fee Advi y H & y $290.00 0.20 $0.00 S0.00  $58.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Plan and prepare for rate case prep re: access to draft materials.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/9/24 Fee . $320.00 0.50 $0.00 S0.00  $160.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Begin review of draft testimony for witnesses provided by C. Rickard.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/31/24 Fee Advi y H 8 v $290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Plan and prepare for rate case email re: access to shared files.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/9/24 Fee . $320.00 0.20 $0.00 S0.00  $64.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email from C. Rickard re testimony drafts for rate case.

C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/15/24 Fee Advi y s : $275.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $27.50
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Reviewed email from J.Ryan re: witness meetings.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/12/24 Fee . $320.00 0.10 $0.00 S0.00  S$32.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Send email to K. Johsnon re setting up meeting to discuss any issues.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/29/24 Fee . y P $275.00 0.50 $0.00 S$0.00 $137.50
Advice S
33
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Reviewed prior depreciation testimony/study from 2021 rate case to prepare to meet with witness.
C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/29/24  Fee o anay P $275.00 010 $0.00 $0.00  $27.50
Advice S
34
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchanged emails regarding acess to client server for rate case.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/5/24 Fee . Y $320.00 0.10 $0.00 S$0.00  $32.00
Advice Allyson
35
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Telephone conference with J. Clark re access to the Tool.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/3/24 Fee . y & y $290.00 0.70 $0.00 S$0.00  $203.00
Advice H
36
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Appear for / attend weekly rate case video conference with J. Ryan, et. al.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/4/24 Fee . Y $320.00 0.30 $0.00 S$0.00  $96.00
Advice Allyson
37
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review post-meeting notes from J. Gore.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/17/24 Fee . y $320.00 0.30 $0.00 S$0.00  $96.00
Advice Allyson
38
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review meeting notes from J. Gore, et. al.
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/11/24 Fee . Y $320.00 0.20 $0.00 S0.00  $64.00
Advice Allyson
39
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchange emails with J. Clark, et. al. expert witness recommendation.
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/16/24 Fee . Y & Y $290.00 0.30 $0.00 S$0.00  $87.00
Advice H
40

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Communicate (with client) meet with C. Inscho re: testimony for rate case app.



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units
C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/24/24 Fee . $275.00 0.30
Advice S

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Weekly rate case meeting.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/24/24 Fee ) $320.00 0.40
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in virtual meeting with J. Gore, et. al.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/10/24 Fee . $320.00 0.30
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review meeting notes and agenda from J. Gore.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/17/24 Fee . $320.00 0.20
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan, et.al. re weekly meeting attendance.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/10/24 Fee . $320.00 0.30
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange emails with K. Johnson re testimony and questions on same.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/10/24 Fee . $320.00 0.50
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in weekly meeting for rate case application.

C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/12/24 Fee . $275.00 0.10
Advice S

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
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Disc Adj Amt

$0.00 | S0.00  $82.50

$0.00  $0.00  $128.00

$0.00 | S0.00  $96.00

$0.00  S0.00  $64.00

$0.00 | S0.00  $96.00

$0.00 | $0.00  $160.00

$0.00 $0.00 | $27.50

Description: Exchanged emails with A.Honaker about contacting witness. Same with John/Joe from Columbia.

C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/10/24 Fee . $275.00 0.50
Advice S

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Weekly meeting to prepare application for rate case

$0.00 | $0.00  $137.50
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc
C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/8/24 Fee . $320.00 0.10 $0.00
Advice Allyson

49

50

51

52

53

54

55

56

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange emails with J. Gore re testimony and anticipated process.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/16/24  Fee o Analy 8 Y $29000 040  $0.00
Advice H

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Plan and prepare for meeting with witness re: cost of service.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/9/24 Fee . $320.00 0.20 $0.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review emails from J.Ryan, et. al. re rate case witnesses and schedules.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/17/24 Fee . $320.00 0.20 $0.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Telephone conference with J. Clark re witnesses and strategy for rate case.

C300 Analysis and Honaker, L.
1/19/24 Fee . $320.00 0.10 $0.00
Advice Allyson

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review emails from J. Clark and B. Owens re rate case.

C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/9/24 Fee . $275.00 0.20  $0.00
Advice S

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review emails from J.Ryan regarding rate case witnesses.

C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/16/24  Fee o Anay g Y $29000 010  $0.00
Advice H

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Adj

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Page 47 of 78

Amt

$32.00

$116.00

$64.00

$64.00

$32.00

$55.00

$29.00

Description: Manage data/files. Preparation and management meeting for client strategy and work plan.

C300 Analysis and Temple, Heather
1/12/24 Fee . $275.00 0.20 $0.00
Advice S

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchanged emails with B.Koenig and A.Honaker re expert for compensation.

$0.00

$55.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and Koenig, Brittan
1/12/24  Fee v Analy & ¥ 29000 010 $0.00 $0.00  $29.00
Advice H
57
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Communicate (with client) email to M. Girata-follow-up re: next steps.
Access Information
[creaTeD BY |  ooiFiep BY |
system, system system, system
[creaTeD ON |  obiFiED ON |
2/5/24 9:08 AM 2/12/24 10:15 PM
Summary Breakdowns
By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category
. Avg Net Net . . % of Total
Timekeeper . Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
Rate Units ees
2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Honaker, L. Allyson 320.00 6.70 0.00 0.00 2,144.00 41.37%
Koenig, Brittany H 290.00 8.20 0.00 0.00 2,378.00 45.89%
Temple, Heather S 275.00 2.40 0.00 0.00 660.00 12.74%
Remittance Details
Ready to send to AP: Yes Invoice On Hold For No
AP:
Acceptance Status: Accepted Date Received by AP: 2/12/24
Reason for Rejection:
Payment Method: Check Check # 2012047773
Paid Date: 2/13/24 Total Amount on 5,182
Check:
Paid Amount: 5,182 Paid By Insurance No
Group:

User Rights
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Option User Read Update Delete Perm

Allow Clark, Joe Yes Yes No No

Active Requests

Request Name

Completed Requests

Requester Request Date

No records available.

Expiration Date Status

Item Request Name Requester Request Date Completion Date Comment Outcome
1 Post Invoice for 5,182.00 Honaker 2/5/24 2/9/24 Approved
usb Law
Office,
PLLC
Approval History
Stop Performer Activity Date/Time Internal Comment
1 Clark, Joe Approved 2/9/24 11:35 AM
Versions
Invoice Version Created On Rejection Date Invoice Reason/Comments

No versions available.

Invoice Details »

|PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

| [auTeRNATIVE FEE

No No

[pAID AMOUNT | Invoice on HoLD For AP |
5,182.00 No

[accePTANCE STATUS | Insurance invorce? |
Accepted No

[paYmENT METHOD | |eHeck# |
Check 2012047773

[cHECK DATE |  WiTHHOLDING AMOUNT |
[MaTTER TYPE |  |Reason For resecTiON |
Matter

|TRANSACTION MATTER

| |pispute maTTER

2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
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Po NUMBER

TOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK

5,182.00

READY TO SEND TO AP PAID DATE
Yes 2/13/24
[MATTER CATEGORY [DATE RECEIVED BY AP

308 - State Regulatory

2/12/24



Vendor Details
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1795 Alysheba Way Suite 6202
Billing Address: Lexington

KY 40509

Header Information

Page 51 of 78

[nvoice NumBER | [piLunG sTarT DATE |
738 2/1/24

[VENDOR | [BiLLING END DATE |
Honaker Law Office, PLLC 2/29/24

[nvoice pate | busmiTTeD TOTAL |
3/19/24 $6,158.50

[Receivep paTe | buBmITTED CURRENCY |
3/19/24 usD

[proseCT | lUnEITEM waRNINGS |
2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case None

[posTING sTATUS |

Posted

|WARNING: |

None

Tax Information

[TAX TYPE

us

[TAX RATE

0.00 %

Invoice Summary

Type Rate x Unit (-) Discount (-) Adjustment Tax
Fees $6,158.50 $0.00 $0.00
Expenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Invoice Total (USD) $6,158.50 $0.00 $0.00

Description

2023-009192

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

Amount

$6,158.50
$0.00

$6,158.50
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Comments to Requester

Line ltems

View: AllLine Items
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Line Items 1 - 51 of 51

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
€300 Analysis and
2/1/24 Fee Advi nalysis an Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $64.00
vice
1

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review meeting notes from J. Gore.

C300 Analysis and

2/5/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $160.00
vice
2
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Video conference with J. Ryan, D. Roy, et. al. re testimony.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/9/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.60 S0.00 | $0.00  $174.00
vice
3
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review of M. Girata's testimony draft.
C300 Analysis and ) )
2/13/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00  $58.00
vice
4
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Email re: testimony of M. Girata with A. Honaker.
C300 Analysis and
2/1/24 Fee Advi ¥ Temple, Heather S | $275.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $137.50
vice
5
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Weekly rate case meeting.
C300 Analysis and
2/15/24  Fee Advi y Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 0.10  $0.00 $0.00 $32.00
vice
6
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchange emails with A. VanKleeck re scheduling meeting to discuss testimony.
C300 Analysis and
2/13/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 0.50  $0.00 $0.00  $160.00
vice
7
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review testimony and edits from B. Koenig re M. Griata.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/16/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00  0.20 | $0.00 | $0.00  $58.00
vice
8

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Discussion re: rate case application testimony with A. Honaker.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc
C300 Analysis and
2/5/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S | $275.00  0.20  $0.00
vice

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchanged emails with J.Ryan and G.Skinner about testimony in rate case.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/29/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00  0.30  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Email from C. Inscho re: testimony and response.

C300 Analysis and ) .
2/14/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.50  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Adj

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Page 54 of 78

Amt

$55.00

$87.00

$145.00

Description: Report on status of testimony to team call, receive updates from team, discuss rate case application

preparation with A. Honaker.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/9/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.80  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Edit draft of M. Girata's testimony for rate case application.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/29/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.50  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Attend rate case meeting for information on witnesses testimony deadline.

C300 Analysis and
2/6/24 Fee . Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email re expert testimony.

C300 Analysis and
2/29/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.20  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email and notes from meeting from J. Gore.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/29/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.20  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review notes emailed from J. Gore.

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$232.00

$145.00

$32.00

$64.00

$58.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
2/9/24 Fee Advi y Temple, Heather S = $275.00 0.20 $0.00 S0.00 $55.00
vice
17
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Discussed testimony and Tool with B.Koenig.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/1/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 | 0.30  $0.00 $0.00 @ $87.00
vice
18
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review email re: rate case meeting notes.
C300 Analysis and . )
2/28/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 | 0.20 S0.00 S0.00 $58.00
vice
19
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Meeting with M. Girata re: testimony and data missing until end of March.
C300 Analysis and
2/15/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.20  $0.00 $0.00  $55.00
vice
20
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Talked with A.Honaker and B.Koenig about witness testimony.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/28/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.40 S0.00 S0.00 $116.00
vice
21
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review Mi. Girata's draft testimony in preparation for meeting re: data questions.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/7/24 Fee ) Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 | 0.30 S$S0.00 S0.00 $87.00
Advice
22
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review / Analyze meeting notes/email for meeting 6 from J. Gore.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/9/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 | 0.20  $0.00  $0.00  $58.00
vice
23
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Email M. Girata's edited testimony to A. Honaker for review.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/15/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.40 S0.00 S0.00 $116.00
vice
24

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Revise M. Girata testimony in regulatory tool.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and ) )
2/15/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.20 $0.00 S0.00 $58.00
vice
25
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Email update to M. Girata re: edits in regulatory tool to his testimony.
C300 Analysis and
2/29/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 | 0.20  $0.00 $0.00  $64.00
vice
26
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re expert witness.
C300 Analysis and . )
2/15/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.60  S0.00 S0.00 $174.00
vice
27
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Revise C. Inscho's testimony in regulatory tool.
C300 Analysis and
2/19/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 | 0.10  $S0.00 S0.00 $32.00
vice
28
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchange emails with K. Johnson re lead/lag study.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/15/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 | 0.20 S0.00 S0.00  $58.00
vice
29
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Email C. Inscho re: updated testimony edits in regulatory tool.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/6/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.80  S0.00 S0.00 $232.00
vice
30
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Email and review of M. Girata draft testimony.
C300 Analysis and
2/29/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 | 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 | $160.00
vice
31
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Participate in weekly video conference re updates and issues.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/9/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.40 S0.00 S0.00 $116.00
vice
32

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Manage files for preparation of rate case testimony for Girata and Inscho.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
2/12/24 Fee Advi Y Koenig, Brittany H = $290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 | $87.00
vice

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Email to A. Honaker and review response re: draft testimony from M. Girata.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/7/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 ' 0.80 $0.00 S0.00 | $232.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Email and review of C. Inscho witness draft testimony.

C300 Analysis and
2/23/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 | 0.50 S0.00 S0.00 $160.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with A. Vankleek.

C300 Analysis and
2/23/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 0.40 S0.00 S0.00 $128.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review Commission Orders on NOL and forward link to A. Vankleek for review.

C300 Analysis and
2/7/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00  0.90 S0.00 S0.00 $288.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in weekly video conference and small groups asked to stay after call.

C300 Analysis and
2/7/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00 1.20 | S0.00 $0.00 | $384.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with J. Ryan, D. Roy, et. al. re testimony overlap for rate case.

C300 Analysis and
2/27/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 | 0.10  $0.00 $0.00  $32.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Email to J. Clark and J. Ryan re upcoming rate case.

C300 Analysis and
2/29/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S = $275.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $110.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Weekly rate case meeting.



Item Date Type Category TK Rate
C300 Analysis and ) )
2/9/24 Fee ) Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00
Advice

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review of draft testimony from C. Inscho.

C300 Analysis and
2/29/24  Fee . Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in meeting re depreciation study.

C300 Analysis and
2/22/24 Fee ) Temple, Heather S = $275.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Weekly rate case meeting.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/9/24 Fee . Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14

Units Disc

0.50  $0.00
0.60  $0.00
0.50 | $0.00
0.80  $0.00
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Adj

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Page 58 of 78

Amt

$145.00

$192.00

$137.50

$232.00

Description: Confirm citations in testimony of C. Inscho for forecast test period pro forma requirements.

C300 Analysis and . .
2/9/24 Fee ) Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Edit draft testimony of C. Inscho.

C300 Analysis and
2/9/24 Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

0.70

0.50

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$203.00

$160.00

Description: Review and edit draft testimony from C. Inscho for B. Koenig and exchange emails re same.

C300 Analysis and
2/28/24  Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

0.10

$0.00

$0.00

Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re time to schedule meeting to discuss rate case filing.

C300 Analysis and
2/1/24 Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with J. Gore, et. al.

0.50

$0.00

$0.00

$32.00

$160.00



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092
Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Page 59 of 78

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
2/7/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $137.50
vice
49
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Weekly rate case meeting.
C300 Analysis and
2/2/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.20  $0.00 $0.00  $64.00
vice
50
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review lengthy email from J. Ryan re meeting to discuss overlap of issues with D. Roy, et. al.
C300 Analysis and . .
2/1/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00
vice
51
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review / Analyze meeting notes for rate case team.
Access Information
[cREATED BY |  mooiFieD BY |
system, system system, system
[cREATED ON | mooiFiED on |
3/19/24 8:58 AM 3/22/24 11:15 PM
Summary Breakdowns
By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category
. Avg Net Net . . % of Total
Timekeeper ] Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
Rate Units Fees
2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Honaker, L. Allyson 320.00 7.40 0.00 0.00 | 2,368.00 38.45%
Koenig, Brittany H 290.00 10.70 0.00 0.00 | 3,103.00 50.39%
Temple, Heather S 275.00 2.50 0.00 0.00 687.50 11.16%

Remittance Details
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Ready to send to AP: Yes Invoice On Hold For No
AP:
Acceptance Status: Accepted Date Received by AP: 3/22/24

Reason for Rejection:

Payment Method: Check Check # 2012048575
Paid Date: 3/25/24 Total Amounton 6,158
Check:
Paid Amount: 6,158 Paid By Insurance No
Group:
User Rights
Option User Read Update Delete Perm
Allow Clark, Joe Yes Yes No No

Active Requests

Request Name Requester Request Date  Expiration Date Status

No records available.

Completed Requests

Item Request Name Requester Request Date Completion Date Comment Outcome
1 Post Invoice for 6,158.50 Honaker  3/19/24 3/21/24 Approved
usbD Law
Office,
PLLC

Approval History

Stop Performer Activity Date/Time Internal Comment
1 Clark, Joe Approved 3/21/24 8:24 PM
Versions
Invoice Version Created On Rejection Date Invoice Reason/Comments

No versions available.
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|PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

lALTERNATIVE FEE

No

No

[PAID AMOUNT INVOICE ON HOLD FOR AP
6,158.50 No

IACCEPTANCE STATUS INSURANCE INVOICE?
Accepted No

[PAYMENT METHOD [CHECK #

Check 2012048575

|cHECK DATE WITHHOLDING AMOUNT
[MATTER TYPE REASON FOR REJECTION
Matter

|TRANSACTION MATTER

|DISPUTE MATTER

2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

[Po NUMBER

|TOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK

6,158.50

[ReADY TO sEnD TO AP PAID DATE
Yes 3/25/24
[MATTER cATEGORY IDATE RECEIVED BY AP

308 - State Regulatory

3/22/24



Vendor Details
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1795 Alysheba Way Suite 6202
Billing Address: Lexington

KY 40509

Header Information

Page 62 of 78

[nvoice NumBER | [iLunG sTaRT DATE |
741 3/1/24

[VENDOR |  [BiLLING END DATE |
Honaker Law Office, PLLC 3/31/24

[nvoice pate | busmiTTeD TOTAL |
4/3/24 S 12,446.00

[Receivep paTe | buBmITTED CURRENCY |
4/3/24 usD

[proseCT | lUnEITEM waRNINGS |
2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case None

[posTING sTATUS |

Posted

|WARNING: |

None

Tax Information

[TAX TYPE

us

[TAX RATE

0.00 %

Invoice Summary

Type Rate x Unit (-) Discount (-) Adjustment Tax
Fees $12,446.00 $0.00 $0.00
Expenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Invoice Total (USD) $12,446.00 $0.00 $0.00

Description

2023-009192

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

Amount

$12,446.00
$0.00

$12,446.00
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Comments to Requester

Line ltems

View: AllLine Items
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Line Items 1 - 76 of 76

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
3/29/24  Fee Advi ¥ Honaker, L. Allyson 1 $320.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $480.00
vice
1

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with J. Ryan, et. al. re brainstorming issues.

C300 Analysis and

3/14/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00  $58.00
vice
2
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Draft Notice of Electronic Filing and sent to A. Honaker and H. Temple for review.
C300 Analysis and . .
3/14/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 S$116.00
vice
3
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Draft notice of intent and sent to A. Honaker and H. Temple for review.
C300 Analysis and . )
3/14/24  Fee Advi Koenig, BrittanyH  $290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00  $232.00
vice
4
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Draft start of application and sent to A. Honaker and H. Temple for review.
C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $64.00
vice
5
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Conference call with B. Koenig and H. Temple re update from J. Ryan.
C300 Analysis and
3/22/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson 1 $320.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $320.00
vice
6
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Participate in video conference with J. Ryan, et. al. re rate case.
C300 Analysis and . .
3/1/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00
vice
7
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Discussion re: next steps in application preparation with A. Honaker.
C300 Analysis and
3/21/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.20 $0.00 | $0.00  $64.00
vice
8

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email and attached notes re Kentucky Press Association deadline from J. Ryan.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

C300 Analysis and . .
3/28/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.20  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference call with A. Honaker and H. Temple re update from J. Ryan

C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.20  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Call with A.Honaker and B.Koenig to discussed potential new issue in rate case.

C300 Analysis and . )
3/1/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.30  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference with B. Koenig re draft application and next steps.

C300 Analysis and
3/4/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.10  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Discussed update/review with A.Honaker.

C300 Analysis and
3/20/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00 1.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in weekly rate case meeting.

C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.20  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Telephone conference with B. Koenig and H. Temple re status update.

C300 Analysis and
3/29/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 1.50  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Brainstorming session.

C300 Analysis and . .
3/22/24  Fee Advi Koenig, BrittanyH  $290.00 0.40  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Attachment B

Repsondent: Shaeffer

Adj

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Page 65 of 78

Amt

$58.00

$55.00

$87.00

$27.50

$320.00

$64.00

$412.50

$116.00

Description: Review notes from team meeting and testimony from M. Girata in preparation for meeting re:

forecasting.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and . .
3/22/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00  $290.00
vice

17 Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference call re: forecasting witness with J. Cooper, J. Clark, M. Girata, several members of
Columbia Team, A. Honaker.

C300 Analysis and . .
3/21/24  Fee Advi Koenig, BrittanyH  $290.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $261.00
vice

18
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference call with J. Cooper, J. Ryan, A. Honaker, H. Temple re: legal issues for rate case.

C300 Analysis and ] .
3/13/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00
vice

19
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Discussion re: update of application preparation.

C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.10 $0.00 S0.00 $27.50
vice

20
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Reviewed email re: depreciation study.

C300 Analysis and . .
3/4/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H | $290.00 ' 0.20 $0.00 $0.00  $58.00
vice

21
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Emails responding to testimony question/coordination.

C300 Analysis and
3/4/24 Fee . Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00  $32.00
vice

22
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email and attachment from J. Ryan re testimony review scheduling and page turn.

C300 Analysis and
3/25/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $192.00
vice

23
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email and attachment from T. Shaeffer re rate case drivers.

C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00  $32.00
vice

24
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange texts with J. Ryan re scheduling meeting.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
3/28/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson | $320.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $320.00
vice
25
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Participate in weekly team meeting.
C300 Analysis and
3/19/24 | Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 ' 0.20 | $0.00 $0.00 | $64.00
vice
26
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review emails from K. Johnson and J. Ryan re lead lag study.
C300 Analysis and
3/27/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 ' 0.20 S0.00 $0.00  $55.00
vice
27
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review and respond email re: Skinner testimony.
C300 Analysis and
3/21/24 | Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $275.00
vice
28
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Legal meeting for rate case planning.
C300 Analysis and . .
3/29/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 1.50 S$S0.00 $0.00  $435.00
vice
29
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Legal meeting to brainstorm regulatory issues with J. Ryan, J. Cooper, M. Thompson.
C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10 | S0.00 $0.00 $32.00
Advice
30
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review email from J. Ryan re tax witness update.
C300 Analysis and
3/25/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 ' 0.10 | $0.00 $0.00 | $32.00
vice
31
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re changing meeting time.
C300 Analysis and
3/14/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10 | S0.00 $0.00 $32.00
vice
32

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re scheduling meeting to discuss issues.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and ) )
3/13/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00
vice
33
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review of notes re: Rate Case drivers for application preparation.
C300 Analysis and
3/20/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $275.00
vice
34
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Weekly rate case meeting.
C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee ) y Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10 | S$S0.00 $0.00 $32.00
Advice
35
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re list of items discussed.
C300 Analysis and
3/18/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 ' 1.70 S0.00 $0.00  $467.50
vice
36
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Researched and compiled information re: other rate cases.
C300 Analysis and
3/13/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 1.50 S0.00 $0.00  $480.00
vice
37
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Participate in meeting with K. Cole, et. al. re revenue requirement and other items.
C300 Analysis and
3/18/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10 S0.00 $0.00 $32.00
vice
38
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review email from J. Gore re depreciation study.
C300 Analysis and
3/15/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.10 | $0.00 $0.00 | $27.50
vice
39
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Reviewed email from A.Honaker re research request by J. Ryan.
C300 Analysis and
3/13/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $82.50
vice
40

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference re materials provided from meeting.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
3/28/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $275.00
vice

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

48

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Attend weekly rate case meeting.

C300 Analysis and
3/7/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 ' 0.10 | $0.00 $0.00 | $32.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re expense research.

C300 Analysis and
3/18/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 @ $96.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review research on other rate cases from H. Temple as requested by J. Ryan.

C300 Analysis and
3/18/24 | Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 1.30 S0.00 $0.00  $416.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with J. Ryan, et. al. re outstanding issues.

C300 Analysis and
3/6/24 Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 ' 0.40 S0.00 $0.00 $110.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review updates to witness testimony in Tool.

C300 Analysis and . .
3/14/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.30 S0.00 $0.00  $87.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Discussion with C. Inscho re: update for testimony and data.

C300 Analysis and
3/7/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00 1.30 $0.00 $0.00 $416.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review multiple drafts of testimony in Tool.

C300 Analysis and
3/6/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.20 S0.00 $0.00  $64.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review email and attached meeting notes from J. Gore.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and ) )
3/26/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.40 S0.00 $0.00 $116.00
vice
49
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review email and attached information on COSS forwarded by A. Honaker.
C300 Analysis and
3/26/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $110.00
vice
50
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review email and attached information on COSS forwarded by A. Honaker.
C300 Analysis and
3/6/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.60  S$S0.00 $0.00 $192.00
vice
51
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Participate in weekly rate case meeting.
C300 Analysis and
3/26/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10  S0.00 $0.00 $32.00
vice
52
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Forward email and information provided by J. Ryan to H. Temple and B. Koenig for review.
C300 Analysis and
3/21/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 1.00 | S0.00 $0.00  $320.00
vice
53
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Legal meeting for rate case planning.
C300 Analysis and
3/26/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.30 | S0.00 $0.00  $96.00
vice
54
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Review emails from J. Ryan re COSS.
C300 Analysis and . .
3/14/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 ' 0.20 | $0.00 $0.00 | $58.00
vice
55
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Discussion with M. Girata re: update for testimony.
C300 Analysis and . .
3/28/24  Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 1.00 S0.00 $0.00  $290.00
vice
56

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Attend weekly rate case meeting and discussion re: customer classes.



Item Date Type Category TK Rate
C300 Analysis and
3/4/24 Fee . Honaker, L. Allyson = $320.00
Advice

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference re status of review and updates with H. Temple.

C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee ) Temple, Heather S | $275.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Draft email with research findings to A. Honaker.

C300 Analysis and
3/13/24  Fee . Temple, Heather S $275.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092

Units Disc

0.10 $0.00
0.20 $0.00
0.50 $0.00

Staff DR Set 1, No. 14
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Page 71 of 78

Adj Amt
$0.00  $32.00
$0.00  $55.00

$0.00  $137.50

Description: Review of notes re: Rate Case drivers for application preparation forwarded by A. Honaker after

meeting.

C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson = $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Telephone conference with J. Ryan re update.

C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee . Temple, Heather S $275.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Research expenses requested by J. Ryan.

C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee ) Temple, Heather S $275.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference with A. Honaker re research needed.

C300 Analysis and
3/13/24  Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson = $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

0.30

0.80

0.20

0.30

Description: Email attachments to Honaker Law team to review and discuss same.

C300 Analysis and
3/13/24  Fee . Honaker, L. Allyson = $320.00
Advice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

0.80

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00  $96.00

$0.00  $220.00

$0.00  $55.00

$0.00  $96.00

$0.00  $256.00

Description: Review email and multiple attachments from T. Shaeffer pursuant to video conference discussion.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj
C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee ) Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.10  $0.00  $0.00
Advice
65

66

67

68

69

70

71

72

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Email expense research to J. Ryan, et. al.

C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.30  $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review research provided by H. Temple on expenses.

C300 Analysis and
3/14/24  Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.80 $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Page 72 of 78

Amt

$32.00

$96.00

$256.00

Description: Review drafts of Notice to Use Electronic Procedures, Notice of Intent and portions of Application

from B. Koenig.

C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.20  $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Telephone conference with H. Temple re research needed on expenses.

C300 Analysis and
3/1/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 1.00 $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with J. Ryan, et. al. re rate application.

C300 Analysis and
3/4/24 Fee Advi Honaker, L. Allyson  $320.00 0.50  $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Participate in video conference with J. Clark, et. al. re upcoming meetings and page turn.

C300 Analysis and
3/28/24  Fee Advi Temple, Heather S $275.00 ' 0.30  $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review TOOL to see if updated testimony for witnesses is available.

C300 Analysis and . .
3/6/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.30  $0.00  $0.00
vice

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

$64.00

$320.00

$160.00

$82.50

$87.00

Description: Update re: rate case preparation discussion re: rate case meeting and next steps with A. Honaker and

H. Temple.
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc  Adj Amt
C300 Analysis and
3/15/24 Fee Advi Y Honaker, L. Allyson ' $320.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 | $320.00
vice
73

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Conference with J. Ryan re issues for upcoming filing.

C300 Analysis and . .
3/14/24  Fee Advice Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 0.80  $0.00 S$S0.00 $232.00
vi

74 project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Review application files on regulatory tool to review compliance with regulatory requirements in
application for rate case.

C300 Analysis and

3/7/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H = $290.00 0.70 | S0.00 S$0.00 $203.00
vice
75
Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Description: Research company information for preparation of application.
C300 Analysis and . .
3/7/24 Fee Advi Koenig, Brittany H  $290.00 2.10 S$0.00 S$0.00  $609.00
vice
76

Project: 2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

Description: Drafting Application for rate case.

Access Information

[creaTED BY |  mooiFiED BY |
system, system Madvek, Nicholas
[creaTeD ON |  ooiriED on |
4/3/24 2:20 PM 4/29/24 2:28 PM

Summary Breakdowns

By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category

i Avg Net Net . . % of Total
Timekeeper . Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
Rate Units Fees
2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case
Honaker, L. Allyson 320.00 18.70 0.00 0.00 5,984.00 48.08%
Koenig, Brittany H 290.00 12.80 0.00 0.00 3,712.00 29.82%
Temple, Heather S 275.00 10.00 0.00 0.00 2,750.00 22.10%

Remittance Details



Ready to send to AP:

Acceptance Status:
Reason for Rejection:
Payment Method:

Paid Date:

Paid Amount:

User Rights

Option

Allow

Active Requests

Request Name

Yes

Accepted

Check

4/5/24

12,446

User

Thompson, Melissa

Completed Requests

Item Request Name

Versions

Invoice Version

No versions available.

Invoice Details #

Requester

Invoice On Hold For
AP:

Date Received by AP:

Check #

Total Amount on
Check:

Paid By Insurance

Group:

No records available.

Request Date

KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092

4/4/24

2012048843

12,446

No
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Read Update Delete Perm

Yes

Yes No No

Expiration Date Status

Requester Request Date Completion Date Comment

Created On

No records available.

Rejection Date

Outcome

Invoice Reason/Comments

|PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

iALTERNATIVE FEE

No No
[paID AMOUNT | Invoice on HoLD FoR AP |
12,446.00 No
IaccEPTANCE STATUS | InsuraNcE INvoICE? |

Accepted

No
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[PAYMENT METHOD CHECK #

Check 2012048843

|cHECK DATE WITHHOLDING AMOUNT
[MATTER TYPE REASON FOR REJECTION
Matter

|TRANSACTION MATTER

DISPUTE MATTER

2023-009192-CKY 2024 Rate Case

[Po NUMBER FOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK
12,446.00

[ReADY TO SEND TO AP PAID DATE

Yes 4/5/24

[MATTER CATEGORY DATE RECEIVED BY AP

308 - State Regulatory

4/4/24
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COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

CUSTOMER NOTIFICATIONS
INVOICES

No Activity through May 24, 2024
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COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
CASE NO. 2024-00092

ALL OTHER INVOICES
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Kentucky.gov

Kentucky Secretary of State
Michael G. Adams

The transaction was completed successfully. The (Certificates of Existence / Authorization) for COLUMBIA GAS
OF KENTUCKY, INC. is now ready for viewing and printing.

You can print this page to use as your receipt for payment.

View/Print this certificate (PDF)

Certificate number 309764

Jurisdiction Kentucky

Certificate Type (Certificates of Existence / Authorization)
Certificate Date 4/21/2024

Company COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC.
Company ID 0010555.09.99998

Charge $10.00

Certificate Web Address https://web.sos.ky.gov/corpcertificates/64/2024042100309764.pdf

Click here to go back to you Business Profile.

DO NOT click the back button if you are attempting to order another document.

Contact  Site Map

Privacy = Security  Disclaimer  Accessibility

© Commonwealth of Kentucky
All rights reserved.

Kentucky Unbridled Spirit


http://kentucky.gov/
https://www.sos.ky.gov/
https://www.sos.ky.gov/
https://www.sos.ky.gov/
https://web.sos.ky.gov/corpcertificates/64/2024042100309764.pdf
https://web.sos.ky.gov/corpcertificates/64/2024042100309764.pdf
https://web.sos.ky.gov/BusSearchNProfile/Profile.aspx/?ctr=53139
https://www.sos.ky.gov/Pages/contact.aspx
https://www.sos.ky.gov/Pages/sitemap.aspx
http://kentucky.gov/policies/Pages/default.aspx
http://kentucky.gov/policies/Pages/security.aspx
http://kentucky.gov/policies/Pages/disclaimer.aspx
http://kentucky.gov/policies/Pages/accessibility.aspx
http://www.kentucky.gov/
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STATEMENT OF WORK NO. 4 (CW2013397)
between
NiSource Corporate Services Company
and
Atrium Economics, LLC
to
Short Form Professional Services Agreement No. CW2001743

Project Title: Columbia Gas KY GRC 2024

Owner Project Manager: Julie Wozniak
Telephone Number: (614) 460-4843
E-Mail: jcwozniak@nisource.com

Consultant Project Manager: John Taylor
Telephone Number: +1 (314) 307-5237
E-Mail: jtaylor@atriumecon.com

Term: This Statement of Work No. 4 (“SOW”) is entered into as of December 1, 2023 (“Effective
Date”), by and between Atrium Economics (“Consultant”) and NiSource Corporate Services
Company (“Owner”).

The Consultant shall perform the Services in accordance with this SOW. This SOW is governed
by and subject to the Short Form Professional Services Agreement No. CW2001743
(“Agreement”), dated January 1, 2022. This SOW shall be effective until 5/31/2025.

1 Scope of the Services
a Project Description Summary.

Columbia Gas of Kentucky (CKY) is seeking a witness (witnesses) to sponsor testimony on
an allocated class cost of service study (ACOSS), rate design as part of a CKY gas rate case
filing. The Consultant will work with CKY’s team throughout the preparation of the study to
ensure that all parties understand and agree on the methods used in the study. Consultant
understands that CKY plans to file the gas rate case by the early May 2024 and to use a
forecasted test year.

b Key Business Objectives.

Expert witness testimony in support of CKY’s gas rate case filing.

¢ Scope of the Services to be performed.

Task 1 — Administrative and Data Collection

Task 2 - Conduct an Allocated Class Cost of Service Study (ACOSS)
Task 3 — Develop Rate Design by Customer Class

Task 4 — Prepare Minimum Standard Filing Requirement (MSFR)
Task 5 - Post Filing Support

Page 1 of 6
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d Approach. How will the actual work be accomplished?

Task 1 - Administrative and Data Collection

Atrium proposes a virtual kickoff meeting as soon as practical to establish the project plan
and schedule, review what changes have occurred since the last case, review data
requirements, review the revenue proof, and finalize the working relationship and
communications protocols between Atrium and CKY. Atrium also anticipates weekly status
calls with CKY’s team, similar to prior projects with other NiSource Companies.

Task 2 - Conduct an Allocated Class Cost of Service Study (ACOSS)

Atrium will be responsible for preparing the ACOSS for filing in CKY’s upcoming natural gas
general rate case. Atrium will prepare the necessary support studies utilizing CKY’s data and
structure the analyses to provide CKY with customer, demand, and commodity costs and rates
of return by customer rate schedule. The results of the ACOSS will be presented in a format
that meets the Minimum Standard Filing Requirements (MSFR) of the Kentucky Public Service
Commission (KPSC). In conducting the ACOSS, Atrium will perform the following tasks:

e Serve as a Subject Matter Expert (SME) and provide recommendations and guidance.

e Review historical regulatory decisions pertaining to cost of service allocation
methodologies, provide expertise and recommendations, and verify the Company’s
preferred approach to its class cost of service studies.

e Review historical studies and determine whether modifications are warranted.

e Conduct studies of various cost components in order to determine appropriate
allocation factors to be utilized.

e Set up and run the ACOSS model using the results of the revenue requirement and
allocation factor studies to obtain preliminary results of the cost of service, by class.

e Evaluate the cost functionality, classification, and allocation methodologies
employed in the class cost of service model.

e Review the consistency of CKY’s current cost of service results with its previous filings
and examine the underlying factors related to any identified disparities.

e Recommend and test alternative cost allocation methodologies against class rate of
return results.

e Prepare expert testimony in support of the selected cost of service approach.

Task 3 - Develop Rate Design by Customer Class

Utilizing the class cost of service along with other relevant non-cost factors, Atrium will
prepare a proposed revenue allocation and rate design for each of CKY’s classes of service.
Atrium will be responsible for performing the following tasks:

e Serve as a Subject Matter Expert (SME), provide overall strategic guidance and
specific recommendations.

e Distribute CKY’s proposed revenue increase among its classes of service. We will
evaluate and reflect considerations such as the cost of service by class, the customer

Page 2 of 6
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billing class rate impacts, market conditions in CKY’s service territory and historical
rate perspectives.

e Combine allocated costs, billing units, and bill frequency data to evaluate rate design
alternatives for proper economic price signals, margin stability, and reasonable
customer bill impacts.

o Develop the specific rate-related elements of CKY’s rate proposals, including any
desired changes to rate class changes, separate unit charges, rate levels, unbundled
and ancillary service options, and terms and conditions of service.

e Prepare expert testimony in support of the selected revenue allocation and rate
design.

Task 4 - Prepare Minimum Standard Filing Requirement (MSFR)

Atrium will prepare all the required minimum filing requirement schedules related to the cost
of service and rate design to meet the KPSC requirements in the required formats.

Task 5 - Post Filing Support

In the post-filing phase, Atrium will perform the following services, as needed:

e Respond to KPSC and Intervenor interrogatories within required time frames.
e Prepare rebuttal testimony responding to Intervenor testimony.
e Assist with the development of data requests and cross-examination questions of
the intervenors’ testimony.
e Participate in witness preparation sessions.
e Provide expert testimony before the commission.
e Participate and support settlement discussions, as needed.
e Assist with the drafting of briefs.
e Review and provide comments on the proposed order, as needed.
e Review and provide comments on the Commission’s order, as needed.
e Provide support for the Compliance Filing, as needed.
e Provide electronic files (e.g., Microsoft Excel) of all models.
e Support efforts on rehearing, as needed.
e Definitions. Any additional Definitions not defined in the Agreement?
Owner for the purposes of this SOW shall mean Owner, Owner Project Manager or their
designee)

2 Project Deliverables

# | Deliverable Responsible Acceptance Accepting | Due Milestone
name and | Party Criteria Party Date Payment
description

1 | Complete the | Consultant Review and | NiSource | 3/22/24
Cost of Service approval at the | Project
Study , sole discretion | Manager
including all of the NiSource
necessary Project
subsidiary Manager

Page 3 of 6
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special studies,

to be provided

to NiSource in

Excel format

Finalize Rate | Consultant Review and | NiSource | 3/29/24

Design, to approval at the | Project

include setting sole discretion | Manager

rates for all of the NiSource

classes and to Project

be provided to Manager

NiSource in

Excel format

Finalize  Min. | Consultant Review and | NiSource | 4/17/24

Std. Filing approval at the | Project

Requirements sole discretion | Manager

relating to the of the NiSource

Cost of Service Project

Study and Rate Manager

Design, to be

provided to

NiSource in

Excel format

Direct Consultant Review and | NiSource | 4/17/24

Testimony. to approval at the | Project

include exhibits sole discretion | Manager

and of the NiSource

workpapers Project

and to be Manager

provided to

NiSource in

Word format

Post Filing | Consultant Review and | NiSource | As

Support, (see approval at the | Project mutually

Task for sole discretion | Manager | agreed

details) of the NiSource upon by

Project both
Manager parties
Total: See

Section 6
below

3 Meetings & Reports

4

Consultant and Owner shall meet as necessary to perform the Services.

Tools

Consultant requires continuing access to Owner’s Regulatory Case Management Database
(“The Tool”).

Page 4 of 6
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5 Resource Table

This section must specify any Consultant personnel who are deemed by Owner to be essential
to the Consultant's performance of this SOW.

Name Role Hourly Rate
Ron Amen Managing Partner $425
John Taylor Managing Partner $425
Greg Macias Managing Consultant | $390

Julie Lieberman | Managing Consultant | $390
Svetlana Atoyan | Senior Consultant $350

Chris Hutchinson | Consultant $300
Kara Hounam Consultant $300
Dylan Spreer Senior Analyst $245
Cody Kleckley Senior Analyst $245
TBD Analyst $205
Jordan Flaagan Project Assistant $100

6 Fees for Services, Not-to-Exceed Amount

Fees for the pre-filing tasks within this SOW shall not exceed $157,250, unless authorized in
writing by Owner in advance. Post filing fees shall be billed according to the rates in the above
Resource Table. Post filing fees shall not exceed $80,000 without written approval from Owner
in advance. The overall fees for this SOW shall not exceed $237,250.00 without prior written
approval from Owner in advance.

7 Reimbursement of Expenses

In addition to the not-to-exceed amount, Consultant shall be reimbursed at cost for fully
documented, reasonable travel and living expenses. Reasonable travel and living expenses
include airfare, meals, and accommodations. Other reasonable expenses may be reimbursed
at cost by Owner, but these other expenses must be approved in advance by Owner.
Consultant must follow the policies outlined in the Owner Travel Policy which can be made
available upon request. Expenses as described in this paragraph shall not exceed 10% unless
authorized in writing by Owner in advance.

8 Change Orders

In case either party desires Services beyond those outlined in this Statement of Work,
Consultant will estimate the time and cost of those needs and communicate that to Owner. If
Owner agrees to those additions, a project change request will be written and agreed to by
both parties and an appropriate amendment to this SOW will be executed between the
parties in advance of any additional Services to be performed.

Consultant acknowledges that the Services set forth in this SOW shall be subject to and
governed by all terms and conditions of the Agreement. Undefined terms used herein shall have
the meaning as set forth in the Agreement. Facsimile, electronic mail and pdf signatures to this
SOW shall be as legally binding and considered in all manner and respects as original signatures.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Consultant and Owner have caused this SOW to be executed by their
duly authorized representatives as of the Effective Date.

Page 5 of 6
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Accepted and Agreed to: Accepted and Agreed to:

NISOURCE CORPORATE CONSULTANT

SERVICES COMPANY

DocuSigned by: [Docu3|gned by

By —[040A037682DF4E4 —_— By _— 26264310D446458...
Jennifer Shikany John Taylor

Name: Name:

Title: VP, Rates & Regulatory Stratﬁgg: Managing Partner
1/19/2024 1/19/2024

Date: /19/ Date:

Page 6 of 6
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STATEMENT OF WORK NO. CW2013678
between
NiSource Corporate Services Company
and
Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC
to
Independent Contractor Agreement No. CW1996701

Project Title: Columbia Gas of Kentucky 2024 Rate Case

Owner Project Manager: Julie Wozniak
Telephone Number: (614) 403 4125

E-Mail: jcwozniak@nisource.com

Consultant Project Manager: Vincent V. Rea
Telephone Number: (910) 639-6994
E-Mail: RegulatoryFinanceAssociates@gmail.com

Term: This Statement of Work No.1 (“SOW?”) is entered into as of January 9, 2024 (“Effective
Date”), by and between Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC (“Consultant”) and NiSource
Corporate Services Company (“Owner”).

The Consultant shall perform the Services in accordance with this SOW. This SOW is governed
by and subject to Independent Contractor Agreement No. CW 1996701, dated February 10, 2021,
as amended December 15, 2023 (the “Agreement”). This SOW shall be effective until December
31, 2024.

1 Scope of the Services

a Project Description Summary.

In connection with Columbia Gas of Kentucky's (“CKY” or the “Company”’) 2024 base rate
proceeding, CKY is seeking to engage an expert witness to sponsor direct and rebuttal testimony
and supporting quantitative analyses concerning CKY’s cost of equity, overall fair rate of return,
and appropriate ratemaking capital structure. The Company will be filing its 2024 rate case with
the Kentucky Public Service Commission during early-May 2024. As part of that filing, Regulatory
Finance Associates, LLC will provide the Company with support relating to CKY’s proposed cost of
equity, overall fair rate of return, embedded cost of debt, and ratemaking capital structure. The
professional services that RFA will provide in connection with this engagement are expected to be
provided over a twelve month period spanning between January 2024 and December 2024.

b Key Business Objectives.
Expert witness testimony in support of CKY’s 2024 rate case filing.
¢ Scope of the Services to be performed.

The quantitative analyses and pre-filed direct testimony that Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC
will prepare in support of the Company’s rate proceeding will be fully comprehensive in nature, thus

Page 1 of 4
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ensuring the statistical reliability of the analyses and ultimate recommendations. In addition to
conducting the traditional quantitative evaluations of the various cost of equity analytical models,
the analyses will also include an evaluation of three separate proxy groups to enhance the
statistical reliability of the analytical results, a comprehensive comparative risk assessment
comparing the risk profile of the Company to the three respective proxy groups, as well as an
evaluation of the regulatory mechanisms that are utilized by the utility proxy group companies,
which may have some bearing on the comparative risk assessment.

A considerable amount of rate case activity usually occurs after the filing of direct testimony and
the case-in-chief. Additional time is typically required for responding to interrogatories, reviewing
and analyzing the cost of capital testimony of multiple opposing witnesses, conducting additional
research and developing counter-arguments to the testimony of the opposing witnesses (as
appropriate), drafting/preparing rebuttal testimony and all associated tables and supporting
exhibits, preparing for and attending evidentiary hearings for purposes of cross-examination,
assisting legal counsel in the preparation of legal briefs, and participating in settlement negotiations
(as required).

d Approach. How will the actual work be accomplished?

Vincent V. Rea, who serves as Managing Director of Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC will be
the Project Manager and shall be responsible for the work activities outlined above.

e Definitions. Any additional Definitions note defined in the Agreement (Owner for
the purposes of this SOW shall mean Owner, Owner Project Manager or their designee)

2 Project Deliverables

This section should list all Deliverables and specific dates when the Consultant is to deliver the
following or clearly set forth the performance milestones:

# | Deliverable name and description Responsible Party Due Date
1 Complete all cost of capital quantitative Consultant 2/29/2024
evaluations, comparative risk assessments, and
evaluation of the regulatory mechanisms
employed by the proxy group companies vs.
CKY.
2 | Develop and present ROE and overall fair rate Consultant 2/29/2024
of return recommendations to the CKY rate
case team.
3 | Direct Testimony Development (final draft) Consultant 4/17/2024
4 | Direct Testimony Completion and Filing Consultant 5/6/2024
5 | Post-Filing Support as outlined in Section 1(c)
above. Consultant TBD
6 | Participate in weekly rate case meetings. Consultant TBD

Page 2 of 4
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3 Meetings & Reports

This section is to be used to identify the purpose and frequency of meetings and reports. For
meetings, define who is required to attend, when meetings will be held on a regular basis, and
when and how special meetings are to be convened. Identify when the Consultant is to provide
status reports on the deliverables in terms of Not-To-Exceed Amounts and schedules per the
Project Plan.

Consultant and Owner shall meet as necessary to perform the required Services.
4 Tools

Identify any and all tools that Owner must provide for Consultant’s use in performing the SOW
and any tools that the Consultant will provide for its own use in performing the SOW.

Consultant requires continuing access to Owner’'s Regulatory Case Management Database
currently residing in Lotus Notes. To complete the work activities, Consultant shall also require
Owner’'s support with regard to securing copies of the Company’s historical financial
statements (both GAAP and FERC Form 2 financial statements) and other financial and
operating data (as required).

5 Resource Table

This section must specify any Consultant personnel who are deemed by Owner to be essential
to the Consultant's performance of this SOW.

Name Role Hourly Rate

Vincent V. Rea Managing Director $260 (up until the expiration date of
ICA Amendment No. 2, which is
February 9, 2024).

$270 (beginning as of the effective
date of ICA Amendment No. 3,
which is February 10, 2024).

6 Fees for Services, Not-to-Exceed Amount

Part A. The Consultant’s fees for all pre-filing work activities as described in Section 1(c) shall
not exceed $45,000, unless authorized in writing by Owner in advance. Owner agrees that it
shall not unreasonably withhold such written authorization in the event that the project work
requirements exceed those contemplated within this SOW.

Part B. The Consultant’s fees for post-filing work activities shall be billed on a time and material
basis in accordance with the hourly rates reflected in the above Resource Table (Section 5).
The post-filing fees shall not exceed $45,000 unless authorized in writing by Owner in advance.
Owner agrees that it shall not unreasonably withhold such written authorization in the event
that the project work requirements within the Scope of Services identified in Section 1(c)
exceed those contemplated within this SOW, and further agrees that such additional work
requirements shall not constitute a Change Order as contemplated in Section 8 below.

Page 3 of 4
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7 Reimbursement of Expenses

In addition to the not-to-exceed amount, Consultant shall be reimbursed at cost for fully
documented, reasonable travel and living expenses. Reasonable travel and living expenses
include airfare, meals, and accommodations. Other reasonable expenses may be reimbursed
at cost by Owner, but these other expenses must be approved in advance by Owner.
Consultant must follow the policies outlined in the Owner Travel Policy which can be made
available upon request. Expenses as described in this paragraph shall not exceed $3,000,
unless authorized in writing by Owner in advance.

8 Change Orders

In case either party desires Services beyond those outlined in this Statement of Work,
Consultant will estimate the time and cost of those needs and communicate that to Owner. If
Owner agrees to those additions, a project change request will be written and agreed to by
both parties and an appropriate amendment to this SOW will be executed between the parties
in advance of any additional Services to be performed.

Consultant acknowledges that the Services set forth in this SOW shall be subject to and governed
by all terms and conditions of the Agreement. Undefined terms used herein shall have the meaning
as set forth in the Agreement. Facsimile, electronic mail and pdf signatures to this SOW shall be
as legally binding and considered in all manner and respects as original signatures.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, Consultant and Owner have caused this SOW to be executed by their
duly authorized representatives as of the Effective Date.

Accepted and Agreed to: Accepted and Agreed to:
NISOURCE CORPORATE REGULATORY FINANCE ASSOCIATES, LLC
SERVICES COMPANY

DocuSigned by:

o 1RO | Vincnt fea

040A037682DF4E4... 853D11F7576C4ES6...

i i vincent Rea
Name:]enmfer Shikany Name:

Title: VP, Rates & Regulatory Strategy Title Managing Director

1/23/2024
Date: /23/ Date: 1/23/2024
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‘ .
A GAN N ETT s:::;:::::l:rr::r:(gate Consultants, LLC
F L E M I N G Corporate Headquarters

207 Senate Avenue
Camp Hill, PA 17011
P 717.763.7211 | F 717.763.8150

gannettfleming.com

October 20, 2023

Via E-Mail at: jshikany@nisource.com

Ms. Jennifer Shikany

Assistant Controller

NiSource - Columbia Gas of Kentucky, Inc.
801 E. 86" Avenue

Merrillville, IN 46410

Dear Jenn:

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC is pleased to submit this
engagement letter to NiSource to conduct a depreciation study of the gas plant of
Columbia Gas of Kentucky (CGK) as of October 31, 2023 and a forecasted test year study
as of December 31, 2025.

The 2023 depreciation study will include seven major tasks up to the date of filing
with the Kentucky Public Service Commission (KPSC). Once the depreciation studies are
filed, we will prepare testimony and respond to any data requests from the KPSC. The
following scope of services sets forth our depreciation study work plan.

Task 1. Data Assembly and Review. We have prepared a written data requirements
list for CGK personnel to use in assembling the needed data for the study which we will
send to initiate the project. The list specifies the data to be obtained for each plant
account and the manner in which the data are to be transmitted to Gannett Fleming. The
required data will be for the years 2021 through October 2023 in order to update from
our last study. The data requirements also request data for the period November 2023
through year end 2025.

The assembled data will be reviewed by our staff and a “post audit” computer
program for control and logic. Irregular or unusual entries will be identified and reviewed
with CGK personnel to determine their circumstances and whether they require
adjustment. Large retirements also will be identified and explanations as to the cause of
such retirements will be requested.

| 1



KY PSC Case No. 2024-00092

Staff 1-14

Attachment C

" GANNETT Page 12 of 319
A) FLEMING

Task 2. Statistical Analyses of Data. The data assembled and reviewed in Task 1
will be analyzed for historical indications of service life using the retirement rate method.

Trends in average service life and survivor curve shape will be identified through
the use of experience band analyses with the retirement rate model. Experience bands
will identify the impact of economic and technological cycles on the service life of
property groups. The selection of the bands for analysis will be based on a review of
annual addition and retirement levels, a multiple original group life table, and preliminary
discussions with operating management related to changes in materials used in
construction, changes in installed technology and major retirement programs.

Annual gross salvage and cost of removal will be expressed as percents of the
related retirements for all accounts, as appropriate. Moving averages will be used to
smooth the annual fluctuations.

Task 3. Field Review and Management Conferences. A field review will include
visits to representative town border stations, measuring and regulating stations, service
centers and office buildings. Sites will be determined based on location and change since
the last study. The purpose of the inspections will be to obtain information related to the
operation and condition of the property.

During these visits, we also will meet with appropriate personnel to obtain
additional information related to the outlook for the property. The results of the statistical
analyses conducted in Task 2, the typical range of lives and salvage used in the industry,
and our general experience, will be reviewed with these personnel as a basis for
forecasting future survivor and net salvage characteristics. The discussion will focus on
the past forces of retirement which produced the historical indications and the extent to
which future forces such as economic, technological, physical and environmental, will
result in future lives and net salvage values that differ from the past.

Task 4. Preliminary Service Life and Net Salvage Estimates. Preliminary estimates
of average service lives, type survivor curves and net salvage percents will be made on
the basis of the statistical analyses, observed conditions at the time of the field review,
the discussions with management related to outlook and the typical range of lives used
in the gas utility industry. Calculations of annual and accrued depreciation will be
performed. The calculations may include scenarios that realign plant assets and the
accumulated depreciation based on procedures.
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Task 5. Presentation to Management. The results of the depreciation calculations
and the bases for such calculations will be presented to management to ensure that the
results are in accordance with management’s capital recovery policies and outlook.

Task 6. Final Estimates and Calculations. Final calculations of depreciation accrual

rates by account will be performed in order to reflect appropriate modifications as
determined during the review with management.

Task 7. Draft and Final Report. A draft report for each test year will be prepared
for review by management. Each report will include an introduction, a description of the
methods used in the statistical analyses and depreciation calculations, a narrative
discussion of the factors considered in the estimation of service life and net salvage
including the content of the account, the statistical support for the estimates, and the
summary and detailed tabulations of depreciation by account. After review, comment
and discussion, final reports will be prepared and submitted to management prior to the
April 2024 filing date.

Our overall estimate of cost to complete both test year studies will approximate
$60,000.

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC proposes to perform the
previously-described services, and other related services which you may authorize, on the
basis of hourly billing rates in effect at the time the work is performed for our personnel,
plus reimbursement of direct expenses.

Direct expenses include expenditures such as transportation, board and lodging,
incidental expenses incurred while working at the client’s location, and any other expenses
required by virtue of the assignment and not incidental to the normal conduct of business.

The amount of time required to complete studies varies widely, depending on
factors such as availability of basic data, the extent to which assistance is provided by
utility personnel and the complexity of the utility being studied. The estimated costs
exclude charges for work subsequent to the completion of the final reports, such as work
in connection with a proceeding before a regulatory body.
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If you have questions pertaining to our cost estimate or tasks in performing
depreciation studies, please do not hesitate to contact me at 717-886-5721 or via email
at jspanos@gfnet.com.

Very truly yours,

GANNETT FLEMING VALUATION
AND RATE CONSULTANTS, LLC

il ) fponen

JOHN J. SPANOS
President

JJS:mle

NiSource accepts the foregoing Proposal and authorizes Gannett Fleming
Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC to proceed with the services described herein.

ACCEPTED B

Jennifer L. Shikany

(Signatuvre) u (Printed Name)

VP, Rates & Regulatory Strategy 12/7/2023

(Title) (Date)

| 4
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| Requisition Creation/Extension Approval Form || R
iSource
Job Information:
Date: [10/4/2023 |  Requestor: [ramaleh Shaeffer |
Temporary Workers Name Wonica Easter l
Requisition # I: Location: I_ Columbus Arena/Remote ]

New Position [0 Replacementfor Req# [J Extension
Project Name & ScopalDescription _

CKY and CVA Rate Case Activities

Business Rationale & Length of Engagement
Monica will provide support for Columbia Gas of Kentucky and Columbia Gas of Virginia rate case preparation, filing, discovery responses and other
regulatory related tasks. Initial engagement length - November 1, 2023 - July 31, 2024.

iﬂwm APPROVALS: —

Please Indicate below approvals Included.

[ Supervisor or Manager Tamaleh Shaeffer

[J One Level Up ﬂ ﬁld&/ Sf’lm Paula Strauss

OVve @‘m ; D Jennifer Shikany

-
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