

INVOICE

Date: October 1, 2023	Invoice #: 230904		
Client:	Project:		
Taylor County RECC P. O. Box 100 Campbellsville, KY 42719	2021 Rate Filing Case No. 2023-00147		
Attn: Patsy Walters	For Services Provided in September 2023		

#	Item	Description	Qty	Rate	Amt
1	Consulting Services	John Wolfram – consulting support for 2021 rate review. Prepare/review responses to data requests. Hearing preparation. Emails and calls with staff on same.	17.0 hours	\$225.00	\$ 3,825.00
2	Mileage	9/25 Travel to Lexington	156.0	\$0.655	\$ 102.18
				TOTAL	\$ 3,927.18

Please remit payment to Catalyst Consulting LLC as noted above. Thank you.

#3129 183.00 OTSD ØS SERVICES PROVIDED IN SEP 2023



L. Aliyson Honaker aliyson@hioky.com (859) 368-8803 (office) (859)396-3172 (mobile)

1795 Alysheba Way, Ste 6202 Lexington, KY 40509

> October 03, 2023 Invoice No. 509

Taylor County RECC Mr. Jeff Williams PO Box 100 Campbellsville, KY 42718

Client Number:07340Taylor County RECCMatter07340-0002Taylor County RECC- 2023 RateFor Services Rendered Through 9/30/2023.

Fees				
<u>Date</u> 9/1/2023	<u>Timekeeper</u> LAH	Description Prepare responses to fourth data requests for electronic filing; electronically file same.	<u>Hours</u> 0.40	<u>Amount</u> \$100.00
9/7/2023	ВНК	Meeting with P. Walters, J. Williams, J. Wolfram, A. Honaker for witness preparation for the hearing on 9-17, preparation for meeting and follow-up discussion with A. Honaker re: prep of witness binders.	2.60	\$650.00
9/7/2023	LAH	Prepare for and take notes on items to stress for hearing prep; participate in virtual meeting with J. Williams, et. al. re hearing preparation; separate meeting with B. Koenig re witness prep binders and preparing same.	2.80	\$700.00
9/7/2023	LAH	Review corrected response spreadsheets to file from P. Walters.	0.20	\$50.00
9/8/2023	LAH	Review emails from J. Wolfram, et. al. re updated ask after accepting some AG recommendations; review multiple emails from P. Walters, et. al. re corrected spreadsheets to file; review corrected spreadsheets.	0.80	\$200.00

Continued On Next Page

Client Number: Matter Number:	07340 07340-0002			10/3/2023 Page: 2
9/8/2023	LAH	Review email and first draft of rebuttal testimony of J. Wolfram; office conference wth B. Koenig re same.	0.60	\$150.00
9/8/2023	ВНК	Discussion with A. Honaker re: correction of filed spreadsheets, emails with P. Walters re: confidentiality.	0.50	\$125.00
9/9/2023	LAH	Review email from P. Walters and corrected AG response from P. Walters.	0.30	\$75.00
9/11/2023) LAH	Review emails and draft rebuttal testimony of J. Williams; conference with B. Koenig re same.	0.70	\$175.00
9/12/2023	BHK.	Drafted Notice of Corrected Responses, cover letter, confirmed filings with P. Walters, and filed Notice, cover letter, and two excel spreadsheets through the electronic filing system at Public Service Commission.	1.40	\$350.00
9/12/2023	LAH	Review corrected responses to data requests to file; conference with B. Koenig re filing same.	0.40	\$100.00
9/13/2023	BHK	Review and edit of Williams Rebuttal. Multiple emails re: rebuttal from A. Honaker, J. William, J.Wolfram.	1.20	\$300.00
9/13/2023	LAH	Review and edit rebuttal testimony; exchange emails with team re same; conference with B. Koenig re same.	1.00	\$250.00
9/14/2023	ВНК	Review emails, and discussion with A. Honaker re: J. Wolfram rebuttal testimony, Review attorney general filed comments. Emails with team discussing issues to cover in rebuttal.	2.10	\$525.00
9/14/2023	LAH	Review multiple emails re rebuttal testimony; review final versions of Wolfram and Williams rebuttal testimony and exhibits to J. Wolfram rebuttal; multiple conferences with B. Koenig re same.	1.90	\$475.00
9/15/2023	ВНК	Rebuttal Testimony of J. Wolfram, J. Williams, exhibits, final review, discussion with A. Honaker. Emails with comments on final review.	0.80	\$200.00
9/15/2023	LAH	Make final revisions to rebuttal testimony; send final version to team for review; review multiple emails re same; draft cover letter for filing; prepare for electronic filing and electronically file same.	1,00	\$250.00
9/18/2023	BHK	Hearing Prep-emails with Commission Staff, Attorney General's office and discussion with A. Honaker Re: hearing, exhibits.	0.50	\$125.00

Continued On Next Page

Client Number: Matter Number:	07340 07340-0002			10/3/2023 Page: 3
9/18/202	23 LAH	Exchange emails with H. Temple, et. al. re any exhibits to use at hearing.	0.20	\$50.00
9/19/202	BHK	Review of filed public comments entered by PSC.	0.50	\$125.00
9/19/202	3 LAH	Review multiple public comments filed into record,	0.70	\$175.00
9/20/202	3 BHK	Witness preparation, review of file testimony and issues from repeat data requests from PSC and AG.	2.30	\$575.00
9/20/202	3 BHK	Review PSC ORder re: Confidentiality.	0.30	\$75.00
9/20/202	3 LAH	Review Commission's Order granting confidential treatment; review emails from team re same.	0.40	\$100.00
9/21/202	3 BHK	Review of responses and rebuttal testimony in preparation for hearing.	1.90	\$475.00
9/21/202	3 LAH	Exchange emails with H. Temple, et. al. re updates to hearing exhibits.	0.10	\$25.00
9/23/202	3 LAH	Begin review of case file to prepare for hearing.	1.90	\$475.00
9/24/202	3 BHK	Review health insurance benefits for state from J. Wolfram and Taylor Responses for hearing prep.	0.40	\$100.00
9/24/202	3 LAH	Continue review of case file and notes to prepare for hearing; draft questions/notes for P. Walters and J. Wolfram.	3.50	\$875.00
9/24/202	3 LAH	Exchange emails with P. Walters re AG 2-58 part c not filed; review filing; review emails; draft updated AG 2-58; draft cover letter; prepare for electronic filing; electronically file same.	0.40	\$100.00
9/25/202	3 LAH	Prepare for and participate in witness preparation meeting with J. Williams, et.al.	4.00	\$1,000.00
9/25/2023	BHK	Prepare for and participate in witness preparation meeting for hearing prep with J. Williams, P. Walters, J. Wolfram.	4.00	\$1,000.00
9/26/2023	3 LAH	Travel to and from Frankfort for public comment hearing; attend hearing; telephone conference with J. Williams re same; conference with B. Koenig re same.	2.20	\$0.00 N/C
9/26/2023	B LAH	Review multiple public comments filed in the record.	0.40	\$100.00
9/26/2023	B LAH	Review email and attachment from P. Walters re PSC response 4-12.	0.10	\$25.00

Continued On Next Page

Client Number: Matter Number:	07340 07340-0002			10/3/2023 Page: 4
9/28/202	23 LAH	Review rate case expense information from P. Walters; prepare documents for filing; draft cover letter; electronically file same.	0.40	\$100.00
9/28/202	23 BHK	Review PSC Order re: confidentiality and public comments re: rate case.	0.40	\$100.00
9/29/202	3 BHK	Review emails from P. Walters, A. Honaker re: rate case expense, RUS loans. Call from utility other attorney for title searches. Review notes on witness prep. Discussion with A. Honaker re: hearing preparation.	0.60	\$150.00
9/29/202	3 BHK	Review PSC Order re: confidentiality.	0.30	\$75.00
9/29/202	3 BHK	Multiple emails re: witness order and hearing procedure from A. Goad, PSC Staff.	0.30	\$75.00
		Billable Hours / Fees:	42.30	\$10,575.00

Timekeeper Summary

Timekeeper LAH worked 22.20 hours at \$250.00 per hour, totaling \$5,550.00.

Timekeeper LAH worked 2.20 hours at no charge.

Timekeeper BHK worked 20.10 hours at \$250.00 per hour, totaling \$5,025.00.

Current Invoice Summary

Prior Balance:	\$10,375:00-72	
Payments Received:	\$0.00	
Unpaid Prior Balance:	\$10,375.00 P2 9/28/23	cK ± 106 09
Current Fees:	\$10,575.00	
Advanced Costs:	\$0.00	
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE:	-\$20,950.00 h,575.00	

Thank You for Letting Us Serve You. Payment Due Upon Receipt.

0	1#8056		
Rect	DRON OTSDOI		
Price & Ext	ptr 497 2000		
Postod	4001 No. 183.00		
Appreved	2023 General	Rate	Case
Check No . (Jana an a		