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Well, I have a letter here from Madison with bookkeeping. She has put in the letter that we do
not get charged anything. However, it seems to be inconsistent on what we do get charged. We
get $5 charges on most, but not all returned checks/ACHs. She said going forward we will not
be charged this fee. Therefore, I am assuming we do not need to be charging the customers a
fee now.

Here is the attached letter from Madison.

Thanks!

On Fri, Feb 3, 2023 at 3:14 PM Sarah Price <sarahbcwd@gmail.com> wrote:
I am having the bank type a letter up. Should have it by the end of the day today.

On Tue, Jan 31, 2023 at 4:15 PM Holly Nicholas <hnicholas@kyengr.com> wrote:

How much does the District’s bank charge for a returned check?

 

 

Holly Nicholas

Kentucky Engineering Group, PLLC

P.O. Box 1034

Versailles, KY 40383

Office: 859.251.4127

Office Fax: 859.251.4137

Cell: 859.333.9742

e-mail: hnicholas@kyengr.com

www.kyengr.com

 
Notice:  The information contained in this communication is privileged and confidential. 
It is intended only for the recipient named above.  If you have received this
communication in error, please contact the sender at (859) 251-4127 and delete this
message from your system.
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