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SOUTH KENTUCKY RECC 

PSC CASE NO. 2021-00407 

FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION RESPONSE 

COMMISSION STAFF’S FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION—11/29/21 

REQUEST 37 

RESPONSIBLE PERSON:  Michelle Herrman 

COMPANY:    South Kentucky RECC 

Request 37.  Provide a running total of the following information concerning the cost of 

preparing this case: 

Request 37c.  Provide monthly updates of the actual costs incurred in conjunction with 

this rate case, reported in the manner requested in (a) above. Updates will be due when the utility 

files its monthly financial statements with the Commission, through the month of the public 

hearing. 

Response 37c.  Please see attached for the monthly updates.  One attachment is an Excel 

spreadsheet and is being uploaded into the Commission’s electronic filing system separately. 

Please note that South Kentucky has agreed in its post-hearing brief that employee time should 

not be  recovered as a rate case expense so any entries for employee time are for tracking 

purposes only.



ATTORNEYS AT LAW ! PLLC 

Mr. Ken Simmons 
President & CEO 
South Kentucky RECC 
P. 0. Box 910
Somerset, KY 42501

Re: April 1, 2022 to April 30, 2022 

Dear Ken: 

May 11, 2022 

Mark David Goss 

mdgoss@gosssamfordlaw.com 
(859) 368-7740

Please find enclosed the invoices for legal services performed by Goss Samford, PLLC on 
behalf of South Kentucky RECC for the period April 1, 2022 to April 30, 2022. Please remit 
payment for the amount due within thirty days of today's date. A summary of the amount due 
and owing is as follows: 

Matter Description 

-2021 General Rate Adjustment
-Prior
-Current

TOTAL: 

Amount 

$0.00 
$33,277.60 

Should you have any questions, please contact me at your convenience. Once again, it is a 
privilege to represent South Kentucky RECC and we thank you for allowing us the opportunity to 
work with you. 

Enclosures 

Sincerely, 

�: 
Mark David Goss 

2365 Harrodsburg Road, Suite B-325 I Lexington, Kentucky 40504 
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Mr. Ken Simmons 
President/ CEO 

South Kentucky RECC 

P.O. Box 910 

Somerset, KY 42501 

Client Number: 7100 South Kentucky RECC 

Goss Samford, PLLC 

Suite B-325 
2365 Harrodsburg Road 

Lexington, KY 40504 

Telephone: 859-368-7740 

Matter 1610 SKRECC - 2021 General Rate Adjustment 

For Services Rendered Through 4/30/2022. 

Date 

4/1/2022 

4/1/2022 

4/4/2022 

4/4/2022 

4/4/2022 

4/4/2022 

Timekeeper 

LAH 

MDG 

LAH 

LAH 

LAH 

LAH 

Fees 

Description 

Review AG's responses to Commission Staffs 
data requests; review and analyze AG's 
responses to SKRECC's data requests. 

Receipt and review of AG's responses to PSC 
Staff and SKRECC Information Requests 
transmitted by email by A. Goad, OAG 
counsel. 

Exchange emails with A. Baldwin re monthly 
updates to file; review documents provided by 
A. Baldwin re same; draft verification for M.
Hemnan and exchange emails re same;
compile and format responses; email responses
to A. Baldwin and M. Herrman for review.

Review and analyze Staffs Fourth DRs; review 
emails from M. Herrman, et. al. re witness 
assignments and questions regarding requests; 
email team re same; review multiple emails 
from M. Herrman, et. al. re timing of Order. 

Exchange emails with M. Herrman re 
attachments to be amended pursuant to denial 
of confidential treatment; review information 
provided by M. Herrman re same. 

Review emails re publishing notice of hearing 
from M. Herrman, et. al. 

Continued On Next Page 

Hours 

1.00 

1.40 

0.80 

0.60 

0.20 

0.10 

May 06, 2022 

Invoice No. 6268 

Amount 

$265.00 

$441.00 

$212.00 

$159.00 

$53.00 

$26.50 
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Client Number: 7100 5/6/2022 
Matter Number: 1610 Page: 2 

4/4/2022 MDG Receipt and review of PSC Staffs Fourth 0.50 $157.50 
Information Requests; transmit link to same to 
rate case team; email exchange with A. 
Honaker re need to prepare response template 
for rate case team. 

4/4/2022 MDG Email exchanges with M. Herrman re PSC 0.70 $220.50 
DR-04-l c.; prepare draft response to same and 
transmit by email. 

4/4/2022 MDG Email exchanges with M. Herrman re hearing 0.40 $126.00 
notice publication, potential rates-effective 
date, suspension deadline and similar 
procedural matters. 

4/5/2022 LAH Review email and revised spreadsheets from A. 0.40 $106.00 
Baldwin for montly updates; review email and 
suggested edit from M. Herrman; edit 
document; draft cover letter; prepare 
documents for electronic filing; electronically 
file same. 

4/5/2022 LAH Draft template for data request responses; draft 0.90 $238.50 
verifications for same. 

4/5/2022 LAH Review email from M. Herrman re draft 0.40 $106.00 
rebuttal testimony; begin review and analyze 
attached draft rebuttal testimony. 

4/5/2022 LAH Review emails from M. Herrman and W. 0.10 $26.50 
Seelye re rebuttal testimony. 

4/5/2022 MDG Receipt and review of draft template for 0.30 $94.50 
insertion ofresponses to PSC Fourth 
Information Request transmitted by A. 
Honaker. 

4/5/2022 MDG Receipt and review of draft responses to 0.40 $126.00 
ongoing supplemental rate case expense filing; 
review of'as-filed' version for accuracy. 

4/5/2022 MDG Receipt and review of initial drafts of rebuttal 1.30 $409.50 
testimony for S. Seelye and M. Herrman. 

4/5/2022 MDG Make search for Capita! Credits BOD 0.60 $189.00 
resolutions at M. Herrman's request for use in 
responses to PSC Staffs Fourth Information 
Requests; subsequent email exchanges with M. 
Herrman re same. 

4/6/2022 LAH Review emails from M. Goss, et. al., re hearing 0.20 $53.00 
preparation session. 

4/6/2022 LAH Exchange emails with N. Vinsel re 1.20 $318.00 
confidentiality order; continue revising 
SKRECC documents to relief pursuant to 
Order; email documents to M. Herrman for 
review; exchange emails with M. Herrman re 
same. 

Continued On Next Page 
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Client Number: 7100 5/6/2022 
Matter Number: 1610 Page: 3 

4/6/2022 MDG Coordinate rate case hearing preparation 0.50 $157.50 
session with rate case team; discussion of 
preparation of hearing notebooks and other 
materials for Client. 

4/7/2022 LAH Review and analyze testimony ofL. Kollen to 1.80 $477.00 
prepare for rebuttal testimony review; begin 
review of rebuttal testimony. 

4/7/2022 MDG Email exchange with J. Turpin re rate case 0.10 $31.50 
preparation notebooks for K. Simmons. 

4/8/2022 LAH Complete review of rebuttal testimony of M. 2.00 $530.00 
Herrman and S. Seelye; suggest edits re same; 
office conference with M. Goss re edits to 
rebuttal testimony and additional items needed. 

4/8/2022 LAH Review email and attached responses to data 0.40 $106.00 
requests from S. Seelye. 

4/8/2022 LAH Exchange emails with M. Herrman re revised 0.10 $26.50 
confidential documents pursuant to Order. 

4/8/2022 MDG Receipt and review of initial draft responses to 1.20 $378.00 
PSC Fourth Information Requests transmitted 
by S. Seelye. 

4/10/2022 MDG Receipt and review of current draft of S. Seelye 0.80 $252.00 
rebuttal testimony transmitted by S. Seelye. 

4/11/2022 LAH Insert revised confidential pages into large 0.80 $212.00 
original attachment to update pursuant to 
Commission's Order; draft cover letter; prepare 
large attachment for electronic filing; 
electronically file same; email confidential 
versions to PSC. 

4/11/2022 LAH Exchange emails with S. Seelye and M. 0.10 $26.50 
Herrman re verifications for rebuttal testimony. 

4/11/2022 LAH Begin printing and organizing for hearing prep 2.00 $530.00 
binders. 

4/11/2022 LAH Exchange emails with S. Seelye and M. 0.20 $53.00 
Herrman re verifications and rebuttal 
testimony. 

4/11/2022 MDG Telephone conference with S. Seelye re his 0.40 $126.00 
rebuttal testimony. 

4/11/2022 MDG Review of draft supplemental response to 0.80 $252.00 
PSC-DR-02-03 before filing; office 
conference with A. Honaker re same; review 
of'as-filed' version on PSC website for 
accuracy. 

Continued On Next Page 
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M 1 

The Sentinel-Echo 
P.0.Box 830 

London, KY 40743 - O'ir � o
(606) 878-7400 

Advertising Invoice and Statement 

11 Billina.Period 

APRIL 2022 

231" . - Total Amount Due .•. 

68.48 

211 · · .Curre:nt NetArhciunt Due 221 

68.48 

·4! Paae Number 51 Billino Date 

1 04/30/22 

81 -.. Billed Acc·outlt Narri9.and Address ·: .. •· 

SOUTH KY.RECC 

P.O. BOX 910 

SOMERSET,KY 

· . .. ,: 
" '' 

11)1 Date •-:111 Newspaper Referenc·e 
·. 

04/27 LEG SE 

Ill II IIIIII I Ill I IIIII Ill I Ill 
$33304797 

Ill I IIIIIII IIII IIIIIII Ill 
..... 043022 

I I 

42502 

12113]141 Descrlpticm-Ot_her Comments/Charges 

PREVIOUS BALANCE 

KPSC PUBLIC HEARING 

�Ml 

fr 

Statement of Account - Aging of Past Due Amounts 

211.: Curfent Net Arriount Due 221 · 30 DaYs .• 60 Davs 

68. 48 0.00 0.00 
. 

21 ·Advertiser/Cllent Name 

SOUTH KY.RECC 

•I •Un'api:,lied _Amount · 131 Terms of Payment 

I I NET 30 DAYS 

30 Davs 60 Davs Over 90 Davs 

0.00 0.00 0.00 

61 Billed Account Number 71 Advertiser/Client Number 

151 SAU Size 
161 Billed-Units 

. 

3x2.75 

8.25 

\'<\� ._._., 

Over 90 Davs 

0.00 

15634 15634 

91 Remittance Address 

THE SENTINEL ECHO 

123 WEST FIFTH STREET 

PO BOX 

LONDON 

171 Times Run 
.181 Rate 

1 

8.300 

3.33.0 1 

� . \"\� 

830 

KY 

40743 

191 Gross Amount 1201 Net Amount 
. 

0.00 

68.48 68.48 

.. '"\ "\ ., 

' . "\ ;l.., 'r; . oo . 

µJoi+ 6 l I .).-1 ).....)...... 

*Unaoolied.Amollnt 231 Total Amount Due 

68.48 

The Sentinel-Echo 
P.O. Box 830 

Acccunts 30 day a cld - charged 1 1/2% par month urvlca charge. ANNUAL RATE 18%. 

London, KY 40743 

(606) 878-7400

241· ln\/Oic8 Nurtlber · ·251 
11 

.. .. . Advertiser lnfonnatioil 
Billing Period •. 

2204015634 APRIL 2022 

. 

61 .. Billed Account Number 

15634 

• Unapplled amounts are Included in Total Amount Due 

.. .. 
.• 

. .•• •· 
.. 

7! Ad\lertiser/Client Number 21 Advertiser!Cllent.Name .• 

15634 SOUTH KY.RECC 
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COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY 

BEFORE THE PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 

In the Matter of: 

THE ELECTRONIC APPLICATION OF 
SOUTH KENTUCKY RURAL ELECTRIC 
COOPERATIVE CORPORATION FOR A 
GENERAL ADJUSTMENT OF RA TES, 
APPROVAL OF A DEPRECIATION STUDY, 
AND OTHER GENERAL RELIEF 

) 

) 

) 

) 
) 

) 

CASE NO. 
2021-00407 

VERIFICATION OF MICHELLE D. HERRMAN 

COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY ) 
) 

COUNTY OF PULASKI ) 

Michelle D. Herrman, Vice-President of Finance and Member Services of South Kentucky 
Rural Electric Cooperative Corporation, being duly sworn, states that she has supervised the 
preparation of the updates to Commission Staff's Request 1-37 pertaining to rate case expense in 
the above-referenced case and that the matters and things set forth therein are true and accurate to 
the best of her knowledge, infonnation and belief, fonned after reasonable inquiry. 

(Y) I� D. fi-<...AA.---­
Michelle D. Hernnan 

The foregoing Ve1ification was signed, acknowledged and sworn to before me this 31st 

day of May, 2022, by Michelle D. Henman. 
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