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Attorney at Law  

Professional Service Corporation  
124 West Todd Street  

Frankfort, Kentucky 40601 

Telephone: (502) 227-7270 jnhughes@johnnhughespsc.com 

February 17, 2022 

Linda C. Bridwell 
Executive Director 
Public Service Commission 
211 Sower Blvd. 
Frankfort, KY 40601 

Re: Atmos Energy Corporation 
Case No. 2021-00214 
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Case No. 2021-00214  
Atmos Energy Corporation, Kentucky Division  

Staff DR Set No. 1  
Question No. 1-12 Supplement 4  

Page 1 of 1 
 
REQUEST: 
 
Provide the following information concerning the costs for the preparation of this case: 
 
1. A detailed schedule of expenses incurred to date for the following categories: 
 

(1) Accounting; 
(2) Engineering; 
(3) Legal; 
(4) Consultants; and 
(5) Other Expenses (Identify separately). 

 
2. For each category identified in Item 12.a., the schedule should include the date of 

each transaction, check number or other document reference, the vendor, the hours 
worked, the rates per hour, amount, a description of the services performed, and the 
account number in which the expenditure was recorded. Provide copies of contracts 
or other documentation that support charges incurred in the preparation of this case. 
Identify any costs incurred for this case that occurred during the base period. 

 
3. An itemized estimate of the total cost to be incurred for this case. Expenses should be 

broken down into the same categories as identified in Item 12.a., with an estimate of 
the hours to be worked and the rates per hour. Include a detailed explanation of how 
the estimate was determined, along with all supporting workpapers and calculations. 

 
4. Provide monthly updates of the actual costs incurred in conjunction with this rate case, 

reported in the manner requested in Items 12.a. and 12.b., and a cumulative total of 
cost incurred to date for each category. Updates will be due when the utility files its 
monthly financial statements with the Commission, through the month of the public 
hearing. 

 
SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE: 
 
Please see supplemental Attachment 1 for an updated detailed schedule of rate case 
expenses incurred to date.  Please see supplemental Attachment 2 for the invoices. 

 
ATTACHMENT: 
 
ATTACHMENT 1 - Staff_1-12_Att1_Suppl4 - Rate Case Expenses through 2022-02-
17.xlsx, 1 Page. 
   
ATTACHMENT 2 – Staff_1-12_Att2_Suppl4 - Rate Case Expenses Invoices.pdf, 133 
Pages. 
 
 
Respondent:  Joe Christian 



CASE NO. 2021‐00214
ATTACHMENT 1

TO STAFF DR NO. 1‐12
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02‐17‐22)

Atmos Energy Corporation, Kentucky
Rate Case Expenses (050.55403)
Actuals Through February 17, 2022

Category Transaction Date Invoice Number Vendor Amount Hours Worked Hourly Rate FERC Account Expenditure Type Base Period Description
Consultants 10/31/2020 201003 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $1,072.50 5.5 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 10/31/2020 201003 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $21.45 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 11/30/2020 201103 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $4,095.00 21 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 11/30/2020 201103 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $81.90 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 12/31/2020 201203 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $2,925.00 15 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 12/31/2020 201203 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $58.50 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 01/31/2021 210103 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $1,755.00 6.5 270$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 01/31/2021 210103 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $3,607.50 18.5 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 01/31/2021 210103 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $107.25 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 02/28/2021 210203 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $3,105.00 11.5 270$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 02/28/2021 210203 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $2,973.75 15.25 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 02/28/2021 210203 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $121.58 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 03/31/2021 2'I0305 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $1,755.00 9 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 03/31/2021 2'I0305 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $455.00 6.5 70$                 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Elizabeth Watts
Consultants 03/31/2021 2'I0305 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $44.20 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 04/30/2021 210402 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $780.00 4 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 04/30/2021 210402 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $280.00 4 70$                 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Timothy Watson
Consultants 04/30/2021 210402 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $17.50 0.25 70$                 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Teresa Stewar
Consultants 04/30/2021 210402 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $21.55 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 05/31/2021 210503 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $1,350.00 5 270$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 05/31/2021 210503 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $2,827.50 14.5 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 05/31/2021 210503 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $35.00 0.5 70$                 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Teresa Stewar
Consultants 05/31/2021 210503 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $84.25 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 6/30/2021 210602 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $135.00 0.5 270$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 6/30/2021 210602 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $195.00 1 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 6/30/2021 210602 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $6.60 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 07/01/2021 I07012107KY RAAB PAUL H $11,700.00 36 325$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Cost of Service Study /Testimony/Workpapers - Paul Raa

Consultants 07/19/2021 150141135483 WILLIS TOWERS WATSON US LLC $6,413.18 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes
Annual pension cost by participant for Shared Services, Customer Service, and KY/Mid-State
employees

Other Expenses 07/21/2021 21072AAO KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICES $94,282.29 N/A N/A 9280 ADVERTISING Yes Required public notification of pending rate case to KY customer
Consultants 07/28/2021 019391 SCOTTMADDEN INC $7,245.00 21 345$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Dylan D'Ascendi
Consultants 07/28/2021 019391 SCOTTMADDEN INC $10,350.00 30 345$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Adam Perr
Consultants 07/28/2021 019391 SCOTTMADDEN INC $800.00 2.5 320$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Matthew Howar
Consultants 07/28/2021 019391 SCOTTMADDEN INC $1,200.00 8 150$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Isaac Gustafso
Consultants 07/28/2021 019391 SCOTTMADDEN INC $4,700.00 20 235$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Eric Brook
Other Expenses 08/16/2021 010_JOANNE.LANZ_AUG-21_PCARD BANK OF AMERICA $1,253.34 N/A N/A 9280 POSTAGE/DELIVERY SERVICE Yes FEDEX 92681521 - 21-JUL-21 - 800-4633339 - TN - 38116 - FBOPYMT92681521 PCE
Other Expenses 08/16/2021 010_JOANNE.LANZ_AUG-21_PCARD BANK OF AMERICA $346.41 N/A N/A 9280 POSTAGE/DELIVERY SERVICE Yes FEDEX 92922430 - 30-JUL-21 - MEMPHIS - TN - 38116 - EPAPYMT92922430 PCE
Other Expenses 08/16/2021 010_JOANNE.LANZ_AUG-21_PCARD BANK OF AMERICA $344.42 N/A N/A 9280 POSTAGE/DELIVERY SERVICE Yes FEDEX 92928106 - 30-JUL-21 - 800-4633339 - TN - 38116 - FBOPYMT92928106 PCE
Consultants 09/01/2021 INV090121 RAAB PAUL H $1,625.00 5 325$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Cost of Service Study Discovery - Paul Raa
Consultants 08/01/2021 210802 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $810.00 3 270$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 08/01/2021 210802 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $780.00 4 195$               9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Rhonda Watts
Consultants 08/01/2021 210802 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $31.80 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING Yes Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Other Expenses 09/27/2021 WEXP-00041277 Densman, Josh C (Josh) $12.00 N/A N/A 9280 OTHER EMPLOYEE EXPENSES Yes Legal Kentucky Rate Case Notary for Discovery Respons
Other Expenses 09/27/2021 WEXP-00041277 Densman, Josh C (Josh) $12.00 N/A N/A 9280 OTHER EMPLOYEE EXPENSES Yes Legal Kentucky Rate Case Notary for Discovery Respons
Legal 09/22/2021 09-22-2021 WILSON HUTCHINSON POTEAT & LITTLEPAGE $13,347.00 44.49 300 9280 LEGAL Yes Legal Representation - Review of testimony, discovery responses, et
Legal 09/15/2021 092021 JOHN N HUGHES PSC $38,500.00 110 350 9280 LEGAL Yes Legal Representation - Review of testimony, discovery responses, et
Other Expenses 12/14/2021 WEXP-00043768 Christian, Joe T (Joe) $417.80 N/A N/A 9280 TRAVEL EXPENSE No Airfare Case No. 2021-000214 Kentucky Rate Cas
Other Expenses 12/06/2021 21121AA0 KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICES $1,044.91 N/A N/A 9280 CONTRACTOR - LABOR No Required public notification of pending rate case to KY customer
Other Expenses 11/24/2021 WEXP-00043232 Densman, Josh C (Josh) $20.42 N/A N/A 9280 OTHER EMPLOYEE EXPENSES No Print KY Rate Case Testimony and Discovery Responses for Rate Case Hearing in Decemb
Consultants 10/28/2021 019925 SCOTTMADDEN INC $517.50 1.5 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Dylan D'Ascendi
Consultants 10/28/2021 019925 SCOTTMADDEN INC $4,485.00 13 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Adam Perr
Consultants 10/28/2021 019925 SCOTTMADDEN INC $560.00 1.75 320 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Matthew Howar
Consultants 10/28/2021 019925 SCOTTMADDEN INC $1,880.00 8 235 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Mike Kerriga
Consultants 09/30/2021 210902 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $270.00 1 270 9280 CONSULTING No Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 09/30/2021 210902 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $5.40 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING No Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Consultants 09/27/2021 019725 SCOTTMADDEN INC $4,140.00 12 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Adam Perr
Other Expenses 01/09/2022 WEXP-00044663 Densman, Josh C (Josh) $6.00 N/A N/A 9280 OTHER EMPLOYEE EXPENSES No Notarize Affidavit for 6th Round of KY Discover
Consultants 12/31/2021 211201 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $1,215.00 4.5 270 9280 CONSULTING No Depreciation Study - Dane Watson
Consultants 12/31/2021 211201 ALLIANCE CONSULTING GROUP $24.30 N/A N/A 9280 CONSULTING No Depreciation Study - Misc. Office Expenses
Other Expenses 12/27/2021 WEXP-00044368 Densman, Josh C (Josh) $6.00 N/A N/A 9280 OTHER EMPLOYEE EXPENSES No Notary Services for Kentucky Discovery Filin
Other Expenses 01/03/2022 WEXP-00044537 Austin, Timothy R (Ryan) $28.85 N/A N/A 9280 MEALS &ENTERTAINMENT No Business Meals Lunch While Preparing for KY Rate Case
Consultants 11/22/2021 020069 SCOTTMADDEN INC $1,380.00 4 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Dylan D'Ascendi
Consultants 11/22/2021 020069 SCOTTMADDEN INC $15,352.50 44.5 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Adam Perr
Consultants 11/22/2021 020069 SCOTTMADDEN INC $1,750.00 14 125 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - John Semenz
Consultants 11/22/2021 020069 SCOTTMADDEN INC $6,000.00 40 150 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Kamil Yusubo
Consultants 01/01/2022 INV010122 RAAB PAUL H $2,600.00 8 325 9280 CONSULTING No Cost of Service Study Discovery - Paul Raa
Consultants 12/23/2021 020272 SCOTTMADDEN INC $1,380.00 4 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Dylan D'Ascendi
Consultants 12/23/2021 020272 SCOTTMADDEN INC $16,215.00 47 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Adam Perr
Consultants 12/23/2021 020272 SCOTTMADDEN INC $156.25 1.25 125 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Nicole Star
Consultants 01/20/2022 020350 SCOTTMADDEN INC $5,175.00 15 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Dylan D'Ascendi
Consultants 01/20/2022 020350 SCOTTMADDEN INC $8,970.00 26 345 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Adam Perr
Consultants 01/20/2022 020350 SCOTTMADDEN INC $357.50 5.5 65 9280 CONSULTING No Return on Equity Study/Testimony/Workpapers - Sara Derstin
Legal 2/15/2022 02-15-2022 WILSON HUTCHINSON POTEAT & LITTLEPAGE $22,350.00 74.5 300 9280 LEGAL No Legal Representation - Review of testimony, discovery responses, et
Legal 2/17/2022 021722 JOHN N HUGHES PSC $39,725.00 113.5 350 9280 LEGAL No Legal Representation - Review of testimony, discovery responses, et

$357,695.90
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Mr. Eric Wilen
Project Manager - Rates and Regulatory Affairs
Atmos Energy
5420 LBJ Freeway
Lincoln II, Suite 1600
Dallas TX 75240

Professional Fees 2,600$                  

Out-of-Pocket Expenses -$                      

Federal Express -$                      

TOTAL 2,600$                  

I010122.07KY

  INVOICE - Kentucky

Professional fees and expenses related to services performed for Atmos in conjunction with its 
Kentucky rate increase filing as per agreement (detail attached):

PAUL H. RAAB
ECONOMIC CONSULTING

5313 PORTSMOUTH ROAD

BETHESDA, MD 20816

(301) 320-7549  FAX: (301) 320-6369

January 1, 2022

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Date Consultant Hours Expenses Task

12/6 Raab 6.0 Hearing Prep

12/10 Raab 2.0 Hearing Prep

TOTALS 8.0 -$          

DETAILED INVOICE - HOURS BREAKDOWN

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Consultant Hours Rate Fees

Raab 8.0 325$              2,600$           

8.0 2,600$           

DETAILED INVOICE - FEE COMPUTATION
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Mr. Eric Wilen
Project Manager - Rates and Regulatory Affairs
Atmos Energy
5420 LBJ Freeway
Lincoln II, Suite 1600
Dallas TX 75240

Professional Fees 11,700$                

Out-of-Pocket Expenses -$                      

Federal Express -$                      

TOTAL 11,700$                

I070121.07KY

  INVOICE - Kentucky

Professional fees and expenses related to services performed for Atmos in conjunction with its 
Kentucky rate increase filing as per agreement (detail attached):

July 1, 2021

PAUL H. RAAB
ECONOMIC CONSULTING

5313 PORTSMOUTH ROAD

BETHESDA, MD 20816

(301) 320-7549  FAX: (301) 320-6369

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Date Consultant Hours Expenses Task

6/18 Raab 8.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

6/21 Raab 8.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

6/22 Raab 8.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

6/23 Raab 5.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

6/24 Raab 4.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

6/25 Raab 2.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

6/27 Raab 1.0 Cost of Service/Testimony

TOTALS 36.0 -$          

DETAILED INVOICE - HOURS BREAKDOWN

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Consultant Hours Rate Fees

Raab 36.0 325$              11,700$         

36.0 11,700$         

DETAILED INVOICE - FEE COMPUTATION

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Mr. Eric Wilen
Project Manager - Rates and Regulatory Affairs
Atmos Energy
5420 LBJ Freeway
Lincoln II, Suite 1600
Dallas TX 75240

Professional Fees 1,625$                  

Out-of-Pocket Expenses -$                      

Federal Express -$                      

TOTAL 1,625$                  

I090121.07KY

  INVOICE - Kentucky

Professional fees and expenses related to services performed for Atmos in conjunction with its Kentucky 
rate increase filing as per agreement (detail attached):

September 1, 2021

PAUL H. RAAB
ECONOMIC CONSULTING

5313 PORTSMOUTH ROAD

BETHESDA, MD 20816

(301) 320-7549  FAX: (301) 320-6369

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Date Consultant Hours Expenses Task

8/10 Raab 4.0 Discovery

8/31 Raab 1.0 Discovery

TOTALS 5.0 -$          

DETAILED INVOICE - HOURS BREAKDOWN

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Consultant Hours Rate Fees

Raab 5.0 325$              1,625$           

5.0 1,625$           

DETAILED INVOICE - FEE COMPUTATION
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John N. Hughes, PSC 

Attorney at Law 

124 West Todd St. 

Frankfort, KY 40601 

 

Atmos Energy Corporation 

%Brannon Taylor 

5430 LBJ Freeway 

1800 Three Lincoln Centre  

Dallas, TX 75240 

 

Invoice Number 02 22 

Account reference: 2021 Kentucky rate case 2021-00214 

 

      

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT 

 
10/01 Review AG testimony/exhibits 1.75 

10/4 Review PSC order denying confidentiality; draft conf. 

petition rehearing motion;  

1.75 

10/12 several messages re: AG discovery; .5 

10/13 Tele. SB, BT re: annual rate filings        .5 

10/14 Tele. Rate team re: case issues; rebuttal issues; AG DR’s .75 

10/15 Review SB annual rate case issues; messages re: AG 

discovery 

2.5 

10/18 Response SB re: annual rate case issues 1.75 

10/19 Review PSC/AG DR’s.  .5 

10/21 Response to AG .25 

10/28 Review case issues .5 

10/29 Messages/tele. re: AG conference .25 

11/2 Message BT re: customer notice .25 

11/3 Tele. RH re: PSC DR 3; responses .5 

11/9 Review Delta Settlement .5 

11/10 Tele. Re: AG case issues; Supplemental MFR’s .5 

11/11 Review, revise AG case issues 1.25 

11/14 Base period update revisions .25 

11/15 Review D’Ascendis,Christian draft testimony 2.75 

11/16 Several messages re: AG case issues; D’Ascendis, 

Christian rebuttal 

1.25 

11/18 Witness prep; hearing cross issues; review DR’s 5.75 

11/22 Witness cross exam prep.;  3.5 

11/23 Draft hearing notice; several messages BT; notice PSC re: 

KPA filing; motion for virtual witness appearances;  

5.5 

11/24 Review Staff DR 3; message AG re: joint motion for 

witnesses 

.5 

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



11/28 Several messages re: witness preparation .25 

11/30 Tele. AG re: surrebuttal testimony; review AG surrebuttal 

issues; motion for virtual witness appearance; motion PHV 

SB; hearing notice; Christian rebuttal; messages re: public 

comments; review AG motion to amend procedural 

schedule 

3.25 

12/1 Draft petition for confidentiality for PSC 5-05; messages 

re: AG motion 

1 

12/2 Response to AG motion for witness panel; tele rate team re: 

responses to AG surrebuttal issues 

1.25 

12/3 Tele. RH; Staff DR 5; witness issues 2.75 

12/6 Virtual Witness prep – cross exam issues; review KPA 

hearing notice; several messages re: DR responses 

9.5 

12/7 Witness prep. Draft witness/exhibit response 1.5 

12/8 Witness cross/hearing prep; AG witness cross 5.5 

12/9 Witness prep. Cross exam prep.  5 

12/10 Witness prep 1.75 

12/11 Several calls re: hearing postponement; response PSC re: 

hearing schedule; several calls re: tornado/hearing issues; 

response to PSC re: hearing 

3.25 

12/12 Several messages re: hearing postponement 1.25 

12/13 Several calls, messages re: procedural schedule; brief 

issues; DR responses; Joint motion for hearing waiver/brief 

3.75 

12/14 Review for brief issues 4.25 

12/16 Brief 5 

12/17 Brief; issues re: tornado activities, suspension of tariffs 6.5 

12/18 Brief 4.5 

12/19 Brief 7 

12/20 Brief         4 

12/30 Brief 2.75 

2022   

1/3 Brief 1 

1/4 PSC DR 6 review;  confidentiality petition 1.5 

1/6 Review AG DR 2 responses; pet. confid 1.25 

1/10 Brief .75 

1/14 Brief .75 

2/2 Review responses PSC DR 7        .5 

2/8 Review confidentiality order re: AG 1-13 .25 

 Sub total 113.5 

hrs@ 

$350.00= 
$ 

   

+ Expenses - mileage travel $0 

 Prior balance $00 

 TOTAL DUE $39,725.00 
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CASE NO. 2021-00214 
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(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



 

 

John N. Hughes, PSC 

Attorney at Law 

124 West Todd St. 

Frankfort, KY 40601 

 

Atmos Energy Corporation 

%Douglas Walther 

5430 LBJ Freeway 

1800 Three Lincoln Centre  

Dallas, TX 75240 

 

Invoice Number 092021 

Account reference: 2021 Kentucky rate case 2021-00214 

 

      

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT 

 
1/21/21 Response EW re: rate case preparation; filing requirements;  1.5 

3/10 Response BT re: draft tariff; rate case issues; tariff 

revisions 

1.75 

5/2 Response BT re: tariff issues 2.25 

5/3 Response BT re: tariff proposals; Conf. call re: rate case 

issues 

       1.5 

5/3 Conference call application preparation issues .75 

5/19 Response KF re: tariff proposals; tele. SB re: rate case 

procedures 

1.5 

5/25 Response BT re: public notice  .5 

5/26 Response KF re; tariffs .5 

5/27 Response KF re: tariffs; review LGE/KU hearing and 

exhibits re: case issues; review 2018 rate order, testimony 

for issue summary 

5.5 

6/1 Response EW re: PSC filing procedures .25 

6/2 MFR review and revisions .75 

6/3 Review Delta Gas deficiency order; proposed tariffs .5 

6/7 Response BT re: notice publication; tariffs; draft public 

notice 

1.5 

6/13 Tariff revisions; customer notice revisions;  1.25 

6/14 Conf. call re: tariffs; rate case issues; research executive 

compensation issues; tele. BT re: incentive compensation; 

tele. SB re: ccn issues; review CapX projects;  

4.5 

6/15 Testimony review 5.5 

6/16 Testimony review 6.5 

6/17 Messages re: notice issues; tele. BT; draft rate application; 

tele. RH re: application 

7.25 

6/18 Draft application; tele. BT re: notice; several messages re: 5 

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
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notice, draft application; case issues 

6/21 Testimony review; response BT re: lobbying issues; 

research various case issues 

4.5 

6/23 Tele BT, RH re: lobbying issues; revise BT testimony; 

Austin testimony 

3.75 

6/24 Testimony review revisions;  2.75 

6/25 Testimony revisions 

 

     2.25 

6/28 Testimony review; tele. RH; revision application 2.75 

6/30 Several messages re: notice issues .5 

7/1 Review deficiency letter; messages BT, RH .75 

7/2 Message BT re: deficiencies       .25 

7/6 Draft deficiency response; Tele. BT, RH, JC 3.25 

7/7 Deficiency response revisions; motion for deviation 1.5 

7/9 Messages re: revised/supplemental MFR’s and deficiency 

response 

.5 

7/12 Message SB re: confidentiality of attorney fees .25 

7/14 Draft motion deviation for Watson schedules PSC DR 1-55 .5 

7/16 Review PSC order re: notice deviation; tele. BT re: notice; 

several calls and messages re: notice  

.75 

7/24 Review Columbia Gas, LGE orders re: rate case issues; 

tele. AG re: procedural order; conf call re: case issues;  

3.5 

7/26 Review rate case issues; PRP consolidation with rate case 

ROE issues; tele. AG re: procedural order; conference call 

re: rate issues 

3.75 

7/27 Tele. AG re: procedural order; tele. RH re: case issues; 

review Delta Gas ROE testimony; draft conf. petition PSC 

DR-1; review, revise PSC DR’s; Draft Watson motion 

deviate; DR-1 revisions;  

2.75 

7/28 Draft conf. petition; review PSC DR’s;  1.5 

7/29 Revisions to conf. petition; Watson motion deviate; DR-1 

revisions; tele. RH 

      3 

7/30 Response SB re: consultant contracts; draft conf. petition; 

conf. issues PSC DR-1 

1.75 

8/9 Tele. PSC re: Watson DR 1-55 deviation; tele. EW, several 

messages re: electronic filing options 

.5 

8/13 Draft motion withdraw Watson deviation .5 

8/17 Messages BT, RH re: PSC DR responses .5 

8/18 Tele. BT, RH re: PSC DR response  .5 

8/20 Review, revise PSC/AG DR responses; draft conf. petition; 

several messages BT, RH 

5.5 

8/23 Review PRP order consolidation with rate case; review 

impact on rate case issues, procedures, options 

1 

8/24 Revisions to PSC/AG DR’s; petition confidentiality; 

several messages 

2.75 

8/31 Revisions to PSC DR’s .5 

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



9/2 Tele AG re: AG 1-6; several messages .5 

9/7 Conf call  re: PSC/AG DR responses .75 

9/9 Review and revise PSC DR-3; tele BT. RH 2.25 

9/13 Response BT re: ROE issues 1.25 

9/14 Review PSC DR responses; tele. BT, RH; response BT  1.5 

9/15 Review PSC, AG DR’s; draft confidentiality petition; tele 

BT 

2.75 

 Sub total 110.0 

hrs@ 

$350.00= 
$ 

   

+ Expenses - mileage travel $0 

 Prior balance $00 

 TOTAL DUE $38,500.00 

 

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



 
The Law Offices of 

 

WILSON, HUTCHINSON & LITTLEPAGE 

 
611 Frederica Street 

Owensboro, Kentucky 42301 

Telephone (270) 926-5011 

Facsimile (270) 926-9394 

 

William L. Wilson, Jr.                                                                                                              bill@whplawfirm.com 

Mark R. Hutchinson                                                                                                                 randy@whplawfirm.com 

T. Tommy Littlepage                                                                                                             ttommy@whplawfirm.com 

 
 
February 15, 2022 
 
 
Atmos Energy Corporation 
c/o Brannon Taylor 
 

KENTUCKY RATE CASE – 2021-00214 
 

     S T A T E M E N T 
 
___________________________________________________________________________ 

 
 
10/1/21  Review of AG Direct Pre-Filed Testimony; review 
   Of Order re: Petition for Confidentiality – Staff 
   DR 1-55; telephone conference with J H and BT  2.5 
 
10/4/21  Various email correspondence re: revised Revenue 
   Model of Lane Kollen; review of Motion 
   Re: Staff 1-55 concerning executive compensation  .75 
 
10/14/21  Review of AG expert testimony in preparation for 
   Telephone conference call; conference call with  
   Rate case team      2.0 
 
10/19/21  Review of proposed DRs to AG    1.0 
 
10/21/21  Review of revised draft of DRs to AG     .5 
 
11/10/21  Review of proposed settlement terms;  
& 11/11/21  conference call concerning same    1.25 
 
11/12/21  Review of AG Responses to Atmos DRs   1.0 

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)
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11/15/21  Conference call with rate team;  
   settlement conference call with  
   AG; post settlement conference call 
   with rate team      3.5 
 
11/16/21  Work on rebuttal testimonies     2.75 
11/17/21 
 
11/22/21  Work on witness preparation     8.5 
-11/25/21      
  
11/27/21  Continued work on witness prep 
&11/28/21          7.0 
 
11/30/21  Misc work on various hearing matters and 
   Witness cross       5.0 
 
12/2/21  Continued work on witness and 
& 12/3/21  hearing prep; conference call     6.0 
 
12/5/21  Continued work on witness prep; 
& 12/6/21  conference call with Company witness   6.0 
 
12/7/21  Continued work on rate case     3.0 
 
12/8/21  Continued witness prep and hearing prep   5.0 
 
12/10/21  Continued witness and hearing prep    4.0 
 
12/11/21  Continued work on hearing; work on  
   Postponement/waiver     5.5 
 
12/13/21  Continued work on procedural order/ 
   Hearing waiver      1.0 
 
1/10/22  Review of Brief drafts      2.75 
 
1/11/22  Continued work on Brief drafts    3.0 
 
1/12/22  Continued work on Brief; t.c. Jack    2.5 
 
      Total:    $22,350.00 
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019391July 28, 2021

Shelly Bass
Atmos Energy Corporation
5420 LBJ Freeway, Suite 1800
Dallas, TX 75240

Invoice Number:

In Reference To:
Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony
Professional services provided in June 2021 for project 338-017

Amount

Professional Fees
$ 24,295.00

Total Fees and Expenses $ 24,295.00

Total Due $ 24,295.00

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please let me know.  Please remit payment in U.S. funds to:
Accounts Receivable, ScottMadden, Inc., 2626 Glenwood Avenue, Suite 480, Raleigh, NC 27608.  Thank you for retaining
ScottMadden.

Dylan D'Ascendis
Partner

ScottMadden, Inc.
Tax ID: 56-1445505

Sincerely,

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)

kdao
Dylan D'Ascendis



  

Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Professional services provided in June 2021 for project 338-017In Reference to:

Current

Hours Rate

Current

Amount
Professional Fees

Dylan D'Ascendis 6/10/2021 8.00 345.00 2,760.00

Developed direct testimony

Dylan D'Ascendis 6/14/2021 6.00 345.00 2,070.00

Developed direct testimony

Dylan D'Ascendis 6/21/2021 7.00 345.00 2,415.00

Developed direct testimony

Adam Perry 5/10/2021 7.00 345.00 2,415.00

Drafted Direct Testimony

Adam Perry 5/11/2021 7.00 345.00 2,415.00

Drafted Direct Testimony

Adam Perry 5/12/2021 8.00 345.00 2,760.00

Drafted Direct Testimony

Adam Perry 6/15/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Prepared ROE supporting workpapers

Adam Perry 6/16/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Prepared ROE supporting workpapers

Matthew Howard 5/4/2021 2.50 320.00 800.00

Analysis

Isaac Gustafson 5/3/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Gas Exhibit

Isaac Gustafson 5/4/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Gas Exhibit

Eric Brooks 6/2/2021 5.00 235.00 1,175.00

ROE Exhibit Update

Eric Brooks 6/3/2021 8.00 235.00 1,880.00

ROE Exhibit and Testimony Update

Eric Brooks 6/16/2021 7.00 235.00 1,645.00

ROE final testimony review and workpaper preparation

Professional Fees 81.50 24,295.00
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019725September 27, 2021

Shelly Bass
Atmos Energy Corporation
5420 LBJ Freeway, Suite 1800
Dallas, TX 75240

Invoice Number:

In Reference To:
Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony
Professional services provided in August 2021 for project 338-017

Amount

Professional Fees
$ 4,140.00

Total Fees and Expenses $ 4,140.00

Total Due $ 4,140.00

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please let me know.  Please remit payment in U.S. funds to:
Accounts Receivable, ScottMadden, Inc., 2626 Glenwood Avenue, Suite 480, Raleigh, NC 27608.  Thank you for retaining
ScottMadden.

Dylan D'Ascendis
Partner

ScottMadden, Inc.
Tax ID: 56-1445505

Sincerely,

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)

kdao
Dylan D'Ascendis



  

Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Professional services provided in August 2021 for project 338-017In Reference to:

Current

Hours Rate

Current

Amount
Professional Fees

Adam Perry 8/10/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 8/11/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 8/12/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 8/16/2021 1.00 345.00 345.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 8/17/2021 1.00 345.00 345.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Professional Fees 12.00 4,140.00
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019925October 28, 2021

Shelly Bass
Atmos Energy Corporation
5420 LBJ Freeway, Suite 1800
Dallas, TX 75240

Invoice Number:

In Reference To:
Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony
Professional services provided in September 2021 for project 338-017

Amount

Professional Fees
$ 7,442.50

Total Fees and Expenses $ 7,442.50

Total Due $ 7,442.50

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please let me know.  Please remit payment in U.S. funds to:
Accounts Receivable, ScottMadden, Inc., 2626 Glenwood Avenue, Suite 480, Raleigh, NC 27608.  Thank you for retaining
ScottMadden.

Dylan D'Ascendis
Partner

ScottMadden, Inc.
Tax ID: 56-1445505

Sincerely,
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kdao
Dylan D'Ascendis



  

Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Professional services provided in September 2021 for project 338-017In Reference to:

Current

Hours Rate

Current

Amount
Professional Fees

Dylan D'Ascendis 9/13/2021 1.50 345.00 517.50

Response to DR

Adam Perry 9/7/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 9/8/2021 0.50 345.00 172.50

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 9/9/2021 1.00 345.00 345.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 9/15/2021 7.50 345.00 2,587.50

Drafted responses to data requests

Matthew Howard 9/8/2021 1.00 320.00 320.00

Analysis

Matthew Howard 9/22/2021 0.75 320.00 240.00

Analysis

Mike Kerrigan 9/8/2021 4.00 235.00 940.00

Preparing D'Ascendis Discovery Analysis

Mike Kerrigan 9/9/2021 4.00 235.00 940.00

Preparing D'Ascendis Discovery Analysis

Professional Fees 24.25 7,442.50
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020069November 22, 2021

Shelly Bass
Atmos Energy Corporation
5420 LBJ Freeway, Suite 1800
Dallas, TX 75240

Invoice Number:

In Reference To:
Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony
Professional services provided in October 2021 for project 338-017

Amount

Professional Fees
$ 24,482.50

Total Fees and Expenses $ 24,482.50

Total Due $ 24,482.50

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please let me know.  Please remit payment in U.S. funds to:
Accounts Receivable, ScottMadden, Inc., 2626 Glenwood Avenue, Suite 480, Raleigh, NC 27608.  Thank you for retaining
ScottMadden.

Dylan D'Ascendis
Partner

ScottMadden, Inc.
Tax ID: 56-1445505

Sincerely,
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(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)

kdao
Dylan D'Ascendis



  

Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Professional services provided in October 2021 for project 338-017In Reference to:

Current

Hours Rate

Current

Amount
Professional Fees

Dylan D'Ascendis 10/26/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Review rebuttal testimony

Dylan D'Ascendis 10/29/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Review rebuttal testimony.

Adam Perry 10/1/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Reviewed opposing witness testimony

Adam Perry 10/8/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Reviewed opposing witness testimony

Adam Perry 10/13/2021 1.50 345.00 517.50

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/14/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/15/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/19/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/20/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/21/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/22/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/25/2021 6.00 345.00 2,070.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/26/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Developed ROE supporting analyses

Adam Perry 10/27/2021 5.00 345.00 1,725.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/28/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 10/29/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

John Semenza 10/12/2021 7.00 125.00 875.00

Audit exhibits

John Semenza 10/13/2021 7.00 125.00 875.00

Audit exhibits

Kamil Yusubov 10/11/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Analysis

Kamil Yusubov 10/12/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Analysis

Kamil Yusubov 10/13/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Analysis

Kamil Yusubov 10/14/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Analysis

Kamil Yusubov 10/15/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Analysis

Kamil Yusubov 10/18/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Rebuttal Testimony Draft

Kamil Yusubov 10/19/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Rebuttal Testimony Draft

Kamil Yusubov 10/20/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Rebuttal Testimony Draft

Kamil Yusubov 10/21/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Rebuttal Testimony Draft

Kamil Yusubov 10/22/2021 4.00 150.00 600.00

Rebuttal Testimony Draft

Professional Fees 102.50 24,482.50

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)



 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

020272December 23, 2021

Shelly Bass
Atmos Energy Corporation
5420 LBJ Freeway, Suite 1800
Dallas, TX 75240

Invoice Number:

In Reference To:
Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony
Professional services provided in November 2021 for project 338-017

Amount

Professional Fees
$ 17,751.25

Total Fees and Expenses $ 17,751.25

Total Due $ 17,751.25

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please let me know.  Please remit payment in U.S. funds to:
Accounts Receivable, ScottMadden, Inc., 2626 Glenwood Avenue, Suite 480, Raleigh, NC 27608.  Thank you for retaining
ScottMadden.

Dylan D'Ascendis
Partner

ScottMadden, Inc.
Tax ID: 56-1445505

Sincerely,

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)

kdao
Dylan D'Ascendis



  

Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Professional services provided in November 2021 for project 338-017In Reference to:

Current

Hours Rate

Current

Amount
Professional Fees

Dylan D'Ascendis 11/15/2021 1.00 345.00 345.00

Rebuttal testimony.

Dylan D'Ascendis 11/17/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Rebuttal testimony.

Adam Perry 11/1/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Drafted response to data request

Adam Perry 11/4/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/5/2021 6.00 345.00 2,070.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/8/2021 8.00 345.00 2,760.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/9/2021 8.00 345.00 2,760.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/10/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/11/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/12/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/15/2021 6.00 345.00 2,070.00

Reviewed and audited Rebuttal Testimony

Adam Perry 11/16/2021 6.00 345.00 2,070.00

Reviewed and audited Rebuttal Testimony

Nicole Stark 11/5/2021 1.25 125.00 156.25

Compilation of work papers.

Professional Fees 52.25 17,751.25

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
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020350January 20, 2022

Shelly Bass
Atmos Energy Corporation
5420 LBJ Freeway, Suite 1800
Dallas, TX 75240

Invoice Number:

In Reference To:
Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony
Professional services provided in December 2021 for project 338-017

Amount

Professional Fees
$ 14,502.50

Total Fees and Expenses $ 14,502.50

Total Due $ 14,502.50

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please let me know.  Please remit payment in U.S. funds to:
Accounts Receivable, ScottMadden, Inc., 2626 Glenwood Avenue, Suite 480, Raleigh, NC 27608.  Thank you for retaining
ScottMadden.

Dylan D'Ascendis
Partner

ScottMadden, Inc.
Tax ID: 56-1445505

Sincerely,

CASE NO. 2021-00214 
ATTACHMENT 2 

TO STAFF DR NO. 1-12 
(SUPPLEMENT 4 02-17-22)
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Dylan D'Ascendis



  

Project         Atmos KY 2021 ROE Testimony

Professional services provided in December 2021 for project 338-017In Reference to:

Current

Hours Rate

Current

Amount
Professional Fees

Dylan D'Ascendis 12/6/2021 6.00 345.00 2,070.00

Prep

Dylan D'Ascendis 12/21/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Discovery responses.

Dylan D'Ascendis 12/22/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Discovery responses.

Dylan D'Ascendis 12/27/2021 3.00 345.00 1,035.00

Discovery responses.

Dylan D'Ascendis 12/28/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Response to discovery.

Adam Perry 12/6/2021 4.00 345.00 1,380.00

Drafted questions for cross examination

Adam Perry 12/7/2021 2.00 345.00 690.00

Drafted questions for cross examination

Adam Perry 12/20/2021 7.00 345.00 2,415.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 12/21/2021 8.00 345.00 2,760.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Adam Perry 12/22/2021 5.00 345.00 1,725.00

Drafted responses to data requests

Sara Derstine 12/3/2021 2.00 65.00 130.00

Organized hearing prep documents

Sara Derstine 12/6/2021 2.00 65.00 130.00

Organized hearing prep documents

Sara Derstine 12/10/2021 1.50 65.00 97.50

Organized hearing prep documents

Professional Fees 46.50 14,502.50
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