
KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Response to Staff’s Data Request Set One No. 3 June Update 

 Respondent: Jeffery Gore 
 

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC. 
RESPONSE TO STAFF’S FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

DATED MAY 5, 2021 
 

3. As historical data becomes available, provide detailed monthly income statements for 

each forecasted month of the base period including the month in which the Commission 

hears this case. 

Response:  

Refer to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183, Staff 1-3 June Update, Attachment D for the 

monthly income statement for June 2021. 
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Attachment D
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc

Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account

For the Month Ended June 30, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-

Month Prior Month Date

 

Operating Revenues

Gas Residential Sales 3,862,006.75          (1,304,493.17)         53,798,010.09        

Gas Comm & Indust Revenues 1,772,871.56          (478,575.25)            23,064,945.90        

Gas Sales for Resale 4,433.74                 (1,856.41)                51,622.04               

Gas Interdepartmental Sales -                          -                          -                          

Gas Intercompany Transfers -                          -                          -                          

Total Sales of Gas 5,639,312.05          (1,784,924.83)         76,914,578.03        

Electric Residential Revenues -                          -                          -                          

Elec Comm & Indust Rev -                          -                          -                          

Public Street & Hwy Lighting -                          -                          -                          

Elec Oth Sales to Public Auth -                          -                          -                          

Sales to Railroads & Railways -                          -                          -                          

Electric Sales for Resale -                          -                          -                          

Elec Interdepartmental Sales -                          -                          -                          

Total Sales of Electricity -                          -                          -                          

Forfeited Discounts - Gas 41,950.16               4,262.91                 368,400.49             

Forfeited Discounts - Ele -                          -                          -                          

Total Forfeited Discounts 41,950.16               4,262.91                 368,400.49             

Misc Service Revenues - Gas 4,273.55                 (11,385.63)              42,494.78               

Misc Service Revenues - Ele -                          -                          -                          

Total Miscellaneous Service Revenues 4,273.55                 (11,385.63)              42,494.78               

Rent from Electricity Property -                          -                          -                          

Other Electric Revenues -                          -                          -                          

Rev Transm of Elec of Oth -                          -                          -                          

Nonutility Revenues - Serv Co -                          -                          -                          

Regional Transm Service Rev -                          -                          -                          

Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Gather -                          -                          -                          

Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Transm -                          -                          -                          

Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Distr 1,237,994.33          (252,175.70)            11,844,772.51        

Rev from Storing Gas of Oth -                          -                          -                          

Sales - Prod Extracted from NG -                          -                          -                          

Incidental Gasoline & Oil Sale -                          -                          -                          

Rent from Gas Property 2,852.00                 -                          17,112.00               

Other Gas Revenues (869,535.42)            (248,919.40)            (6,654,374.78)         

Gas Provision of Rate Refunds -                          -                          -                          

Total Other Operating Revenues 417,534.62             (508,217.82)            5,618,405.00          

Total Operating Revenues 6,056,846.67          (2,293,142.65)         82,532,983.03        

Operating Expenses

Operation Expenses

Manufac Gas Production - Oper -                          -                          -                          

NG Production & Gather - Oper -                          -                          -                          

Products Extraction - Oper -                          -                          -                          

Other Gas Supply - Operations 1,052,038.31          (1,081,723.35)         30,149,779.93        

Steam Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          

Hydraulic Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          

Other Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          

Other Power Supply - Oper -                          -                          -                          

NG Stor, Term & Proc - Oper -                          -                          -                          

Transmission Exp - Oper 64.53                      (126.01)                   4,396.55                 

Regional Market Exp - Oper -                          -                          -                          

Distribution Exp - Oper 1,118,729.65          25,861.71               6,801,245.16          

Customer Accounts - Oper 602,702.41             307,087.02             1,160,885.45          
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc

Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account

For the Month Ended June 30, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-

Month Prior Month Date

Cust Serv & Info Exp - Oper 21,484.92               (8,335.23)                190,552.92             

Sales Expenses - Oper 246.72                    (962.65)                   4,769.67                 

Admin & General Exp - Oper 2,079,750.83          587,939.88             11,959,848.40        

Total Operation Expenses 4,875,017.37          (170,258.63)            50,271,478.08        

Maintenance Expenses

Production Expenses - Maint -                          -                          -                          

NG Stor, Term & Proc - Maint -                          -                          -                          

Transmission Exp - Maint 30,255.00               30,255.00               30,255.00               

Distribution Exp - Maint 422,574.03             85,047.13               2,313,825.32          

Maintenance Gen and Admin 108,103.62             (90,987.31)              709,773.13             

Total Maintenance Expenses 560,932.65             24,314.82               3,053,853.45          

Depreciation Expense 1,225,837.22          7,719.81                 7,238,850.32          

Depreciation Expense for AROs -                          -                          -                          

Amort & Deplet of Util Plant 157,625.69             5,037.84                 886,572.70             

Amort of Gas Plant Acq Adj -                          -                          -                          

Amort of Conversion Exp -                          -                          -                          

Reg Debits -                          -                          -                          

Reg Credits -                          -                          -                          

Other Taxes FERC 628,756.70             34,488.08               3,447,307.89          

Income Taxes - State (95,223.00)              (39,805.00)              (44,702.00)              

Income Taxes - Federal (503,698.00)            (370,978.00)            1,943,723.00          

Total Utilities Current Fed State (598,921.00)            (410,783.00)            1,899,021.00          

Deferred Income Taxes 353,404.00             (36,312.00)              3,636,027.00          

Prov Deferred Inc Tax - Cr (312,510.00)            (92,589.00)              (2,413,286.00)         

Investment Tax Credit Adj (2,037.00)                -                          (12,222.00)              

Gain from Disposition of Plant -                          -                          -                          

Loss from Disposition of Plant -                          -                          -                          

Accretion Expenses -                          -                          -                          

Total Operating Expenses 6,888,105.63          (638,382.08)            68,007,602.44        

Net Utility Operating Income(Loss) (831,258.96)            (1,654,760.57)         14,525,380.59        

Other  Income & Deductions

Revenues from Merchandising -                          -                          -                          
 Costs and Exp Merch Job -                          -                          -                          

NonUtility Revenues (3,197.48)                (11,961.75)              194,474.10             

NonUtility Unaffil 2,472.20                 2,192.40                 5,375.21                 

Nonoperating Rental Revenue -                          -                          -                          

Earnings of Subsidiaries 9.43                        (1.29)                       345.24                    

Interest and Dividend Income -                          -                          -                          

Allow for Other FUDC 39,968.56               (50,634.67)              204,415.48             

Misc Nonoperating Income 8,543.42                 (9,962.29)                596,218.58             

Gain Disposition of Property -                          -                          -                          

Total Other Income 47,796.13               (70,367.60)              1,000,828.61          

Loss on Disposal of Property -                          -                          39,513.95               

Misc Amortization (2,158.59)                -                          (12,951.54)              

Other Inc Exp Donations -                          (3,314.00)                13,189.98               

Corporate Owned Life Ins -                          -                          -                          

Penalties 12,000.00               (28,000.00)              108,001.36             

Other Inc Exp PoliticalContrib -                          -                          2,448.50                 

Other Inc Deductions 17,942.00               1,275.00                 99,065.46               

Total Other Income Deductions 27,783.41               (30,039.00)              249,267.71             
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc

Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account

For the Month Ended June 30, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-

Month Prior Month Date

NonUtility Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Income Taxes - Federal 7,542.00                 (13,632.00)              178,360.00             

Income Taxes - State 1,890.00                 (3,417.00)                44,702.00               

Total Income Taxes Federal Other 9,432.00                 (17,049.00)              223,062.00             

Other Deferred Income Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Prov Defer Inc Tax - Oth - Cr -                          -                          -                          

Invest Tax Credits Adjust -Net -                          -                          -                          

Amortization of ITC -                          -                          -                          

Total Taxes Other Income & Deduct 9,432.00                 (17,049.00)              223,062.00             

Total Other Income (Deductions) 10,580.72               (23,279.60)              528,498.90             

Interest LT Debt -                          -                          -                          

Amort of Debt Disc & Exp -                          -                          -                          

Amort of Loss on Reacq Debt -                          -                          -                          

Amort of Prem on Debt - Cr -                          -                          -                          

Interest Exp Affiliate 629,278.35             (20,816.92)              3,807,555.67          

Other Interest Expense (2,332.31)                526.15                    (26,007.44)              

AFUDIC PISCC (17,183.96)              (11,067.88)              (71,688.94)              

Total Interest Charges 609,762.08             (31,358.65)              3,709,859.29          

Income Before Extraordinary Items (1,430,440.32)         (1,646,681.52)         11,344,020.20        

Extraordinary Income -                          -                          -                          

Extraordinary Deductions -                          -                          -                          

Net Extraordinary Items -                          -                          -                          

Extraordinary Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Deferred Extraordinary Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Income Taxes - Federal & Other -                          -                          -                          

Total Extraordinary Items -                          -                          -                          
Net Income (1,430,440.32)         (1,646,681.52)         11,344,020.20        



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Response to Staff’s Data Request Set One No. 3 July Update 

 Respondent: Jeffery Gore 
 

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC. 
RESPONSE TO STAFF’S FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

DATED MAY 5, 2021 
 

3. As historical data becomes available, provide detailed monthly income statements for 

each forecasted month of the base period including the month in which the Commission 

hears this case. 

Response:  

Refer to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183, Staff 1-3 July Update, Attachment E for the 

monthly income statement for July 2021. 
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc
Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account
For the Month Ended July 31, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-
Month Prior Month Date

 
Operating Revenues

Gas Residential Sales 3,456,655.70          (405,351.05)            57,254,665.79        
Gas Comm & Indust Revenues 1,624,911.28          (147,960.28)            24,689,857.18        
Gas Sales for Resale 3,601.88                 (831.86)                   55,223.92               
Gas Interdepartmental Sales -                          -                          -                          
Gas Intercompany Transfers -                          -                          -                          

Total Sales of Gas 5,085,168.86          (554,143.19)            81,999,746.89        

Electric Residential Revenues -                          -                          -                          
Elec Comm & Indust Rev -                          -                          -                          
Public Street & Hwy Lighting -                          -                          -                          
Elec Oth Sales to Public Auth -                          -                          -                          
Sales to Railroads & Railways -                          -                          -                          
Electric Sales for Resale -                          -                          -                          
Elec Interdepartmental Sales -                          -                          -                          

Total Sales of Electricity -                          -                          -                          

Forfeited Discounts - Gas 34,457.89               (7,492.27)                402,858.38             
Forfeited Discounts - Ele -                          -                          -                          

Total Forfeited Discounts 34,457.89               (7,492.27)                402,858.38             

Misc Service Revenues - Gas 6,923.49                 2,649.94                 49,418.27               
Misc Service Revenues - Ele -                          -                          -                          

Total Miscellaneous Service Revenues 6,923.49                 2,649.94                 49,418.27               

Rent from Electricity Property -                          -                          -                          
Other Electric Revenues -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transm of Elec of Oth -                          -                          -                          
Nonutility Revenues - Serv Co -                          -                          -                          
Regional Transm Service Rev -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Gather -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Transm -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Distr 1,309,108.19          71,113.86               13,153,880.70        
Rev from Storing Gas of Oth -                          -                          -                          
Sales - Prod Extracted from NG -                          -                          -                          
Incidental Gasoline & Oil Sale -                          -                          -                          
Rent from Gas Property 2,852.00                 -                          19,964.00               
Other Gas Revenues 899,402.97             1,768,938.39          (5,754,971.81)         
Gas Provision of Rate Refunds -                          -                          -                          

Total Other Operating Revenues 2,252,744.54          1,835,209.92          7,871,149.54          
Total Operating Revenues 7,337,913.40          1,281,066.73          89,870,896.43        

Operating Expenses

Operation Expenses

Manufac Gas Production - Oper -                          -                          -                          
NG Production & Gather - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Products Extraction - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Other Gas Supply - Operations 1,962,708.16          910,669.85             32,112,488.09        
Steam Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          
Hydraulic Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          
Other Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          
Other Power Supply - Oper 147.72                    147.72                    147.72                    
NG Stor, Term & Proc - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Transmission Exp - Oper 11.58                      (52.95)                     4,408.13                 
Regional Market Exp - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Distribution Exp - Oper 1,144,073.80          25,344.15               7,945,318.96          
Customer Accounts - Oper 131,634.71             (471,067.70)            1,292,520.16          



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183
Staff No. 1-3 - July Update
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc
Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account
For the Month Ended July 31, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-
Month Prior Month Date

Cust Serv & Info Exp - Oper 23,053.00               1,568.08                 213,605.92             
Sales Expenses - Oper 2,556.13                 2,309.41                 7,325.80                 
Admin & General Exp - Oper 2,035,926.74          (43,824.09)              13,995,775.14        

Total Operation Expenses 5,300,111.84          425,094.47             55,571,589.92        

Maintenance Expenses

Production Expenses - Maint -                          -                          -                          
NG Stor, Term & Proc - Maint -                          -                          -                          
Transmission Exp - Maint -                          (30,255.00)              30,255.00               
Distribution Exp - Maint 422,654.95             80.92                      2,736,480.27          
Maintenance Gen and Admin 100,529.80             (7,573.82)                810,302.93             

Total Maintenance Expenses 523,184.75             (37,747.90)              3,577,038.20          

Depreciation Expense 1,234,011.27          8,174.05                 8,472,861.59          
Depreciation Expense for AROs -                          -                          -                          
Amort & Deplet of Util Plant 179,246.05             21,620.36               1,065,818.75          
Amort of Gas Plant Acq Adj -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Conversion Exp -                          -                          -                          
Reg Debits -                          -                          -                          
Reg Credits -                          -                          -                          
Other Taxes FERC 622,451.12             (6,305.58)                4,069,759.01          

Income Taxes - State (1,897.00)                93,326.00               (46,599.00)              
Income Taxes - Federal (953,630.00)            (449,932.00)            990,093.00             

Total Utilities Current Fed State (955,527.00)            (356,606.00)            943,494.00             

Deferred Income Taxes 776,245.00             422,841.00             4,412,272.00          
Prov Deferred Inc Tax - Cr (188,035.00)            124,475.00             (2,601,321.00)         
Investment Tax Credit Adj (2,037.00)                -                          (14,259.00)              
Gain from Disposition of Plant -                          -                          -                          
Loss from Disposition of Plant -                          -                          -                          
Accretion Expenses -                          -                          -                          

Total Operating Expenses 7,489,651.03          601,545.40             75,497,253.47        

Net Utility Operating Income(Loss) (151,737.63)            679,521.33             14,373,642.96        

Other  Income & Deductions

Revenues from Merchandising -                          -                          -                          
 Costs and Exp Merch Job -                          -                          -                          
NonUtility Revenues 2,048.45                 5,245.93                 196,522.55             
NonUtility Unaffil 15.37                      (2,456.83)                5,390.58                 
Nonoperating Rental Revenue -                          -                          -                          
Earnings of Subsidiaries 20.78                      11.35                      366.02                    
Interest and Dividend Income -                          -                          -                          
Allow for Other FUDC 10,503.93               (29,464.63)              214,919.41             
Misc Nonoperating Income 35,548.78               27,005.36               631,767.36             
Gain Disposition of Property -                          -                          -                          

Total Other Income 48,137.31               341.18                    1,048,965.92          

Loss on Disposal of Property -                          -                          39,513.95               
Misc Amortization (2,158.59)                -                          (15,110.13)              
Other Inc Exp Donations 1,455.00                 1,455.00                 14,644.98               
Corporate Owned Life Ins -                          -                          -                          
Penalties 24,000.00               12,000.00               132,001.36             
Other Inc Exp PoliticalContrib -                          -                          2,448.50                 
Other Inc Deductions 16,667.00               (1,275.00)                115,732.46             

Total Other Income Deductions 39,963.41               12,180.00               289,231.12             
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc
Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account
For the Month Ended July 31, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-
Month Prior Month Date

NonUtility Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Income Taxes - Federal 7,572.00                 30.00                      185,932.00             
Income Taxes - State 1,898.00                 8.00                        46,600.00               

Total Income Taxes Federal Other 9,470.00                 38.00                      232,532.00             

Other Deferred Income Taxes -                          -                          -                          
Prov Defer Inc Tax - Oth - Cr -                          -                          -                          
Invest Tax Credits Adjust -Net -                          -                          -                          
Amortization of ITC -                          -                          -                          

Total Taxes Other Income & Deduct 9,470.00                 38.00                      232,532.00             
Total Other Income (Deductions) (1,296.10)                (11,876.82)              527,202.80             

Interest LT Debt -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Debt Disc & Exp -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Loss on Reacq Debt -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Prem on Debt - Cr -                          -                          -                          
Interest Exp Affiliate 713,034.52             83,756.17               4,520,590.19          
Other Interest Expense (1,010.57)                1,321.74                 (27,018.01)              
AFUDIC PISCC 3,928.19                 21,112.15               (67,760.75)              

Total Interest Charges 715,952.14             106,190.06             4,425,811.43          

Income Before Extraordinary Items (868,985.87)            561,454.45             10,475,034.33        

Extraordinary Income -                          -                          -                          
Extraordinary Deductions -                          -                          -                          

Net Extraordinary Items -                          -                          -                          

Extraordinary Taxes -                          -                          -                          
Deferred Extraordinary Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Income Taxes - Federal & Other -                          -                          -                          
Total Extraordinary Items -                          -                          -                          

Net Income (868,985.87)            561,454.45             10,475,034.33        



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Response to Staff’s Data Request Set One No. 3 – Supplemental C 

 Respondent: Jeffery Gore 
 

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC. 
RESPONSE TO STAFF’S FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

DATED MAY 5, 2021 
 

3. As historical data becomes available, provide detailed monthly income statements for 

each forecasted month of the base period including the month in which the Commission 

hears this case. 

Response:  

Refer to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183, Staff 1-3, Attachment F for the monthly income 

statement for August 2021. 
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc
Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account
For the Month Ended August 31, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-
Month Prior Month Date

 
Operating Revenues

Gas Residential Sales 3,368,625.17          (88,030.53)              60,623,290.96        
Gas Comm & Indust Revenues 1,599,629.28          (25,282.00)              26,289,486.46        
Gas Sales for Resale 3,429.41                 (172.47)                   58,653.33               
Gas Interdepartmental Sales -                          -                          -                          
Gas Intercompany Transfers -                          -                          -                          

Total Sales of Gas 4,971,683.86          (113,485.00)            86,971,430.75        

Electric Residential Revenues -                          -                          -                          
Elec Comm & Indust Rev -                          -                          -                          
Public Street & Hwy Lighting -                          -                          -                          
Elec Oth Sales to Public Auth -                          -                          -                          
Sales to Railroads & Railways -                          -                          -                          
Electric Sales for Resale -                          -                          -                          
Elec Interdepartmental Sales -                          -                          -                          

Total Sales of Electricity -                          -                          -                          

Forfeited Discounts - Gas 25,711.51               (8,746.38)                428,569.89             
Forfeited Discounts - Ele -                          -                          -                          

Total Forfeited Discounts 25,711.51               (8,746.38)                428,569.89             

Misc Service Revenues - Gas 13,195.87               6,272.38                 62,614.14               
Misc Service Revenues - Ele -                          -                          -                          

Total Miscellaneous Service Revenues 13,195.87               6,272.38                 62,614.14               

Rent from Electricity Property -                          -                          -                          
Other Electric Revenues -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transm of Elec of Oth -                          -                          -                          
Nonutility Revenues - Serv Co -                          -                          -                          
Regional Transm Service Rev -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Gather -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Transm -                          -                          -                          
Rev Transp Gas of Oth - Distr 1,200,022.97          (109,085.22)            14,353,903.67        
Rev from Storing Gas of Oth -                          -                          -                          
Sales - Prod Extracted from NG -                          -                          -                          
Incidental Gasoline & Oil Sale -                          -                          -                          
Rent from Gas Property 2,852.00                 -                          22,816.00               
Other Gas Revenues 499,845.90             (399,557.07)            (5,255,125.91)         
Gas Provision of Rate Refunds -                          -                          -                          

Total Other Operating Revenues 1,741,628.25          (511,116.29)            9,612,777.79          
Total Operating Revenues 6,713,312.11          (624,601.29)            96,584,208.54        

Operating Expenses

Operation Expenses

Manufac Gas Production - Oper -                          -                          -                          
NG Production & Gather - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Products Extraction - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Other Gas Supply - Operations 1,389,819.67          (572,888.49)            33,502,307.76        
Steam Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          
Hydraulic Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          
Other Power - Operations -                          -                          -                          
Other Power Supply - Oper -                          (147.72)                   147.72                    
NG Stor, Term & Proc - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Transmission Exp - Oper 0.99                        (10.59)                     4,409.12                 
Regional Market Exp - Oper -                          -                          -                          
Distribution Exp - Oper 1,122,566.48          (21,507.32)              9,067,885.44          
Customer Accounts - Oper 273,355.58             141,720.87             1,565,875.74          
Cust Serv & Info Exp - Oper 21,809.61               (1,243.39)                235,415.53             
Sales Expenses - Oper 2,584.45                 28.32                      9,910.25                 
Admin & General Exp - Oper 1,963,658.57          (72,268.17)              15,959,433.71        
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc
Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account
For the Month Ended August 31, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-
Month Prior Month Date

Total Operation Expenses 4,773,795.35          (526,316.49)            60,345,385.27        

Maintenance Expenses

Production Expenses - Maint -                          -                          -                          
NG Stor, Term & Proc - Maint -                          -                          -                          
Transmission Exp - Maint -                          -                          30,255.00               
Distribution Exp - Maint 648,109.91             225,454.96             3,384,590.18          
Maintenance Gen and Admin 87,981.52               (12,548.28)              898,284.45             

Total Maintenance Expenses 736,091.43             212,906.68             4,313,129.63          

Depreciation Expense 1,242,723.79          8,712.52                 9,715,585.38          
Depreciation Expense for AROs -                          -                          -                          
Amort & Deplet of Util Plant 192,000.28             12,754.23               1,257,819.03          
Amort of Gas Plant Acq Adj -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Conversion Exp -                          -                          -                          
Reg Debits -                          -                          -                          
Reg Credits -                          -                          -                          
Other Taxes FERC 622,452.22             1.10                        4,692,211.23          

Income Taxes - State (5,056.00)                (3,159.00)                (51,655.00)              
Income Taxes - Federal (489,107.00)            464,523.00             500,986.00             

Total Utilities Current Fed State (494,163.00)            461,364.00             449,331.00             

Deferred Income Taxes 298,881.00             (477,364.00)            4,711,153.00          
Prov Deferred Inc Tax - Cr (248,821.00)            (60,786.00)              (2,850,142.00)         
Investment Tax Credit Adj 1,867.00                 3,904.00                 (12,392.00)              
Gain from Disposition of Plant -                          -                          -                          
Loss from Disposition of Plant -                          -                          -                          
Accretion Expenses -                          -                          -                          

Total Operating Expenses 7,124,827.07          (364,823.96)            82,622,080.54        

Net Utility Operating Income(Loss) (411,514.96)            (259,777.33)            13,962,128.00        

Other  Income & Deductions

Revenues from Merchandising -                          -                          -                          
 Costs and Exp Merch Job -                          -                          -                          
NonUtility Revenues 1,104.01                 (944.44)                   197,626.56             
NonUtility Unaffil 520.63                    505.26                    5,911.21                 
Nonoperating Rental Revenue -                          -                          -                          
Earnings of Subsidiaries 65.90                      45.12                      431.92                    
Interest and Dividend Income -                          -                          -                          
Allow for Other FUDC 46,527.57               36,023.64               261,446.98             
Misc Nonoperating Income 49,681.58               14,132.80               681,448.94             
Gain Disposition of Property -                          -                          -                          

Total Other Income 97,899.69               49,762.38               1,146,865.61          

Loss on Disposal of Property -                          -                          39,513.95               
Misc Amortization (2,158.59)                -                          (17,268.72)              
Other Inc Exp Donations -                          (1,455.00)                14,644.98               
Corporate Owned Life Ins -                          -                          -                          
Penalties 16,000.00               (8,000.00)                148,001.36             
Other Inc Exp PoliticalContrib -                          -                          2,448.50                 
Other Inc Deductions 4,667.64                 (11,999.36)              120,400.10             

Total Other Income Deductions 18,509.05               (21,454.36)              307,740.17             

NonUtility Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Income Taxes - Federal 20,175.00               12,603.00               206,107.00             
Income Taxes - State 5,056.00                 3,158.00                 51,656.00               
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Columbia Gas of Kentucky Inc
Income Statement-FERC

Regulatory View - FERC Account
For the Month Ended August 31, 2021

Current Change from Year-To-
Month Prior Month Date

Total Income Taxes Federal Other 25,231.00               15,761.00               257,763.00             

Other Deferred Income Taxes -                          -                          -                          
Prov Defer Inc Tax - Oth - Cr -                          -                          -                          
Invest Tax Credits Adjust -Net -                          -                          -                          
Amortization of ITC -                          -                          -                          

Total Taxes Other Income & Deduct 25,231.00               15,761.00               257,763.00             
Total Other Income (Deductions) 54,159.64               55,455.74               581,362.44             

Interest LT Debt -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Debt Disc & Exp -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Loss on Reacq Debt -                          -                          -                          
Amort of Prem on Debt - Cr -                          -                          -                          
Interest Exp Affiliate 712,609.07             (425.45)                   5,233,199.26          
Other Interest Expense (1,068.64)                (58.07)                     (28,086.65)              
AFUDIC PISCC (21,132.68)              (25,060.87)              (88,893.43)              

Total Interest Charges 690,407.75             (25,544.39)              5,116,219.18          

Income Before Extraordinary Items (1,047,763.07)         (178,777.20)            9,427,271.26          

Extraordinary Income -                          -                          -                          
Extraordinary Deductions -                          -                          -                          

Net Extraordinary Items -                          -                          -                          

Extraordinary Taxes -                          -                          -                          
Deferred Extraordinary Taxes -                          -                          -                          

Income Taxes - Federal & Other -                          -                          -                          
Total Extraordinary Items -                          -                          -                          

Net Income (1,047,763.07)         (178,777.20)            9,427,271.26          



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Response to Staff’s Data Request Set One No. 12 – August Update 

 Respondent:  Jeffery Gore 
 

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC. 
RESPONSE TO STAFF’S FIRST REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

DATED MAY 5, 2021 
 

12.  Provide the following information concerning the costs for the preparation of this 

case: 

a. A detailed schedule of expenses incurred to date for the following categories: 

i. Accounting; 

ii. Engineering; 

iii. Legal; 

iv. Consultants; and 

v. Other Expenses (Identify separately). 

b. For each category identified in Item 12(a), the schedule should include the date 

of each transaction, check number, or other document reference, the vendor, 

the hours worked, the rates per hour, amount, a description of the services 

performed, and the account number in which the expenditure was recorded. 

Provide copies of contracts or other documentation that support charges 

incurred in the preparation of this case. Identify any costs incurred for this case 

that occurred during the base period. 



c. An itemized estimate of the total cost to be incurred for this case. Expenses 

should be broken down into the same categories as identified in Item 12(a), 

with an estimate of the hours to be worked and the rates per hour. Include a 

detailed explanation of how the estimate was determined, along with all 

supporting workpapers and calculations. 

d. Provide monthly updates of the actual costs incurred in conjunction with this 

rate case, reported in the manner requested in Items 12(a) and 12(b), and a 

cumulative total of cost incurred to date for each category. Updates will be due 

when the utility files its monthly financial statements with the Commission, 

through the month of public hearing. 

Response:  

a. Please refer to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183, Staff 1-12, August Update, 

Attachment A for an updated schedule of expenses.  Refer to KY PSC Case No. 2021-

00183, Staff 1-12, August Update, Attachments E, F, G, H, I, J and K for individual invoices 

for additional supporting documentation. The majority of costs of this rate case are 

expected to be incurred in the base period. Columbia is deferring the costs for the 

preparation of this case and is requesting a three year amortization. 

b. Please refer to the original response to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183, Staff 1-12.  

c. Please refer to the original response to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183, Staff 1-12.  



d. Refer to response to Part A. 
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Line Invoice FERC Payment Rates
No. Category Date Account Method Description Vendor Consultant Hours per Hour Support File Amount

$ $

1 Advertising: 6/24/2021 182 Check # 5032060948 Newspaper Advertisements  AdOhio DBA: Ohio Newspaper Services, Inc
2 N/A August Update - Attachment I 31,278.09        
3
4 7/2/2021 182 Check # 5032061133 Newspaper Advertisements  AdOhio DBA: Ohio Newspaper Services, Inc
5 N/A August Update - Attachment I 62,551.18        
6
7
8 Consulting: 4/19/2021 182 ACH # 2012030273 Rate Case Preparation Concentric Energy Advisors Inc Vice President 28.00 517.5 14,490.00        
9   Total August Update - Attachment G 14,490.00        

10
11 6/3/2021 182 ACH # 2012031024 Rate Case Preparation Concentric Energy Advisors Inc
12 Vice President 17.75 517.5 9,185.63          
13   Total August Update - Attachment G 9,185.63          
14 3/25/2021 182 ACH # 2032018244 Rate Case Consultant - Depreciation Study Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate
15 John J Spanos 1.0 285.00 285.00             
16 Support Staff 2.5 120.00 300.00             
17 Assistant Analyst I 2.0 120.00 240.00             
18   Total August Update - Attachment H 825.00             
19 5/3/2021 182 ACH # 2032018137 Rate Case Consultant - Depreciation Study Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate
20 John J Spanos 3.5 285.00 997.50             
21 Analyst 18.0 180.00 3,240.00          
22 Associate Analyst 6.5 170.00 1,105.00          
23 Support Staff 2.0 120.00 240.00             
24 Assistant Analyst I 10.0 120.00 1,200.00          
25   Total August Update - Attachment H 6,782.50          
26 6/4/2021 182 ACH # 2032018244 Rate Case Consultant - Depreciation Study Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate
27 John J Spanos 25.0 285.00 7,125.00          
28 Analyst 30.0 180.00 5,400.00          
29 Associate Analyst 21.5 170.00 3,655.00          
30 Support Staff 8.5 120.00 1,020.00          
31 Assistant Analyst I 10.0 120.00 1,200.00          
32 Expenses 258.27             
33   Total August Update - Attachment H 18,658.27        
34
35 6/28/2021 182 ACH # 2032018335 Rate Case Consultant - Depreciation Study Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate
36 John J Spanos 4.5 285.00 1,282.50          
37 Support Staff 3.5 120.00 420.00             
38 Expenses 758.86             
39   Total August Update - Attachment H 2,461.36          
40
41 3/31/2021 182 ACH # 2012030228 Rate Case Preparation Regulatory Finance Associates
42 Vincent Rea 107.2 260.00 27,872.00        
43   Total August Update - Attachment F 27,872.00        
44 5/31/2021 182 ACH # 2012031193 Rate Case Preparation Regulatory Finance Associates
45 Vincent Rea 54.133 260.00 14,074.58        
46 August Update - Attachment F 14,074.58        
47 7/25/2021 182 ACH # 2012031193 Rate Case Preparation Regulatory Finance Associates
48 Vincent Rea 38.167 260.00 9,923.42          
49 August Update - Attachment F 9,923.42          
50   Total
51 3/31/2021 182 ACH # 2012030213 Rate Case Preparation Agile One
52 Haley Daw 61.25 59.48 3,643.15          
53   Total August Update - Attachment J 3,643.15          
54
55 4/30/2021 182 ACH # 2012030689 Rate Case Preparation Agile One
56 Haley Daw 48.25 59.48 2,869.91          
57   Total August Update - Attachment J 2,869.91          
58
59 5/31/2021 182 ACH # 2012031180 Rate Case Preparation Agile One
60 Haley Daw 7.75 59.48 460.97             
61   Total August Update - Attachment J 460.97             
62
63 6/30/2021 182 ACH # 2012031658 Rate Case Preparation Agile One
64 Haley Daw 1.25 59.48 74.35               
65   Total August Update - Attachment J 74.35               
66

August 31, 2021 Update

Columbia Gas of Kentucky, Inc.
Case No. 2021-00183
Rate Case Expenses



Case No. 2021-00183
Staff Set 1 No. 12 - August Update

Attachment A
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Line Invoice FERC Payment Rates
No. Category Date Account Method Description Vendor Consultant Hours per Hour Support File Amount

$ $

August 31, 2021 Update

Columbia Gas of Kentucky, Inc.
Case No. 2021-00183
Rate Case Expenses

67 Legal: 3/9/2021 182 Check #5012063254 Outside Legal Counsel Goss Samford
68 David Samford 0.7      325.00 227.50             
69 Allyson Honaker 1.0      290.00 290.00             
70   Total Original Response - Attachment B-1 517.50             
71 4/7/2021 182 Check #5012063959 Outside Legal Counsel Goss Samford
72 David Samford 19.7    325.00 6,402.50          
73 Allyson Honaker 15.6    290.00 4,524.00          
74   Total Original Response - Attachment B-1 10,926.50        
75 5/1/2021 182 Check #5012065158 Outside Legal Counsel Goss Samford
76 David Samford 36.0    325.00 11,700.00        
77 Allyson Honaker 47.2    290.00 13,688.00        
78   Total August Update - Attachment E 25,388.00        
79
80 6/8/2021 182 Check #5012065158 Outside Legal Counsel Goss Samford
81 David Samford 25.1    325.00 8,157.50          
82 Ethan Schrage 1.7      95.00 161.50             
83 Allyson Honaker 142.4  290.00 41,296.00        
84 Expenses 2,608.90          
85   Total August Update - Attachment E 52,223.90        
86
87 7/14/2021 182 Check #5012065377 Outside Legal Counsel Goss Samford
88 David Samford 17.1    321.20 5,492.50          
89 Ethan Schrage -      95.00 -                   
90 Allyson Honaker 32.3    290.00 9,367.00          
91 Expenses
92   Total August Update - Attachment E 14,859.50        
93
94 8/7/2021 182 Check #5012065784 Outside Legal Counsel Goss Samford
95 David Samford 14.6    325.00 4,745.00          
96 Ethan Schrage -      95.00 -                   
97 Allyson Honaker 74.8    290.00 21,692.00        
98 Expenses -                   
99   Total August Update - Attachment E 26,437.00        

100
101 Other Expenses:
102
103 6/10/2021 182 Travel Expenses David Roy Expenses August Update - Attachment K 548.17             
104 6/11/2021 182 Travel Expenses Linda Rumpke Expenses August Update - Attachment K 1,545.58          
105 6/11/2021 182 Travel Expenses Kimra Cole Expenses August Update - Attachment K 2,019.95          
106 6/14/2021 182 Travel Expenses Judy Cooper Expenses August Update - Attachment K 1,444.05          
107 Total 5,557.75          
108
109 Total Rate Case Expenses 341,060.55      



Vendor Details

Billing Address:

2365 Harrodsburg Road, Suite B-
324 
Lexington 
KY 40504 

Tax-ID:

Header Informa� on

Tax Informa� on

Invoice Summary

Type Rate x Unit (-) Discount (-) Adjustment Tax Amount

Fees $26,437.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 26,437.00

Expenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 0.00

Invoice Total (USD) $26,437.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 26,437.00

Descrip� on

INVOICE NUMBER

5712

VENDOR

Goss Samford PLLC

INVOICE DATE

8/7/21

RECEIVED DATE

8/7/21

PROJECT

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

POSTING STATUS

Posted

WARNING:

None

BILLING START DATE

1/1/00

BILLING END DATE

7/31/21

SUBMITTED TOTAL

$ 26,437.00

SUBMITTED CURRENCY

USD

LINE ITEM WARNINGS

None

TAX TYPE

US

TAX RATE

0.00 %

-

• 

• 



Comments to Requester

Line Items

View:  All Line Items

Line Items 1 - 121 of 121

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

2

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple responses to data requests that had been marked ready for review and edit same. 

3

7/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails and the Tool for excel spreadsheets in response to Staff's 26 and email J. Clark and J.
Ryan re same. 

4

7/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re hearing date. 

5

7/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review table provided by S. Durr re missing a� achments and compare to the Tool and the actual
filing. 

6

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $261.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with project team re status and responses to data requests. 

7

7/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with S. Durr re review of Staff's responses for missing informa� on in filing. 

8
7/24/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Forward email from A. Goad re missing excel files to J. Clark and J. Ryan. 

9

7/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with A. Goad re excel spreadsheets not filed. 

10

7/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email mul� ple emails to PSC with confiden� al informa� on a� ached for responses to discovery. 

11

7/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email mul� ple emails with confiden� al informa� on a� ached to A. Goad. 

12

7/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review KIUC's Mo� on to Intervene. 

13

7/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul� ple emails with A. Goad re filing and confiden� al informa� on. 

14

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $348.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Op� mize several pdfs to reduce file size for filing and electronically file responses to Staff's and AG's
discovery requests. 

15

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  cover le� er and complete Mo�on and prepare same for electronic filing. 

16

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to mul�ple emails from J. Clark, et. al. re discovery. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

17

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from R. Bright and J. Cooper re customer no� ce. 

18

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  Mo�on for Devia�on for Proof of Publica�on filing. 

19

7/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re tear sheets for customer no�ce and copy of customer no�ce
to provide as proof of publica�on. 

20

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 6.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,740.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nuing preparing discovery responses for electronic filing and reviewing same. 

21

7/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with K. Johnson, et. al. re responses to data requests. 

22

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review suggested edits to Mo�on for Devia�on and edit same. 

23

7/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 4.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,160.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and edit mul�ple responses to data requests and emails re same. 

24

7/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review Order gran�ng KIUC's mo�on to intervene. 

25
7/9/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with C. Lai, et al. re dra.  responses to discovery requests. 

26

7/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 3.00 $0.00 $0.00 $870.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple responses to discovery and a� achments. 

27

7/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with Chun-Yi Lai, et. al. re responses to discovery. 

28

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul�ple telephone conferences with J. Ryan and J. Clark re discovery responses. 

29

7/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with J. Konold, et. al. re responses to discovery. 

30

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Konold, et al. re responses to dra� data requests. 

31

7/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark, et al. re response to AG data requests. 

32

7/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a� ached informa�on from K. Cartella re response to AG's requests and reply to
same. 

33

7/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with A. Honaker re mo�on for confiden�al treatment. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

34

7/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with project team to discuss status and upcoming deadlines. 

35

7/31/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email J. Clark, J. Cooper, et. al. re filing missing informa� on for AG requests. 

36

7/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with K. Johnson, et. al. re discovery responses. 

37

7/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Cooper re KIUC's Mo� on to Intervene. 

38

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark and J. Ryan re process for discovery. 

39

7/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with project team re rate case status. 

40

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to mul� ple emails from J. Ryan and J. Clark re responses to data requests. 

41

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office conference with D. Samford re tear sheets and email to J. Cooper re deadline to provide tear
sheets. 

42
7/21/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re edits to Mo� on. 

43

7/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re developments and strategy. 

44

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a� ached spreadsheet from J. Ryan re witness assignments for AG data requests. 

45

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review suggested edits to Mo� on from D. Samford and edit same. 

46

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.60 $0.00 $0.00 $464.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete review of confiden� al informa� on and dra. ing mo�on. 

47

7/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from K. Johnson, et al. re dra� responses to discovery requests. 

48

7/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email chain from J. Clark and prepare response to same. 

49

7/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin reviewing confiden�al responses and dra�ing mo�on for confiden�al treatment. 

50

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from N. Madvek re dra� responses to data requests. 

51
7/20/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul� ple telephone conferences and emails with J. Ryan re dra.  responses to data requests. 

52

7/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange texts and telephone conference with J. Cooper re filing made. 

53

7/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 5.20 $0.00 $0.00 $1,508.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple responses and a� achments to data requests. 

54

7/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $580.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with K. Cole, et al. re responses to discovery requests. 

55

7/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review Commission Order gran�ng KIUC's interven�on. 

56

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $292.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with project team re status and responses to data requests. 

57

7/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with A. Goad re responses to Staff 26. 

58

7/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Create jump drive with confiden�al informa�on for AG and give to J. Horne.

59

7/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 2.50 $0.00 $0.00 $725.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and edit mul�ple responses to data requests. 

60
7/8/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review the Commission's website and review the prior Orders K. Johnson requested and forward
lanague from the Orders to K. Johnson. 

61

7/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from K. Johnson re language from prior Commission Orders. 

62

7/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email from C. Yi-Lin re clarifica� on on data request. 

63

7/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  cover le� er for filing excel spreadsheets in response to Staff's 26 and prepare for electronic
filing. 

64

7/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with K. Cole, et al. re dra� responses to discovery requests. 

65

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Meet S. Durr to pick up affidavit for customer no�ce mailing. 

66

7/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Cooper re responses to AG requests; exchange texts with S. Durr re same. 

67

7/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a� ached spreadsheet from J. Clark re Staff Response 26. 

68

7/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.10 $0.00 $0.00 $319.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review notes for discussion on AG requests and par�cipate in video conference re same. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

69

7/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple responses to discovery. 

70

7/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $292.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team re requests from the AG's office. 

71

7/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review responses from K. Cuccia and J. Clark re discovery issue. 

72

7/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email re KIUC interven� on from J. Cooper. 

73

7/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email from J. Cooper re response to data request. 

74

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on dra.  mo�on for devia�on. 

75

7/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to emails from K. Johnson, C. Lai and others re responses to data requests. 

76

7/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email form J. Gore re rate case expense update. 

77

7/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark and J. Ryan re dra� responses to data requests. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

78

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re data requests. 

79

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 2.40 $0.00 $0.00 $780.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference call with J. Konold, et al. to discuss informa� on requests from the AG. 

80

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email to S. Durr re mo� on for devia� on. 

81

7/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails re discovery requests and exchange emails with J. Ryan re same. 

82

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re tear sheets for proof of publica� on filing. 

83

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email from J. Clark re V. Rea ques� on on discovery and conference with D.
Samford re same. 

84

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and analyze the AG's First Request for Informa� on. 

85

7/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails and comment on dra. s of responses to Staff and AG data requests and conference
with A. Honaker re same. 

86
7/29/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  cover le�er for filing informa�on not previously filed with responses to discovery. 

87

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office conference re response to data request from the Commission. 

88

7/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple emails and a� achments from L. Cook, S. Durr and J. Cooper re discovery responses. 

89

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $292.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and analyze the data requests from the A� orney General. 

90

7/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Separate telephone conferences with L. Cook, J. Cooper and S. Durr re informa�on not included in
previous filing for responses to discovery. 

91

7/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a� ached notes and documents from mee�ng from K. Ricci. 

92

7/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with S. Taylor, et. al. re responses to discovery. 

93

7/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re supplemental response to data request. 

94

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Edit filing to insert legible versions of four tear sheets and prepare for electronic filing. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

95

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 3.00 $0.00 $0.00 $870.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review numerous responses to discovery and edit same. 

96

7/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with S. Durr re informa� on that needs to be filed in response to AG's request
for informa� on. 

97

7/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review notes from S. Durr re informa� on to be filed. 

98

7/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Cooper and S. Durr re customer no� ce and review documents provided re
same. 

99

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re status of rate case. 

100

7/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review KIUC's mo� on for leave to intervene. 

101

7/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with project team. 

102

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and analyze Commission's Staff's second request for informa� on. 

103
7/26/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Electronically file excel spreadsheets and cover le� er in response to Staff 26. 

104

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conferenc with D. Samford re discovery issues. 

105

7/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re review of responses to discovery and exchange emails with S.
Durr re same. 

106

7/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul� ple telephone conferences and texts with J. Ryan re responses to data requests. 

107

7/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with project team. 

108

7/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.80 $0.00 $0.00 $522.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on mul� ple data request responses. 

109

7/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails re discovery requests and respond to same. 

110

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare affidavits, tear sheets and mo� on for electronic filing. 

111

7/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  cover le� er for proof of publica�on filing and prepare for electronic filing. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

112

7/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 3.50 $0.00 $0.00 $1,015.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con� nue reviewing and edi� ng mul� ple responses to discovery and a� achments and emails re same. 

113

7/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $650.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Ryan, et al. re dra.  responses to discovery requests. 

114

7/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and analyze Staff's supplemental data requests. 

115

7/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review recent decisions from the PSC for relevant guidance. 

116

7/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on dra� mo�on for confiden�al treatment. 

117

7/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 2.50 $0.00 $0.00 $725.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with K. Cole, et al. re responses to discovery requests. 

118

7/17/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 3.40 $0.00 $0.00 $986.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nue review and edi�ng responses to discovery and a� achments. 

119

7/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 4.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,160.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple emails from J. Ryan, et. al. re discovery responses and review and edit numerous
discovery responses and a� achments.

120
7/1/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and respond to M. Kurtz re Mo� on to Intervene. 

121

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in telephone conference with K. Johnson, et. al. re ques� ons on responses to data
requests. 

122

7/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails re discovery responses. 

Access Informa� on

Summary Breakdowns

By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category 

Timekeeper
Avg Net
Rate

Net
Units

Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
% of Total
Fees

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

 Honaker, Allyson L 290.00 74.80 0.00 0.00 21,692.00 82.05%

 Samford, David S 325.00 14.60 0.00 0.00 4,745.00 17.95%

Remi� ance Details

CREATED BY

system, system

CREATED ON

8/7/21 12:23 PM

MODIFIED BY

system, system

MODIFIED ON

8/24/21 1:50 AM

, 
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Ready to send to AP: Yes Invoice On Hold For
AP:

No

Acceptance Status: Accepted Date Received by AP: 8/23/21

Reason for Rejec� on:

Payment Method: Check Check # 5012065784

Paid Date: 8/24/21 Total Amount on
Check:

26,437

Paid Amount: 26,437 Paid By Insurance
Group:

No

User Rights

Op� on User Read Update Delete Perm

Allow Clark, Joe Yes Yes No No

Ac� ve Requests

Request Name Requester Request Date Expira� on Date Status

No records available.

Completed Requests

Item Request Name Requester Request Date Comple� on Date Comment Outcome

1 Post Invoice for 26,437.00
USD

Goss
Samford
PLLC

8/23/21 8/23/21 Approved

Approval History

Stop Performer Ac� vity Date/Time Internal Comment

1 Clark, Joe Approved 8/7/21 12:45 PM

2 System Expired 8/22/21 12:00 AM

2 System Sent to Process Manager 8/22/21 12:00 AM

2 Madvek, Nicholas Restarted at previously ac� ve stop 8/23/21 7:32 AM

2 Cuccia, Kim S Approved 8/23/21 7:53 AM

I I I I I 

I I I I 



Versions

Invoice Version Created On Rejec� on Date Invoice Reason/Comments

No versions available.

Invoice Details  

PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

No
ALTERNATIVE FEE

No

PAID AMOUNT

26,437.00
INVOICE ON HOLD FOR AP

No

ACCEPTANCE STATUS

Accepted
INSURANCE INVOICE?

No

PAYMENT METHOD

Check
CHECK #

5012065784

CHECK DATE WITHHOLDING AMOUNT

MATTER TYPE

Ma� er
REASON FOR REJECTION

TRANSACTION MATTER DISPUTE MATTER

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

PO NUMBER TOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK

26,437.00

READY TO SEND TO AP

Yes
PAID DATE

8/24/21

MATTER CATEGORY

308 - State Regulatory
DATE RECEIVED BY AP

8/23/21

javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')
javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')
javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')
javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')


Vendor Details

Billing Address:

2365 Harrodsburg Road, Suite B-
324 
Lexington 
KY 40504 

Tax-ID: 455403380

Header Informa� on 

Tax Informa� on 

Invoice Summary

Type Rate x Unit (-) Discount (-) Adjustment Tax Amount

Fees $14,859.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 14,859.50

Expenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 0.00

Invoice Total (USD) $14,859.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 14,859.50

Descrip� on 

INVOICE NUMBER

5627

VENDOR

Goss Samford PLLC

INVOICE DATE

7/4/21

RECEIVED DATE

7/4/21

PROJECT

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

POSTING STATUS

Posted

WARNING:

None

BILLING START DATE

1/1/00

BILLING END DATE

6/30/21

SUBMITTED TOTAL

$ 14,859.50

SUBMITTED CURRENCY

USD

LINE ITEM WARNINGS

None

TAX TYPE

US

TAX RATE

0.00 %

• 

• 



Comments to Requester 

Line Items 

View:  All Line Items

Line Items 1 - 105 of 105

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

2

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails and a� ached final data request response from J. Ryan to begin conver� ng to
pdf and combining into one pdf for filing. 

3

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to emails from J. Cooper, et al. re dra.  discovery requests. 

4

6/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. re case status and strategy. 

5

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.30 $0.00 $0.00 $422.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails re mo�on for confiden�al treatment, review confiden�al documents and dra� mo�on. 

6

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $650.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference to discuss responses to dra� data requests. 

7

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Edit and revise dra� mo�on for confiden�al treatment and forward same to J. Ryan, et al. for review. 

8
6/3/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $0.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re case administra� on. 

9

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford to discuss discovery response mee� ng. 

10

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review revisions to dra.  mo�on for confiden�al treatment. 

11

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.60 $0.00 $0.00 $464.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple completed data request response, adjust headings on some and convert to pdf for
filing. 

12

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re dra� responses. 

13

6/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Ryan re mee�ng and office conference with D. Samford re same. 

14

6/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Ryan re discovery. 

15

6/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review le� er with items need to cure deficiency and the deficiency cured le� er from the Commission. 

16

6/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review deficiency le� ers from the Commission and mul�ple telephone conferences to discuss and
remedy same. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

17

6/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Clark re procedural schedule ques� on and respond to same. 

18

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and exchange emails with K. Cartella re issue on discovery; telephone conference with D.
Samford re same. 

19

6/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange and telephone conference with J. Wozniak re dra.  document and review and
comment on same. 

20

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review Mo�on for Confiden�al Treatment. 

21

6/23/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email J. Clark, et al. re conversa�on with K. Boehm. 

22

6/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in legal team video conference. 

23

6/23/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with K. Boehm re the rate case. 

24

6/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to emails and texts re dra� data request responses. 

25
6/14/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange texts with J. Ryan re mee� ng to discuss schedule M. 

26

6/23/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Cooper, et. al. re ques� ons from K. Boehm. 

27

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with project team. 

28

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $580.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et. al. to discuss responses to dra.  data requests. 

29

6/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Clark re procedural schedule. 

30

6/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Ryan et. al. re error in K. Cartella spreadsheet. 

31

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul�ple telephone conferences with D. Samford re status of responses. 

32

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra� cover le� er for filing. 

33

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails, texts and telephone conferences with J. Ryan re discovery issues and filing. 

34
6/8/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team. 

35

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review numerous emails re revised dra.  data request responses from K. Cole, et al. 

36

6/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in project team video conference and review notes forwarded by E. Bytnar re same. 

37

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul�ples telephone conferences with J. Clark, J. Ryan and A. Honaker re dra� responses to data
requests. 

38

6/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in project team video conference with J. Cooper, et. al. 

39

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re confiden�ality of certain responses. 

40

6/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review various emails re status of responses to data requests. 

41

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review public comment filed. 

42

6/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with S. Durr, et. al. re �ming to file proof of publica�on and review a� achment from
S. Durr re same. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

43

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul� ple emails with J. Ryan and K. Perez re password issues and go through process to
change same. 

44

6/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with L. Black re pdf copies of Applica� on and Responses to Data Requests. 

45

6/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emaili and a� ached agenda for upcoming mee� ng from E. Bytnar. 

46

6/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.80 $0.00 $0.00 $522.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Tab, hole punch and bind original copy of complete 13 volume applica� on and label same. 

47

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.10 $0.00 $0.00 $319.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con� nuing review of responses to data requests and make notes on items s� ll needed. 

48

6/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email confiden� al informa� on to A. Goad and executed agreement. 

49

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from Ad Ohio re publica� on. 

50

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team. 

51
6/3/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con� nue reviewing discovery responses and emails re same. 

52

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails from J. Cooper, et. al. re responses to data requests. 

53

6/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with A. Goad and D. Samford re confiden� ality agreement. 

54

6/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Cooper, et. al. re Applica� on accepted for filing. 

55

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.90 $0.00 $0.00 $617.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. re dra.  data request responses. 

56

6/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email confiden�ality agreement to A. Goad and exchange emails re same. 

57

6/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra� confiden�ality agreement and email same to D. Samford for review. 

58

6/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review executed confiden�ality agreement from A. Goad for AG. 

59

6/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference re Schedule M. 

60
6/8/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Research precedent to address ques� on re dra.  data request response and email update re same. 

61

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple emails re response to request confiden�al treatment. 

62

6/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.40 $0.00 $0.00 $455.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review deficiency le� ers from the Commission; telephone conferences re same; prepare and submit
cure le� er. 

63

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with S. Durr re customer no�ce publica�on issue. 

64

6/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re procedural schedule. 

65

6/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with rate case team. 

66

6/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review procedural order and calendar case milestones. 

67

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review Order gran�ng the AG's Mo�on for Leave to Intervene. 

68

6/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with A. Honaker re confiden�ality agreement and review documenta�on re same. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

69

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with A. Goad re confiden� ality agreement. 

70

6/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. re base period update. 

71

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and text from S. Durr re customer no� ce issue. 

72

6/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails and addi� onal responses to discovery uploaded into the tool. 

73

6/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Ryan and J. Harding re responses to data request edits. 

74

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with project team. 

75

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re discovery related issues.

76

6/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review procedural schedule issued by the Commission and calendar rates re same. 

77

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Cooper re dra.  data request responses. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

78

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con� nue review of discovery response and email re same. 

79

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on dra.  responses to data requests. 

80

6/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re status and strategy. 

81

6/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $348.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nue review of emails re discovery responses and reviewing responses. 

82

6/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team re discovery requests, scheduling, etc. 

83

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra� cover le� er for filing K. Cartella verifica�on and electronically file same. 

84

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and telephone conference with J. Ryan re K. Cartella verifica�on. 

85

6/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Cooper, et al. re the deficiency cure. 

86

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re status of outstanding response and when to expect same. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

87

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review PSC Order gran� ng AG interven� on. 

88

6/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Wolzniak. 

89

6/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails re discovery responses and review mul� ple discovery responses. 

90

6/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails re discovery issues. 

91

6/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $261.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con� nue review of emails re discovery responses and reviewing responses. 

92

6/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on dra.  confiden�ality agreement with the A� orney General's office.

93

6/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re case schedule and developments. 

94

6/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a� ached agenda for mee�ng from E. Bytnar.

95

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference re suspension period. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

96

6/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re developments and strategy. 

97

6/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails from J. Clark, et. al. re discovery requests and issues re same. 

98

6/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Convert mul� ple response to pdf, review a� achment headings and edit same and begin combining
into one pdf document for filing. 

99

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Horne and J. Cooper re more legible copy of customer no� ce; provide same to
J. Horne. 

100

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 3.00 $0.00 $0.00 $870.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare cover le� er, mo� on for confiden� al treatment and all response for electronic filing (op� mize,
OCR, etc.) and electronically file same. 

101

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple excel spreadsheets for filing and exchange emails with J. Ryan re same. 

102

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails from A. Stubbs, J. Clark, et. al. re responses to discovery. 

103

6/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Ryan and D. Samford re verifica� ons for witnesses. 



Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

104

6/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review AG's Mo� on to Intervene. 

105

6/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re witness prepara� on and other case items. 

106

6/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.30 $0.00 $0.00 $377.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review en� re filing before filing. 

Access Informa� on

Summary Breakdowns

By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category 

Timekeeper
Avg Net
Rate

Net
Units

Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
% of Total
Fees

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

    Honaker, Allyson L 290.00 32.30 0.00 0.00 9,367.00 63.04%

    Samford, David S 321.20 17.10 0.00 0.00 5,492.50 36.96%

Remi� ance Details

CREATED BY

system, system

CREATED ON

7/4/21 3:17 PM

MODIFIED BY

system, system

MODIFIED ON

7/19/21 11:15 PM
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Ready to send to AP: Yes Invoice On Hold For
AP:

No

Acceptance Status: Accepted Date Received by AP: 7/19/21

Reason for Rejec� on:

Payment Method: Check Check # 5012065377

Paid Date: 7/20/21 Total Amount on
Check:

14,860

Paid Amount: 14,860 Paid By Insurance
Group:

No

User Rights  

Op� on User Read Update Delete Perm

Allow Clark, Joe Yes Yes No No

Ac� ve Requests  

Request Name Requester Request Date Expira� on Date Status

No records available.

Completed Requests  

Item Request Name Requester Request Date Comple� on Date Comment Outcome

1 Post Invoice for 14,859.50
USD

Goss
Samford
PLLC

7/4/21 7/18/21 Approved

Approval History

Stop Performer Ac� vity Date/Time Internal Comment

1 Clark, Joe Approved 7/18/21 9:36 PM

Versions

Invoice Version Created On Rejec� on Date Invoice Reason/Comments

No versions available.
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Invoice Details  

PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

No
ALTERNATIVE FEE

No

PAID AMOUNT

14,859.50
INVOICE ON HOLD FOR AP

No

ACCEPTANCE STATUS

Accepted
INSURANCE INVOICE?

No

PAYMENT METHOD

Check
CHECK #

5012065377

CHECK DATE WITHHOLDING AMOUNT

MATTER TYPE

Ma� er
REASON FOR REJECTION

TRANSACTION MATTER DISPUTE MATTER

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

PO NUMBER TOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK

14,859.50

READY TO SEND TO AP

Yes
PAID DATE

7/20/21

MATTER CATEGORY

308 - State Regulatory
DATE RECEIVED BY AP

7/19/21

javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')
javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')
javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')
javascript:submitForm('editAction',undefined, 'block_Common_Details')


6/8/2021
Invoice - 5617 - Team

C
onnect 6.1.1

team
connect.nisource.net:9081/Team

C
onnect-6.1.1/invoiceView.htm

?rn=474
1/25

 N
o�fica�on:

W
orkflow

 status: Pending Approval 

Vendor Details

Billing Address:

2365 Harrodsburg Road, Suite B-
324 
Lexington 
KY 40504 

Tax-ID:

Header Inform
a�on

Tax Inform
a�on

Invoice Sum
m

ary

Type
Rate x U

nit
(-) Discount

(-) Adjustm
ent

Tax
Am

ount

Fees
$49,615.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$ 49,615.00

Expenses
$2,608.90

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$ 2,608.90

Invoice Total (U
SD)

$52,223.90
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$ 52,223.90

Adjustm
ent Date

Adjusted By
Descrip�on

IN
VO

ICE N
U

M
BER

5617

VEN
DO

R

Goss Sam
ford PLLC

IN
VO

ICE DATE

6/8/21

RECEIVED DATE

6/8/21

PRO
JECT

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

PO
STIN

G STATU
S

N
ot Posted

W
ARN

IN
G:

N
one

BILLIN
G START DATE

1/1/00

BILLIN
G EN

D DATE

5/31/21

SU
BM

ITTED TO
TAL

$ 52,223.90

SU
BM

ITTED CU
RREN

CY

U
SD

LIN
E ITEM

 W
ARN

IN
GS

9

TAX TYPE

U
STAX RATE

0.00 %

~ 

I 



6/8/2021 Invoice - 5617 - TeamConnect 6.1.1

teamconnect.nisource.net:9081/TeamConnect-6.1.1/invoiceView.htm?rn=474 2/25

Adjustment Date Adjusted By Descrip� on

6/8/21 8:51 PM Clark, Joe Total Reduce By Percent 0.00 
Comments to Requester: No reduc� on because expenses are allowed as
prin� ng, copying, postage, etc... was for copies for other par� es to the
case (not internal to GS) 
In House Comments: No reduc� on because expenses are allowed as
prin� ng, copying, postage, etc... was for copies for other par� es to the
case (not internal to GS)  

Descrip� on

Comments to Requester

Line Items

View:  All Line Items

Line Items 1 - 178 of 178

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

1

5/5/21 Expense E101 Copying $0.12 41.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.92

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Photocopies of Staff's First Set of Discovery Requests. 

2 
5/5/21 Expense E110 Out-of-town travel $0.58 200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Travel to Columbus to a. end witness tes�mony mee�ngs. (LAH) 
Warning: Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

3 
5/7/21 Expense E110 Out-of-town travel $0.58 200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mileage from Columbus a�er a�ending witness tes�mony mee�ngs. (LAH) 
Warning: Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

4 
5/7/21 Expense E110 Out-of-town travel $342.08 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $342.08

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Hotel charges for Columbus mee�ngs. (LAH) 
Warning: Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

5 5/17/21 Expense E110 Out-of-town travel $0.58 200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00
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6/8/2021 Invoice - 5617 - TeamConnect 6.1.1

teamconnect.nisource.net:9081/TeamConnect-6.1.1/invoiceView.htm?rn=474 3/25

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mileage to Columbus to a. end page turn mee�ngs. (LAH) 
Warning: Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

6 
5/20/21 Expense E110 Out-of-town travel $0.58 200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mileage from Columbus a�er page turn. (LAH) 
Warning: Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

7 
5/20/21 Expense E110 Out-of-town travel $780.45 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $780.45

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Hotel and parking for mee�ngs in Columbus. (LAH) 
Warning: Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

8

5/28/21 Expense E101 Copying $0.30 250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $75.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Color Photocopies for rate applica�on. 

9

5/28/21 Expense E101 Copying $0.12 6,157.00 $0.00 $0.00 $738.84

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Photocopies for rate applica�on. 

10 

5/28/21 Expense E102 Outside prin�ng $65.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office supplies for rate applica�on. 
Warning: Line item descrip�on contains a charge matching disallowed descrip�on: Supplies 
Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

11 

5/28/21 Expense E102 Outside prin�ng $89.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $89.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office Supplies for rate applica�on. 
Warning: Line item descrip�on contains a charge matching disallowed descrip�on: Supplies 
Line Item includes Expense that needs to be reviewed. 

12 
5/28/21 Expense E108 Postage $0.50 95.56 $0.00 $0.00 $47.78

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Postage for service copy of applica�on to the A�orney General. 
Warning: Line item descrip�on contains a charge matching disallowed descrip�on: General 

13

4/28/21 Expense E101 Copying $0.12 11.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.32

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Photocopies of No�ce of Intent 

14 4/28/21 Expense E108 Postage $0.50 1.02 $0.00 $0.00 $0.51
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6/8/2021 Invoice - 5617 - TeamConnect 6.1.1

teamconnect.nisource.net:9081/TeamConnect-6.1.1/invoiceView.htm?rn=474 4/25

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Postage for service of No� ce of Intent to AGs. 

16

5/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul� ple emails with L. Black, et. al. re addi� onal revisions and incorpora� ng same. 

17

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $580.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Incorporate edits and print updated versions of filing requirements and insert into hard copy volumes
and review for completeness to prepare for mee� ng with J. Cooper and S. Durr. 

18

5/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review DAR-3 and incorporate into hard copy and pdf volume 1. 

19

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Gore re revision needed to fix a typo on SFR. 

20

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul� ple emails with L. Black and review mul� ple a. achments re pdf volumes. 

21

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin compiling final original hard copy of filing. 

22

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete dra�ing and prin�ng of blue pages to insert for tes�mony a�achments and SEC reports. 

23

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 4.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,160.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review final versions of witness tes�mony and print same for inclusion into original hard copy filing. 
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24

5/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 8.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,320.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in extended rate case mee� ng. 

25

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with J. Cooper, et al. rate case filing and related ma. ers. 

26

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with project team. 

27

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with legal team re case status and outstanding items.

28

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re status of tes�mony review. 

29

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Ryan and J. Clark re addi�onal edits to the applica�on and telephone
conference with D. Samford re same. 

30

5/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 8.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,320.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in rate case mee�ng. 

31

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review suggested edits to Mo�on for Devia�on and email same to J. Clark and J. Ryan for review. 

32
5/24/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and complete dra.  of Mo�on for Devia�on. 

33

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $348.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review tes�mony to prepare for witness mee�ngs. 

34

5/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review forma�ed customer no�ce and exchange emails re same. 

35

5/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference re customer no�ce forma�ng for newspaper. 

36

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and edit J. Seigler tes�mony; email re same. 

37

5/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review the Commission's First Set of Discovery Requests. 

38

5/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Wolzniak, et al. re rate case issue. 

39

5/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to emails from J. Ryan re tes�mony. 

40

5/17/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.50 $0.00 $0.00 $1,015.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Travel to Columbus for rate case turn mee�ng. 

41
5/3/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50
I I I I I I I I 
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Clark re dra.  tes�mony. 

42

5/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re witnesses to prepare verifica�ons for. 

43

5/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 8.50 $0.00 $0.00 $2,465.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in rate case mee�ng. 

44

5/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with A. Honaker to discuss status of various pieces of tes�mony. 

45

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 1.10 $0.00 $0.00 $357.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team to discuss rate case status, strategy and current dra�s of SFR and
other components. 

46

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper, et al. re rate case issue. 

47

5/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review balancing adjustment order and exchange emails with J. Cooper re same. 

48

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Schrage,
Ethan

$95.00 1.70 $0.00 $0.00 $161.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Research necessary to assist with J. Cooper tes�mony. 

49

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.20 $0.00 $0.00 $928.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Travel from Columbus to home. 
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50

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 4.50 $0.00 $0.00 $1,305.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: A. end mee�ngs with Columbia team and witnesses to review tes�mony. 

51

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email research order to J. Harding for reference and review. 

52

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails and a�ached documents from J. Spanos. 

53

5/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.20 $0.00 $0.00 $928.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review tes�mony of K. Cole, M. Bartos, S. Taylor, J. Spanos, M. Roaza, J. Cooper and C. Lai to prepare
for tes�mony review mee�ng on Thursday. 

54

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review agenda for legal mee�ng emailed by J. Clark. 

55

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review PSC site for relevant precedent 

56

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 8.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,320.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: A�end mee�ngs with witnesses to review tes�mony. 

57

5/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.20 $0.00 $0.00 $928.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Travel to Columbus to a�end tes�mony review mee�ngs. 

58
5/28/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Clark re dra.  responses to data requests. 

59

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Assist with prepara�on of rate case filing; mul�ple office conferences with A. Honaker re same. 

60

5/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email J. Clark re upcoming tasks. 

61

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails and a�achments from J. Ryan re edits to Mo�on and Applica�on. 

62

5/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $580.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin to assemble final volumes (hard copy and pdf) to match revised TOC volumes from L. Black 

63

5/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re status and developments following page-turn. 

64

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul�ple office conferences with D. Samford re status of filing. 

65

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a�ached agenda for rate case video conference. 

66

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails on updates on the tes�mony of M. Roza. 

67
5/25/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
I I I I I I I I 
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Cooper re D. Roy verifica� on. 

68

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails from V. Rea, et. al. re tes� mony and ques� ons re same. 

69

5/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails and a. ached pdf volumes from L. Black. 

70

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Clark re S. Taylor tes�mony. 

71

5/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin OCR on volumes containing SEC reports and inser�ng blue pages to separate reports. 

72

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with J. Harding, et. al. re tax tes�mony; review documents provided by
J. Harding re same.

73

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul�ple texts with J. Clark and J. Cooper re status of filing. 

74

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Box AG copy for mailing and travel to UPS Store to mail. 

75

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Electronically file Cover le�er, Mo�on for Devia�on, Applica�on and all filing requirements and print
filing receipts for each filing. 
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76

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.70 $0.00 $0.00 $493.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Insert edited tariff pages into hard copy and pdf copy and do final page turn comparison of changed
volumes for consistency. 

77

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with rate case team to discuss outstanding issues on accoun� ng and
COSS.

78

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review revised dra.  of S. Taylor tes�mony and email J. Clark re same. 

79

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review data requests received from Commision. 

80

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Cooper, et al. rate case filing and related ma�ers. 

81

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and suggested edits from D. Roy to Mo�on for Devia�on and edit same. 

82

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with S. Taylor, et al. re dra� tes�mony. 

83

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 4.50 $0.00 $0.00 $1,305.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete prin�ng, tabbing, binding and labeling all 13 volumes for the hard copy to mail to AG. 

84
5/25/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team. 

85

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with legal team to discuss status and assignment of tasks. 

86

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $227.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. re status of the filing and strategy. 

87

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Cooper, et al. re regulatory issues and strategy. 

88

5/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin OCR of pdf completed volumes. 

89

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete edits to Mo� on to Devia� on and email to team for review. 

90

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails and updated TOC from L. Black. 

91

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark re status of J. Spanos tes� mony and deprecia� on study. 

92

5/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul� ple emails re edits needed to tariffs. 

93
5/24/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00
I I I I I I I I 
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on dra.  mo�on for devia�on. 

94

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul�ple emails from J. Clark, K. Cole, et. al. re tes�mony and ILI issues. 

95

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $292.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper and assist with pulling together data to support her tes�mony. 

96

5/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review tariffs that were finalized by J. Cooper and forward same to S. Durr for review. 

97

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails and edits to D. Roy tes�mony. 

98

5/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul�ple emails with L. Black, J. Clark, et. al. re progress and edits. 

99

5/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 2.40 $0.00 $0.00 $780.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on latest dra�s of tes�mony of M. Batos, K. Cole, J. Gore and V. Rea. 

100

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re revised dra� tes�mony. 

101

5/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re tes�mony review progress. 

102
5/28/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $580.00
I I I I I I I I 
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete OCR and op� mizing for pdfs that are too large to file and prepare for electronic filing. 

103

5/17/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to emails from J. Cooper, L. Black, et al. re the dra.  applica�on and filing. 

104

5/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 8.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,320.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nue page turn with J. Cooper and comparison of hard copy and pdf copy to incorporate
addi�onal edits. 

105

5/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 4.50 $0.00 $0.00 $1,305.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Page turn mee�ng with J. Cooper and S. Durr. 

106

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re tes�mony review. 

107

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Wozniak, et al. re updates and developments. 

108

5/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a�ached edits to Mo�on to Devia�on from J. Clark. 

109

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and spreadsheets from S. Durr re customer no�ce and AdOhio. 

110

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole and rate case team to discuss status and items needed. 
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111

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with M. Bartos, et al. re revised dra.  tes�mony and CV/resume. 

112

5/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re tes�mony review mee�ngs.

113

5/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nue prin�ng additonal items that have been edited and assemble hard copy volumes and pdf
volumes to prepare for mee�ng with J. Cooper and S. Durr. 

114

5/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Ryan and J. Clark re addi�onal edits to the applica�on and telephone
conference with A. Honaker re same. 

115

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra� cover le�er for filing. 

116

5/4/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with legal team to discuss strategy, �ming and task assignment. 

117

5/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark and K. Cartella re confiden�al informa�on. 

118

5/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with C. Lai re update to SFR. 

119
5/22/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review all witness tes� mony a. achments. 

120

5/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Make final edits to Applica�on to updated changed volume and tab numbers. 

121

5/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review numerous emails and a�achments for witness tes�mony from L. Black. 

122

5/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mee�ng with S. Durr. 

123

5/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.50 $0.00 $0.00 $1,015.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Travel from Columbus to Richmond. 

124

5/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 8.30 $0.00 $0.00 $2,407.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in page turn mee�ng to review dra� applica�on. 

125

5/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Edit Applica�on re discussions and edits from page turn. 

126

5/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with L. Black re Table of Contents and headers for tes�mony exhibits. 

127

5/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with J. Clark and J. Ryan re Exhibit list for Applica�on. 

128
5/10/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00
I I I I I I I I 
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and edit customer no� ce and forward to J. Clark and J. Ryan. 

129

5/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 1.80 $0.00 $0.00 $585.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review addi� onal revisions to tes� mony from J. Gore, M. Bartos, C. Lai and S. Taylor and comment on
same. 

130

5/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  verifica�ons for each witness' tes�mony. 

131

5/10/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with D. Roy and J. Ryan re mee�ng. 

132

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with legal team to discuss remaining prefiling issues, etc. 

133

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 3.40 $0.00 $0.00 $1,105.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team to review revisions to tes�mony, rate design, etc. 

134

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul�ple video conferences with D. Konold, et al. re rate case issues. 

135

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare and email dra� language for tes�mony to J. Gore. 

136

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with legal team to discuss remaining issues and items le� to do. 
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137

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.40 $0.00 $0.00 $986.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with rate case team to review addi� onal witness tes� mony, rate design and revenue
requirement. 

138

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with J. Konold re outstanding items and follow-up video conference re
same. 

139

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails from K. Johnson, J. Cooper, et. al. re items for customer no� ce and dra.
language for tes�mony. 

140

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Cooper and S. Durr re customer no�ce. 

141

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review spreadsheet provided by K. Johnson to prepare for customer no�ce follow-up video
conference. 

142

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review J. Cooper tes�mony for tariff changes to include in customer no�ce and edit no�ce to include
same. 

143

5/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to ques�on from M. Bartos re dra� tes�mony. 

144

5/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re customer no�ce and other other pre-filing ma�ers. 
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145

5/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Clark re S. Taylor tes� mony. 

146

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 3.00 $0.00 $0.00 $870.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conferences with J. Cooper and S. Durr re customer no� ce and other items. 

147

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.30 $0.00 $0.00 $377.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Gore, K. Johnson, et. al. to discuss issue with schedules. 

148

5/11/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con� nue dra. ing customer no�ce and star�ng table to insert proposed rates when finalized. 

149

5/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with K. Cole, et. al. re status. 

150

5/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with K. Johnson re rate design ques�ons and review excel spreadsheet provided. 

151

5/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul�ple emails with S. Durr and J. Cooper re customer no�ce and make mul�ple ed�s to
same. 

152

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Gore and J. Clark re dra� tes�mony and applica�on. 

153
5/13/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re customer no� ce; review revised dra.  of same; email
exchange with A. Honaker re no�ce. 

154

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re the revised customer no�ce and dra� applica�on. 

155

5/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 1.60 $0.00 $0.00 $520.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and update dra� applica�on and forward same to J. Clark, et al. 

156

5/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with A. Honaker re status of customer no�ce and tariff changes, etc. 

157

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul�ple emails with S. Durr and J. Cooper re customer no�ce. 

158

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review spreadsheets and informa�on provided by J. Siegler and K. Johnson for customer no�ce. 

159

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Input all proposed rates into customer no�ce and calculate totals for delivery por�on of proposed
rates and review en�re no�ce for accuracy. 

160

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper and S. Durr re proposed rates for customer no�ce. 

161

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul�ple telephone conference with S. Durr re edits to customer no�ce and update same. 
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162

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email to J. Gore re pdf volumes. 

163

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Ryan, et. al. re map for CPCN and review map. 

164

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re customer no� ce and his review of same. 

165

5/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange texts with J. Clark re status of customer no� ce. 

166

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re page turn specifics. 

167

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference and text messages with J. Cooper re customer no� ce. 

168

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review updated footnotes on customer no� ce and highlighted comments from J. Cooper and J. Ryan. 

169

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Respond to comments on customer no� ce. 

170

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Mul� ple office conferences with status of customer no� ce and Applica� on with D. Samford. 
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171

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra.  verifica�ons for tes�mony witnesses and data request witnesses. 

172

5/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review dra� Applica�on forwarded by D. Samford and edit same. 

173

5/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re status of Applicaiton and s�ll need for the TOC. 

174

5/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange texts and emails with L. Black re updated TOC and review updated TOC. 

175

5/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Compare �tles of witnesses from Applica�on to Verifica�ons to ensure consistency. 

176

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Gore re order of witnesses. 

177

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review lengthy email and a�achment from J. Clark re page turn and witness assignments. 

178

5/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker,
Allyson L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Ryan re SFRs sponsored by K. Cole. 

179
5/16/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford,
David S

$325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review a. achment from L. Black and incorporate into the revised dra� applica�on and forward same
to J. Clark, et al. 

Access Informa�on

Summary Breakdowns

By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category 

Timekeeper
Avg Net
Rate

Net
Units

Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
% of Total
Fees

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

 Honaker, Allyson L 290.00 142.40 0.00 0.00 41,296.00 83.23%

 Samford, David S 325.00 25.10 0.00 0.00 8,157.50 16.44%

 Schrage, Ethan 95.00 1.70 0.00 0.00 161.50 0.33%

Remi�ance Details

Ready to send to AP: No Invoice On Hold For
AP:

No

Acceptance Status: Date Received by AP:

Reason for Rejec� on:

Payment Method: Check #

Paid Date: Total Amount on
Check:

Paid Amount: Paid By Insurance
Group:

No

Security

Privacy

CREATED BY

SECURED

CREATED ON

6/8/21 1:02 PM

MODIFIED BY

Clark, Joe

MODIFIED ON

6/8/21 8:51 PM

.. 
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User Rights

Op� on User Read Update Delete Perm

Allow Clark, Joe Yes Yes No No

Group Rights

Op� on Group Read Update Delete Perm

No group rights available.

Ac� ve Requests

Request Name Requester Request Date Expira� on Date Status

Post Invoice for 52,223.90 USD
Goss Samford
PLLC

6/8/21 6/22/21 Pending

Approval Schedule

Stop Performer Status Ac� on Date Expira� on Date Internal Comment

1 Clark, Joe Approved 6/8/21 8:51 PM 6/22/21 11:59
PM

2 Cuccia, Kim S Pending 6/22/21 11:59
PM

Approval History

Stop Performer Ac� vity Date/Time Internal Comment

1 Clark, Joe Approved 6/8/21 8:51 PM

Completed Requests

Item Request Name Requester Request Date Comple� on Date Comment Outcome

No records available.

Versions

Invoice Version Created On Rejec� on Date Invoice Reason/Comments

No versions available.

Public

I I I I I 

I I I I I 

I I I I I I 

I I I I I I 

I I I 
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Invoice Details

PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

No
ALTERNATIVE FEE

No

PAID AMOUNT INVOICE ON HOLD FOR AP

No

ACCEPTANCE STATUS INSURANCE INVOICE?

No

PAYMENT METHOD CHECK #

CHECK DATE WITHHOLDING AMOUNT

MATTER TYPE

Ma. er
REASON FOR REJECTION

TRANSACTION MATTER DISPUTE MATTER

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

PO NUMBER TOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK

READY TO SEND TO AP

No
PAID DATE

MATTER CATEGORY

308 - State Regulatory
DATE RECEIVED BY AP
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 No� fica� on: Workflow status: Pending Approval   

Vendor Details

Billing Address:

2365 Harrodsburg Road, Suite B-
324 
Lexington 
KY 40504 

Tax-ID:

Header Informa� on 

Tax Informa� on 

Invoice Summary

Type Rate x Unit (-) Discount (-) Adjustment Tax Amount

Fees $25,388.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 25,388.00

Expenses $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 0.00

Invoice Total (USD) $25,388.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 25,388.00

Adjustment Date Adjusted By Descrip� on

INVOICE NUMBER

5555

VENDOR

Goss Samford PLLC

INVOICE DATE

5/10/21

RECEIVED DATE

6/3/21

PROJECT

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

POSTING STATUS

Not Posted

WARNING:

Invoice Submi� ed A. er 21 Days

BILLING START DATE

1/1/00

BILLING END DATE

4/30/21

SUBMITTED TOTAL

$ 25,388.00

SUBMITTED CURRENCY

USD

LINE ITEM WARNINGS

None

TAX TYPE

US

TAX RATE

0.00 %

I I 
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Adjustment Date Adjusted By Descrip� on

6/8/21 8:46 PM Clark, Joe Total Reduce By Percent 0.00 
Comments to Requester: No adjustment due to difficul� es submi. ng
through system 
In House Comments: No adjustment due to difficul�es submi�ng
through system  

Descrip�on 

Comments to Requester 

Line Items 

View:  All Line Items

Line Items 1 - 168 of 168

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

3

4/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with D. Samford re no case status. 

4

4/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.60 $0.00 $0.00 $520.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with S. Taylor, et al. re dra� tes�mony. 

5

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review the Commission's SMRP order. 

6

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 2.30 $0.00 $0.00 $747.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Gather materials and begin dra�ing applica�on. 

7
4/16/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with D. Samford re updated witness tes� mony to review and deadline to review same. 

8

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with J. Clark, J. Ryan and D. Samford re legal updates and issues. 

9

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Update the dra.  applica�on and forward same to J. Clark and J. Ryan. 

10

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $348.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nue research. 

11

4/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review revised dra� applica�on. 

12

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.90 $0.00 $0.00 $551.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare for and par�cipate in regularly scheduled video conference with project team. 

13

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails re revenue requirement. 

14

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. to discuss status and strategy. 

15

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Calendar mee�ng with same to discuss. 

16
4/18/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with D. Samford re same. 

17

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Harding and J. Ryan re research 

18

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.80 $0.00 $0.00 $585.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team on rate case status and strategy. 

19

4/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re dra.  tes�mony. 

20

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.50 $0.00 $0.00 $435.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete additonal research on tax issue. 

21

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review response email from M. West re same. 

22

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange texts with J. Cooper re research. 

23

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re same. 

24

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office conference with D. Samford re May 28 filing date. 

25
4/22/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $390.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with V. Rea, et al. re dra.  tes�mony. 

26

4/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Ryan re CPCN issue. 

27

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. to discuss miscellaneous rate case ma�ers and issues. 

28

4/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Research re leases issue from video conference. 

29

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.60 $0.00 $0.00 $464.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review addi�onal precedent. 

30

4/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a�ached schedule for tes�mony review from J. Clark. 

31

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange texts with D. Samford re research. 

32

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 2.20 $0.00 $0.00 $638.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conduct research re comments from precedent. 

33

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with prin�ng company re filing logis�cs. 

34
4/20/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with the legal team. 

35

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email to J. Clark and J. Cooper re es� mate for prin� ng. 

36

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin research on tax issue and Commission precedent re same. 

37

4/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with C. Lai, J. Clark, et al. re dra.  tes�mony, filing requirements, etc. 

38

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email same to D. Samford for review and comment. 

39

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Dra� por�ons of customer no�ce. 

40

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a�achment from C. Lai and respond to same. 

41

4/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and spreadsheet forwarded re SFR volume breakdown. 

42

4/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review several filing requirements marked for review. 

43
4/13/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00
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Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare briefing document and forward same to J. Clark and J. Ryan. 

44

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re various ratemaking issues. 

45

4/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Respond to comments. 

46

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email to AG with No� ce of Intent a. ached. 

47

4/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re SFRS. 

48

4/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Begin review of J. Harding schedules provided and make notes re same. 

49

4/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Cooper re dra� tes�mony. 

50

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Kunold, et al. re rate case strategy. 

51

4/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Clark re preliminary filings. 

52
4/8/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Compose email to team re research findings. 

53

4/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with J.Cooper, et. al. re customer no� ce. 

54

4/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re same. 

55

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete review of dra.  J. Harding spreadsheets. 

56

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review update from K. Cole. 

57

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with D. Samford re same. 

58

4/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with J. Gore, J. Clark, et. al. re reassessing calendar dates and deadlines. 

59

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email to J. Clark re copying expenses. 

60

4/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Con�nue review of J. Harding's schedules provided. 

61
4/5/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Compose email to J. Harding, J. Ryan, et. al. re schedules. 

62

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review tes� mony of J. Harding and exhibits. 

63

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. rate case status and strategy. 

64

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review, edit and comment of D. Roy tes� mony 

65

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review No� ce of Intent as filed with the Commission. 

66

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone call to KPA to see if quote was provided by them or Ad Ohio. 

67

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to ques� on re dra.  tes�mony from J. Ryan. 

68

4/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Cooper re rate filing. 

69

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with M. Bartos, et al. re forecas�ng. 

70
4/29/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review mul� ple emails and respond to E. Smith and J. Cooper re customer no� ce publica� on
es� mates. 

71

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review quote provided by Ad Ohio. 

72

4/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team re rate case prepara� on and status. 

73

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from D. Roy, et al. re dra.  tes�mony. 

74

4/2/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $348.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and revise tes�mony dra� of D. Roy and comment re same. 

75

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference on regulatory requirements, no�ce and other issues. 

76

4/8/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a�achment from A. Hughes re informa�on for dra� tes�mony. 

77

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and edit tes�mony of K. Cartell. 

78

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Send update email to rate team. 
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79

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with Commission Staff re filing of No� ce of Intent. 

81

4/25/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re � ming of filing No� ce of Electronic Procedures and No� ce of
Intent. 

82

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re dra.  applica�on; review of tes�mony, etc. 

83

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re related PSC proceedings. 

84

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review dra� No�ce of Intent and No�ce to Use Electronic Filing Procedures forwarded by D. Samford. 

85

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Clark re needed research. 

86

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with C. Lai, et al. re capital structure filing requirements and V. Rea exhibits. 

87

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review response email and acknowledgment le�er received from the Commission. 

88
4/28/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails re rate case procedures. 

89

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference re � ming with K. Cole, et. al.

90

4/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and make addi� onal edits to the dra.  applica�on and return same to J. Clark and J. Ryan. 

91

4/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re same. 

92

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re updates and status. 

93

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $116.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with J. Cooper, et. al. re customer no�ce logis�cs. 

94

4/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review revised tes�mony of J. Harding in prepara�on for video conference to discuss tax issue. 

95

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Edit and comment on same. 

96

4/18/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 2.90 $0.00 $0.00 $841.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review tes�mony of D. Roy, K. Cartella, J. Cooper, J. Siegler, J. Harding and J. Spanos and comment and
propose edits to same. 
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97

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to emails from J. Ryan and K. Cartella re tes� mony. 

98

4/24/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review revised dra.  tes�mony of J. Gore. 

99

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review agenda and a�ached progress excel spreadsheet for weekly touch base mee�ng.

100

4/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with D. Samford re strategy. 

101

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email J. Clark and J. Ryan re procedural ma�ers. 

102

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with D. Samford re same. 

103

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare cover le�er for no�ce of intent, make filing at the Commission and forward same to the
A�orney General's Office of Rate Interven�on. 

104

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re rate case scheduling ma�er. 

105
4/28/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re rate case topics and issues. 

106

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Update No� ce of Elec� on of Use of Electronic Filing Procedures and prepare cover le. er and file same
at the PSC. 

107

4/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $348.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team re rate case issues and tasks. 

108

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office conference with D. Samford re filing logis�cs. 

109

4/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Cooper, et. al. re rate case filing and courtesy no�ce to the PSC's execu�ve
director. 

110

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re rate case strategy. 

111

4/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $292.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. to discuss rate case tes�mony. 

112

4/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. re rate case status and strategy. 

113

4/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with legal team re status and strategy. 
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114

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review no� ce requirements. 

115

4/23/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchange with J. Ryan re CPCN request. 

116

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Kunold, et al. re rate case issues. 

117

4/21/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in video conference with J. Harding, et. al. re tax issue. 

118

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review the No� ce of Elec� on of Electronic Filing Procedures as filed with the Commission. 

119

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $87.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with S. Durr re publica� on of customer no� ce. 

120

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.40 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with C. Lai, et al. re filing requirements. 

121

4/23/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from V. Rea re dra.  tes�mony. 

122

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Harding re tes�mony and schedule forma�ng. 
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123

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in mee� ng to further discuss strategy with L. Rumpke, et. al. 

124

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in small group video conference to discuss case status. 

125

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Cooper re no� ce requirements for certain franchise agreements. 

126

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Conference with A. Honaker re schedule for filing applica� on and expense re same. 

127

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par� cipate in regulatory mee� ng with K. Cole, et. al. 

128

4/7/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Prepare dra. s of the No�ce of Electronic Filing Procedures and No�ce of Intent and forward same to
J. Ryan. 

129

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with D. Roy, et al. re filing requirements. 

130

4/20/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with D. Konold, et al. re rate case status. 

131
4/16/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00
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Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Office conference with D. Samford re addi� onal research needed. 

132

4/16/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from K. Cole re with case strategy. 

133

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with D. Konold, et al. re various ratemaking issues. 

134

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et al. re rate case strategy and tes� mony. 

135

4/13/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $162.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with S. Taylor re dra.  tes�mony. 

136

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $145.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with legal team.

137

4/26/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from J. Clark re Applica�on edits. 

138

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $290.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Par�cipate in video conference with J. Kunold, K. Cole et al. re regulatory issues and op�ons for filing. 

139

4/27/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. re rate case status and strategy. 

140
4/24/21 Fee

C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $97.50



6/8/2021 Invoice - 5555 - TeamConnect 6.1.1

teamconnect.nisource.net:9081/TeamConnect-6.1.1/invoiceView.htm?rn=359 18/24

Item Date Type Category TK Rate Units Disc Adj Amt

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with J. Cooper re various items related to rate case. 

141

4/14/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with D. Kunold, et al. re regulatory issues and � meline. 

142

4/1/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email from J. Gore re filing requirements. 

143

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.70 $0.00 $0.00 $203.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with K. Cole, et. al. re op� ons. 

144

4/22/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a. achment from V. Rea. 

145

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email re developments for Columbia signed. 

146

4/19/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 3.30 $0.00 $0.00 $1,072.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on revised tes�mony from C. Lai, K. Cole, J. Gore, K. Johnson, S. Taylor, J.
Holtzmuller and V. Rea. 

147

4/3/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from C. Lai re filing requirements. 

148

4/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review filing requirements checklist. 
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149

4/5/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $292.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with C. Lai, et al. re filing requirements. 

150

4/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $260.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with J. Clark, et al. to discuss rate case status. 

151

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.60 $0.00 $0.00 $174.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review regula� ons re customer no� ce requirements. 

152

4/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $325.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Video conference with project team re rate case issues and tasks. 

153

4/6/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 1.20 $0.00 $0.00 $390.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review updates to tes� mony and certain filing requirements. 

154

4/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Email exchanges with J. Clark, et al. re rate case status. 

155

4/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.80 $0.00 $0.00 $232.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Complete required trainings through LMS system. 

156

4/9/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $261.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and edit tes� mony. 

157

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $32.50

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and respond to email from J. Ryan re filing requirements. 
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158

4/12/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re filing requirements. 

159

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Samford, David S $325.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $65.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and analyze document from J. Hurtzmiller. 

160

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and a. ached document from J. Hurtzmiller.

161

4/15/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul�ple emails re case filing with J. Cooper, et. al. 

162

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with KPA re publica�on es�mate. 

163

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange mul�ple emails with S. Durr re same. 

164

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review invoice provided by KPA and forward same to S. Durr, et. al. for review. 

165

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email and respond to S. Durr re hearing no�ce and ways to publish. 

166

4/28/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.90 $0.00 $0.00 $261.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review and comment on J. Cooper tes�mony. 
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167

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails from J. Clark, et. al. re updates. 

168

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review email from K. Cartella re tes� mony; review email from J. Clark re mo� ons to intervene � ming. 

169

4/29/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.20 $0.00 $0.00 $58.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Telephone conference with D. Samford re possible impacts to case. 

170

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Exchange emails with J. Clark re tariff decisions. 

171

4/30/21 Fee
C312 Client Counsel -
Stat/Reg/Judicial

Honaker, Allyson
L

$290.00 0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $29.00

Project: 2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case 
Descrip� on: Review emails re mo� ons to intervene. 

Access Informa� on

Summary Breakdowns

By Timekeeper| By Fee/Expense Category 

Timekeeper
Avg Net
Rate

Net
Units

Net Disc Total Adj Net Amt
% of Total
Fees

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

 Honaker, Allyson L 290.00 47.20 0.00 0.00 13,688.00 53.92%

 Samford, David S 325.00 36.00 0.00 0.00 11,700.00 46.08%

CREATED BY

SECURED

CREATED ON

6/3/21 3:56 PM

MODIFIED BY

Clark, Joe

MODIFIED ON

6/8/21 8:46 PM
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Remi. ance Details

Ready to send to AP: No Invoice On Hold For
AP:

No

Acceptance Status: Date Received by AP:

Reason for Rejec� on:

Payment Method: Check #

Paid Date: Total Amount on
Check:

Paid Amount: Paid By Insurance
Group:

No

Security

Privacy

User Rights

Op� on User Read Update Delete Perm

Allow Clark, Joe Yes Yes No No

Group Rights

Op� on Group Read Update Delete Perm

No group rights available.

Ac�ve Requests

Request Name Requester Request Date Expira� on Date Status

Post Invoice for 25,388.00 USD
Goss Samford
PLLC

6/3/21 6/22/21 Pending

Public

I I I I I I I 

I I I I I 

I I 
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Request Name Requester Request Date Expira� on Date Status

Approval Schedule

Stop Performer Status Ac� on Date Expira� on Date Internal Comment

1 Clark, Joe Approved 6/8/21 8:46 PM 6/17/21 11:59
PM

2 Cuccia, Kim S Pending 6/22/21 11:59
PM

Approval History

Stop Performer Ac� vity Date/Time Internal Comment

1 Clark, Joe Approved 6/8/21 8:46 PM

Completed Requests

Item Request Name Requester Request Date Comple� on Date Comment Outcome

No records available.

Versions

Invoice Version Created On Rejec� on Date Invoice Reason/Comments

No versions available.

Invoice Details

PAID BY INSURANCE GROUP

No
ALTERNATIVE FEE

No

PAID AMOUNT INVOICE ON HOLD FOR AP

No

ACCEPTANCE STATUS INSURANCE INVOICE?

No

PAYMENT METHOD CHECK #

CHECK DATE WITHHOLDING AMOUNT

MATTER TYPE

Ma. er
REASON FOR REJECTION

TRANSACTION MATTER DISPUTE MATTER

2021-008102-CKY - 2021 Rate Case

PO NUMBER TOTAL AMOUNT ON CHECK

READY TO SEND TO AP

No
PAID DATE

MATTER CATEGORY

I I I I 

[ [ [ 

I I I 
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MATTER CATEGORY

308 - State Regulatory
DATE RECEIVED BY AP



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment F 
Page 1 of 6

Invoice No. 2021-01 

Columbia Gas of Kentucky ("CKY") 

Invoice for Period: February 15, 2021 to March 31, 2021 

For professional services rendered by Vincent Rea, Managing Director, Regulatory Finance 
Associates, LLC, including conducting research, preparing quantitative analyses and 

developing direct testimony in connection with CKY's 2021 rate case tiling. 

Work Activities Spanning between February 15, 2021 and March 31, 2021 

• Review CKY's 2016 rate case filing and associated testimony. 
• Proxy group development for two utility and one non-regulated proxy group(s). 
• Conduct comparative risk assessments for CKY versus the proxy groups. 
• Review financial ratios based on CKY's historjcal FERC Fonn No. 2 filings. 
• Review recent FERC ROE opinions/decisions relating to determination of outlier results. 
• Research required model inputs and conduct cost of capital quantitative analyses. 
• Conduct financial risk analyses to detennine appropriate ROE adjustments. 
• Confer with NiSource treasury staff to source Bloomberg estimates of projected earnings 

growth rates for the S&P 500 Index constituents. 
• Evaluate appropriate sources of interest rate forecasts to reference in quantitative analyses. 
• Evaluate possibility of conducting a comparable earnings approach quantitative analysis. 
• Begin evaluations of all the vali ous forms of decoupling mechanisms and infrastructure 

tracking mechanisms that are used across the state regulatory j urisdictions for each of the 
proxy group companies. 

• Conduct analyses to determine appropriate flotation cost adjustment for CKY. 
• Participate in CKY rate case kick-off meeting and weekly rate case meetings. 
• Review CKY financing application prepared by the Company prior to fil ing and associated 

impacts on CKY's rate case fi ling. 
• Conduct research of recent rate case outcomes in Kentucky and across the U.S., as 

requested by the CKY rate case team and NiSow-ce Business Decision Support team. 
• Participate in multiple working group meetings relative to development of CK Y's fuJly 

forecasted test year capital structure. 
• Allocation of time spent for LMS training requirements. 

1 
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Page 2 of 6

Total Petiod Total Billable Hours - 2/15/2021 through 3/31/2021 

Totals Total Invoice Amount Due - I 07.20 hours@ $260.00/hour 

Terms: Net 30 days. Kindly remit payment to: 

Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC 
80 Blake Blvd,, #4572 
Pinehurst, NC 28374 

107.20 hrs. 

$27,872.00 

2 
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Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment F 
Page 3 of 6

Invoice No. 2021-03 

Columbia Gas ofKentuck:y ("CKY") 

Invoice for Period: April 1, 2021 to May 31, 2021 

For professional services rendered by Vincent Rea, Managing Director, Regulatory Finance 
Associates, LLC, including conducting research, preparing quantitative analyses and 

developing direct testimony in connection with CK Y's 2021 rate case filing. 

Work activities spanning between Apiil 1, 2021 and May 31, 2021, including all activities 
completed through the CKY rate case filing date (May 28. 2021) 

• Presented ROE recommendations to the CKY rate case team. 
• Research and draft direct testimony for rate case filing purposes. 
• Continue updating quantitative analyses and exhibits supporting direct testimony. 
• Conduct multiple rounds of discussions concerning Mr. Rea' s direct testimony with the 

CKY rate case team, NiSource counsel and outside counsel at Goss Samford. 
• Apply edits to direct testimony where indicated as based upon discussions with the CKY 

rate case team and inside/outside counsel. 
• Participated in broader NiSource enterprise-wide discussions sun-ounding the proposed 

ROEs that are most appropriate for each of Ni Source' s jurisdictions. 
• Conduct comparative risk assessment of the Company vs . the proxy groups. 
• Conduct financial risk analyses to determine appropriate ROE adjustments. 
• Identify customer class allocations from final CKY FERC Form No. 2. 
• Review financial ratios based on CK Y' s historical FERC Form No. 2 filings . 
• Complete evaluations of the various forms of decoupling mechanisms and infrastructure 

tracking mechanisms that am used across the state regulatory jurisdictions for each of the 
proxy group companies. 

• Prepare responses to Standard Filing Requests ("SFRs") relating to CKY' s regulatory 
capital structure. 

• Participate in CKY week:Jy rate case meetings. 
• Convert all exhibits supporting Mr. Rea' s testimony to PDF format for page-tum purposes. 
• Allocation of time spent for LMS training requirements. 

1 
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Total Period Total Billable Hours -4/1/2021 through 5/31/2021 54.133 hrs. 

Totals Total Invoice Amount Due - 54.133 hours @ $260.00/hour $14,074.58 

Tenns: Net 45 days . Kindly remit payment via ACH as per bank instructions on record, or to the 
following address: 

Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC 
80 Blake Blvd., #4572 
Pinehurst, NC 28374 

2 
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Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment F 
Page 5 of 6

Invoice No. 2021-08 

Columbia Gas of Kentucky ("CKY'') 

Invoice for Period Covering: June 1, 2021 to JuJy 25, 2021 

For professional services rendered by Vincent Rea, Managing Director, Regulatory Finance 
Associates, LLC, inclurung the preparation of responses to the interrogato1ies and data 

requests made by the Kentucky PSC Staff and the Kentucky Attorney General in 
connection with CKY's 2021 rate case filing .. 

Work activities spanning between June 1, 2021 and July 25, 2021. 

• Review, evaluate and prepare responses to Kentucky PSC Staff Data Requests Set No. l. 
Coorclihate responses with NiSource Treasury and Accounting teams. 

• Review, evaluate and prepare responses to Kentucky Attorney General Data Requests Set 
No. 1. Coordinate responses with NiSource Treasu1y and Accounting teams. 

• Review, evaluate and prepare responses to Kentucky PSC Staff Data Requests Set No. 2. 
Coordinate responses with NiSource Treasury and Accounting teams. 

• Participate in CKY weekly rate case meetings. 
• Allocation of time spent for LMS training requirements. 

Total Period Total Billable Hours - 6/1/2021 through 7/25/2021 38.167 hrs. 

Totals Total Invoice Amount Due - 38. 167 hours @ $260.00/hour $9,923.42 

Tenns: Net 45 days. KindJy remit payment via ACH as per bank instructions on record, or to the 
folJowing address: 

1 
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Regulatory Finance Associates, LLC 
80 Blake Blvd. , #4572 
Pinehurst, NC 28374 

2 
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Page 1 of 9

Invoice 

• CONCENTRIC 

Adam Gale 
NiSource Corporate Services 
290 W. Nationwide Blvd. 
Columbus, OH 43215 

June 3, 2021 
Engagement No: 
fnvoice No: 

03907.00 
0014463 

Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 
Professional Services from April 1. 2021 to April 30, .2021 

■ - -- -- -
Total this Phase 

Phase 04 CKY Rate Case 
Professional Personnel 

Hours Rate Amount 
Vice President 17.75 517.50 9,185.63 

Totals 17.75 9,185.63 
Total Labor 

Total this Phase 

- ■ - -- -- -
Total this Phase 

- ■ - ---
Total this Phase 

293 l\nqn" l'on ROAi) Wm • SlllTF 500 • M ARI ~oRn\JGH, MA • 01752 • 508-26J-6200 • Cr-Anv1soRtC:OM 

$1,164.38 

9,185.63 

$9,185.63 

$8,668.13 

$6,986.25 
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Engagement 03907.00 

Billings to Date 

Labor 

Totals 

NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 

Current 
26,004.39 

26,004.39 

Prior 
49,215.65 

49,215.65 

Total this Invoice 

Total 
75,220.04 

75,220.04 

For billing inquiries or to request electronic payment instructions, 
please contact us at: accounting@ceadvisors.com 

Taxpayer ID 

Invoice 0014463 

$26,004.39 

Please note, we have no intention of changing our bank details and any request to do so should be 
treated as suspicious. 

2')3 Rono, Pon R()il.l) WFS 1 • Sll f'IT 500 • MARI RC)I\OlJ<rH Mt\ • 01752 • 508-263-6200 • CFADVl~ORH;OM 

Page 2 
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Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 

Billing Backup 
Concentric Energy Advisors, Inc. Invoice 0014463 Dated 6/3/2021 

Phase 04 

Professional Personnel 

Vice President 
Bartos, Melissa 

CKY Rate Case 

Hours 

4/1/2021 225 
Review demand forecast data and analysis from prior CKY rate case 

Bartos, Melissa 4/2/2021 4.00 
Develop analysis and presentation for forecasting discussion 

Bartos, Melissa 4/5/2021 .SO 
Discuss customer count exhibit 

Bartos, Melissa 4/6/2021 4.00 

Rate 

517.50 

517.50 

517.50 

517,50 
Participate in weekly rate case update call; discuss CKY forecast with demand 
forecasting team; draft materials for forecast discussion 

Bartos, Melissa 4/7/2021 1 00 517.50 
Particip;ite in call to discuss CKY rate case forecast 

Bartos, Melissa 4/8/2021 1 00 517 .50 
Discussion re: rate case forecast 

Bartos, Melissa 4/12/2021 1.75 517.50 
Review draft SFRs and provide feedback; discuss gas price forecast used in 
analysts 

Bartos, Melissa 4/13/2021 1.00 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case update call 

Bartos, Melissa 4/20/2021 1.00 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case call; finalize SFRs 

Bartos, Melissa 4/27/2021 1.25 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case call; edit and update draft testimony 

Totals 17.75 
Total Labor 

Invoice. 0014463 

Thursday, June 3, 2021 

8:34:03AM 

Amount 

1,164,37 

2 ,070.00 

258.75 

2 ,070.00 

517.50 

517.50 

905.63 

517.50 

517.50 

646.88 

9,185.63 

Total this Phase 

9,185.63 

$9,185.63 

Phase 05 NI PSCO Gas Rate Case 

293 l\0.'iTC1-.J l1O$T RoAr, Wr-r • ~11m 500 • M,1, R1 ml\o\JOfi, MA • 01752 • 508-26:1-6200 • Cr-11ov1~0R\C'OM 
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Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 Invoice 0014463 

Totat this Engagement $26,004.39 

29,J '10STl1 \I Pon R(M !1 WFi r • Sil ti F 500 • MARI 1,0Rh(K,H, Mr\ • 01752 • 508-261-6200 • CFAflW;crn'.C:OM 
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Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 Invoice 0014463 

Total this Report $26,004.39 

293 Rmro, POST Rom WFS r • surrr 500 • MAl\1 ROI\OlJCiH Mt\ • 01752 • 508-263-6200 • CFAIWI\ORS.COM 
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Invoice 

• CONCENTRIC 

Adam Gale 
NiSource Corporate Services 
290 W. Nationwide Blvd. 
Columbus, OH 43215 

April 19, 2021 
Engagement No: 
Invoice No: 

03907.00 
0014318 

Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 
Professional Services from March 1, 2021 to March 31, 2021 

Phase 04 CKY Rate Case 
Professional Personnel 

Vice President 
Totals 
Total Labor 

Hours 
28.00 
28.00 

Total this Phase 

Total this Phase 

Rate 
517.50 

Amount 
14,490.00 
14,490.00 

Total this Phase 

J<)j Bo, I ON J\(1\1 lln111> w~, I • • Ill ff 5()0 • MAIU~(lR~llll,ll, MA • (ll 752 • 508-263-<,.lOO • c~,\()Vt~OR~.COM 

$1 ,164.38 

$2,975.63 

14,490.00 

$14,490.00 
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Engagement 03907.00 

Outstanding Invoices 

Number 
0014247 
Total 

Billings to Date 

Labor 

Totals 

NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 

Date 
3/30/2021 

Current 
20,570.64 

20,570.64 

Balance 
8,927.51 
8,927.51 

Prior 
28,645.01 

28,645.01 

Total this Invoice 

Total 
49,215.65 

49,215.65 

For billing inquiries or to request electronic payment instructions, 
please contact us at: accounting@ceadvisors.com 

Taxpayer ID 

Invoice 0014318 

$20,570.64 

Please note, we have no intention of changing our bank details and any request to do so should be 
treated as suspicious. 

2')3 HmrnN Pmr Ro,\D Wm • Sum 500 • MAIUKORotJGH. MA • 01752 • 508-263-6200 • CF,.,ov1~01t,xoM 
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Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 

Billing Backup 
Concentric Energy Advisors, Inc. Invoice 0014318 Dated 4/19/2021 

Phase 04 CKY Rate Case 

Professional Personnel 

Hours Rate 
Vice President 

Bartos, Melissa 3/2/2021 .75 51 7.50 
Participate in weekly rate case calls 

Bartos, Melissa 3/3/2021 1.50 517.50 

Invoice 0014318 

Monday, April 19, 2021 

2.:55;47 PM 

Amount 

388.11 

776.25 

29J llOHON 110)1 ROAO Whl • Sum 500 • MARLIIOROllvtl, MA • 01752 • 508-263-6200 • CIADVl~!JR.SlOM 
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Engagement 03907.00 NiSource Demand Forecasting 2021 

Participate in call re: historical data sources used for forecasting; review updated 
price forecast for rate case forecast 

Bartos. Melissa 3/9/2021 2.25 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case update meeting; discuss CKY rate case analysis with 
demand forecasti~ team 

Bartos, Melissa 3/10/2021 1.00 517.50 
Review revised forecast models and provide feedbad< 

Bartos, Melissa 3/11/2021 .50 517.50 
Review revised demand forecasts for CKY rate case and provide feedback 

Bartos, Melissa 3/12/2021 1,50 517.50 
review gas price forecast for CKY rate case; review and discuss demand forecast 
transmittal fi le with forecaSting team 

Bartos, Melissa 3/15/2021 3,00 517.50 
review revised forecast and send feedback to forecasting team; researcn and 
discussions about CKY COVID moratorium 

Bartos, Melissa 3/16/2021 1.50 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case update call; discuss CKY forecast status and next 
steps with forecasting team 

Bartos. Melissa 3/18/2021 3.25 517.50 
Dtscuss COVID moratorium adjustment; begin to draft testimony 

Bartos, Melissa 3/19/2021 6.00 517.50 
Work on drafting CKY testimony for rate case 

Bartos, Melissa 3/23/2021 1.50 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case call; review testimony feedback and edit testimony 

Bartos, Melissa 3/24/2021 1.00 517.50 
Review and edit testimony based on feedback 

Bartos, Melissa 3/30/2021 2,00 517.50 
Participate in weekly rate case call; review and discuss wholesale allocation with 
forecasting team 

Bartos, Melissa 3/31/2021 2.25 51 7.50 
Begin drafting forecast presentation; ask questions re: last rate case data 

Totals 28. 00 
Total Labor 

Invoice 

1,164.38 

517.50 

258.75 

776.25 

1,552.50 

776.25 

1,681 .88 

3,105.00 

776.25 

517.50 

1,035.00 

1,164,38 

14,490.00 

Total this Phase 

Total this Engagement 

Total this Report 

0014318 

14,490.00 

$14,490.00 

$20,570.64 

$20,570.64 

2QJ BmroN Poq RoAO Wh1 • \11111 500 • MAIU tu 1Rrn1nu. MA • 01752 • 50R-2fl3-6200 • l.lAIWt~111H < 0,1 
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~ 6annettFIE!ming 
Excellence Delivered As Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Crawford U 128858 

NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY 

Attn: Judy Cooper, Dir., Govt & Regulatory Affairs 
P.O. Box 117 
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 

Project: 068275 

Invoice No: 068275*5977 
Invoice Date: March 25, 2021 

INVOICE 

ACH/EFT Payment Information: 

ABA:-
Account No.: 

Check Payment Information: 
Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, 
LLC 
PO Box 829160 
Philadelphia, PA 19182 9160 

Federal EIN: 
Send Remit Info: AccountsReceivable@gfnet.com 

Nolle: TO PREVENT IMPOSTER FRAUD If you receivean'(notilic:abonof achangein p~nl: nstructions. ,oo shou1d cal OUf Acmunt:sReoe-.Vabledepamnertat717•763-7211 to verify t he au1hen!k.ity 
cl the change \i\e cannd be heli 1espmsible for a m1$di'l!cif9d payn'W!•'ll as a t4l'!I-U:t of ~ur not l!XINirn'llng alJthemkity d 1equ9Sbadehanges Ii:> payr"Mnlll'StrudJons 01 .. 1~teI hacks" to yo!# s~tem 

Invoice Period: January 30, 2021 through February 26, 2021 

Project Manager : John J. Spanos jspanos@gfnet.com 

Depreciation Study 

Phase 000 

Summary of Current Charges 

- DEPRECIATION STUDY 

Total Charges 

Total Due This Invoice ................... . 

$ 82500 

$825 00 

$825.00 
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~ liannett Fleming 
Ex,ellence Delivered At Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Phase 000 - Depreciation Study 

Labor Costs 

Labor Classification 

Assislan1 Analyst I 

John J . Spanos 

Support Slaff 

Hours Rate 

2.00 

1.00 

$ 120.00 

2.50 

Total labor Costs 

Total Phase -000 

285.00 

120.00 

Project: 068275 
Invoice No: 068275"5977 

Invoice Date: March 25, 2021 

Amount 

240.00 

285.00 

-300.00 

$ 825.00 

$ 825.00 

Page 2 of 2 
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~ Gannett Fleming 
Excellence Delivered As Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Crawford U 128858 

NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY 
Attn: Judy Cooper, Dir., Govt & Regulatory Affairs 
P .O. Box 117 
Columbus, OH 432 15-0117 

Project: 068275 
Invoice No: 068275*113963 

Invoice Date: May 3, 2021 

INVOICE 

ACHIEFT Payment Information: 
ABA: 
Account No.: 
Account Name: 

Check Payment Information: 
Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, 
LLC 
PO Box 829160 
Phfladelphia, PA 19182-9160 

Federal EIN : 
Send Remit Info: AccountsReceivable@gfnet.com 

Invoice Period: February 27, 2021 through April 2, 2021 

Project Manager: John J. Spanos jspanos@gfnet.com 

Depreciation Study 

Summary of Current Charges 

Phase 000 - DEPRECIATION STUDY 6,782.50 

Total Chargea $6,782.50 

Total Due This Invoice ................... . $6,782.50 
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~ liannett Fleming 
Ex,ellence Delivered At Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Phase 000 - Depreciation Study 

Labor Costs 

Labor Classification 

Analyst 

Associate Analyst 

Jonn J . Spanos 

Support Slaff 

Assistant Analy~ I 

Hours 

18.00 $ 

6.50 

3.50 

2.00 

10.00 

Total Labor Costs 

Total Phase -000 

Rate 

160.00 

170.00 

285.00 

120.00 

120.00 

P roject: 068275 
Invoice No: 068275"113963 

Invoice Date: May 3, 2021 

Amount 

$ 3 ,240.00 

1 ,105.00 

997.50 

240.00 

1,200.00 

$6,782.50 

$ 6,782.50 

Page 2 of 2 
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~ Gannett Fleming 
Excellence Delivered As Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Crawford U128858 

NiSource - Columbia Gas of KY 
Attn: Judy Cooper, Dir., Govt & Regulatory Affairs 
P .O. Box 117 
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 

Project: 068275 
Invoice No: 068275•115799 

Invoice Date: June 4, 2021 

INVOICE 

ACHIEFT Payment Information: 
ABA: 
Account No.: 
Account Name: 

Check Payment Information: 
Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, 
LLC 
PO Box 829160 
Philadelphia, PA 19182-9160 

Federal EIN: 
Send Remit Info: AccountsReceivable@gfnet.com 

Invoice Period: April 3, 2021 through May 7, 2021 

Project Manager: John J . Spanos jspanos@gfnet .com 

Depreciation Study 

Summary of Current Charges 

Phase 000 - DEPRECIATION STUDY 18,658.27 

Total Chargea $18,658.27 

Total Due This Invoice ................... . $18,658.27 
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~ liannett Fleming 
Ex,ellence Delivered At Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Phase 000 - Depreciation Study 

Labor Costs 

Labor Classification Hours Rate 

Analyst 

Associate Analyst 

Jonn J . Spanos 

Support Slaff 

A:;sistant Analyst I 

Expenses 

Other Transportation 

Transportation - Rental Car 

Meals and Meals Per Diem 

Lodgl~g 

30.00 $ 

21 .50 

25.00 

8 .50 

10.00 

Total Labor Costs 

Total Expenses 

Total Phase - 000 

160.00 

170.00 

285.00 

120.00 

120.00 

Project: 068275 
Invoice No: 068275*115799 

Invoice Date: June 4, 2021 

$ 

Amount 

5,400.00 

3 ,655.00 

7,125.00 

1,020.00 

1,200.00 

34.60 

67.43 
45.53 

120.71 

$18,400.00 

$ 258.27 

$ 18,65827 

Page 2 of 2 
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~ National. 

Renter Information 

Renter Name 

JOHN J SPANOS 

Renter Address 

MECHANICSBURG, PA 17055 

USA 

Contract 

GANNETT FLEMING 

Frequent Traveler 

=requent Traveler credit has been sent 

to AA lor program number RY18656 

Vehicle Information 

4DRFRONT-WHEELDRIVE SEDAN 

License#: BFH230 

State/Province: KY 

Unit #: 7V2GFM 

Vehicle#: MU543091 

Vehicle Class Driven 

f ull Size 4-Door/AutomatlciAir 

Vehicle Class Charged 

Midslzc 2 or 4-0oor/Automatio/Air 

Odometer Mileage/Kilometers 

Starting: 8 ,912 Ending: 8 954 

Total: 42 

Thank you for renting 
with National Car Rental 
We appreciate your business! 

This email was automatically generated 

'roman unattended mailbox, &> please 

do not reply to thh.e-mail. 

'f you have any questions about your 

rental, please view our Frequently 

Rental Agreement# 766663412 

Invoice# 70051507297 

GF Project No. 068275.000 

Trip Information 

Pickup Return 
1 Tu esday,AprilG, 2021 5:21 PM Wednesday , ,April7, 2021 11:15AM 

LEXINGTON ARPT (LEX) 

Start Charges 4000 TERMINAL DR STE 103 
1 Tuesday, April 6, 2021 

LEXINGTON ARPT (LEX) 

' 5 :25 PM LEXINGTON, KY 40510-9645 

\JSA 

4000 TERMINAL OR S TE 103 

LEXINGTON, KY 40510-9645 

USA 

Bill-To: GANNETT FLEMING 

Rental Rate 

coverages 

Time & Distance 1 Day al $44,50 / Day 

Cctw-a11ocated lnctus1ve ($0.00 I Day) 

Taxes c1nd Fees Kentucky U-drtve-lt Tax 6 Pct (6.00%) 

Concession Recovery Fee 11.11 Pct (11.11 %) 

Vehicle Lie Cost Reco'✓ Fee 1 .35/day ($1.3.5 / 

Day) 

Subtotal 

Total 

(Subject to audit) 

FrP.quent Traveler Recovery Fee ($0 00 / 

Rental) 

Contract Facility Charge S3.75/day {$3.75 / 

Day) 

Amount cha rged lo f!USINESS ACCOUNT-APPLICAIH 

Amount Due 

$44.50 

Included 

$2.67 

$5.09 

$1 .35 

$0.07 

$3.75 

$57.43 

$57.43 

($57 43) 

$0.00 
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~ liannetl Fleming EMPLOYEE ELECTRONIC EXPENSE REPORT 

Co/Org: 003/331050 Acct Month: 2021/04 Exp Rpt No: ER00330315 

Emp No: 07249 I Emp Name: John J. Spanos I From Dale: 4/6/2021 Thru Date: 4/23/2021 

Description: april21expenses 

I r,m:; Qats C;itegor:i,: Ci!t De:;cci etiQ.D ~ ~ Pha:;e ~ Qrg Em Units A.!ruu!.!lt B§i[!JQ!,!r:;e .Q.!1!! B£L 
Amt 

4/6/2021 PRJDINNER Project- Dinner 003 068275 000 331050 S10 58 $10.58 us 1 

4/6/2021 PRJLODG Proiect- Lodging 003 068275 000 ...... 331050 '$120.71 $120.71 us 5 

4/6/2021 PRJLUNCH Project• Lunch 003 068275 000 ...... 331050 S7 44 5744 us NR 
Exp Description: no receipt 

4/6/2021 PRJTOLLS Project- Toils 003 068275 000 .... 331050 S2 80 $280 us NR 
Exp Description: rield trip for NiSource· Columbia Gas of Kentucky· Lexington, f<Y • no receipt 4/6-4/7 

4/712021 PRJDINNER Project- Dinner 003 068275 000 .... 331050 ~55 S655 us NR 
Exp Description: no receipt 

4/712021 PRJLUNCH Project· Lunch 003 068275 000 .... 331050 S20.96 $20.96 us 3 

4/712021 PRJPARKNG Project- Parking 003 068275 000 .... 331050 S2400 S24.00 us 4 
4/712021 PRJRNTLGAS Project- Rental Car 003 068275 000 .... 331050 S5.00 S5.00 us 2 

Gas 

4/7/2021 PRJTOLLS Project- Toll::; 003 068275 000 331050 S280 S2.80 us NR 
Exp Description: no receipt 

EE003 Page 49 of 350 5/14/2021 12:24:31 PM 
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Project No. 068275.000 

Project No. 068275.000 
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Project No. 68275.000 
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Residence IN'-J. 
BY MARRIOTT 

Residence Inn~ Lexington North 

1080 Newtown Pike , Lexington, KY 40511 P 859.231.6191 

Marriottcom/LEXNN 

John/Mr Spanos 

Leisure 

Arrive: 06Apr21 

DATE 

06Apr21 
06Apr21 
06Apr21 
06Apr21 
07Apr21 

nme: 04:30PM 

DESCRIPTION 

Room Charge 
State Occupancy Tax 
County T:.x 
Convention and Tourism Tax 
Visa 

Project No. 068275.000 

Depart: 07 Apr21 

Room: 413 

Room Type: STDO 

Number of Guests: 

Rate: $104.00 

Time: 07:44AM 

CHARGES 

104.0J 
6.83 
8.84 
1.04 

Card#: VIXXXXXXXXXXXX4145/XXXX 
Amount: 120.71 Auth: 033414 

BALANCE: 0.00 

Clerk: CDS 

Folio Number: 59874 

CREDITS 

1120.71 

Marriott Bonvoy Account# XXXXX8090. Your Marriott Bonvoy points/miles earned on your eligib le earnings will be credited to your account. 
Check your Marriott Bonvoy account statement or your onl ine statement for updated activity. 

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement'' on Marriott.com. 

Operated under license from Marriott Inte rnational, Inc. or one of its affil iates. 

To plan your next stay visit Residence Inn.com. 
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~ liannettF/eming 
Excellence Delivered As Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Consultants, LLC 

CRAVVFORO U# 128858 

NiSource • Columbia Gas of KY 
Attn: Judy Coopef, Dir., Govt & Regulatory A ffairs 
P.O. Bor 117 
Columbus, OH 43215-0117 

Project: 068275 
Invoice No: 068275'1 17488 

Invoice Date: June 28, 2021 

INVOICE 

ACHIEFT Pa)'menf lnfonnation: 
ABA: 

Check Payment Information: 
Gannett Fleming Valuation and Rate Corsuttants. 
LLC 
PO Box 829160 
Philadelphia, PA 19182-911\0 

Federal EIN: 
Send Remit Info: AccountsRe~e vllble@gtnet.com 

Invoice Period: May 8, 2021 through June 4, 2021 

Project Manager : John J . Spanos jspanos@gfnet.com 

Depreciat on Study 

Phase 000 

Summary of Current Charges 

• DEPP.ECIATIOIJ STUDY 

Total Charges 

Tot.al Due This Invoice ....... ., ..... ..... . 

$ 2 .-'61.36 

S2,461.36 
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~ 6annettF/eming 
Excellence Delivered As Promised 

Gannett Fleming Valuat;on and Rate Consultants, LLC 

Phase 000 - Depreciation Study 

Labor Costs 
Labor Classification 

Suppo,t Sia rr 

Expenses 

Transportation - Airfare 

Hours Rate 

4 50 $ ?8-'\.00 

3.50 

Total Lab0< Costs 

Total Expenses 

Total Phase - 000 

12'J.OO 

Project: 068275 
b1vo ice No: 068275•117488 

Invoice Date: June 28. 2021 

Amount 

1 2s2 ~o 

420.00 

758.86 

$1,702.50 

$ 756.66 

$ 2,1161.36 

Page 2 of 2 
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Gannett Fleming Project No. 068275 - NiSource- Columbia Ga• of Kentucky 

Air Travel Charges - John J. Spanos 
Traueler lnvoiceNumber Ticket Itinerary OepartOate Oes.tinationCity Amount 

SPANOS/JOHN J 212436884 0786094294 Ser,ice Fee 06·Apr·21 Lexington s 25.00 
SPANOS/JOHN J 212437014 7520829620 MDT·U T-LEX-CLT MDT 06 Apr 21 Lexington s 708.86 
SPANOS/JOHN J 212437014 0786094367 Service Fee 06-Apr-21 Lexingt on $ 2S.OO 

Total $ 758.86 



Ohio 
Order; 21062CC0 Invoice# 6670 

AUn: 

Columbia Gas or Kentucky 
CRA\NFORD - U,,128858 

Voice: 614~60-6231 Fax: 

Email : sdurr@nisolln::e.com 

AdOhio 
1335 Dublin Rd_1 Suite 216B 
Columbus, Ohio 43215-1000 

INVOICE 
July 02, 2021 

Advertiser. 

Brand: 

Campaign 

Client Order Number: 

Columbia Gas or Kentucky. 

Amount Due: ~----------$-6-2-,5-5-1-.1-8~1 

Pfaase de/BCl1 and ,e1um tfi;s pcd1,oo wilh yor..ir oayrnenl 

.. ... .... ......... ... .... ....... ... ... .. .. ..... ... ....... ... .... .... ...... .... .. .... ... ... .... ... ... .. .. ... ...... .... ... ... .... ... ... .... ... ... ... ....... . ' ..... ... ... ....... ... .... ... 
Columbia Gas or Kentucky. Invoice# 6670 P.O.#; Client Order Number: 

Run Del!> AdSizce Rak Type Rele Color Rak Tola/ Di$COU11I ('¼) Am;,unl ofli,; Dl•=nr p.,_,.. 

Affidavit Charge (Columbus, Ohio) 

06/04/2021 0.00 Spe~-ial $5.00 $5.00 $0.00 (0 .00%) $5.00 

Caption: Affidav il charge 

Subtotal : 0.00 $5.00 $0.00 $5,00 $0.00 $5.00 

Appalachian News•E~press (Pikeville, K.entucky) 

06/0112021 129 .00 special $12.60 $1 ,625.40 $0.00 (0 .00%) $1 ,625.40 

06/08/2021 129,00 special $12.60 $1 ,625.40 $0,00 (0,00%) $1,625.40 

subtotal: 258.00 $25.20 $0.00 $3 ,250.80 $0.00 $3,250.80 

Ashland Daily Independent (Ashland, Kentucky) 

06/04/2021 126,00 special $12.66 $1 ,595.16 $0,00 (0,00%) $1,595.16 

06/11/2021 126,00 special $12 ,66 $1,595.16 $0,00 (0.00%) $1,595.16 

Subtotal : 252,00 $25.32 $0.00 $3,190.32 $0.00 $3,190.32 

Bourbon County Citizen (Paris, Kentucky) 

06/03/2021 129.00 special $12.00 $1,548 .00 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,548.00 

06/10/2021 129,00 special $12 ,00 $1 ,548 00 $0,00 (0 .00%) $1 ,548,00 

Subtotal : 268,00 $24.00 $0.00 $3,096.00 $0.00 $3,096.00 

Brooksville Bracken County News (Brooksville , Kentucky) 

06/03/2021 126,00 special $6,50 $819 00 $0 ,00 (0.00%) $819,00 

06/10/2021 126,00 special $6.50 $819.00 $0.00 (0.00%) $819.00 

Subtotal : 252,00 513.00 $0.00 $1 ,638.00 $0.00 S1 ,638.00 

Citizen Voice & Times (I rvine, Kentucky) 

06/03/2021 129,00 special $6.27 $808.83 $0.00 (0 .00%) $808.83 

06/10/2021 129.00 special $6.27 $808.83 $0,00 (0,00%) $808,83 

Subtotal : 258.00 $12.54 $0.00 $1,617.66 $0.00 $1 ,617.66 

Cynthiana Democrat (Cynathlana, Kentucky) 

06/03/2021 129.00 special $'11 .81 $1 ,523.49 $0,00 (0 ,00%) $1,523.49 

06110/2021 129,00 special $11.81 $1 ,523.49 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,523.49 

Subtotal : 258,00 $23.62 $0 .00 $3,046.98 $0.00 $3,046.98 

Frankfort State Journal (F,ankfort, Kentucky) 
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Columbla Gas of Kentucky , Invoice# 6670 P.O .# : Client Order Number: 

U,j Dafe Ad Size R'ale T;<J)e fia/e GouRaJB TO/al Disco .. ml (%) Armunl af!ar Dlscoont Page 

06/04/2021 120,00 speclal $16.00 $1,920 00 $0,00 (0 .00%) $1,920.00 

06/1112021 120,00 special $16.:oo S1 ,920.-00 $0.00 (0.00%) $1 ,920.00 

Subtotal: 240,00 $32.00 $0.00 $3,840.00 $0.00 $3,840.00 

Greenup Counly News Tl mes (Greenup, Keritucky) 

06/0112021 121 .50 special $4,00 $486.00 $0.00 (0.00%) $486.00 

06108/2021 121 .50 special S4 .00 $486 00 $0.00 (0 .00%) $486.00 

Subtotal : 243,00 58.00 $0.00 $972.00 $0.00 $972,00 

Inez Mountain Citizen {Inez, Kentuaky) 

OG/OVW21 129,00 special sa.22 $1 ,060.38 $0.00 {0 .00%) $1,060.38 

06109/2021 129.00 special S8.22 S~,060.38 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,060.38 

Subtotal : 2S8.00 $16.44 $0.00 $2,120.76 $0.00 52,120.76 

Lexington Herald Leader (Lexington, Kentucky) 

0610412021 126,00 Special $3,067.00 $3 ,067 00 $0.00 (0.00%) $3,067.00 

06]11/2021 126.00 Speoial $3,067.00 $3 ,067.00 $0,00 (0.00%) $3 ,067.00 

Subtotal : 252.00 $6,134.00 $0.00 $6,134,00 $0.00 $6,134.00 

Lou isa Big Sandy News jLoulsa, Kentucky) 

06/02/2021 126.00 specia l $8.86 $1,116.36 $'0.00 (0.00%) $1,116.36 

06/09/2021 126.00 special $6.86 $1 ,116.36 $0.00 (0.00%) $1 ,116.36 

Sub1otal : 262.00 ~11.n $0.00 $2,232.72 $0.00 $2,232.72 

Maysville Ledger Independent (Maysllllle, Ken1ucky) 

06/04/2021 129 .00 speclal -$24,02 $3 ,098.58 $0,00 (0.00%) $3 ,098.58 

OG/1112021 129.00 special $24.02 $3 ,098.58 $0,00 (0.00%) $3,098.58 

Subtotal : 258.00 $48.04 $0.00 $6,197.16 $0.00 $6,197.16 

Mount Sterling Advocate (Mount Sterling, Kentucky) 

OG/0312021 129.00 special $6,88 $887.52 $0,00 (0.00%) $887,52 

06/1012021 129.00 sn~cial $6.88 $887.52 $0.00 (0 .00%) $887,52 

Subtotal: 268,00 513.76' $0.00 $1,775.04 SO.OD 51,775.04 

News-Graphic (Gemgetown, Kentucky) 

06/04/2021 107.50 Sp~~ial $18,60 $1 ,999.50 $0.00 (0.00%) $1 ,999.50 

06/1112021 ·101.so. special $18.60 $1 ,999.50 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,999.50 

Subtotal: 215,00 $37.20 $0.00 $3,999.00 $0.00 S3.999.00 

Preston burg Floyd County Times (Prestonbulg, Kentucky) 

06/02/2021 129.00 special $13.40 $1 ,728.60 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,728.60 

06/09/Z021 129.00 special i13,40 $1 ,728 60 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,728.60 

Subtotal ; 258.00 $26.80 $0.00 $3,457 20 $0.00 $3,457.20 

Richmond Register (Richmond, Kentucky) 

06/03/2021 129.00 special $16.46 $2 ,123.34 $0.00 (0.00%) $2 ,123.34 

06/10/2021 129.00 special $16.46 $2,123.34 $0,00 (0.00%) $2,1 23.34 

Subtotal : 258.00 $32.92 $0.00 $4,246.68 $0.00 $4,246.68 

The Jessamine Journal {Nicholasville, Kentucky) 

06/03/2021 126,00 speoial $14 .57 $1 ,835.82 $0,00 {0.00%) $1 ,835.82 

06/10/2021 126.00 special $14,57 $1 ,835.82 $0.00 (0.00%) $1,835.82 

Subtotal : 252.00 $29.14 $0.00 $3,671 ,.64 $0.00 $3,671.64 

The Winchester Suij (Winchester, Kentucky) 
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Columbla Gas of Kentucky, Invoice# 6670 P.O.# : Client Order Number: 

w, Dale Ad Size F?a/BTJ,'[Je "'>le 

06101/2021 126 .00 speclal $12.66 

06/08/2021 126.00 special $12.66 

Subtotal : 252.00 $25.32 

The Woodford Sun (Versailles, Kentucky) 

06/0312021 126.00 special $11 .80 

0611712021 126.00 specia l $11 .80 

Subtotal : 2S2.00 $23.60 

Troublesome creek Times (H indman, Kentucky) 

06/0312021 129,00 special S7.35 

06!10/2021 129.00 special S7.35 

Subtotal : 258,00 $14.70 

Grnss Advertisi ng $62,551 .18 

Agenoy Discou nl $0,00 

0th er Discount $0.00 

Serv ice Charge $000 

Adoh,o 07iW20Z1 121.0:0.111 

CobrRa/e Tola , 

$1 ,595,16 

$1 ,595.16 

$0.00 $3,190.32 

$1,486.80 

$1 ,486.80 

$0.00 $2,973.60 

$948.15 

$948.15 

$0.00 $1 ,1396.30 

Tola I Misc. $0.00 

Ta~ $0,00 

Total Billed '$62,551.18 

Unbilled $0.00 

TERMS: DUE UPON RECEIPT 

Please remit payment to : 

AilOhio 

1335 Dublin Rd ., Suite 216 8 

Columbus, OH 43215-1000 

Disco .. ml (%) Am.:mnl -al!ar Discount Page 

$0,00 (0.00%) $1,595.16 

$0.00 (0.00%) $1,595.16 

$0.00 $3,190.32 

$0.00 (0.00%) $1 ,486.80 

$0.00 (0 .00%) $1 ,486.&0 

$0,00 $2,973.60 

$0.00 (0.00%) $948.15 

$0.00 (0.00%) $948.15 

$0.00 $1,896.30 

Amount Paid $ 0.00 

Adjustments $ 0.00 

Payment Date 

Balance Due $62,551.1 8 



i~ AdOhio 
1335 Dublin Rd., Suite 2168 
Columbus, Ohio 43215-1000 

0-h- ADVERTISING ESTIMATE - io" June 24, 2021 
- - CRAWFORD 0 #128858 

Order: 21055CC1 Document Number: 68236 

AdSilb ROPRolo ROP Typo 

Affidavit Charo a (Cc/umbus, OH) (Sun, Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu , Fri, Sal) -

Thu 05/27/21 o 0,00 X 0.00 $5.00 Special 

Caption: affidavit charge 

Appalachian News-Express (Plkevllle, KY) (Tue, Thu, Sat) •· 

Thu05/27/21 o 6.00 X 21.50 512.60 special 

Position; Main news AdOhlo does not pay fmanct1 charges 

Ashland Dally Independent (Ashland, KY) (Sun, Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sat) ·· 

Agonoy 
Commlssl!>n 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

Fri 05128/21 o 6.00 X 21.00 $1 2.66 special 0,0000% 

Po9ltlon: Main newg Ac!Ohlo does not pay flnar,ce charges 

BourtJon County Citizen (Paris, KY) (Thursday) •· 

Thu05/27/21 o 6.00X21 .50 512.00 special 

Posillon; Main news AdO'1Io does not pay finance charges 

Brooksville Bracken County News (Broohsvlllo, KY} (TI1ursday) -

Thu 05/27/21 o 6.00 X 21 ,00 $6.50 special 

Posltlon: Main nows AdOhio does nol pay finanr.o charges 

Citizen Voice & Timas {Irvine, KY) (Thursday) -

Thu 05/27/21 o 6.00 X 21 .50 $6.27 specia l 

Position; Main news AdOhlo does nol pay finance charges 

Cynll>lana Domocrat (Cynolh/ona, KY) (Thu~ay) -

Thu 05/27121 o 6.00 X 21.50 $11 .81 special 

Position: Main news AdOhlo does nol poy finance chargas 

Frankfort State Journal (Frankfort, KY) (Sun. Mon, Tue , Wed, Thu, Fri) -

Fri 05/28/21 o 6.00 X 20.00 $16.00 special 

Poelllon: Main news AdOhlo does no( pay finance charges 

Th11 Gre&nup Beacon (Flatwoods, KY} (Tuesday) 6.00-20.25 full psgc-1.00 

Tue 05125/21 o 6.00 X 20.25 $486.00 Speclal 

Po,ltlon: main MWS 

MO lo 08124/2021 # 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

Advor11ser; 

P.O.#: 

Client Order #: 

Brand: 

Campaign: 

Position: 

Copy: 

Columbia Gas of Kontucky. 

Main News 

Ad copy will be provided 

Color Raio Ca/or Typo 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

50.00 

$0.00 

Ai,ency 
C<Jmmlss/on 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

0.0000% 

Mil 
TOia/ 

$5.00 

$1 ,625.40 

$1 ,595, '(6 

$1 ,548.00 

$819.00 

$80B.83 

$1 ,523.49 

$1,920.00 

$486.00 

Pa e 1 ol 3 



Run Dare MS/1.o ROPRalo ROPTypo A!l"llOY Cofor Ralo Color Type A~MCY Noo 
Commlssfoo Commission Tolnl 

Greenup County News Times (Grasnup, KY) (Thursday) -

Thu 05/27/21 O 6.00X0.00 $4.00 special 0.0000% $0.00 0,0000% $0.00 

Posilh,n; Main news AdOhlo does not pay rinance charges 

Caption: wrong pepar 

lnei Mountain Citizen (Inez, KY) (Wednesday) -

Wed 05/26/21 o 6.00 X21 .50 $8.22 special 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $1,060.38 

Position: Main news AdOhlo does not pay finance charges 

The Jessamine Journal (Nlcholasvllle, KY) (Thursday) -

Thu 05/27/21 o 6.00 X21.00 $14.57 special 0.0000% $0,00 0.0000% $1,835.82 

Position ; Main naws AdOhlo does nol pay finance charges 

Lexington Herald Leador (Lexington, KY) (Sun, Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu, Frl, Sal) -

Fri 05128/21 0 6.00 X 20.50 $3,067.00 Special 0,0000% $0,00 0.0000% $3,067.00 

Position: Main MWS AdOhlo does nol pay finance charges 

Louisa Sig Sandy News /Loul&B, KY) (Wednesday) -

Wed 05/26/21 o 6.00 X21.00 $8.86 speclal 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $1 ,116.36 

Poslllon ; Malo nows AdOhlo does nol pay flnance charges 

Maysville Ledger Independent (Maysvl/le, KY) (Mon, Tue , Wed, Thu. Fri, Sal) -

Frl 05/28121 0 6.00X21 .50 $24 .02 special 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $3,098.58 

Position ; Main news AdOhio does nol pay finance charges 

Mount Storllng Advocalo (Mount S!orllng, KY) (Thursday) •· 

Thu 05/27121 o 6.00X21.50 $6.88 special 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $887.52 

Pcslllon: Mein nllWS AdOhlo does nol pay finance charges 

News-Graphic (George/own, KY) (Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat) -

Fri 05/28121 0 5.00 X 21 .50 $18,60 specl al 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $1 ,999.50 

Pos ltlon: Main nows AdOhlo does nol pay ffnance charges 

Proslonburg Floyd County Times (Proslonbur9, KY) (Wed, Fri) -

Wed 05126/21 o 6.00X 21.50 $13.40 special 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $1 ,728.60 

Posl llon: Moln news AdOhic docs nol pay flnanco charges 

Richmond Register (Richmond, l<Y) (Sun, Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sal) -

Thu 05/27/21 o 6.00 X 21 .50 $16.46 specia l 0.0000% $0.00 0.0000% $2,123.34 

Poslllon : Main news AdOhlo does not pay finance charges 

Troublosomo Crock Times /Hindman, KY} (Thursday) -

Thu 05/27121 o 6.00 X 21.50 $7.35 special 0,0000% $0.00 0.0000% $948.1 6 

Position: Main naws AdOhlo does not pay finance charges 

Th• Wlnchesler Sun /Wine/lester, KY) (Sun, Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sat) -

Tile 05/25/21 0 8,00X 21.00 $12.66 special 0.0()00% $0.00 0.0000% $1,595.16 

P01ill0n: Main news AdOhio does not pay finance charges 

The Woodford Sun (\lersallles, KY) (Thursday) -

Thu 05127/21 o 6,00X21.00 $11.80 special 0.0000% SO.OD 0,0000% $1,486.80 

Position: Main news AdOtifo does not pay finance charges 

Pa e 2of 3 
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Run Dalo Ad SJz.o ROPRoto ROPTyp,, Agoncy 
Color Role Color Type Agency Not 

CommJ.ssfCJn Cr1mmi~lon Tela, 

Tolal Insertions 22 Total Advertising $31,278.09 Total Net Estimate 

Total Lineage 2518.0000 Net $31,278.09 $31 ,278.091 

Total Misc. $0.00 

Total Clrculatlon 0.0 Tax $0.00 

Aiiofi1o 0812412021 # 
Pago 3 ol 3 



Invoice pages 2 through 29 of Invoice No. COL8572927 not provided, 

 but is available upon request. 

Data is not related to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183. 

KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 1 of 15



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 2 of 15

0 AgileOne Invoice 
Customer Number : 00178119 

Agile 1 I 1999 West 19oth Street I Torrance , CA 90504 Invoice Date : 03/31 /2021 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 I Email : BillingDeptAgile1@agne1 _com Invoice Number : COL8572927 

Tax ID: Invoice Amount ; $704,340.73 

Terms: NET 30 DAYS 

Vendor Number : 2000120789 

Bill To: Remit To: 

NiSource Agile 1 

Attn : Ryann Jewett, U125756 1999 West 190th Street 

PO 30130 Torrance, CA 90504 

College Station, TX 77842 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge 
Tenure Tenure 

Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - -- I -I - - I - - -I - - - - - -- I - - - I - -- - - - - -- I -I - - I -· - - I - - - - - -- I -I - - I - - - I - - - - - - -- I -I - - I - - - I - - - - - -- I - - - I - - - I - - - - - - -Daw, Haley 03/14/2021 00012 15,50 59.48 STDO0 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $921,94 

Daw, Haley 03/21/2021 00012 27.00 59.48 STD00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $1,605.96 

Daw, Haley 03/2812021 00012 18.75 59.48 STO00 $0.00 0,00 $0,00 $1 ,11525 - - - - - - -- I -I -I -I - - -- - - - - - --I -I -I - I - - -- - - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - -I - - - - I - -- I -I -I - I - - - I - - - - - -- I - -I - I - - -
06-Apr-2021 Page 1 of30 
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KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 3 of 15

Name Weekend Unit Hours - -- -I - -- -I 
Sub-total !unit oooso 577.50 

GRAND TOTAL 118,359.33 I 
If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 

Email : BillingDeptAgile1@agi/e1.com 

06-Apr-2021 

Rate Charge - -- -I - -- - i 

Tenure Tenure 
Discount Discount% 

Sales Tax Amount - - -- - -I - - --- - -I 
I $33,098.961 

$904.181 $16,233.911 $704,340.731 

Page 30 of30 



Invoice pages 2 through 25 of Invoice No. COL8599190 not provided, 

but is available upon request. 

Data is not related to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183. 

KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 4 of 15



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 5 of 15

0 AgileOne Invoice 
Customer Number : 00178119 

Agile 1 I 1999 West 19oth Street I Torrance , CA 90504 Invoice Date : 04/30/2021 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 I Email : BillingDeptAgile1@agne1 _com Invoice Number : COL8599190 

Tax ID: Invoice Amount ; $618,814.15 

Terms: NET 30 DAYS 

Vendor Number : 2000120789 

Bill To: Remit To: 

NiSource Agile 1 

Attn : Ryann Jewett, U125756 1999 West 190th Street 

PO 30130 Torrance, CA 90504 

College Station, TX 77842 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge 
Tenure Tenure 

Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - -- I - I - - I - - - I - - - - - -- I -I - - - - -I -- - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - - --I - - -I - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - -I - -- - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - - - - -I 
Daw, Haley 04/04/2021 00012 23.75 59.48 STD00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $1 ,412.65 

Daw, Haley 04111 /2021 00012 17.50 59.48 STD00 $0.00 0,00 $0.00 $1,040.90 

Daw, Haley 04/1 8/2021 00012 7.00 59.48 STDO0 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $416.36 -I -I -I - I - - -I - - - - - - --I -I -I - I - - -I - - - - - - --I - -I - I - - -
05-May-2021 Page 1 of26 
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KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 6 of 15

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - -- -I - - i - - -I -- - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - - -- - I - - I - - -I -- - - - - - -- - I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - -- -I - - - - - -· - - - - - - -- -I - - - - -I -- - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I -Sub-total !Unit 00059 1 5,460.33 I $239,245.721 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - -- -I - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - - -I - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - -- - - -I - - - I -- - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I 
Sub-total !Unit 00080 347.34 I $15,058.141 

GRAND TOTAL 115,494.79 I $756.541 s18, 149.351 $618,814.151 

If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 

Email : BillingDeptAgile 1@agile 1. com 

05-May-2021 Page 26 of 26 



Invoice pages 3 through 29 of Invoice No. COL8626659 not provided,  

but is available upon request. 

Data is not related to KY PSC Case No. 2011-00183. 

KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 7 of 15



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 8 of 15

0 AgileOne Invoice 
Customer Number : 00178119 

Agile 1 11999 West 1901h Street I Torrance . CA 90504 Invoice Date : 05/31 /2021 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 I Email : BillingDeptAgile1@agile1 .com Invoice Number : COL8626659 

Tax ID: Invoice Amount : $733,083.79 

Terms: NET30DAYS 

Vendor Number : 2000120789 

Bill To: Remit To: 

NiSource Agile 1 

Attn : Ryann Jewett, U125756 1999 West 190th Street 

PO 30130 Torrance, CA 90504 

College Station, TX 77842 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure 
Sales TaK Amount 

Discount Discount% - - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -
06-Jun-2021 Page 1 of30 



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 9 of 15

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount 
Discount Discount% - - - - - - - . 

- - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -Daw, Haley 05/02/2021 00012 4 .25 59.48 STD00 $0.00 000 $0.00 $252.79 - - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -Daw, Haley 05/09/2021 00012 3.25 59.48 STD00 $0.00 0 .00 $0.00 $193.31 - - - - - - -Daw, Haley 05/23/2021 00012 0.25 59.48 STD00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $14.87 - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -I - - - - - -- - - - - - -I - - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -
06-Jun-2021 Page 2 of30 
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KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment J 
Page 10 of 15

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount 
Discount Discount% - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - -- - - - - - -Sub-total -- 1 s,43s.1s 1 I $244,884.041 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount 
Discount Discount% - - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -Sub-total 589.92 I $34.069.ao 1 

GRAND TOTAL 117,441.18 I S952.781 $23,242.511 $733,083.791 

If you have any questions concerning this invoice please use 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 

Email : BillingDeptAgile1@agile 1.com 

06-Jun-2021 Page 30 of30 



Invoice pages 3 through 31 of Invoice No. COL8655929 not provided,  

but is available upon request. 

Data is not related to KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183. 
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0 AgileOne Invoice 
Customer Number : 00178119 

Agile 1 I 1999 West 19oth Street I Torrance , CA 90504 Invoice Date : 06/30/2021 

Phone : (310) 750-3400 I Email : BillingDeptAgile1@agile1.com Invoice Number: COL8655929 

Tax ID: Invoice Amount ; $823,275 34 

Terms: NET 30 DAYS 

Vendor Number : 2000120789 

Bill To: Remit To: 

NiSource Agile 1 

Attn : Ryann Jewett, U125756 1999 West 190th Street 

PO 30130 Torrance, CA 90504 

College Station, TX 77842 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge 
Tenure Tenure 

Sales Tax Amount C>iscount Discount% - - - - - -- I - I - - I - - - I - - - - - -- I - - -I -I - -- - - - - -- I - I -I -I _, - - I - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - -- - - - - - --I -I -I - - - -I _, - - - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - - -- - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - - -- - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I 
06-Jul-2021 Page 1 of33 
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Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - -- - - -I - - -- - - - - - --I -I - -I -· - - -- - - - - - --I -I - - - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I - - - - - - -- - - -I - - -I - - - - - - -- I -I - -I - - -- - - - - - --I -I - - - - -I - - - - - - --I -I - - - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - -I -· -- - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I 
Daw, Haley 05/30/2021 00012 1,25 59.48 STD00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $74.35 -I -I - - - - -I - - - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - -I - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - -- - - - - - -- -I -I - - -- - - - - - --I -I -I -I - - -I - - - - - - - --I -I - -I - - -I -I - - - - - - -- I - I - - - - - I - - - - - - --I -I - -I -I - -I - - - - - - - -I 

06-Jul-2021 Page 2 of33 

U134447
Highlight
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Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - - -- -I - - - - -I -- - - - - - - -- -I - -i _, - -I -- - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - - -- •1 - -I - - -I -- - - - - - -- -I - -I - - - I -- - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I -- - - - - - -- -I - - - - -I -Sub-total I unit oooss 1 s,103.75 1 I $269,498.961 

Name Weekend Unit Hours Rate Charge Tenure Tenure Sales Tax Amount Discount Discount% - - - - - - -- -I - - - - - -- - - - - - -- -I - - - - -I -I - - - - - - -- - - -I - - - -- - - - - - -- - - - - - -I -- - - - - - - -- -I - -I - ., -I - - - -I - - -- -I - - - - -I - - - - - - -- -I - -I - - -I 
Sub-total I unit 00080 431.82 I $26,925.491 

GRAND TOTAL I 1a,32s.os I $1,033.571 $28,779.311 $823,275.341 

If you have any quesfjons concerning this invoice please use 

06-Jul-2021 Page 32 of33 
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Phone : (310) 750-3400 

Email : Bil/ingDeptAgile1@agi/e1.com 

06-Jul-2021 Page 33 of 33 
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David Roy 

5/7/2021 0:00 116560 270966 Rental Car Fuel 39.51 Roy, David 01 

5/8/2021 0:00 116560 270966 Car Rental 100.5 Roy, David 02 

5/6/ 20210:00 116560 270966 Hotel 170.38 Roy, David 03 

5/5/20210:00 116560 270966 Hotel 170.38 Roy, David 04 
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"='nterprise 
® 



Hyatt Regency Columbus
350 North High Street
Columbus, OH 43215
Tel: 16144631234
Fax: 16142803034
columbusregency.hyatt.com

  INVOICE

David Roy
Room No. 2032
Arrival 05-05-21
Departure 05-07-21

Confirmation No. 1357143301 Folio Window 1
Group Name Folio No 1018394
Booking No 4T5VUQ
Date Description Charges Credits

05-05-21 Accommodation 145.00
05-05-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 14.50
05-05-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 10.88
05-05-21 Self Parking - Chestnut 20.00
05-06-21 Accommodation 145.00
05-06-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 14.50
05-06-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 10.88
05-06-21 Self Parking - Chestnut 20.00
05-07-21 Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX3961 XX/XX 380.76

Total 380.76 380.76

Balance 0.00

KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment K
Page 4 of 43

HYATT 
REGENCY" 
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Linda Rumpke 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/7/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Tolls/ Road Charges/ Parking 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/20/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Rental Car Fuel 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/20/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Tolls/ Road Charges/ Parking 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/5/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Personal Car Mileage 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/7/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Personal Car Mileage 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/20/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Meals - With Attendees 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/19/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Hotel 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/17/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Hotel 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/18/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Hotel 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/20/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Car Rental 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/6/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Hotel 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/5/2021 0:00 129226 267250 Hotel 

52 Rumpke, Linda 03 and 03A this is actually two separate transactions. One at $43 and one at $9 

58.4 Rumpke, Linda 04 and 04A this is actually two separate transactions. One at $49.90 and one at $8.50 

100 Rumpke, Linda 05 and 05A this is actually two separate transactions. One at $93 and one at $7 

104.16 Rumpke, Linda 06 

105.84 Rumpke, Linda 

122.12 Rumpke, Linda 

158.63 Rumpke, Linda 

158.63 Rumpke, Linda 

158.63 Rumpke, Linda 

163.08 Rumpke, Linda 

170.38 Rumpke, Linda 

170.38 Rumpke, Linda 

07 

08 

09 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 
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Receia:>·t 

LJR #27 

r ;o #31 

Entry T 1111e 

Exit Time 
Parking Tune 

Parking Fee 

VfSA 

Account# 
S l lP # 

Auth Code 
Credit Cdrd Amou~t 

A Payment No.0002/180 
T .I cket No. 007794 

0~/051 ?0?1 (Wed) 15:23 

05/0//:ZOtl (Frl) 7:02 
lDay 15:39 

Rate A $43.00 

31841 

0000024243 

$1'13. 00 
=·== .. .= ·:..:; __ ·- _-., _____ --~ - - ·--- -=·-·--·=--·-~.:.. ·.:.::.-::.:. ._ :.::~-·--.. -.-• -

Total 

--- -- . ---····-.. -- . 

n,ar·,k YCJU fOI' Your Vi~,it 
Please Coinr Again t • 

$43.00 

==~==:~~=~~=------ -----
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Expense Source 

LAZ PARKJNG 690151-LUKE 

Source 

One Card 5183 

Card Charge 
LAZ PARKING 690151-LUKE 

COLUMBUS. OH 432150000 

Reference Number 
240552211280918TT000028 

Purchase Date 
05/0712021 

Shipping Amounl 
$0.00 

May 7, 2021 $9.00 

Vendor 

LAZ PARKING 690151 -LUKE 
COLUMBUS, OH 

$9.00 
One Card 5183 

Dale 

05/07/2021 

Transaction Date 

May 7 2021 

Order Number 
87700002 

Duty Amount 
so 00 

Posted Date 
May 10, 2021 

Billing Date 
May 31 , 2021 

Discount Amount 
$0.00 

Amount 

$900 

+-++ 
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W!LLiijSU~ FAST LANE 
287 MST IFI 36 WlLLlijSTOit~,~ 41897 

SUNOCO 0429913700 
xxxxxxxxx0001 
207 W. HWY 36 
WILLIAMSTOWN, kY 
41097 
05/20/2021 897656677 
02 : 24 : i 6 PM 

xxxxxxxxxxx~ 
Visa Fleet 
INVOICE 023338 
AUTH 043474 

PUMP# 2 
001 
PRICE/GAL 

17.213G 
$2.899 

FUEL_JOTAL $ 49 . 90 

CREDIT $ 49.90 

.. ------------- ---------
custooier--acti vated Pul"Ct1a~~/ Captu~­
Se~Jence fHJllber 33299 
Cm~ Reai! 
VISA CREDIT 
Mode: Iss~r 
AW: A9868688831818 
m: oeeeaaeaea 
!AO: E-5818Ari3681,~82 
TSI: £BB& 
ARC: 98 
TC: 32829AD4F&Hf,2A1 
APPROVEO &nrn 
m B7passe1 
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Expense Source 

SHELL OIL 10011451019 

Source 

One Card 5183 

Card Charge 

SHELL OIL 10011451019 

LEXINGTON. KY 405020000 

Reference Number 
24316051141548275004968 

Purchase Date 
05/20/2021 

Shipping Amount 
50 00 

May 20, 2021 $8-50 

Vendor 

SHELL OIL 10011451019 
LEXINGTON KY 

Order Number 
27500496 

Duty Amount 
so 00 

Date 

05120/2021 

$8.50 
One Card 5183 

Transaction Date 

May 20 2021 

Posted Date 
May 24. 2021 

Billing Date 
May 31 , 2021 

Discount Amount 
$0 00 

)( 

Amount 

58.50 

++++ 
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Removed from Rate Case Expense

Removed from Rate Case Expense

Removed from Rate Case Expense

7:54 
◄ Mail 

Done 

RUMPKE,,UM>A 

121DESHARD 

LEXINGTON I('( 40502 

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA 

CGtllrrni:alJon Nt.ffi)lif: 316"1959774 

t-l1lM Collrius ~ 5/2Ql2021 2.J9ffl PM 

!DATE I DESCRIPTION 

S/17/2021 SELF PARKING 

6117'2021 Gl.l:STROOM 

S/17/2021 RM • 5Al1'STM 

S/17/2021 RM · OCCUPANCY TAA - - IE 8' R 

5118/2021 SElf PARKING 

S/18/2021 GUE.ST ROOM 

Sflll/202I RM • SAl..ESTAX 

S11ll2021 RM · DCCL.JP.ANCY TAX 

S/19'2021 COFFEE SHOP - IW,l,QIJEB'R - ~t,,GUC:8ftR 

S/19/2021 SElF PARKING 

S/19/202I GUEST ROOM 

!i/19/202I RM , SAlES TAX 

S/19/2021 RM • OCCUPANCY TAX 

RUMPKE, lJNDA 

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA 

Coriirmauon NtmhH:. J161959n4 

KJl.on Ctlfumbus Oownfo¥w'I Sl2(1l202. J 2:39:00 PM 

jDATE ioesCRJPTION 
5.'2CW2021 VS-SIB.1 

■ I 

4of4 
~. ,_ ,-------

Hilton lklM<I Slares af -
TEl£PttONE.614..J34.J!600 • FAA6I4--4M-5219 

HOTELS & RESCRTS R­wwvt.hlllon.COfl'l:or1800HllTONS 

ID 
HESP 

HESP 

HESP 

HESP -HESP 

HESP 

HESP 

HESP 

UNTR --SADERS 

SADERS 

SAOERS 

SAIJERS 

Page. I 

ID 

SADERS 

RoamNa:. 

Aml,alD,aM,_ 

OeparueDa&a: 

Adul/Chid; 

C-0 

RoomRalil 
Al.. 
tiHO 

VAT# 

FolioNolClte 

REF NO CHARUES 

3194193 

3194194 

319-1194 

3194194 

~ 

3194444 

3194445 

3\94-445 

311144-45 

3194663 --3194890 

3194891 

3l!MHl 

3194A91 

Room No 

A.tmrmOate: 

Departure Date: .... .,,,_ 
Cashief'ID: 

RoomRaa-_ 

Al.. 

HH< 

VATR 
F$No1Ct,,, 

$3100 

513500 

$10.13 

SIJSO -$3100 

$135.00 

$10.13 

S13.50 

$551 --$31.00 

$13500 

$1013 

S1350 

REF NO CHARGES. 

3195113 

1005IQ20 

S/17121121 4 S<.OOPM 

S/20Q0212.3900PM 

I'() 

JODA 

13500 

861931 A 

CREDIT IIAI..ANC!o 

1005l02D 

5117Q021 4.54:00 PM 

Sl20l2021 2::39JIO PM ..,, 
JODA 

135,00 

861931A 

CREDIT I BAU.NCE I 
(S709-74) 

S0.00 

·--
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Expense Source 

LAZ PARKING 690151-LUKE 

Source 

One Card 5183 

Card Charge 
lAZ PARKING 690151-LUKE 

COLUMBUS OH 432150000 

Reference Number 
24055221141091870000010 

Purchase Date 
05120/2021 

Shipping Amount 
S0.00 

May 20, 2021 57.00 

Vendor Date 

lAZ PARKING 690151-1.UKE 
COLUMBUS OH 

05/20/2021 

Order Number 
87000001 

Duty Amount 
$0 00 

$7.00 
One Card 5183 

Transaction Date 
May 20. 2021 

Posted Date 

May 21 . 2021 

Billing Date 
May 31 . 2021 

Discount Amount 
so on 

Amount 

S7 .00 

+++a 
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➔ 

05/05/2021 

Personal Car Mileage $104.16 

Details Itemizations 

;.., Mileage Calculator @ Allocations 

Expense Type 

Personal Car Mileage 

From Location 

2001 Mercer Rd , Lexington, KY 
40511 , USA 

Work Order 

(CKY02021) CKY 2021 Rate C. 

Cost Object 

Rate Case (NORG) 

Comment 

e 

To Location 

290 W Nationwide Blvd , 
Columbus, OH 43215, US 

Charged Department 

CKY President (0326 100) 

Code Pattern 

Transaction Date 

05/05/2021 

Paymenl Type 

Cash 

Business Unit 0 
(00032) Columbia Gas of Kentu .. 

Activity 

Year 2021 (Y2021) 

WMS Business Unit 0 
(00032) Columbia Gas of Ken tu .. 

Purpose of the Trip 

Rate Case 

Approved Amount 

104.16 

Account 

EIEHHF 

1~m El l 
I 

• Required field 

e 
(18235440) NC Reg Asset Rate .. 

Billing Pool 

WMS Job Order e 
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Manage Expenses View Transactions 

.... ➔ Personal Car Mi leage $105.84 
05/07/2021 

Details Itemizations 

,9--. Mileage Calculator @ Allocations 

Expense Type 

Personal Car Mileage 

From location 

290 W Nationwide Blvd, 
Columbus, OH 43215, US 

Work Order 0 
(CKY02021 ) CKY 2021 Rate C . 

Cost Object 

Rate Case (NORG) 

Comment 

To Location 

2001 Mercer Rd, Lexington, KY 
40511 , USA 

Charged Department 

CKY President (0326100) 

Code Pattern 

Transaction Date 

05107/2021 

Payment Type 

Cash 

Business Unit 0 
(00032) Columbia Gas of Kentu .. 

Activity 

Year 2021 (Y2021 ) 

WMS Business Unit 0 
(00032) Columbia Gas of Ken tu ... 

Eiifrhi& 

Show Receipt E] 

..,.. Required field 

Purpose of the Trip 

CKY Rate Case Page Turn 

Approved Amount 

105.84 

Account fJ 
(18235440) NC Reg Asset Rate .. 

Billing Pool 

WMS Job Order fJ 
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Removed from Rate Case Expense

FORNO 
721 N High St. 

Cclumbus, Ohle 43215 

Server:H1 I, 
Check #l4d 
Ordered: 

Arancini 
Seasonal !;mi,.~. :r r 1e::; 
1 9et-tt r'tll1tt; 
Hawd 1 \::in 
5teamed Mussels 
Forno Chicken 

Subtotal 
Tax 
rotal 

Table 5)6 
0~/ 13/21 6 :5IJ P11 

$12 00 
$15 00 
$2&:00 
$16.00 
$15.00 
$17.00 

$95 .00 
$7 12 

$102 .12 

TOUCHI.ESS PAYMENT 
1)PTION 

Scan with r. hone camera to pay 

SUgge!;ted T1p: 
251: (111 $25.53 Total $127.65) 
221: (11, $22.47 Total $124.59) 
10X: (Ti> .20.42 Total $122.54) 

Tip ~~rcentiges are based on lhe check 
p·lce after taxes. 

7 
I■ 

FURNO 
721 N Hlgh St, 

Columbus, Oh1o 43t15 

Server: RI ley B 
Check #148 Tab le 5/6' 
Ordered: 05/19/21 6:50 PH 

Input Type C (tHV Cr1p -
VISA CREDIT XliXKXXX 

T lme 7:58 PH 

Transact Ion Typ ! Sale 
Authorization Approved 
Approval Code 010581 
Payment ID hXbyJmllcWff 
Appl 1cat 1on ID A0000000031010 
Application Labil VISA CREDI l 
lerJ111na1 ID 
Card Reader HAGTEK _EOYNAHO 

Amoun : $102 .12 

+ 11 >: - --
=Total: _ J::9·'~ 

LI NOA L RUHPK E 

Suggested I IP' 
251; (II l $25 .~3 lutn I 1// ,b':>) 
2ZI; (Tl> $22 .47 Tota I !17-1 ',9) 
201: (ll l $70 .42 Total •I ii'',) 
, percent ages are ba'IPd lk Ilk· i.1,,. k 

p ·tee 1 , t •1• 

Custor.1e1 Copt 
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~ ;:$ National. f: -)5 
Rental Agreement Summary RES # 1075319468 
RA # 787042629 ACCOUNT NiSOURCE 

1-L:..:;IN;:.D:..A:.:R~U:..:M::.:P:.::.KE:,.----------, CORPORATE SERVICES · CPG 

LEXINGTON, KY 40502 EXT REF # 

RENTAL LOCATION 
LEXINGTON ARPT (844)8878401 
4000 TERMINAL DA STE 103 
LEXINGTON, KV 40510-9645 
RATEFiiii:ES AND QUALIFICATIONS 
20HPG01 
Monlhly Charge up lo 31 days 

RENTAL DATE 
17-MAV-2021 
RENTAL TIME 
10:29AM 

INITIAL X._ __ 

111111111111111111111111III 1111111111 111111111111111 IIIII lllll llll 1111 

EC # 8289TT284 7 
FT# 

REnJRN LOCATION raETURN DATE 1 
LEXINGTON ARPT (844)8878401 MAV-2021 
4000 TERMINAL DR STE 103 ETURN TIME 
LEXINGTON, KV 40510-9645 00 PM __ 

VEHICLE INFORMATION 
RESERVED INTERMEDIATE 2/4 DOOR AUTOMATIC AJC 
DRIVEN PREMIUM C ROSSOVER 
CHARGED INTERMEDIATE 2/4 DOOR AUTOMATIC AJC 
MAKE VOLKSWAGEN 
MODEL ATlAS 
COLOR Bl.ACK 
ODOMETER 11875 
PLATE 5EL3093 
REG AREA MO 
VEHICLE# MC551706 
BAY R1 
STALL E1l5 

CH_A_RG_E_S-------------------,-U.,.,.Nc:-::IT::---=--==-:p:::R:::::-IC'E/UNIT CURRENT CHARGE 

RENTER'S RESPONSIBILITY 
TIME & DISTANCE 
TIME & DISTANCE 
TIME & DISTANCE 
TIME & DISTANCE 
UNLIMITED MILES/l<M-TIME & DISTANCE 
REFUELING SERVICE CHARGE 
CTRCT FACILITY CHARGE $3.75/0AV 
KV U-ORIVE-ITTAX 6 PCT @ 6.00% 
CONCESSION RECOVERY FEE 11.11 PCT @ 11.11 % 
VLC RECOVERY FEE 1.35,IDAV 

Hour 
Day 
WEEK 
MONTH 
M.IKM 
Gallon 
Day 

Day 

15.17 X 
30.33 X 4 

166.82 X 
667.26 X 

0.00 X 
4.00 X 

ESTIMATED CHARGES 

0.00 
121.32 

0.00 
0.00 
0.00 
0.00 

15.00 
7.28 

14.08 
5.40 

163.08 INITIAL X 

(ALL CHARGES ARE ESTIMATE ONLY · SUBJECT TO CHANGE IF VEHICLE NOT 
RETURNED TO THE LOCATION ON DATE ANO TIME SPECIFIED. OR IF FUEL TANK IS 
NOT FULL AT RETURN ANO FUEL SERVICE OPTION WAS NOT PURCHASED). 
PAYMENTS 
VISA 5183 Auth # 

I DECLINE OPTIONAL LOSS DAMAGE WAIVER X _______ _ 

I DECLINE PERSONAL ACCIDENT INSURANCE (PAI) WITH PERSONAL EFFECTS COVERAGE (PEG), X ________ _ 

I DECLINE NATIONAL'$ OPTIONAL ROADSIDE SERVICE PLUS X ___ ____ _ 

I DECLINE OPTIONAL THIRD PARTY BODILY INJURY AND PROPERTY DAMAGE INSURANCE (SLP). X 

PLEASE READ IMPORTANT INFORMATION REGARDING AUTHORIZED DRIVERS WITHIN THE ~GREEt.\ENT lSEE 
RENTAL AGREEMENT JACKET). 

I, THE "RENTER• SIGNING BELOW, HAVE READ AND 
AGREE TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS IN THE 

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS, WHICH ARE 
INCORPORATED HEREIN BY REFERENCE AS IF FULLY 
SET FORTH HEREIN, AND THE RENTAL AGREEMENT 

SUMMARY (COLLECTIVELY, THE ADDITIONAL TEAMS 
AND CONDITIONS AND THE RENTAL AGREEMENT 
SUMMARY ARE THE "CONTRACT"). BY SIGNING BELOW, 
I AM AUTHORIZING OWNER TO CHARGE TO THE CREDIT 
CARD($) AND/OR DEBIT CARD(S) THAT I HAVE PROVIDED 
TO OWNER ALL AMOUNTS OWED BY ME UNDER THIS 

CONTRACT FOR ADVANCE DEPOSITS, INCREMENTAL 
~UTHORIZA T/ONSIDEPOS/TS, AND OR ANY OTHER 
MOUNTS OWED BY ME, AS WELL AS PAYMENTS 

RA # 767042629 
PAGE 1 OF2 
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7:50 ■ I 

Done Fol io_2 5346601. pdf 

HYATT 

INVOICE 

Ms Linda Rumpke 
121 Desha Ad 
Lexington KY 40502 
Un~ed States 

Conlirmabon No. 3434096801 

Group Name 

Boolong No. 2FHF93 

Date Description 

05-05-21 
05-05-21 
05-05-21 
05-06-21 
05-06-21 
05-06-21 
05-06-21 
05•07-21 

Accommodabon 
City Occupancy Tax 10o/,, 
Room State Tax7.5% 
• Perks Breakfast Food 
Accommodation 
City Occupancy Tax 10% 
Room State Tax 7.5"<. 
Visa 

Guest StgnatW8 

las,Mthalrny~to,h;!;IDillf51'1GC•-.eds'llltllQl'M­
~betM!ldpen-'V~Sllhenatt._lt)ll!nitatsir:! 
~~Of~ illl.lOpa_yforq perlOI 
1hefuiAffllU!lafSWM,amgea.. 

Wo~d of Hyatt Summary 

Membership: 
Bonus Code~ 
Qualifying Nights: 
Eligible Spend: 
Redemption Eilgible: 

XXXXXXIIII 
2 
334.50 
14.84 

Summary Invoice. please see front desk 
for efigibtlity details. 

INVOICE 

Ms Linda Rumpke 
121 Desha Ad 
Lexong1on KY 40502 
Unll&d Slates 

C,onf1rmabon No 3434096801 

Group Name 

Book,ng No. 2FHF93 

c!J 

Hyatt Regency Columbus 
350 North High Street 
Columbus. OH 43215 
Tel : 16144631234 
Fax: 16142803034 
c-0lumbusregency.hyatt.com 

Room No. 1541 

Amval 05-05-21 

Departure 05-07-21 

FoboWmdow 
Fo6o No. 1018358 

Charges Credits 

145.00 
14.50 
10.88 

CHECl<t 605552 12.21 
145.00 

14.50 
10.88 

Xl0000000000(5183 XX/XX 352.97 

Total 352.97 352.97 

Balance 0.00 

WE HOPE YOU ENJOYED YOUR STAY WITH US! 

Fa< 1nqwnes concerning your bill, please cal S88-587•28TT 

We 1/alue your reedback. tf YtJO were not fuil)I sabsfaed with your VIS!\. please emad us at 
hyattcolumbos@HyatLcom 

Please remit payment lo: 
Hyatt Regency Columbus 
PO Box 301596 
Dallas TX 75303-1596 

Hyatt Regency Columbu~ 
350 North High Stree, 
Columbus, OH 43215 
Tel· 16144631234 
F x: 16142803034 
columbusregency.hya11.com 

Room No. 1541 

Amval 05-05-21 

0epar1Ule 05-07-21 

FoboW1ndaw 2 

Foilo No. 1018359 



Josephine "Josie" Crawford 
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Removed from Rate Case Expense

Kimra Cole 

6/11/20210:00 5/7/20210:00 461382 269025 Tolls/ Road Charg, 50 Cole, Kimra _01 and 0lA th is is actually two separate transactions. One at $42 and one at $8 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/19/20210:00 461382 269025 Tolls/ Road Charg, 53 Cole, Kimra 03 and 03A th is is actually two separate transactions . One at $44 and one at $9 

6/11/20210:00 5/7/20210:00 461382 269025 Meals - With Atter 87.68 Cole, Kimra 04 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/5/20210:00 461382 269025 Personal Car Milec 104.16 Cole, Kimra 05 

6/11/20210:00 5/17/20210:00 461382 269025 Personal Car Milec 104.16 Cole, Kimra 06 

6/11/20210:00 5/7/20210:00 461382 269025 Personal Car Milec 105.28 Cole, Kimra 07 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/19/20210:00 461382 269025 Personal Car Milec 105.28 Cole, Kimra 08 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/18/2021 0:00 461382 269025 Hotel 151.58 Cole, Kimra 09 

6/11/20210:00 5/17/20210:00 461382 269025 Hotel 151.58 Cole, Kimra 10 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/5/20210:00 461382 269025 Hotel 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/6/2021 0:00 461382 269025 Hotel 

170.38 Cole, Kimra 

170.38 Cole, Kimra 

11 

12 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/18/20210:00 461382 269025 Meals - With Atter 190.79 Cole, Kimra 13 and 13A th is is actually two separate transactions. One for $160.79 and one for $30 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/19/20210:00 461382 269025 Meals - With Atter 273 .36 Cole, Kimra 14 and 14A th is is actually two sepa rate transactions. One for $100.28 and one for $173.08 

6/11/2021 0:00 5/6/20210:00 461382 269025 Meals - With Atter 311.95 Cole, Kimra 15 and lSA th is is actually two separate transactions . OAe for $73.81 and one for $238.14 
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■ 111 Veri zon ~ 6:18 PM 

Done 11 of 30 

I l l .; - I..Ji 

1/U · t8 

Entry ll nt~· 

E;o t T 111nj 

Park rig ' lffitl 

Pc11 -k1 rig Fee 

VlSA 
Account# 
Slir; # 

Auth Code 
crem t ca, u An,our t 

A 11« ·me11r N . OOLl:?l 179 

I Ll.kflt No. 1'}: O 7 

WJ/ 11'../20~1 l (W d) 1 S: 1. 3 

05/ l /2021 ffn) 6: :.i9 

Way 1'1:3 

Rc1te A . i2. 0 

-31 110 

oouo n 
4~.o 

Total 4' . 

Th 1, tou ftt our· Vl!:il 

p j I ,e 
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■111 Verizon ? 6:19 PM 

Done 9of 30 

RECEIPT 
License Plate Nun-ber 

AGV346 
Expiration Oate/Tlrre 

01:04 PM 
MAY 07, 2021 

Purchase Date/Time: 07:04am May 07, 2021 
Total Due: $8.00 Rate: $8 for 6 Hws 
Total Paid: $8.00 Pmt Type1 CC (Swipe) 
Ticket #: 00050):)9 
SIN #: 500011480241 
Setting: McConnell Garage 
Mach Name1 McConnell Pl Luke 1 

#*"""'. , Visa 
Auth #! 049883 
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■ 111 Veri zon 

< 

VI: A 

~ Ill IJ 

SIW IJ 

Of J 

fl Ill \00 TOI IX.JI Vt 1 

5:59 PM 

Kimra 

4.00 

Parking at hotel 
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■ 11 Verizon ? :~ 5:49 PM 

< 
Kimra 

Thu, May 20, 10:29 AM 

RECEIPT 

t 

AGV346 
I tori 

02:51 PM 
MAY 19, 2021 

fvcnase te/T rrie: 07:5 May 19, 2021 
To al Cl,ei $9.00 Rate: $9 for 7 Hou-s 
Tota/ Paid: $9.00 Pm Type: a: (5'# pe) 
T • I · IXXl51)1> 

#: 5(0)11480241 
Setting: Mceomell Garage 

: McCcmell Pt LUce 1 

, ..... ,. Visa 

Parking at arena 

Th11 M::iv ?O ?:OLL PM 

@ 4 9%(0• 
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■ 111 Verizon 

Done 

6:17 PM 

12 of 30 

I 7 
i; so 

y 
f E ,,../Ur,.,..: HD 

I ~al Sooy~ ,-1•. 
pr:)--Olx .,..rq 

•rl~5 Nll 
Q<. l.a'□ ~□ 

~ CH S,md 
1 ~J;i~et i!ct 

Spc •Dl ~ +PJ 
2 f-r 1es ~ 
1 fr ies _G 
1 fr-t Cup 

7, ~F'1 S~J.Jte 
? BBC: 
1 i, .~Shk croc 

Ifs· rt l rke to <J I ~er ;,ou ~ I r2e, 
Cr1ck - ffl-~ cr, i cker- s.i , .,,r.·r 

{Orig1na or Splcy) 
as I hal"IK you fo r 

CIJIIIP1et1l"tll cor SU"VE.Y 
w1th1n 2 daYs of your Vi~;t , 

M ,avcfavis1t .com 

1,79 
15,';:6 
3.99 
4.89 
3.93 
2..39 
3. 29 
0 .crJ 
;i ,r,t, 
'.1. 65 

Ser1al NUii: 2370308-0378S·l04fi-05U7· U 

At tre er.d of tne survey, your emaii 
w'll be required in order for us 
o send yDur free SdnrMkh o fer , 

, otal : 
TIX! 
otal: 
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-~=~ Hl!'lp,., 

SAP Concur KJ &- •• kmg .. Cal■ , K.ni:::. .. ._,. 

f- I -. Personal Car M-leage $ 104_ 16 
05 · 51202.1 

Deta,;ls 

t."ileage Calculator P<llocationa-

Pe:"So s Car J. 'leage 

2001 Meroar Rd, Lex gton, KY 

4-051 1. SA A· 

0 

(CKY= I ) CKY 2021 Rate C .. 

Rate Case ( 'Oil.~) 

View R~ort :imerne 

Dist;,ic~ 

HiiHh·:IIM 

290 W Nat o wid'E! Blvd, 
Columbus, D 432 15, US 

Ch.!"Jl."11.DcpanrmM 

CKY Presi<1ent (0326100) 

lintaunL 

04. 16 

T~P.21:lloo Dalt:-

05/0512021 

Cash 

8JSlftl!SsUn1 

(00032) ColJmoia Gas o' Kent... 

1&1'!1\ 

Year 2021 (Y2J2I) 

WW.SBJ~iMsslJnrl 

(00032) C<>I mbia,Gas o' Kenl.. 

Cuneney 

US, D 

FF+E1 

CKY Rate Case Page Turn 

D4.1o 

Aax:ilstl 0 
(18<235440) NC '<eg.A:set Rat.. 

B.ll.ir,g Paci 

WMSJubOtde--

R~mbur2nnin! Ratr:s 

US00.5i!,PC"'"'tffi~ 

0 
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➔ Personal Car M"leage $104. 16 
5' - 2021 

De.ra1s lte.mizat ons 

9 1.t'ile1:1ge- C3lcLlator @ Allocatioes 

201}1 Meroer Rd, l ex;ngtor. , KY 

4-0511 USA / 

IA'ark~, 

(CKYa2021 ) CKY 2J2 I Rate C ... 

Rate Case (l'lDRC) 

Vie rN Rc;pc•rt 7 me l,ne 

JosephAC! Cf;iwfont061'0.f.?02l 

To laca'JOr 

2QO w NabonWic!',e BfJd , 
Col mbus. -0 432 15. US 

CKY Preside t (On,HOO) 

C.i.-11511..,1 w~n:- nol .1v&l:!ble 1a-lr11~ date lr, lhe ~,m!;'.ah Ky -arm. 

186 104.16 

EHBPH:+& 

-+p .. ,:+, 

* Rcqwrc-d liekl 

05/1 7.'2021 CKY Rate. Case Page um 

C3sh 104. 16 

0 0 
(00032) Columbfa Gas of l<,,rt"L.. [182~5440) NC Reg Asset RaL .. 

S:Jling?od 

Year 2021 (Y2021 I 

0 W~SJobOrdr!"" 

(OOD32) Columbia Ga.; o' Keni. .. 

US. D ar 

R~mOOrr..mu::,,il +L:it.e:i 

Us.:J 0.56 pl!'" ,uilc. 

0 
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Help., 

SAP Concur Kj .,._ ·• Ai:tirig ■c;Col ■, tiirrn. .. .... 

E- I Personal C,r Mileage $105.28 
05,07 2021 

0 -2raJs ltemi=a.t a n-s l 
.2. P.(1le3g1: Calcul2tor 

E.r;,eri!.t:- Type 

Pefs-0ns Car Mile3g-e 

~ OW Na~onwic!e Blvc, 
Colwnbus O"H 432 15, U 

Weir._ Order 

0. Atloc,tior, 

200 Me, cec· Rd . Lexir,gion. KY 
40511 , USA /,, 

0 

(CK\'02021) CKY 2D21 Rale C ... CKY ?resicterl {ll326100) 

Co-., ObJoc'. 

Rate Cas~ (N-ORCj 

~lt'f1l 

View Report I mel ne 

JQRPhre Crn•Jlj:Jrd (lfJ10•202'1 

Carr~I was l,jf":.t'rnj;ibj'l,'I ~ tt'l:I lime'" u~ !ll'lt 

k'nuunt 

S8 

T~~...ictim.Dalr 

05,'07/2021 

Cash 

R.r..ine:~s Jn,4 

(00032) Columbia Ga.s cl K<>nl.. 

Year 2021 (Y2021J 

(00032) Col m'bia: Gas oi Kent... 

CU"tency 

US Dalla: 

E@L::H 

:11 Required field 

105,2$" 

0 
( 1 $235440) NC Reg Ass.et Rac .. 

8Jli~Po.J 

0 

Re:1111YJ~eaunl fl:11.e!: 

USO !l.56 ocr -,.ile: 
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Hetp• 

SAP Concur 1£] - t• 
A.Gti~ as Col ■ , IGnva • .,. .. 

.... Personal Car Mileage t 105.28 
O~-' 19/ 2021 

De: ' s lc~miza.fon~ 

~ 1leage. Calcc.la!or @ Allocafrons 

Pe-rs.ona Car t.'-lleage 

D l..Dt;).JIOn 

2~1) W Naftor,wide Blvd, 2:10 Merca Rd. Lexin,;itcn. KY 
Columbus o 432 5 , us __ /; 40511 . USA /;. 

WorkCk'cclr 

(CKY02021 ) CKY 2021 Rat;, C .. CKY Preside I (032-31001 

=ObJOCl 

Rate C ase (N JRC) 

COIM11Yll 

View Report Imel ne 

Jmep/ure C-aw!>::irc 06' · IJ.'2021 

C:i· n:""l.:!11 W~;.in.:l'l~ofei t!'.Jrhg ~ lirre tr- l}til!; .11,e-

knot..nl 

188 10528, 

H·HHH:IIM 

0511812021 

0 
(0()032) Col m"'" Gas oi Ken!... 

lv:\"'11 

Year2021 (Y202 1) 

0 
(00032) C<lkimoia Gas o · Kenl.. 

US. DIJ(,~a:r 

CKY Rate C-ase Pa.ge T um 

lwfl"3VL-'dAtTlOUI'! 

t J5.2S 

l,a,nrl 

(18235440) NC RegAsset RaL 

WPAS Jab Order 

Reirnb.iri:a:menl Ra~~ 

USO 0.:56.pe-,nl~ 

0 

0 



Hyatt Regency Columbus
350 North High Street
Columbus, OH 43215
Tel: 16144631234
Fax: 16142803034
columbusregency.hyatt.com

  INVOICE

Kimra Cole
1841 Fielden Dr
Lexington KY 40502
United States

Room No. 0541
Arrival 05-17-21
Departure 05-19-21

Confirmation No. 2314089401 Folio Window 1
Group Name Folio No 1020164
Booking No 1770543350
Date Description Charges Credits

05-17-21 Accommodation 129.00
05-17-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 12.90
05-17-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 9.68
05-18-21 Accommodation 129.00
05-18-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 12.90
05-18-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 9.68
05-19-21 Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX  XX/XX 303.16

Total 303.16 303.16

Balance 0.00
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HYATT 
REGENCY" 

-



Hyatt Regency Columbus
350 North High Street
Columbus, OH 43215
Tel: 16144631234
Fax: 16142803034
columbusregency.hyatt.com

  INVOICE

Kimra Cole
1841 Fielden Dr
Lexington KY 40502
United States

Room No. 0537
Arrival 05-05-21
Departure 05-07-21

Confirmation No. 5551298101 Folio Window 1
Group Name Folio No 1018356
Booking No 4JWF5I
Date Description Charges Credits

05-05-21 Accommodation 145.00
05-05-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 14.50
05-05-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 10.88
05-06-21 Accommodation 145.00
05-06-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 14.50
05-06-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 10.88
05-07-21 Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX  XX/XX 340.76

Total 340.76 340.76

Balance 0.00

KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
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HYATT 
REGENCY" 

-



Fwd: Lunch today - BostonsKimra Cole to: Josephine Crawford 05/18/2021 02:20 PM 
From: Kimra Cole/NCS/Enterprise
To: Josephine Crawford/NCS/Enterprise@NISOURCE
The attendance list for lunch today. Delivery from Boston’s. 

Kimra H. Cole 
President and COO, Columbia Gas of KY

Begin forwarded message:

From: Joseph Clark <JosephClark@nisource.com>
Date: May 18, 2021 at 9:04:10 AM EDT
To: John Ryan <JohnRyan@nisource.com>, John Siegle <jsiegle@nisource.com>, Jeffery Gore 
<JefferyGore@nisource.com>, Alexis Meyers <AMeyers@nisource.com>, Chun Yi Lai 
<clai@nisource.com>, Allyson@gosssamfordlaw.com, Judy Cooper <jmcoop@nisource.com>, 
Kimra Cole <kimracole@nisource.com>, Linda Rumpke <LRumpke@nisource.com>, Linda Black 
<LindaBlack@nisource.com>
Subject: Lunch today - Bostons

Gang,

Please send me your lunch order and I will get lunch ordered. Here is the link to the menu 
- https://www.bostons.com/menu/index.html

Please have your order to me by 10:30. Thanks, Joe

Joe Clark | Assistant General Counsel
NiSource Corporate Services Company
290 W. Nationwide Blvd. | Columbus, Ohio 43215

josephclark@nisource.com | 614-460-6988 (Office) | 614-460-8403 (Fax)

KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
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■ 111 Verizon ? :~ 6:00 PM 

Done 24 of 30 

0 0 2 
SFr er. c,umvour c e1.: I 
05/16/~ 11 3!>, r. tnp f. !JOO Tetm: 

12 
BLVD 

AR T PE 
VlSA 

me::~ 
T SAl r _ON AfiP JVED 

TH 7A 10N # : 021 96 
: 12!1!3 

VISA: XX,\' X . XXX>-
Ap rovc:.1 Code: 021496 
E TRY: CH1P 
TC: ODt 306:mo4F3B35E 
TVR: 0080U08000 
AID: AOOO( 000031 010 
TS!: EE:00 
ATC: 0065 
APP: VlSA CREDIT 
CVM: Sig,w:ureRefo rence: 0518 10000002 
TRANS TYPf:: Cred1t Cai d SAU: 

CH ECf(: ·14 - _7, 

TIP: k't Ou 
-

TOT,).L : I(,~ --11 
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6:02 PM 

Done 23 of 30 

Sunny S reet Cafe Arena Dist r1ct 
277 I•. Natiorn-Jid• Blvd . Colum)us. 01-14321 5 

hl 2 'l 3006 

Avocado Toast 
Hashbrowns 

Open food 
Baja Omeiett 

HashbroM1s 
No Toast 

Iced rea 

rota1 Item Count: 

Subtotal: 
Total Tax: 

fotal: 

VISA 530 
T1p; 
Total Paid: 

Cat r n 
or d 

d unt n 

0 d 1 # 2406~41 
Station# PO, 

Eat In Ode r 
s a Count =2 

erver: Steven S 
Table: Pat1o 85 

Date: 5/18/21, 7:37 AM 

$10 .89 
-i$0.00 
$0.99 

$1 1. 29 
+$0.00 
+ 0.00 

$2 .99 

4 

28. 12 
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... Verizon 

Done 

5:51 PM 

28 of 30, 

~e• I-cf,,._~ 
:~.'! S.ird 1 

rr,:~,uee 
r Jt Urt'F 'fl 

l't11 I ~~i.~':iln-PJ 
S:.;e,r.1 , •PJ 
- t,lq~':"l t!1.i.n 
t If l;11ri ~- -• <'-11 
- lii c\: I~ 
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U,1s-,4t -~ LJ 

1t:a · CF~:.on 
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~~.- -~~L $m l 
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., tt?,;.1- .,~,, 
C:-.!j t:'itlj 
· rte. ~) 

lX><a 1J 
,e.i 1- 'IJaa ,=t 

t.\8:Bt ~L:t 
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l.l-&c lea lfl 
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G~L t.u.J m 
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l l'Qll 

r(1kS'rk Crc,:, 

Si..li , totf •: 
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Tor.e 1: 

rtus; 

lQ ,'nJ 

1.n 
p) 

O.':l;i 
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1.-:¥.1 
I . 73 
; , HO 

1. 7J 
c,.u: 
2.19 
5.1~ 

l. I':) 
~. 4[ 

\.1"£1 
~ ~ ·~o 

1.7<; 
1S.~c-
4.59 
5.13 
]. Q9 

~.:f., 
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3.15 
~ ~(f.l 
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O.l-0 
e.oo 
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ti) . O:l 
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Trari s.~ ti:: 21:i~lf!.i'1 

Char!);) 
\' ii;;~, 
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~ds~ier ; Lll'J3n 
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Please jv 1r1 us fa , bre3kfas~l 
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Can! l Y'!le 
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5:57 PM 

< 
Kimra 

Total 145.08 

Ou 

yau for 11\a\ \ng 
Taste Hospl al1ty Gr~ Rest 

& tharts for read1ng ht 

008: O'ii/18/2021 
Cl,/ 18/202 \ 

4/400\0 

LE 

VISA 
card IMMMM,XX -

gne tc card present: Yes 
card Entry Method: S 

Amount: 

3145742 

$\4':>.08 

I agree to pay the above 
total amount according to the 

card iss r agree ent. 

Dinner with Allison, 
Linda and Judy. 



KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Staff 1-12, August Update 

Attachment K
Page 34 of 43

■ 111 Veri zon ~ ; ,, 6:13 PM 

Done 16 of 30 

L ..,~R. oJ11n 
CM 

LU.'i t=ll,'{;11 ii.'// 
..;r.{;;; .. :, e 11'1'/.•5 1 

1\ U:SL1N 
lHAJ C~E WA, 

Ju[lY 
[CE~ Tc.It 
tiA~rl c~:~•i •~11 1iu, u/ra·1rl 
s.::;o~ , J; 1r peo::: i 

D4V( 
BBO CHj(:~1 i , .'i'n 

CHLO 
1<1A.fh1'/ EP! (1\ IL TOR 

DAnin,Lj 
PEPPfRli H sm , G/1,J I I I J._ 
.s ~cdU,,agu s-yni '-' µr,er., 
, Tr 

10~ 
o. IJ 
.uo 

12 .fl 
D , 
9. !J9 
o.uo 
a .OD 
8.99 
o Oil 

1() b9 
2 Sl:l 
0.00 
9.99 
0.00 
2,99 

l .39 
2 99 
0, (11) 

13 59 
0. ,l 

11 __ g 
L • I 
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■ 111 Veri zon ~ :~ 

Done 

6:14 PM 

15 of 30 

I • 
f I 111: \ 

-06(11 ()1)00 
ef .renct:: UJ 

1 e It ar d SALE' 

Cl-tE 

TIP: 

TO AL. 

198 46 

M . ,~ 
- ;;l)9 Ji 
-- -----
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Removed from Rate Case Expense

Judy Cooper 

6{14/202HUlO 5/17/2021 0 .00 461489 267192 Meals EliAAer Self OF1l1 Tra,el StahJs 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/18/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Tolls/ Road Charges/ Parking 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/19/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Tolls/ Road Charges/ Parking 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/17/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Tolls/ Road Charges / Parking 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/21/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Rental Car Fuel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/20/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Rental Car Fuel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/7/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Rental Car Fuel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/8/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Car Rental 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/17/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Hotel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/18/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Hotel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/19/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Hotel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/5/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Hotel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/6/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Hotel 

6/14/2021 0:00 5/21/2021 0:00 461489 267192 Car Rental ___________ _ 

30.26 Cooper, Jtia 1 

31 Cooper, Judy 

31 Cooper, Judy 

31 Cooper, Judy 

39.24 Cooper, Judy 

40.24 Cooper, Judy 

49.52 Cooper, Judy 

125.61 Cooper, Judy 

158.63 Cooper, Judy 

158.63 Cooper, Judy 

158.63 Cooper, Judy 

170.38 Cooper, Judy 

170.38 Cooper, Judy 

___ 196.9 Cooper, Judy 

Gl IAeltiaea Ofl 1-totel hill. PJo separate reeeipt 

02 

03 

04 

05 Missing Receipt Affidavit - "gas pump failed to print receipt" 

06 

07 Missing Receipt Affidavit - "gas pump fa iled to print receipt" 

08 

09 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 



Hilton Columbus Downtown

401 North High Street

Columbus, OH  43215     

United States of America

TELEPHONE 614-384-8600    • FAX 614-484-5219   

Reservations

www.hilton.com or 1 800 HILTONS

COOPER, JUDY  Room No: 303/K1      

 Arrival Date: 5/17/2021  11:25:00 AM 

Departure Date: 5/20/2021 8:11:00 AM 

Adult/Child: 1/0

     Cashier ID: CHWI

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA Room Rate: 135.00

AL:  

 HH # 429649458 DIAMOND

VAT #

 Folio No/Che 860494 A

  

Confirmation Number: 3156470312

Hilton Columbus Downtown 5/20/2021 8:10:00 AM

DATE DESCRIPTION ID REF NO CHARGES CREDIT BALANCE

5/17/2021 GALLERIE BAR LINTR 3194180 $30.26

5/17/2021 SELF PARKING HESP 3194216 $31.00

5/17/2021 GUEST ROOM HESP 3194217 $135.00

5/17/2021 RM - SALES TAX HESP 3194217 $10.13

5/17/2021 RM - OCCUPANCY TAX HESP 3194217 $13.50

5/18/2021 SELF PARKING HESP 3194480 $31.00

5/18/2021 GUEST ROOM HESP 3194481 $135.00

5/18/2021 RM - SALES TAX HESP 3194481 $10.13

5/18/2021 RM - OCCUPANCY TAX HESP 3194481 $13.50

5/19/2021 SELF PARKING SADERS 3194938 $31.00

5/19/2021 GUEST ROOM SADERS 3194939 $135.00

5/19/2021 RM - SALES TAX SADERS 3194939 $10.13

5/19/2021 RM - OCCUPANCY TAX SADERS 3194939 $13.50

5/20/2021 VS *7162 CHWI 3195120 ($599.15)

**BALANCE**     $0.00 

  

EXPENSE REPORT 
SUMMARY

5/17/2021 5/18/2021 5/19/2021 STAY TOTAL

ROOM AND TAX $158.63 $158.63 $158.63 $475.89

FOOD AND 
BEVERAGE

$30.26 $0.00 $0.00 $30.26

MISCELLANEOUS $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $93.00

DAILY TOTAL $219.89 $189.63 $189.63 $599.15

Hilton Honors(R) stays are posted within 72 hours of checkout. To check your earnings or book your next stay at more than 5,700 hotels and 
resorts in 113 countries, please visit Honors.com

Thank you for choosing Hilton. You'll get more when you book directly with us - more destinations, more points, and more value. Book your next 
stay at hilton.com.

CREDIT CARD DETAIL

APPR CODE 098296      MERCHANT ID 50035-6170          

CARD NUMBER VS EXP DATE 07/21

TRANSACTION ID 3195120 TRANS TYPE Sale

Page:1

XXXXXXXXX,
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Removed from Rate Case Expense

-

'® 
Hilton 

HOTELS & RESORTS 



Missing Receipt Affidavit - Rental Car Fuel

Date of Expense: 05/21/2021
Vendor: SPEEDWAY 09332 LEXINGTON

Amount: $39.24
City: Lexington, Kentucky

Business Reason: 2021-00183 Rate Case

I acknowledge that this expense report contains legitimate corporate expenses incurred by me on behalf
of NiSource's benefit, and are allowable expenses as defined by NiSource’s Travel Policy. I further certify
that the receipt applicable to this expense is no longer available.

Judy Cooper
06/14/2021
9:39 PM Greenwich Mean Time
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r _________ 1 SPEEDI-JAY 0007
611 ~ Octa OH 43128 

TRAN u 4918024 
!---------75/20/2021 5 54 PM 

L -------7Pump 08 

Regular Unleaded L--------7 14 124 ~ s2 849/GAL 
GAS TOTAL S40 24 t-_ ______ lTAX 

~ --------1TOTAL s0 00 
$40 ,1 

' ----------i;,lsa 
1- ard Num · 

xxxxxxxxxx-­L --------"lERM. 00s00~ 

L ________ 
1 

RANS TYPE: CAPTURE 

PR;:: 057827 
NTRY METHOD: Chip ~------lard 

L-------,lSA CREDIT 
ID : A0000000031010 

S/2e/2021 17 : 51 : 19 

PIN Bypassed 

rdholder agrees to L------~y to issuer total 
arges per the L---------rgreement between 
rdholder & issuer 

1------- l eedy Rewards 
ints Earned · 141 ~--""""'=~~-=~·r;w Balance: 78819 

r"" speedway .com 



Missing Receipt Affidavit - Rental Car Fuel

Date of Expense: 05/07/2021
Vendor: SPEEDWAY 09728 LEXINGTON

Amount: $49.52
City: Lexington, Kentucky

Business Reason: 2021-00183 Rate Case

I acknowledge that this expense report contains legitimate corporate expenses incurred by me on behalf
of NiSource's benefit, and are allowable expenses as defined by NiSource’s Travel Policy. I further certify
that the receipt applicable to this expense is no longer available.

Judy Cooper
06/14/2021
9:39 PM Greenwich Mean Time
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6/10/2021 Enterprise Plus Login | Enterprise Rent-A-Car

https://www.enterprise.com/en/account.html#reservation 1/2
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Hyatt Regency Columbus
350 North High Street
Columbus, OH 43215
Tel: 16144631234
Fax: 16142803034
columbusregency.hyatt.com

  INVOICE

Judy Cooper
2001 Mercer Rd
Lexington KY 40511
United States

Room No. 1535
Arrival 05-05-21
Departure 05-07-21

Confirmation No. 6082808901 Folio Window 1
Group Name Folio No 1018368
Booking No 4KAKL6
Date Description Charges Credits

05-05-21 Accommodation 145.00
05-05-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 14.50
05-05-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 10.88
05-06-21 - Perks Breakfast Food CHECK# 605556 14.10
05-06-21 - Perks Dinner Beverage CHECK# 605594 44.63
05-06-21 Accommodation 145.00
05-06-21 City Occupancy Tax 10% 14.50
05-06-21 Room State Tax 7.5% 10.88
05-06-21 Self Parking - Chestnut 20.00
05-07-21 Visa XXXXXXXXXXXX  XX/XX 419.49

Total 419.49 419.49

Balance 0.00
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KY PSC Case No. 2021-00183 
Response to the Attorney General’s Data Request Set Two No. 79 August Update 

 Respondent: Jeffery Gore 
 

COLUMBIA GAS OF KENTUCKY, INC. 
RESPONSE TO ATTORNEY GENERAL’S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION 

DATED AUGUST 11, 2021 
 

79. Refer to Columbia Kentucky’s response to the Attorney General’s First Request, Item 

63. 

Provide updated general ledger information as was provided in Item 63 as new monthly 

data becomes available. Provide this information through the remainder of the 

proceeding.  

 Response:  

Refer to KY PSC Case No 2021-00183, AG 2-79 August Update, Attachment B for the 

general ledger information for August 2021. 



ATTACHMENTS 
ARE EXCEL 

SPREADSHEETS 
AND UPLOADED 

SEPARATELY 



Columbia Gas of Kentucky, Inc. 
CASE NO. 2021-00183 

Forecasted Test Period Filing Requirements 
807 KAR 5:001 Section 16-(7)(o) 

 
 
 

Description of Filing Requirement: 
 

Complete monthly budget variance reports, with narrative explanations, 
for the twelve (12) months immediately prior to the base period, each 
month of the base period, and any subsequent months, as they become 
available; 

 
Supplemental Response: 
 

Please refer to the attached which includes monthly budget variance 
reports for April 2021 through August 2021. 

 
Response: 
 

Please refer to the attached which includes monthly budget variance 
reports for September 2019 through March 2021.  Any subsequent 
months will be provided as they become available. 

 
 
Responsible Witness: 
 
 Chun-Yi Lai 
  
  
  



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - April 2021

NET OPERATING EARNINGS ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN

Net Revenue 6.9$                      7.0$                  (0.2)$            43.1$             42.6$              0.5$                       
O&M Expense (3.9)                       (4.9)                  1.0               (14.8)              (19.3)              4.5                         1

Depreciation (1.4)                       (1.4)                  -                 (5.3)                (5.4)                -                           
Other Taxes (0.4)                       (0.7)                  0.3               (2.2)                (2.6)                0.4                         
Loss (Gain) on Sale or Impairment Assets  -   -   -  -                    -  -                           

Operating Earnings 1.3$                      0.1$                  1.1$             20.7$             15.3$              5.4$                       

O&M ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
Field Operations (1.2)$                     (1.6)$                 0.4$             (5.2)$              (5.7)$              0.5$                       1A

Presidents -                        (0.3)                  0.2               (0.9)                (1.1)                0.2                         1B

Utilities Operations Support (0.2)                       (0.2)                  -                 (0.6)                (0.7)                0.1                         
Environmental, Sustainability and Gov Affairs  -   -   -   -   -   -  
Regulatory & Utility Planning  -   -   -   -   -   -  
Utility Transformation -                        (0.1)                  -                 (0.2)                (0.3)                0.1                         
O&M - Other Direct & Indirects (2.4)                       (2.8)                  0.4               (8.0)                (11.6)              3.6                         1C

O&M Expense (3.9)$                     (4.9)$                 1.0$             (14.8)$            (19.3)$            4.5$                       

CAPITAL ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
CKY 5.8$                      5.1$                  0.7$             17.1$             16.1$              1.0$                       2

YTD Variance Highlights:

1.  O&M Expense $4.5M
     A. Field Operations: $0.5M: Leak Repair and Locating $0.3M, Regulation Inspections $0.2, Meter Work $0.2M (T); 
         offset by Tools and Calibrations ($0.1M) and Training ($0.1M)
     B. Presidents $0.2M: Labor and employee expenses $0.2M (T)
     C. O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $3.6M: Please see next page

2.  Capital: Variance primarily driven by Age & Condition and public improvement projects



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - April 2021

O&M - Other Direct & Indirects ($M) MTD 
ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 

TO PLAN
YTD 

ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 
TO PLAN

x O&M - Other Direct & Indirects
Other Direct Expenses

Utility Support Functions 0.2$                0.4$                0.2$                0.9$                1.5$                0.7$                1

Finance 0.8                  0.6                  (0.2)$               2.8                  2.8                  (0.0)$               
General Counsel 0.1                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.2                  0.2                  0.0$                
Cust Ex, Comm, and HR 0.4                  0.6                  0.3$                0.4                  2.8                  2.3$                2

Office of Strategy & Risk 0.2                  0.2                  0.0$                0.9                  1.0                  0.1$                
Safety Services 0.1                  0.1                  0.0$                0.2                  0.3                  0.1$                
Executive 0.0                  0.0                  0.0$                0.0                  0.0                  0.0$                
Other G&A (0.5)                 (0.2)                 0.3$                (0.7)                 (0.8)                 (0.0)$               

Total Other Direct Expenses 1.3$                1.9$                0.6$                4.7$                7.8$                3.2$                

Indirect Expenses
Corporate Incentive Program 0.1$                0.2$                0.0$                0.5$                0.7$                0.2$                3

Stock Compensation 0.1                  0.1                  0.0$                0.2                  0.3                  0.1$                
Employee Benefits 0.7                  0.5                  (0.2)$               2.1                  2.1                  0.0$                
External Services Indirect 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$               
Rents & Leases Indirect -                  -                  -$                -                  -                  -$                
Other O&M Expenses Indirect -                  (0.0)                 (0.0)$               -                  (0.1)                 (0.1)$               

Total Indirect Expenses 1.0$                0.8$                (0.2)$               2.8$                3.1$                0.3$                
Non O&M NCS Items 0.2$                0.2$                0.0$                0.6$                0.7$                0.1$                
Total O&M - Other Direct & Indirects 2.4$                2.8$                0.4$                8.0$                11.6$              3.6$                

YTD Variance Highlights:

2C.  O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $3.6M

     1.  Utility Support Functions $0.7M: Favorability due to timing in labor and safety plan
     2.  Cust Ex, Comm, and HR $2.3M: Primarily driven by favorability related to uncollectible expense estimated for COVID-19 impact $2.1M
     3.  Corporate Incentive Program $0.2M: Primarily driven by true-up for 2020 from a lower payout than accrued



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - May 2021

NET OPERATING EARNINGS ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN

Net Revenue 6.0$                      6.0$                  (0.1)$            49.1$              48.6$              0.4$                       
O&M Expense (4.0)                       (4.8)                   0.8               (18.8)              (24.1)               5.3                         1

Depreciation (1.4)                       (1.4)                   -                 (6.7)                (6.7)                 -                           
Other Taxes (0.6)                       (0.7)                   0.1               (2.8)                (3.3)                 0.5                         
Loss (Gain) on Sale or Impairment Assets  -   -   -  -                    -  -                           

Operating Earnings -$                      (0.7)$                 0.8$             20.7$              14.5$              6.2$                       

O&M ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
Field Operations (1.2)$                     (1.7)$                 0.5$             (6.3)$              (7.4)$               1.1$                       1A

Presidents (0.2)                       (0.2)                   0.1               (1.0)                (1.3)                 0.3                         1B

Utilities Operations Support (0.2)                       (0.2)                   0.0               (0.8)                (0.9)                 0.1                         
Environmental, Sustainability and Gov Affairs -                          -                      -                 -                   -                    -                           
Regulatory & Utility Planning -                          -                      -                 -                   -                    -                           
Utility Transformation (0.0)                       (0.1)                   0.0               (0.2)                (0.3)                 0.1                         
O&M - Other Direct & Indirects (2.4)                       (2.6)                   0.2               (10.5)              (14.2)               3.7                         1C

O&M Expense (4.0)$                     (4.8)$                 0.8$             (18.8)$            (24.1)$             5.3$                       

CAPITAL ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
CKY 6.7$                      6.2$                  0.5$             23.8$              22.3$              1.6$                       2

Variance Highlights:

1.  O&M Expense
     A. Field Operations
         MTD $0.5M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.1M, Locating $0.2M, Meter Work $0.1M , Curb Box Inspections $0.1M, Corrosion Remediation $0.1M
         YTD $1.1M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.2M, Locating $0.3M, Regulation Inspections $0.2, Meter Work $0.2M, Service and Collections $0.2M
     B. Presidents
         YTD $0.3M: Labor $0.3
     C. O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $3.7M: Please see next page

2.  Capital: Primarily driven by Age & Condition and public improvement projects



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - May 2021

O&M - Other Direct & Indirects ($M) MTD 
ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 

TO PLAN
YTD 

ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 
TO PLAN

x O&M - Other Direct & Indirects
Other Direct Expenses

Utility Support Functions 0.3$                0.4$                0.1$                1.2$                1.9$                0.7$                       1

Finance 0.7                  0.6                  (0.1)$               3.6                  3.4                  (0.1)$                      
General Counsel 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.2                  0.2                  0.0$                       
Cust Ex, Comm, and HR 0.3                  0.5                  0.2$                0.7                  3.3                  2.6$                       2

Office of Strategy & Risk 0.2                  0.2                  0.0$                1.1                  1.2                  0.2$                       
Safety Services 0.1                  0.1                  0.0$                0.3                  0.4                  0.1$                       
Executive 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.0                  0.0                  0.0$                       
Other G&A 0.8                  (0.0)                 (0.8)$               0.0                  (0.8)                 (0.8)$                      

Total Other Direct Expenses 2.4$                1.9$                (0.5)$               7.1$                9.7$                2.6$                       

Indirect Expenses
Corporate Incentive Program 0.1$                0.2$                0.0$                0.6$                0.9$                0.2$                       3

Stock Compensation 0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$               0.3                  0.4                  0.1$                       
Employee Benefits (0.4)                 0.3                  0.7$                1.7                  2.4                  0.7$                       4

External Services Indirect 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$                      
Rents & Leases Indirect -                  -                  -$                -                  -                  -$                       
Other O&M Expenses Indirect 0.0                  (0.0)                 (0.0)$               0.0                  (0.1)                 (0.1)$                      

Total Indirect Expenses (0.2)$               0.5$                0.7$                2.6$                3.6$                1.0$                       
Non O&M NCS Items 0.2$                0.2$                0.0$                0.7$                0.9$                0.1$                       
Total O&M - Other Direct & Indirects 2.4$                2.6$                0.2$                10.5$              14.2$              3.7$                       

YTD Variance Highlights:

2C.  O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $3.7M

     1.  Utility Support Functions $0.7M: Favorability due to timing in labor and safety plan
     2.  Cust Ex, Comm, and HR $2.6M: Primarily driven by favorability related to uncollectible expense estimated for COVID-19 impact $2.3M
     3.  Corporate Incentive Program $0.2M: Primarily driven by true-up for 2020 from a lower payout than accrued
     4.  Employee Benefits $0.7M: Postponed medical care due to COVID-19 and lower rates of sickness due to COVID-19 protocols



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - June 2021

NET OPERATING EARNINGS ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN

Net Revenue 5.3$                      5.4$                  (0.2)$            54.3$              54.1$              0.3$                       
O&M Expense (4.3)                       (4.7)                   0.4               (23.1)              (28.8)               5.7                         1

Depreciation (1.4)                       (1.4)                   (0.0)              (8.1)                (8.1)                 0.0                         
Other Taxes (0.6)                       (0.7)                   0.0               (3.4)                (4.0)                 0.5                         2

Loss (Gain) on Sale or Impairment Assets -                          -                      -                 (0.0)                -                    (0.0)                        
Operating Earnings (1.1)$                     (1.3)$                 0.3$             19.7$              13.2$              6.5$                       

O&M ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
Field Operations (1.3)$                     (1.7)$                 0.4$             (7.6)$              (9.1)$               1.5$                       1A

Presidents (0.2)                       (0.2)                   0.1               (1.2)                (1.5)                 0.3                         1B

Utilities Operations Support (0.2)                       (0.1)                   (0.1)              (1.0)                (1.0)                 0.0                         
Environmental, Sustainability and Gov Affairs -                          -                      -                 -                   -                    -                           
Regulatory & Utility Planning -                          -                      -                 -                   -                    -                           
Utility Transformation (0.0)                       (0.1)                   0.0               (0.3)                (0.4)                 0.1                         
O&M - Other Direct & Indirects (2.6)                       (2.6)                   (0.0)              (13.1)              (16.8)               3.7                         1C

O&M Expense (4.3)$                     (4.7)$                 0.4$             (23.1)$            (28.8)$             5.7$                       

CAPITAL ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
CKY 5.5$                      7.3$                  (1.8)$            30.9$              31.6$              (0.7)$                      

Variance Highlights:

1.  O&M Expense
     A. Field Operations
         MTD $0.4M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.1M, Locating $0.1M, Curb Box Inspections $0.1M, Regulator Parts timing $0.1M
         YTD $1.5M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.3M, Locating $0.4M, Regulation Inspections $0.3, Meter Work $0.3M
     B. Presidents
         YTD $0.3M: Labor $0.3
     C. O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $3.7M: Please see next page



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - June 2021

O&M - Other Direct & Indirects ($M) MTD 
ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 

TO PLAN
YTD 

ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 
TO PLAN

x O&M - Other Direct & Indirects
Other Direct Expenses

Utility Support Functions 0.3$                0.4$                0.1$                1.5$                2.3$                0.8$                       1

Finance 0.7                  0.6                  (0.1)$               4.3                  4.1                  (0.2)$                      
General Counsel 0.0                  0.1                  0.0$                0.3                  0.3                  0.0$                       
Cust Ex, Comm, and HR 0.6                  0.4                  (0.2)$               1.3                  3.7                  2.4$                       2

Office of Strategy & Risk 0.3                  0.2                  (0.1)$               1.4                  1.5                  0.1$                       
Safety Services 0.1                  0.1                  0.0$                0.3                  0.5                  0.2$                       
Executive 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.0                  0.0                  0.0$                       
Other G&A 0.0                  (0.1)                 (0.1)$               0.0                  (0.9)                 (0.9)$                      

Total Other Direct Expenses 2.0$                1.7$                (0.3)$               9.1$                11.5$              2.3$                       

Indirect Expenses
Corporate Incentive Program 0.1$                0.2$                0.0$                0.8$                1.0$                0.3$                       3

Stock Compensation 0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$               0.3                  0.4                  0.1$                       
Employee Benefits 0.2                  0.4                  0.2$                1.9                  2.9                  1.0$                       4

External Services Indirect 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$                      
Rents & Leases Indirect -                  -                  -$                -                  -                  -$                       
Other O&M Expenses Indirect -                  (0.0)                 (0.0)$               0.0                  (0.1)                 (0.1)$                      

Total Indirect Expenses 0.4$                0.7$                0.2$                3.1$                4.3$                1.2$                       
Non O&M NCS Items 0.1$                0.2$                0.1$                0.8$                1.0$                0.2$                       
Total O&M - Other Direct & Indirects 2.6$                2.6$                (0.0)$               13.1$              16.8$              3.7$                       

YTD Variance Highlights:

2C.  O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $3.7M

     1.  Utility Support Functions $0.8M: Favorability due to timing in labor and safety plan
     2.  Cust Ex, Comm, and HR $2.4M: Primarily driven by favorability related to uncollectible expense estimated for COVID-19 impact $2.1M
     3.  Corporate Incentive Program $0.3M: Primarily driven by true-up for 2020 from a lower payout than accrued
     4.  Employee Benefits $1M: Postponed medical care due to COVID-19 and lower rates of sickness due to COVID-19 protocols



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - July 2021

NET OPERATING EARNINGS ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN

Net Revenue 5.1$                      5.3$                 (0.3)$           59.4$             59.4$             (0.0)$                     
O&M Expense (3.6)                      (4.6)                  1.0               (26.7)              (33.4)              6.7                         1

Depreciation (1.4)                      (1.4)                  (0.0)             (9.5)                (9.5)                0.0                         
Other Taxes (0.6)                      (0.7)                  0.0               (4.1)                (4.6)                0.6                         2

Loss (Gain) on Sale or Impairment Assets -                         -                     -                (0.0)                -                   (0.0)                       
Operating Earnings (0.6)$                    (1.3)$                0.8$             19.1$             11.9$             7.2$                       

O&M ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
Field Operations (1.3)$                    (1.7)$                0.4$             (8.9)$              (10.7)$            1.8$                       1A

Presidents (0.2)                      (0.2)                  0.0               (1.4)                (1.7)                0.3                         1B

Utilities Operations Support (0.2)                      (0.2)                  (0.0)             (1.2)                (1.2)                (0.0)                       
Environmental, Sustainability and Gov Affairs -                         -                     -                -                   -                   -                          
Regulatory & Utility Planning -                         -                     -                -                   -                   -                          
Utility Transformation (0.1)                      (0.0)                  (0.1)             (0.4)                (0.4)                0.1                         
O&M - Other Direct & Indirects (1.8)                      (2.6)                  0.8               (14.9)              (19.3)              4.5                         1C

O&M Expense (3.6)$                    (4.6)$                1.0$             (26.7)$            (33.4)$            6.7$                       

CAPITAL ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 
TO PLAN YTD ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 

TO PLAN
CKY 7.1$                      6.9$                 0.2$             38.0$             38.4$             (0.4)$                     

Variance Highlights:

1.  O&M Expense
     A. Field Operations
        MTD $0.4M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.1M, Curb Box Inspections $0.1M, Regulator Parts timing $0.1M, Non-Work Plan $0.1M

     B. Presidents
         YTD $0.3M: Labor and expenses $0.3M
     C. O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $4.5M: Please see next page

YTD $1.8M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.4M, Locating $0.4M, Regulation Inspections $0.4, Meter Work $0.2M, Leakage Survey $0.1, 
Collections $0.1, Corrosion $0.1, Employee Expenses $0.1



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - July 2021

O&M - Other Direct & Indirects ($M) MTD 
ACTUAL MTD PLAN MTD VAR 

TO PLAN
YTD 

ACTUAL YTD PLAN YTD VAR 
TO PLAN

x O&M - Other Direct & Indirects
Other Direct Expenses

Utility Support Functions 0.3$                0.4$                0.1$                1.7$                2.7$                0.9$                       1

Finance 0.6                  0.7                  0.0$                4.9                  4.7                  (0.2)$                      
General Counsel 0.0                  0.0                  0.0$                0.3                  0.3                  0.1$                       
Cust Ex, Comm, and HR (0.2)                 0.5                  0.7$                1.1                  4.2                  3.1$                       2

Office of Strategy & Risk 0.2                  0.3                  0.0$                1.6                  1.7                  0.1$                       
Safety Services 0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$               0.4                  0.5                  0.2$                       
Executive 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$                      
Other G&A 0.1                  (0.1)                 (0.1)$               0.1                  (1.0)                 (1.1)$                      

Total Other Direct Expenses 1.0$                1.8$                0.8$                10.2$              13.3$              3.1$                       

Indirect Expenses
Corporate Incentive Program 0.1$                0.2$                0.0$                0.9$                1.2$                0.3$                       3

Stock Compensation 0.1                  0.1                  0.0$                0.4                  0.5                  0.1$                       
Employee Benefits 0.4                  0.4                  (0.0)$               2.3                  3.2                  0.9$                       4

External Services Indirect 0.0                  0.0                  (0.0)$               0.1                  0.1                  (0.0)$                      
Rents & Leases Indirect -                  -                  -$                -                  -                  -$                       
Other O&M Expenses Indirect -                  (0.0)                 (0.0)$               0.0                  (0.1)                 (0.1)$                      

Total Indirect Expenses 0.6$                0.6$                (0.0)$               3.7$                4.9$                1.2$                       
Non O&M NCS Items 0.2$                0.2$                0.0$                1.0$                1.2$                0.2$                       
Total O&M - Other Direct & Indirects 1.8$                2.6$                0.8$                14.9$              19.4$              4.5$                       

YTD Variance Highlights:

2C.  O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $4.5M

     2.  Cust Ex, Comm, and HR $3.1M: Primarily driven by favorability related to uncollectible expense estimated for COVID-19 impact
     3.  Corporate Incentive Program $0.3M: Primarily driven by true-up for 2020 from a lower payout than accrued
     4.  Employee Benefits $0.9M: Postponed medical care due to COVID-19 and lower rates of sickness due to COVID-19 protocols

     1.  Utility Support Functions $0.9M: Favorability driven by labor and safety plan



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - August 2021

NET OPERATING EARNINGS ($M) MTD ACTUAL MTD Plan MTD VAR 
TO Plan YTD ACTUAL YTD Plan YTD VAR 

TO Plan

Net Revenue 5.4$                      5.3$                 0.0$             64.7$             64.7$             (0.0)$                     
O&M Expense (1.8)$                    (2.2)$                0.3$             (13.6)$            (16.2)$            2.6$                       1

Depreciation (1.4)$                    (1.4)$                (0.0)$           (10.9)$            (10.9)$            (0.0)$                     
Other Taxes (0.6)$                    (0.7)$                0.0$             (4.7)$              (5.3)$              0.6$                       
Loss (Gain) on Sale or Impairment Assets -$                     -$                 -$            (0.0)$              -$               (0.0)$                     

Operating Earnings 1.5$                      1.1$                 0.4$             35.5$             32.3$             3.1$                       

O&M ($M)  MTD ACTUAL  MTD Plan  MTD VAR 
TO Plan  YTD ACTUAL  YTD Plan  YTD VAR 

TO Plan 
Field Operations (1.5)$                    (1.7)$                0.2$             (10.4)$            (12.5)$            2.1$                       1A

Presidents (0.2)$                    (0.2)$                0.1$             (1.6)$              (2.0)$              0.4$                       1B

Utilities Operations Support (0.2)$                    (0.1)$                (0.0)$           (1.3)$              (1.3)$              (0.0)$                     
Environmental, Sustainability and Gov Affairs -$                     -$                 -$            -$               -$               -$                      
Regulatory & Utility Budgetning -$                     -$                 -$            -$               -$               -$                      
Utility Transformation 0.0$                      (0.0)$                0.1$             (0.4)$              (0.5)$              0.1$                       

O&M Expense (1.8)$                    (2.2)$                0.3$             (13.6)$            (16.2)$            2.6$                       

CAPITAL ($M)  MTD ACTUAL  MTD Plan  MTD VAR 
TO Plan  YTD ACTUAL  YTD Plan  YTD VAR 

TO Plan 
CKY 7.5$                      6.6$                 1.0$             43.4$             42.2$             1.2$                       

NET OPERATING EARNINGS-REC TO CORP ($M)  MTD ACTUAL  MTD Plan  MTD VAR 
TO Plan  YTD ACTUAL  YTD Plan  YTD VAR TO Plan 

O&M EXPENSE (2.3)$                    (2.5)$                0.3$             (17.1)$            (21.9)$            4.7$                       1C

Operating Earnings (0.8)$                    (1.4)$                0.6$             18.4$             10.5$             7.9$                       

Variance Highlights:

1.  O&M Expense
     A. Field Operations
        MTD $0.2M: Primarily driven by Locates $0.2M

     B. Presidents
         YTD $0.4M: Labor and expenses $0.4M
     C. O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $4.7M: Please see next page

YTD $2.1M: Primarily driven by Leak Repair $0.4M, Locating $0.6M, Regulation Inspections $0.4, Meter Work $0.3M, Leakage Survey $0.1, 
Collections $0.1, Corrosion $0.1, Employee Expenses $0.1



Columbia Gas of Kentucky
Monthly Financial Results - August 2021

O&M - Other Direct & Indirects ($M) MTD 
ACTUAL MTD Plan MTD VAR 

TO Plan
YTD 

ACTUAL YTD Plan YTD VAR 
TO Plan

x O&M - Other Direct & Indirects
Other Direct Expenses

Utility Support Functions 0.3$                0.4$                0.1$                2.0$                3.0$                1.0$                       1

Finance 0.8$                0.6$                (0.2)$               5.7$                5.6$                (0.1)$                      
General Counsel 0.1$                0.0$                (0.0)$               0.3$                0.4$                0.0$                       
Cust Ex, Comm, and HR 0.2$                0.4$                0.2$                0.9$                4.2$                3.3$                       2

Office of Strategy & Risk 0.2$                0.3$                0.0$                1.8$                2.0$                0.2$                       
Safety Services 0.1$                0.1$                (0.0)$               0.4$                0.6$                0.2$                       
Executive 0.0$                0.0$                0.0$                0.0$                0.0$                0.0$                       
Other G&A (0.1)$               (0.0)$               0.1$                0.4$                (1.0)$               (1.4)$                      

Total Other Direct Expenses 1.6$                1.7$                0.1$                11.6$              14.8$              3.2$                       

Indirect Expenses
Corporate Incentive Program 0.1$                0.2$                0.0$                1.1$                1.4$                0.3$                       3

Stock Compensation 0.1$                0.1$                0.0$                0.5$                0.6$                0.1$                       
Employee Benefits 0.3$                0.4$                0.2$                2.5$                3.6$                1.1$                       4

External Services Indirect 0.0$                0.0$                (0.0)$               0.1$                0.1$                (0.0)$                      
Rents & Leases Indirect -$                -$                -$                -$                -$                -$                       
Other O&M Expenses Indirect -$                (0.0)$               (0.0)$               0.0$                (0.1)$               (0.1)$                      

Total Indirect Expenses 0.5$                0.7$                0.1$                4.2$                5.6$                1.3$                       
Non O&M NCS Items 0.2$                0.2$                0.0$                1.2$                1.4$                0.2$                       
Total O&M - Other Direct & Indirects 2.3$                2.5$                0.3$                17.0$              21.7$              4.7$                       

YTD Variance Highlights:

2C.  O&M - Other Direct & Indirects $4.7M

     2.  Cust Ex, Comm, and HR $3.3M: Primarily driven by favorability related to uncollectible expense estimated for COVID-19 impact
     3.  Corporate Incentive Program $0.3M: Primarily driven by true-up for 2020 from a lower payout than accrued
     4.  Employee Benefits $1.1M: Postponed medical care due to COVID-19 and lower rates of sickness due to COVID-19 protocols

     1.  Utility Support Functions $1M: Favorability driven by labor and safety Budget
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