CASE NO. 2021-00066

VERIFICATION

I verify, state and affirm that the responses to the Commission Staff's 2nd Request for Information filed with this verification and for which I am listed as a witness are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after a reasonable inquiry.

Steve Thompson Vice President Finance

STATE OF KENTUCKY

COUNTY OF: DAVIESS

The foregoing was signed, acknowledged and sworn to before me on this 7th day of June, 2021, by Steve Thompson

My commission expires 7-14-2021



Notary Public, KY. State at Large

(seal)

KENERGY CORP. RESPONSE TO THE COMMISSION STAFF'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION

CASE NO. 2021-00066

1

•		
2	Item 1)	Refer to the Application, Exhibit 2, Fifth Revised Sheet No. 32 and Second
3	Revised She	eet No. 32B.
4	a.	Refer to Kenergy's Response to Commission Staff's First Request for Information
5		(Staff's First Request), Item 3a. Explain why Kenergy is including language regarding
6		self-read meters if there are no self-read meters.
7	b.	Explain when a remote special meter would not occur and instead a trip would occur.
8	c.	Explain whether Kenergy is willing to clarify the difference in cost between a Special
9		Meter Reading Charge and a Remote Meter Reading Charge to the customer when one is
10		requested.
11		
12	Response)	
13	a.	Language regarding Special Meter Reading Charge (d) can be removed on sheet 32.
14		Remote Special Meter Reading Charge can also be removed on sheet 32B. These charges
15		are no longer applicable.
16	b.	Not all of Kenergy's AMI meters are equipped with remote disconnect/reconnect
17		capabilities.
18	c.	See response to (a) above. Special Meter Reading Charge information should be removed
19		from Kenergy's tariff.
20		
21		
22	Witness) S	teve Thompson
23		
24		
25		Item 1, page 1 of 1

KENERGY CORP. RESPONSE TO THE COMMISSION STAFF'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION

CASE NO. 2021-00066

1		
2	ltem 2)	Refer to the Application, Exhibit 2, Fifth Revised Sheet No. 32. Explain why a seasonal
3	or temporary	service turn-on charge cannot be handled remotely.
4		
5	Response)	Not all of Kenergy's AMI meters are equipped with remote disconnect/reconnect
6	capabilities.	
7		
8		
9		
10		
11	Witness) Ste	ve Thompson
12		
13		
14		
15		
16		
17		
18		
19		
20		
21		
22		
23		
24		Item 2, page 1 of 1

KENERGY CORP. RESPONSE TO THE COMMISSION STAFF'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION

CASE NO. 2021-00066

1

2

3

4

5

Item 3)Refer to the Application, Exhibit 2, Third Revised Sheet No. 32 (Exh. B) and Kenergy'sResponse to Staff's First Request, Item 3d. If all meters are AMI, explain why Turn-On, terminations,disconnects, and reconnects are not handled remotely.

5	
6	Response) Not all of Kenergy's AMI meters are equipped with remote disconnect/reconnect
7	capabilities. AMI meters equipped with remote disconnect/reconnect capabilities are more expensive
8	than standard AMI meters, so Kenergy has limited their installation to accounts that typically generate
9	more trips for servicemen. Some examples include: apartments, seasonal accounts, accounts that have
10	previously been disconnected then reconnected, and prepaid accounts. Kenergy currently has
11	approximately 11,500 active meters installed with remote disconnect switches.
12	
13	
14	
15	Witness) Steve Thompson
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	Item 3, page 1 of 1

	KENERGY CORP. RESPONSE TO THE COMMISSION STAFF'S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION								
_	CASE NO. 2021-00066								
1									
2	ltem 4)	Refer to Kenergy's Response to Staff's First Request, Item 22. Provide an update.							
3									
4									
5	Response)	Please see attached, Item 4 page 2-7 of 7.							
6									
7									
8									
9	Witness) Ste	eve Thompson							
10									
11									
12									
13									
14									
15									
16									
17									
18									
19									
20									
21									
22									
23									
24		Item 4, page 1 of 7							

				KENERGY	CORP.					
			2021-00	0066 RATE CA		ION				
				EXHIBI	Т 39					
		THROU	JGH MAY 3	31, 2021 AND F	PROJECTED 1	TOTAL COSTS				
	(a) (b)	(C)	(d)	(e) (f) (g)	(h)	(i)	(j)	(k)	(I)
Line		Date	Check	Dollar		COSS	Depreciation	Wage and	Legal	
No	Vendor Name Description	Paid	Number	Amount	Legal	Rate Design	Study	Benefits	Notice	Other
1	The Prime Group Depreciation study	1/22/21	160585	3,910.00	-	-	3,910.00			
2	Catalyst Consulting COSS & rate design	1/8/21	160367	1,300.00		1,300.00				
3	Johanson Group Wage and Benefit	12/31/20	160317	10,000.00				10,000.00		
4		December 2	2020	15,210.00	-	1,300.00	3,910.00	10,000.00	-	-
5										
6	Catalyst Consulting COSS & rate design	2/5/21	160651	2,600.00	-	2,600.00				
7		January 202	21	2,600.00	-	2,600.00	- 1	-	-	-
8										
9	The Prime Group Depreciation study	2/26/21	160901	6,900.00		-	6,900.00			
10	Johanson Group Wage and Benefit	2/12/21	160752	300.00				300.00		
11	Dorsey, Gray, Norment & Legal	3/5/21	160931	170.00	170.00					
	Catalyst Consulting COSS & rate design	3/12/21	160999	10,100.00		10,100.00				
13		February 20		17,470.00	170.00	10,100.00	6,900.00	300.00	-	-
14		,,, ,		,			-,			
	Dorsey, Gray, Norment & Legal	4/9/21	161316	1,400.00	1,400.00					
	Kentucky Press Service Ads - legal notice	4/9/21	161338	24,293.67					24,293.67	
	Walmart Binder / flash drive	3/10/21	8377	19.96						19.96
18	The Prime Group Depreciation study	3/12/21	161045	3,790.00			3,790.00			
19										
20		March 2021		29,503.63	1,400.00	-	3,790.00	-	24,293.67	19.96
21				,						
	Catalyst Consulting COSS & rate design	4/16/21	161398	1,200.00		1,200.00				
	Walmart Flash drive	4/28/21	8477	4.21		,				4.21
	Dorsey, Gray, Norment & Legal	5/7/21	161617	720.00	720.00					
	Catalyst Consulting COSS & rate design	5/7/21	161605	3,000.00		3,000.00				
26		April 2021		4,924.21	720.00	4,200.00	_	-	-	4.21
27				.,		.,				
	Catalyst Consulting COSS & rate design	6/4/21	161907	1,700.00		1,700.00				
	Dorsey, Gray, Norment & Legal		161958	960.00	960.00	.,				
30		May 2021		2,660.00	960.00	1,700.00		_	-	_
31				2,000.00	555.55	.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,				
32	Total incurred to date	2		72,367.84	3,250.00	19,900.00	14,600.00	10,300.00	24,293.67	24.17
33				. 2,007.04	0,200.00	10,000.00	1,000.00	10,000.00	21,200.07	2
34	Projected Remaining			_	-	-	-	-	-	-
35										
36	Projected Total			72,367.84	\$ 3,250.00	\$ 19,900.00	\$ 14,600.00	\$ 10.300.00	\$ 24,293.67	\$ 24.17



May 4, 2021

Kenergy Co	orp.
Post Office	Box 18
Henderson,	KY 42419-018

DORSEY, GRAY, NORMENT & HOPGOOD ATTORNEYS AT LAW 318 SECOND STREET HENDERSON, KENTUCKY 42420

ID NO. 610462803

Re: Rate case

TO FEE: For legal services rendered during April 2021as follows:

2021		HOUR
4-13	Receipt and review Attorney General's data requests;	.5
4-14	Receipt and review PSC's data requests;	.5
4-19	E-mail from Steve Thompson re:	.25
4-21	Telephone conference with Travis Siewert re: ; research re: same; e-mail to Travis Siewert re: same;	1.0
4-23	Review responses to data requests; e-mail re: same;	1.5
4-24	Receipt and review e-mail from Jeff Hohn re: data request responses; redact bill entries for document production; e-mail to Travis Siewert re: same;	.25
4-27	Receipt and review e-mail from Travis Siewert re: final changes to data request responses;	.25
4-29	E-mail to and from Attorney General re: data request responses;	.25
	Total hours	4.5

FEE for above services rendered (4.5 hours @ \$160.00) -

928 ° W 20 240 (ase 2021-00066

\$720.00

Item 4, Page 4 of 7







3308 Haddon Road Louisville, KY 40241 (502) 599-1739 johnwolfram@catalystcllc.com

INVOICE

Date: May 1, 2021	Invoice #: 210410		
Client:	Project:		
Kenergy Corp. 6402 Old Corydon Road P. O. Box 18	2019 Cost of Service & Rate Review Case No. 2021-00066		
Henderson, KY 42419	For Services Provided in April 2021		

	Item	Description	Qty	Rate	Amt
1	Consulting Services	John Wolfram – consulting support for 2019 Cost of Service & Rate Review. Prepare and review responses to data requests. Calls and emails with staff on same.	15.0 Hours	\$200.00	\$ 3,000.00
				TOTAL	\$ 3,000.00

Please remit payment to Catalyst Consulting LLC at the address listed above. Thank you.

928 au 20 240



CATALYST CONSULTING LLC

3308 Haddon Road Louisville, KY 40241 (502) 599-1739 johnwolfram@catalystcllc.com

1000

INVOICE PO 13304)

Date: June 1, 2021	Invoice #: 210511
Client:	Project:
Kenergy Corp. 6402 Old Corydon Road P. O. Box 18	2019 Cost of Service & Rate Review Case No. 2021-00066
Henderson, KY 42419	For Services Provided in May 2021

	Item	Description	Qty	Rate	Amt
1	Consulting Services	John Wolfram – consulting support for 2019 Cost of Service & Rate Review. Review AG comments. Prepare draft comments and review edits. Calls and emails with staff on same.	8.5 hours	\$200.00	\$ 1,700.00
				TOTAL	\$ 1,700.00

Please remit payment to Catalyst Consulting LLC at the address listed above. Thank you.

928° 20 240 Case # 2021-allbb

June 1, 2021

Kenergy Corp. Post Office Box 18 Henderson, KY 42419-018

SHE

DORSEY, GRAY, NORMENT & HOPGOOD ATTORNEYS AT LAW 318 SECOND STREET HENDERSON, KENTUCKY 42420

ID NO. 610462803

Re: Rate case

TO FEE:	For legal services rendered during May 2021as follows:	
<u>2021</u>		HOUR
5-4	Telephone conferences with Steve Thompson, Travis Siewert, Jeff Hohn and John Wolfram re: Comment to PSC; research re: ; preparation of draft of Comment; e-mail to Steve Thompson and John Wolfram re: same;	4.0
5-5	Revise Comments; e-mail to and from John Wolfram and Steve Thompson re: same;	1.0
5-7	Receipt and review AG comments and e-mail from John Wolfram re: same;	.5
5-12	Receipt and review Order denying motion to place rates into effect on day 75;	.25
5-20	Receipt and review Order re: rate suspension;	.25
	Total hours	6 C

FEE for above services rendered (6 hours @ \$160.00) -

\$960.00 A

928,000 20 24D PSC (me 2021-00066

6