
JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 

Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption .Run Date 

ASHLAND DAILY INDEPENDENT 
Notice-Page 1 06/2112017 
Notfce-Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06121/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice~Page 6 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07105/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice-~Page 4 07105/2017 
Notice--Page 5 0710512017 
Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 7 07/05/2017 

BOONEVILLE SENTINEL 
Notice--Page 1 06121/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/21/2017 

Ad Size 

8x 21 
8x21 

ax 21 
Bx21 

8x21 
8x21 
8 X 14.5 
Bx21 

8x21 
6 x21 
8 x21 
8x 21 
sx21 
8x 14.5 
8x21 
8x21 

Bx21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8 X 14.5 

6x21 
6X21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
.101 CONSUMER lANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8621 Fax (502) 375-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$3~.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$3&.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$3/l,QO SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$3/l,OO SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$36.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$3/l,QO SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$3f;,QQ SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$3S.OO SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$30.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 
$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0,00 0.0000% 

$35.00 SAU $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

PaQe 1 

Total 

$5,880,00 
$5,880.00 
$5,860.00 
$5,860.00 
$5,860.00 
$5,860.00 
$4,060.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,680.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,680.00 
$5,680.00 
$4,060.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,880.00 
$5,880.00 
$4,060.00 

$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE FIVE , THE CLIENT IS I FOR 

FULL PAYMENT OF THE INVOICE 
·· Amount Due Subject to 1 .5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent.. 
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JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR 
FRANKFORT; KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 4 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 5 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 6 07/0512017 
Notice--Page 7 07/05/2017 

GRAYSON JOURNAL-ENQUIRER 
Notice-Page 1 06121/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06121/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/21/2017 
Notice·"Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 2 0612812017 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/2812017 
Notice""Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 6 0612812017 

Ad Size 

6 X 14.5 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6X21 
6x 14.5 
6x21 
6x21 
6x 21 
6x21 
6X21 
6x21 
6x 14.5 

8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
Bx21 
8 X 14.5 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601· 

Voice (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 
Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.86 CLDLS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$a.B6 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6:86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$a.6~ CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13-00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$1'!.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$1'!.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$1'1.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Total 

$770.82 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 

$770.82 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 
$1,116.36 

$770.82 

$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$1,508.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE IS NOT WITHIN I [ I 

··.·•···· Z~untb~~·~:~;e~tt~ 1.~;, ~~~t:eGh~rg~·Al~:30~ays Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 
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JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 4 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 5 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 6 07/05/2017 
Nollce--Page 7 07/05/2017 

GREENUP NEWS 
Notice--Page 1 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06122/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/29/2017 
Notice~-Page 2 06/29/2017 
Notice--Page 3 06/29/2017 
Notice--Page 4 06/29/2017 
Notice--Page 5 06/29/2017 
Notice--Page 6 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/29/2017 
Notice--Page 1 07/06/2017 
Notlce--Page 2 07/06/2017 
Notice-Page 3 07/06/2017 
Notice-Page 4 07106/2017 
Notice-Page 5 07/06/2017 
Notlce-Page 6 07/06/2017 

Ad Size 

8x 14.5 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
Sx 14.5 

Bx 21 
Bx21 

8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
ax 14.5 

8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x 14.5 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 711812017 

PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate R11te. Name Color Dit>C. 

$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$1:1.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$1'1.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$1:1.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLOIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$MO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$MO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$MO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$6.00 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$6.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page3 

Total 

$1,508.00 
$2,184,00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$2,184.00 
$1,508.00 

$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 

$696.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008,00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 

$696.00 
$1,008,00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST IS NOT FIVE THE CLIENT IS RESPONSIBLE FOR 

PAYMENT OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT . 
.. 

' Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent 
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JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 7 07/06/2017 
HAZARD HERALD 

Notice--Page 1 06/2112017 
Notice--Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notfce~Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 4 06/2112017 
Notice--Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/2112017 
Notice-Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 4 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 5 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 7 07/05/2017 

HINDMAN TROUBLESOME CREEK TIMES 
Notice-Page 1 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/22/2017 

Ad Size 

8 X 14.5 

6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6x 21.5 

6 X 21.5 
6 x21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 14.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6x21.5 
6x21.5 
6x 14.5 
6x21.5 
6x21.5 
6x 21.5 
6x 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6 X 14.5 

6x21.5 
6x 21.5 
6x 21.5 
6x 21.5 
6x 21.5 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 675-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 
Order 17072KKO 

R11t11 Rate Name Color Disc. 

$6.00 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page4 

Total 

. $696.00 

$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,195.38 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,195.38 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,772.46 
$1,195.38 

$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE I 

FULL 
'' Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 
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JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 6 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/29/2017 
Notice--Page 3 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07106/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07106/2017 
Notice-Page 3 07106/2017 
Notice-Page 4 07106/2017 
Notice-Page 5 0710612017 
Notice-Page 6 07/0612017 
Notice-Page 7 0710612017 

HYDEN LESLIE CO. NEWS 
Notice-Page 1 0612212017 
Notice-Page 2 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06122/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 7 OS/22/2017 
Notice--Page 1 0612912017 
Notice-Page 2 06/2912017 
Notice-Page 3 06/2912017 
Notice-Page 4 06/2912017 
Notice-Page 5 06129/2017 

Ad Size 

6x 21.5 
6 X 14.5 
6x 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 x21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6 X 14.5 
6x21.5 
6x21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 14.5 

Bx 21 
Bx 21 
Bx 21 
Bx 21 
Bx 21 
Bx21 
Bx 14.5 
Bx21 
6X2'1 
8x21 
Bx21 
sx21 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,I<Y 40601-

Volcs (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 

Order 17072KKD 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10:00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10-00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10,00 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7,00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7,00 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

PageS 

Total 

$1,290.00 
$870.00 

$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 

$870.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 
$1,290.00 

$670.00 

$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 

$812.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS ANDIOR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST IS NOT I FIVE THE CLIENT IS I 

FULL OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT. 
··;·;:,,,; .. :"•'.'•'' 

•' 

Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 
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JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice~~Page 6 06/2912017 
Notice-Page 7 06129/2017 
Notic~age1 07/06/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07/06/2017 
Notice--Page 3 07/0612017 
Notice-Page 4 07/0612017 
Notice--Page 5 07/0612017 
Notice--Page 6 07/06/2017 
Notice-Page 7 07106/2017 

INEZ MOUNTAIN CITIZEN 
Notlce-Page 1 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 4 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 0612112017 
Notice-Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 4 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 4 0710512017 
Notice--Page 5 07/05/2017 

Ad Size 

8x21 

8 X 14.5 
8x21 

8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 

8x21 
8 X 14.5 

6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 
6x21.5 
6 X 14.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 

6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 14.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6 X 21.5 
6x21.5 

6 x21.5 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/1812017 

PO Number 
Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$7.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8,22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 GilliS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Pages 

Total 

$1,176.00 
$812.00 

$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 
$1,176.00 

$812.00 

$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 

$715.14 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 

$715.14 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 
$1,060.38 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE I 

FULL OFTHE 
' Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Vanlagem version 7.64 by Customware, I no. Copyright 2001-2015 Registered To·.l<entuckyPres;; Sorvioo 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 
Page 6 of 74 



JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 

Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 

Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 7 07/05/2017 

Jackson Times~ Voice 

Notice-Page 1 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 6 06/28/2017 
Notice~~Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice~~Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice~~Page 4 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 5 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 7 07/05/2017 

LOUISA BIG SANDY NEWS 
Notice-Page 1 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/21/2017 

Ad Size 

6x21.5 
6x 14.5 

6x21 
6x21 
6 X21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x 14.5 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 

6X 14.5 
6x21 
6x21 
6x 21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x 21 
6 X 14.5 

9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST IS 

FULL PAYMENT OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT. 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANI(FORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7118/2017 
PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.22 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$a.QO CLD!S $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$a,QO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8,00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$&.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page? 

Total 

$1,060.38 
$715.14 

$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 

$696.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 

$696.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 
$1,008.00 

$696.00 

$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 

·· Amountoue Subjectto 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad~V~ntag:e-nt version 7.64 by Customware, Inc. Copyrlyhl2001-2015 RegiGtored To: Kentucky Press Service 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 
Page 7 of 74 



JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 

Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 5 06/2112017 
Notice-Page 6 06121/2017 
Notice--Page 7 0612112017 
NotlceM~Page 1 06128/2017 
Notice--Page 2 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/2812017 
Notice~Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 6 0612812017 
Notice-Page 7 06128/2017 
Notice--Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice~Page 2 07/05/2017 
NOtice--Page 3- 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 4 0710512017 
Notice-Page 5 Ol/0512017 
Notice-Page 6 07105/2017 
Notice-Page 7 07/05/2017 

MANCHESTER ENTERPRISE 
Notice-Page 1 06121/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/2112017 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06121/2017 
NoticeRRPage 5 0612112017 
NoticeR-Page 6 06/21/2017 
Notice~RPage 7 06/2112017 
Notice-Page 1 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06128/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/28/2017 

Ad Size 

9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x 14.5 
9x 21.25 
9x 21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9 X 21.25 
9x21.25 
9x 14.5 
9 X 21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x21.25 
9x14.5 

8x20.5 
8x20.5 
8x20.5 
8x20.5 
8 X 20.5 
8x20.5 
8 X 14.5 
Bx20.5 

8x20.5 
8x20.5 

8 X 20.5 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8621 Fax (502) 675-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$1Q,QO CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$1Q,OO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $o.oo 0.0000% 
$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$10.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12,66 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 GlDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page 

Total 

$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,305.00 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,305.00 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,912.50 
$1,305.00 

$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$1,468.56 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE WITHIN I 

OF THE I : .. '::~:--:'-.I-:.··:·-. .-·./·:-·<:,·.·-:···;-_,-->-:·(;):_-:::::--_:_:{·,:.--_:·:_ .. :>''·< <,-·,r--.:·_.,,-_; :_ -.: .-, 
' . •""""" 

· ..... Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Vantaganl version 7.64 by Customwara, Inc. Copyrighl2001-2015 Raglsterad To: Kentud(y Press Service 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 
Page 8 of 74 



KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 

JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 5 0612812017 
Notice-Page 6 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06128/2017 
Notice~~Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice"~Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 4 07105/2017 
Notice-Page 5 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page: 7 07/0512017 

MOREHEAD NEWS 
Notice-Page 1 06/2312017 
Notice"-Page 2 06/23/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/23/2017 
Notice~Page 4 06/2312017 
Notice-Page 5 06/23/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/2312017 
Notice~P~ge 7 06/23/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/30/2017 
Notloe-Page 2 06/3012017 
Notrce-Page 3 06130/2017 
Notice-Page 4 06/30/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/30/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/30/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/30/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07/07/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07/07/2017 
Notice--Page 3 07/07/2017 
Notice--Page 4 07/07/2017 

Ad Size 

Bx20.5 
8 X 20.5 
8x 14.5 
8x20.5 
Bx20.5 
Bx20.5 
Bx 20.5 · 

8x20.5 
8x20.5 
Bx 14.5 

8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
8x21 
Bx21 

8x21 
8x 14.5 
8x 21 
8x21 
8x21 
8 x21 
Bx21 
8X2"1 
Bx 14.5 
8x21 
Bx21 
8x21 
8x21 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 
Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$1MO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$HWO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$15.00 CLDJS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page 

Total 

$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$1,468.56 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 

. $2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$2,076.24 
$1,468.56 

$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2.520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$1,740.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$1,740.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 
$2,520.00 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE I 

FULL PAYMENT OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT: 
·· · ' Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 

Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad·Vanfage--n• versfon 7.64 by Customware, Inc. Copyrlghl2001-2015 Registered To: Kentucky Press Servioo 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 
Page 9 of 74 



KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 

FRANKFORT,KY 40601-
Voice (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Tuesday, July 18, 201710:32 AM Page 10 

Invoice 
JUDY ROSQUIST Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY PO Number 
P.O. BOX 5190 Order 17072KKO 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client KY POWER COMPANY 

Reps Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption 'Run Date Ad Size Rate Rate Name Color Disc. Total 

Notice-Page 5 07/07/2017 8x21 $1!i.OO CLDIS $0.00 o.oboo% $2,520.00 
Notice~Page 6 07/07/2017 8x21 $16.00 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $2,520.00 
Notice~Page 7 07/07/2017 Bx 14.5 $15.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,740.00 

PAINTSVILLE HERALD 

Notice-Page 1 06/21/2017 6x21.5 $6.97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 2 06/21/2017 6xi1.5 $£1,97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 6x21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notlce-~Page 4 06/21/2017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 5 06/21/2017 6 X 21.5 $6,97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice--Page 6 06/21/2017 6x21.5 $£>.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice--Page 7 06/21/2017 6x 14.5 $£>.97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $606.39 
Notrce--Page 1 06/28/2017 6x21.5 $M7 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 2 06/28/2017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 3 06/28/2017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 4 061i812017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 5 06/28/2017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 6 06/28/2017 6 X 21.5 $6,97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice~~Page 7 06/28/2017 6 X 14.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $606.39 
Notlce--PaQe 1 07/05/2017 6x21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 6x21.5 $6.97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 3 07/05/2017 6x21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 4 07/05/2017 6 x21.5 $6.97 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 5 07/05/2017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 6 X 21.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $899.13 
Notice-Page 7 07/05/2017 6 X 14.5 $6.97 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $606.39 

PIKEVILLE APPALACHIAN NEWS-EXPRESS 

Notice-Page 1 06/21/2017 9 X 21.5 $12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $2,438.10 
Notice--Page 2 06/21/2017 9x21.5 $12.60 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $2,438.10 
Notice-Page 3 06/21/2017 9x21.5 $12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% $2,438.10 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST_ IS NOTRECEIV~D WITHIN FIVE DA ;s,}~ECUENT IS RESPONSIBLE FOR 

&a~~a~~1f~l~ili;6~t¢~t~t~~iral~!~~~~!~'1:~:~~;~!~~-~i~~:::~~~~!~:1~=~=:~: 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Vantage Tit ver:.ion 7.64 by Cuslomware, fnc. Copyright 2001-2015 Registered To: Ken!UGky Pross Se!'Vice 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 

Page 10 of 74 



JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 4 06121/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/2112017 
Notice--Page 6 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice"-Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 3 06/2812017 
Notice-Page 4 06/28/2017 
Notice~Page 5 06/28/2017 
Notice~Page 6 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/28/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 2 07/05/2017 
Notice-~Page 3 07/05/2017 
Notice--Page 4 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 5 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 6 07/05/2017 
Notice-Page 7 07/05/2017 

PRESTONSBURG FLOYD COUNTY TIMES 
Notice-Page 1 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 2 06/21/2017 
Notice~-Page 3 06/21/2017 
Notice--Page 4 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 5 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/21/2017 
Notice~Page 7 06/21/2017 
Notice-Page 1 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 2 06/28/2017 
Notice--Page 3 06/28/2017 

Ad Size 

9x21.5 
9x21.5 
9x21.5 
9 X 14.5 
9x21.5 
ox21.s 
9x 21.5 
9x21.5 
9 X 21.5 
9x 21.5 
9 X 14.5 
9x21.5 
9 X 21.5 
9 X 21.5 
9 X 21.5 
9 X 21.5 
9 X 21.5 
9 X 14.5 

6x 21.2 
6 X 21.2 
6 X 21.2 
6 X 21.2 
6 X 21.2 
6x21.2 
6 X 14.5 
6x21.2 
ex 21.2 
6 X 21.2 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMI'R LANE 
FRANI<FORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$14,60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 O.OPOO% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$12.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$12.60 CLDIS $0,00 0.0000% 

$1~.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$1~.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$1~.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$1~.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$13,74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page 

Total 

$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$1,644.30 

. $2,438.10 

$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$1,644.30 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$2,438.10 
$1,644.30 

$1,747.73 
$1.747,73 
$1,747.73 
$1,747.73 
$1,747.73 
$1,747.73 
$1,195.38 
$1,747.73 
$1,747.73 
$1,747.73 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE IF THE REQUEST IS NOT WITHIN FIVE .. , THE CLIENT .IS RESPONSIBLE FOR 

OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT . 
. . · ··· ···· i A~o~nt Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After30 Days Plea;e Pay From This 

Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent 

Ad-Vantage 1M version 7.64 by Cuslcmware, Inc. Copyrighl2001-2015 Registered To; Knntl.lckY Press Ser11lce 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 

Page 11 of 74 



KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
1G1 GONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 4G6G1-

Voice (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Page 

Invoice 
JUDY ROSQUIST, Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY PO Number 
P.O. BOX 5190 Order 17072KKO 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client KY POWER COMPANY 

Reps Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 

Caption Run Date Ad Size Rate Rate Name Color Disc. Total 

Notice--Page 4 06/28/2017 6 X 21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Noticen-Page 5 06/28/2017 6 X 21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Notice--Page 6 06/28/2017 6x212 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73. 
Notice--Page 7 06/~8/2017 6 X 14.5 $10.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,195.38 
Notice-Page 1. 07/05/2017 6x21.2 $13.7 4 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000%. $1,747.73 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 6x21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Notice-Page 3 07/05/2017 6x21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Notice-Page 4 07/05/2017 6 X 21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Notice--Page 5 07/05/2017 6 X 21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Notice--Page 6 07/05/2017 6x21.2 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,747.73 
Notfce-Page 7 07/0512017 6x 14.5 $13.74 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,195.38 

SALYERSVILLE INDEPENDENT 
Notice-Page 1 06/22/2017 9x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 2 06/22/2017 9x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 3 06/22/2017 9x 21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice--Page 4 06/22/2017 9x21 $~.66 CLDIS $o:oo 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 5 06/22/2017 9x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 6 06/22/2017 9x21 $6.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 7 06/22/2017 9x 14.5 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,156.23 
Notice-Page 1 06/29/2017 9x 21 $8.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 2 06/29/2017 9x21 $~.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 3 06/29/2017 9 x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice··Page 4 06129/2017 9 x21 $6.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.5~. 

Notice~Page 5 06/29/2017 9X2'1 $8.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 6 06/29/2017 9x21 $6.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 7 06/29/2017 9x 14.5 $8.66 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,156.23 
Notice-Page 1 07/06/2017 9x 21 $8.86 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice··Page 2 07/06/2017 9x 21 $8.66 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 3 07/06/2017 9 X 21 $6.66 CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% $"1,674.54 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST IS NOT THE 

FULL PAYMENT OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT . 
. . ··, 

Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Vantage""1 version 7.64 by Customware, lnc. Copyright 2001-2015 Registered To: Kentucky Press Servloo 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 

Page 12 of 74 



KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Voice (502) 223-11821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Page 

Invoice 
JUDY ROSQUIST Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY PO Number 
P.O. BOX5190 Order 17072KKO 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client KY POWER COMPANY 

Reps Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date Ad Size Rate Rate Name Color Disc. Total 

Notice-Page 4 07/06/2017 9x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 5 07/06/2017 9x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 6 07/06/2017 9x21 $8.86 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,674.54 
Notice-Page 7 07/06/2017 9x 14.5 $8.66 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $1,156.23 

SANDY HOOK ElliOTT COUNTY NEWS 
Notice~Page 1 06/23/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
.Notice-Page 2 06/23/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 3 06/23/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 4 06/23/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 5 06/23/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice--Page 6 06/23/2017 6x21 $4,94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice--Page 7 06/23/2017 6 X 14.5 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $429.78 
Notice-Page 1 06/30/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 2 06/30/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 3 06/30/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 4 06/30/2017 6X21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice--Page 5 06/3012017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 6 06/30/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 7 06/30/2017 6 X 14.5 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $429.78 
Notice-Page 1 07114/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 2 07/14/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 3 07/14/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 4 07/14/2017 6x 21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice--Page 5 07/14/2017 6x21 $4Jl'l- CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 6 07/14/2017 6x21 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $622.44 
Notice-Page 7 07/14/2017 6 X 14.5 $4.94 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $429.78 

VANCEBURG LEWIS COUNTY HERALD 
Notice-Page 1 06/27/2017 6x 21 $4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $559.44 
Notice-Page 2 06/27/2017 Gx21 $4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% $559.44 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUt-lT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS lt-lVOICE. IF THE REQUEST IS NOT~ECEIVEDWITHIN FIYEDAYS,}HEC~IENT IS RESPONSIBLE FOR 

~a~;a~t'~~~~i::b~;f~at~~~N{-al~?~!~~~~~(~~:~!,~:;~-~~:~!~~:!!~~!~~~~~~! ri~ 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Van!agon~ version 7.64 by Customware, Inc. Copyrighl2001-2015 Registered TO'. Kentucky Press Service 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 
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JUDY ROSQUIST · 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 

Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 

Caption Run Date 

Notice-Page 3 OB/27/2017 

Notice-Page 4 06/27/2017 
Notice--Page 5 06/27/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/27/2017 
Notlce-Page 7 06/27/2017 
Notice-Page 1 07/0412017 
Notice-Page 2 07/04/2017 
Notice-Page 3 07/04/2017 
Notice-Page 4 07/04/2017 

Notice-Page 5 07/04/2017 
Notice--Page 6 07/04/2017 
Notice--Page 7 07/04/2017 

Notice-Page 1 07111/2017 
Notice-Page 2 07111/2017 
Notice-Page 3 oii1112017 
Notice-Page 4 07/11/2017 

Notice--Page 5 07111/2017 
NoUce~~Page 6 07/11/2017 
NoficewwPage 7 07/11/2017 

WEST LIBERTY LICKING VALLEY COURIER 
Notice-Page 1 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 3 06/22/2017 
NoUce--Page 4 06/22/2017 
Notice--Page 5 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 6 06/22/2017 
Notice-Page 7 06/22/2017 

Notice-Page 1 06/29/2017 
Notice-Page 2 06/29/2017 

Ad Size 

6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x21 

6 X 14.5 
6x21 
6x 21 
6x21 

6x21 
6x21 
6x21 
6x 14.5 
6x 21 
6x21 

6x 21 
6x21 

6x21 
6x21 

6 X 14.5 

6x21 

6x21 
6 )( 21 
6x21 
6x21 

6 X21 

6 X 14.5 
6x21 
6x2·1 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER lANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce (502) 223-8821 Fax (502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 

PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$4.44 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.36 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$o.3a CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$Q.36 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$!;.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Page 

Total 

$559.44 
$559.44 
$559.44 

$559.44 
$386.28 

$559.44 
$559.44 
$559.44 
$559.44 

$559.44 
$559.44 
$386.28 
$559.44 

$559.44 
$559.44 

$559.44 
$559.44 

$559.44 

$386.28 

$677.88 
$677.88 

$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$468.06 
$677.88 
$677.88 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST IS NOT I THE CLIENT IS FOR 

FULL PAYMENT OF THE INVOICE AMOUNT .. I 
'' Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Vanlago11·1 VBrslon 7.64 by Customware, 1nc. Copyrtght 2001-201U Registered To~ l<enlucky Press Service. 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 

Page 14 of 74 



JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 
P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client KY POWER COMPANY 

Reps Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption Run Date Ad Size 

Notice-Page 3 oo/2912017 6x21 
Notice-Page 4 0612912017 6x21 
Notice-Page 5 06/29/2017 6x21 
Notice-Page 6 06129/2017 6x21 
Notice-Page 7 06/29/2017 6 X 14.5 
Notice-Page 1 0711312017 6x21 
Notice-Page 2 07113/2017 6x21 
Noticfl-Page 3 0711312017 6x21 
NoticeR-Page 4 07/13/2017 6x21 
Notice--Page 5 07/1312017 6x21 
Notice--Page 6 07/13/2017 6x21 
Notice-Page 7 0711312017 6x14.5 

WHITESBURG MOUNTAIN EAGLE 
Notice-Page 1 06/21/2017 8x21 
Notice-Page 2 06/2112017 8x21 
Notice-Page 3 0612112017 8x21 
Notice--Page 4 0612112017 8X21 
Notice--Page 5 0612112017 Bx21 
Notice--Page 6 06/2112017 8x21 
Notice-Page 7 0612112017 8 X 14.5 
Notice~Page 1 06/28/2017 8 x21 
Notice-Page 2 06/2812017 8 x21 
Notice--Page 3 06/2812017 8 x21 
Notice--Page 4 0612812017 8x21 
Notice--Page 5 06/2812017 8x 21 
Notice-Page 5 06128/2017 Bx21 
Notice-Page 7 06/28/2017 8 X 14.5 
Notice-Page 1 0710512017 8x 21 
Notice-Page 2 07/05/2017 8 X 21 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601· 

Voloe (502) 223-8621 Fax (502) 815-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 
PO Number 

Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 ClDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 GLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$5.38 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$MO CLDIS $0.00 0.0000%~ 

$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$&.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$MQ CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$a.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.60 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$0.00 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$&.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.1!0 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

Total 

$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$468.06 

$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$677.88 
$468.06 

$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 

$986.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 

$986.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETS AND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUESTIS ~OTR~CEIVEDY'/ITHINFIVES~YS,}~~pliENT IS RESPONSIBLE FOR 
FULL\~'{MENT.OF.T~E_INVOICE.AMOUNT ... &~!i~fMAVci.f.};.2J)!1iti1at~1·S!PEltcl:ilit'i;~~'lMLil:~ 
ali!~~(l;j]f.,payfijg:cpyiCr~dJt':C;i(rij; Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 

Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Vantage Til version 7.64 by Cuslomware., lm Copyrlght 2001-2015 H.eglstered To: Kentucky Press Service 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 

Page 15 of 74 



JUDY ROSQUIST 

Agency KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 

P.O. BOX 5190 
REGULATORY SERVICES 
101A ENTERPRISE DR. 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602 

Client 
Reps 

KY POWER COMPANY 

Rachel McCarty 

Newspaper 
Caption 

Notice-Page 3 
Notice-Page 4 
Notice-Page 5 
Notice--Page 6 
Notice-Page 7 

Run Date 

Ol/05/2017 
07/05/2017 
07/05/2017 
07/05/2017 
07/05/2017 

Ad Si2:e 

Bx21 
Bx21 
Bx21 
8x21 

8 X 14.5 

KENTUCKY PRESS SERVICE 
101 CONSUMER LANE 
FRANKFORT,KY 40601-

Volce {502) 223-8621 Fax {502) 875-2624 

Invoice 
Invoice Date 7/18/2017 
PO Number 
Order 17072KKO 

Rate Rate Name Color Disc. 

$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$8.50 CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 
$8.5o CLDIS $0.00 0.0000% 

$MO CLDIS $0.00 0,0000% 

Total Advertising 

Discounts 

Tax: USA 

Total Invoice 

Payments 

Adjustments 

Balance Due 

Page 16 

Total 

$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 
$1,428.00 

$986.00 

$663,049.56 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$663,049.56 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$663,049.56 

ANY QUESTIONS CONCERNING TEARSHEETSAND/OR REQUESTS FOR ACCOUNT CREDIT MUST BE MADE WITHIN FIVE DAYS 
OF THE DATE OF THIS INVOICE. IF THE REQUEST WITHIN FIVE THE CLIENT IS RESPONSIBLE 

FULL PAYMENT OFTHE INVOICE AMOUNT. .H . ~~ I I 

... ·•· ·• ··• Amount Due Subject to 1.5% Service Charge After 30 Days Please Pay From This 
Invoice. No Statement Will Be Sent. 

Ad-Van!agam vel"3ion 7.64 by Customware, !no.. Copyright 2001~2015 Regls!erec! To: £<entucky Press Se/V!cn 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 
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STITES .. :<r HARBISON rLLc 

421 WESTMA1N STREET 
P.O. BOX634 
FRANKfORT, KY 40602-0634 
(S02) 223-3477 
FAX (502)22).4124 
WWW.STI'I'ES,COM 

KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 
RANIE K. WOHNHAS 
PO BOX 5190 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602-5190 

RE: 2016 RATE CASE 
AEPLAWPACKMATTERNO. AEPD053942 

KE057-KE315 

MRO 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES, for the period ended 

Fees for legal services rendered in cormectlon with 

JUNE 30, 2017 

the above captioned matter through JUNE 30, 2017 
and as reflected by the attached summary 

Additional Services 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

JULY 7, 2017 

INVOICE NO. 1337749 

TAX1D:···· 

TERMS: PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT 

$62,929.00 

$332.92 

$63,261.92 

Alexandri&, VA AtlmHa, GA Frankfort. KY Jeffersonville, IN Lexinglon, KY LoulsviUc, KY Nashville, TN Washington, DC 

KPSC Case No. 2017-00179 
Commission Staff's First Set of Data Requests 

Dated May 22, 2017 
Item No. 56 

September 1, 2017 Supplemental Response 
Attachment 1 

Page 17 of 74 



{ 
-~ 

STITES 8r HARBISON Puc 

KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 
RANIE K. WOHNHAS 
PO BOX5190 

421 WEST MAIN STREET 
P. 0. BOX634 
FRANKFORT, KY 40604-0634 
(502) 223-34TI 
Fox (504)223-4124 
www.stites.com 

JULY7,2017 

FRANKFORT, l<Y 40602-5190 MRO 

INVOICE#: 1337749 
OUR REFERENCE#: KE05H<E3 I 5 

OUR TAXID#: 
•• 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH .T(JNE 30, 2017 

MATTER NO. KE057-KE315 2016 RATE CASE 
AEP LAWPACK MATTER NO. AEPD053942 

6/1117 KG! P400 Al 03 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT NEWSPAPER 3.00 $825.00 
ADVERTISEMENT IN LIGHT OF CHANGES TO TARIFFS 

6/1/17 MRO P400 AI06 MEET WITH MS. RlCHARDSON, MS. ROSQUIST 1.70 $552.50 
AND MESSRS. ROGNESS AND SHARP TO REVIEW FILING 
REQUIREMENTS IN LIGHT OF REVISED FILING DATE 

6/1/17 MRO P4oo Al 03 REVIEW AND REVISE CERTIFICATE OF 0,40 $130.00 
COMPLIANCE IN LIGHT OF CHANGED FILING DATE 

6/J/17 MRO C300 Al 04 REVIEW CALCULA T!ON OF AVERAGE BILL 0.30 $97.50 
IMPACT 

6/1/17 KMG C200A102 RESEARCH AND REVIEW 807 KENTUCKY 3.50 $630.00 
ADMINJSTRA T!VE REGULATIONS CHAPTER 5 AT 
CLIENT'S REQUEST FOR FILING REQUIREMENTS 

6/2/17 MRO C300 AI06TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.10 $32.50 
RE APPLICATION FILING DATE 

6/2/17 KMG C200 A 103 DRAFT CHART SUMMARIZING FILING 2.00 $360.00 
REQUIREMENTS IN PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 
REGULATIONS APPLICABLE TO KEN'IDCKY POWER 

6/5/17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OF B. 1.00 $275.00 
HALL 

--~-·-" 

6/5117 MRO L31 0 Al 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE 0.10 $32.50 
TO KPSC 1-49 AT REQUEST OF MS. SEKULA 

6/5/]7 MRO P400 Al06 MEET WITH MR. WOHNHAS TO REVIEW AND 1.30 $422.50 
DISCUSS HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 
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!\ 

6/5/17 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR MILLER 0.10 $32.50 
RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/5/17 MRO P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT FILING 1.20 $390,00 
REQUIREMENTS DOCUMENT 

616/!7 KG1 P400 A I 04 PREPARE COMMENTS ON FINAL DRAFT OF 1.00 $275.00 
TESTIMONY AND EXHIBITS OF B. HALL 

-----
6/6117 KG! P400 Al 09 TRAVEL TO AND FROM FRANKFORT, KY AND 7.90 $2,172.50 

PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW APPLICATION, 
TARIFFS AND FILING REQUIREMENTS DOCUMENT 

6/6/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTT 0.10 $32,50 
RE FILING JUNE 2017 BOND PROSPECTUSES 

---
6/6117 MRO P400 A1 06 MEET WITH MESSRS, WOHNHAS, SHARP, 2.20 $715.00 

ROGNESS, MS. ROSQU!ST AND MS. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW 
DRAFT APPL!CATION 

·------
6/6117 MRO P400 Al06 MEET WITH MESSRS.SHARP, ROGNESS, MS, 2.40 $7&0.00 

ROSQUIST AND MS. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW DRAFT TARll'FS 
-

6/6/17 KMG P400 A 104 REVIEW FILING REQUIREMENTS, 7,20 $1,296.00 
APPLICATION, AND TARIFFS AT KENTUCKY POWER 
WITH MAR!( OVERSTREET, KEN GISH, JOHN ROGNESS, 
AMY ELLIOTr, flJDY ROSQUIST, AND RANIE W ANHAUS 

617117 MRO P400 A I 04 REVIEW APPLICABLE REFERENCES TO 0.10 $32.50 
REGULATIONS IN APPLICATION 

617/17 KMG P400 A 104 REVIEW DRAFT RATE CASE APPLICATION AND 1.20 $216.00 
CROSS CHECK CITES TO REGULATIONS AND STATUTES 
FOR ACCURACY 

-------
6/8/17 KG1 NOO A104 REVIEW REVISED TARIF!'S 2.20 $605,00 

6/8/17 KG1 P400 Al 04 REVIEW DRA!'T NEWSPAPER ADVERTISEMENT 0.80 $220.00 
FOLLOWING REVIEW OF TARIFF CHANGES 

6/9/17 KG! P400 A I 04 REVIEW UPDATED TARIFFS 2,80 $770.00 

6/9/17 KG! P400 A106 PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN 0.80 $220.00 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW TESTIMONY OF B. HALL 

6/9117 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OF MR. 1.80 $5&5.00 I WOHNHAS' TESTIMONY ! 
·-~···--

~ 6/9117 MRO L31 0 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTT 0.20 $65,00 
RE DRAFT RESPONSE TO DATA REQUESTS I 6/9117 MRO P400 A 1 03 CONTINUE TO REVISE APPLICATION 0.30 $97.50 

' 6/10/17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW FINAL DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OF 0.70 $192,50 

' EXHIBITS OF B. HALL I 
----- ! 
6/11/17 KG! P400 AI 04 REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OF A. 0.70 $192.50 I 

ELLIOTT ~ 
~ 

6/12117 KG! P400 Al04 PREPARE COMMENTS ON REVISED TESTIMONY 0.80 $220.00 I 
/ OF A ELLIOTT J 

li 
j 

l 
j 

6/12/17 KG! N 00 A 1 06 CONFERENCE WITH A. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW 1.40 $385.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

l 
i 
~ 
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6112/17 KGI P400 A104 REVIEW COMPARJSON BETWEEN CLEAN AND 0.70 $192,50 
STRIKE-THROUGH TARJFFS FOR FILING 

6/12/17 KGI P400 A I 06 CONFERENCE WITH J. ROSQUIST TO REVIEW 0.70 $192.50 
COMPARJSON BETWEEN CLEAN AND STRIKE-THROUGH 
TARJFFS FOR FILING 

6/12/17 MRO P400 A104 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELL TO 0,60 $195,00 
REVIEW VEGETATION MANAGEMENT PLAN PORTION OF 
MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/12117 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR, PHILLIPS' 3,90 $1,267.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/13/17 KG! P400 A 103 REVIEW AND REVJSE UPDATED NEWSPAPER 1.20 $330.00 
NOTICE 

6/13/17 MRO P400 A 1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR, PHILLIPS' 2.30 $747,50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/13/!7 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. VAUGHAN'S 0,80 $260,00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/l3/l7 MRO P400 Al03 REVISE APPLICATION 1.60 $520.00 

6/J 4/17 K01 P400 AI 06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 5.20 $1,430.00 
APPLICATION, NEWSPAPER ADVERTISEMENT, AND 
TARIFFS 

{ 
•' 6/14117 KGI P400 AI03 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT NEWSPAPER 1,10 $302.50 

, ADVERTISEMENT -,_ 

6/14/17 MRO P400 A l 06 ADDRESS T ARJFF FILING ISSUE POSED BY MS. 0.40 $130.00 
RICHARDSON 

----·· 
6/14/l7 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELL RE 0.30 $97.50 

MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/l4/l7 MRO P400 A1Q4 MEET AT KENTUCKY POWER'S OFFICES WITH 1.40 $455.00 
MESSRS, ROGNESS AND SHARP, MS. ELLIOTT, AND 
MESSRS, ALLEN AND GARCIA (BY TELEPHONE), AND MS. 
SEKULA, AND MS. RICHARDSON (BY TELEPHONE} TO 
REVIEW DRAFT APPLICATION 

6(]4/17 MRO P400 A I 04 MEET AT KENTUCKY POWER'S OFFICES WITH 3.10 $1,007.50 
MESSRS, ROGNESS AND SHARP, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MR. 
ALLEN, MS. SEKULA, AND MS, RICHARDSON (BY 
TELEPHONE} TO REVIEW DRAFT TARIFFS 

6114117 MRO L310Al06MEETWITHMS. ELLIOTT AND MESSRS, SHARP, 0,50 $162.50 
ROGNESS, AND MESSRS, ALLEN, GARCIA, AND 
WOHNliAS (BY TELEPHONE), AND MS. SEKULA AND MS, 
RICHARDSON (BY TELEPHONE) TO REVIEW DRAFT 
RESPONSES TO COMMISSION'S FIRST SET OF DATA 
REQUESTS 

6/14117 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 0.30 $97.50 
NEWSPAPER AD PRIOR TO MEETING WITH CLIENTS 

{ 
6/14117 MRO L31 0 A 1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 0,20 $65.00 

RESPONSES TO STAFF'S FIRST SET OF DATA REQUESTS 
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61!4/17 KMG P400 Al04 REV JEW TARIFFS, APPLICATION, AND 5.30 $954.00 
NEWSPAPER NOTICEATKllNTIJCKY POWER WITH AMY 
ELLIOTT, STEPHEN SHARP, JUDY ROSQUIST, AND JOHN 
ROGNESS 

6/15!17 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF R. WOHNHAS 2.10 $577.50 

6/15117 KG! P400 A 106 PARTICIPA"!E IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.80 $220.00 
REVISED TESTIMONY OF R. WOI-INHAS 

--~-· 

6115/17 KG! P400 A104 PREPARE COMMENTS ON REVISED TESTIMONY 0.80 $220.00 
OF R .. WOHNHAS 

6115/17 KG! P400 A 103 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT NEWSPAPER 3.20 $880.00 
ADVERTISEMENT TO INCORPORATE RATES 

6/15117 MRO C300 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS, ELLIOTT 0.10 $32.50 
REPROPOSED SYSTEM SALES CLAUSE TARIFF 

6/15/17 MRO P400 AI 06 FOLLOW"UP WITH MS. RICHARDSON RE 0.50 $162.50 
PROPOSED TARIFF FILINGS 

6115117 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. BELL 0.20 $65.00 
AND CARR AND MS. BOOTH IN CONNECTION WITH MR. 
PIITLLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6115/17 MRO P400 AI03 REVISE APPLICATION BASED ON ruNE 14,2017 3.40 $1,105.00 
MEETING WITH CLIENTS AND UPDATED RATES 

6115/17 MRO P400 AI03 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT STATUTORY 0.90 $292.50 
N0'11CE 

6115/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS 0.70 $227.50 
SHARP, WOHNHAS, ROSS, ROGNESS, GARCIA, ROMINE, 
MS. RICHARDSON, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA TO 
REVIEW MR. WOHNHAS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

--·--·-·~-··-

6/15/I 7 MRO P400 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERlJNCE WITH MESSRS. 0.60 $195.00 
BELL, SHARP, PHILLIPS, ROGNESS, AND MS. ELLIOTT TO 
REVIEW MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6115/17 MRO P400 A107 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.30 $97.50 
MR. BELL RE MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6115117 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. WOHNHAS' 0.50 $162.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6115117 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 0.60 $195.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6116117 KGI P400 Al04 REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE NEWSPAPER 5.30 $1,457.50 
ADVERTISEMENT 

6116/17 KG! P400 AI06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.50 $137.50 
RECONCILIATION OF COST OF SERVICE AMOUNTS TO 
REVENUE REQUIREMENTS 

6/16117 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL DRAFT 0.90 $247,50 
TESTIMONY OF D. OSBORNE 

6/16/17 MRO P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LEGAL 3.90 $1,267.50 
( NOTICE 
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6/16/17 MRO P400 A106 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.80 $260.00 
MS. RICHARDSON AND MS. SEKULA RE LEGAL NOTICE 
lSSUES 

6/16/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.40 $130.00 
ROUSH, VAUGHAN, MS. WALSH, MS. ELLIOTf, MS. 
SEKULA, AND MS. RICHARDSON TO DISCUSS Tl-ffi LEGAL 
NOTICE AND APPLICATION 

----··-
6/16117 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR; ROUSH 0,\0 $32.50 

RE RATE CALCULATIONS 

6/16/17 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW APPLICATION TO COORDINATE WITH 1.30 $422.50 
LEGAL NOTICE 

61\71\7 KG! N 00 AI 04 COMPLETE COMMENTS ON DRAFT TESTIMONY 1.30 $357.50 
OF R. WOHNHAS 

6/18/!7 KG1 P400 A 104 REVlEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 1.70 $467.50 
TESTIMONY OF K. WALSH 

6/19/17 KG! P400 A106 PART!CIFATEIN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 1,60 $440.00 
REVISED DRAFT TESTIMONIES OF K. WALSH AND A, 
VAUGHAN 

6/19/17 KGI F400 A104 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF A. VAUGHAN 0.70 $I92.50 

6/I9/17 KGJ P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 0.70 $192.50 
TES'l1MONY OF A, ELLIOTT ... 

,' 

~ 6/19/17 KG! P400 AI06 PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN 0.30 $82.50 
'· CONFERENCE TO REVIEW POTENTIAL CHANGES TO 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS RELATING TO DEPOSIT 
WAIVERS 

6/19/17 KG! P400 A I 04 REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OF S. 0.90 $247.50 
SHARP 

6/19/17 MRO P400 AJ06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTT 0.20 $65.00 
RE TARIFFS 

6/\9/17 MRO P400 AI04 REV!EW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 0.80 $260 .. 00 
TESTIMONY OF MS. WALSH 

6/19/17 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 1.60 $520,00 
GARCIA, SHARI', ROGNESS, ROUSH, VAUGHAN, ROSS, 
MITCHELL, MS. ELLIOTT, MS. RJCHARDSON, MS. WALSH, 
AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW DRAFT TESTIMONY OF 
MESSRS. BUCK AND VAUGHAN AND MS. WALSH 

6/19117 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAPT 0.60 $195.00 
TESTIMONY Of MR. VAUGHAN 

6/19/17 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELL RE 0.30 $97.50 
MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/19/17 MRO L31 0 A 1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON ISSUES 1.40 $455,00 
PRESENTED BY DRAFT RESPONSE TO KPSC I-68 

--· 
6/19/17 MRO L3\0 Al06 COMMUNICATE WITH CLIENTS REDRAFT 0.30 $97.50 

RESPONSE TO KPSC 1-68 

6/19/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTT, 0.20 $65,00 
MS. ROSQUIST, AND MR. SHARP RE TARlFPS 
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( 
-----~-·-

6/19/17 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW REL!ABILI1Y METRICS PROVIDED BY 0.60 $195.00 
MS, BOOTH AND MR. BELL USED IN MR. PHILLIPS' DRAl'T 
TESTIMONY 

6/19117 MRO P400 A1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PH1LLlPS' 0.70 $227.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/20/17 KGI P400 A 104 PREPARE COMMENTS ON REVISED TESTIMONY 1.10 $302.50 
OFS. SHARP 

6/20/17 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED 2,30 $632.50 
TESTIMONY OF A. MCKENZIE 

--· 
6/20/17 KG! P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL DRAFT OF 0.80 $220.00 

TESTIMONY OF J, MCMANUS 

6/20/17 KG! P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 1.20 $330.00 
TESTIMONY OF A, VAUGHAN 

6/20/17 KGI P400 A I 04 REVIEW COMMISSlON PRECEDENT ON 0.90 $247.50 
RECOVERY OF PURCHASE POWER COSTS NOT 
RECOVERABLE THROUGH THE FUEL ADJUSTMENT 
CLAUSE IN BASE RATES FOR INCLUSION IN TESTIMONY 
OF A. VAUGHAN 

6/20/17 MRO L31 0 A 106 TELEPHONE CONJIERENCES WITH MS, SLOAN 0.00 $0.00 
AND MS. ROSQUIST RE DATA REQUEST FORMAT 

-------

6/20/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTI' 0.20 $65,00 
AND MR, SHARP REFORM OF TARIFFS FOR APPLICATION 

6/20/17 MRO P400 A I 04 REVIEW REGULATIONS AND ORDERS 0.60 -~195.00 
REGARDING DATA REQUEST REQUIREMENTS AT 
REQUEST OFMS, SLOAN 

6/20/17 MRO P400 A104REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR, PHlLL!PS' 3.30 $1,072.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/21117 KGI P400 A104 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF J. MCMANUS 0.20 $55.00 

6/21/17 KG! P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OF 2.00 $550.00 
TESTIMONY OFT, ROSS 

6/21/17 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. SHARP'S 0.20 $65.00 
DRAI'T TESTIMONY 

6/21/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/21117 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. WOHNHAS' 0,90 $292.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/21/17 MRO P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MS. WHrTE'S 0.10 $32.50 
COMMENTS REDRAFT APPLICATION 

6/21/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0,30 $97,50 
PHILLIPS, BELL, AND GARCIA RE MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

·-·-----· 
6/22/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF D, BUCK 0,90 $247,50 

~-----

( 6122/17 KGI P400 A I 06 PARTICII' ATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW L!O $302.50 
REVISED TESTIMONY OF D. BUCK 
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6/22/17 KG! P400 Al06 PARTICIPATE lN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 1.00 $275.00 
DESCRJPTION OF REVENUE REQUIREMENT CHANGE 
REQUEST 

6/22/17 KG! P400 A!06 PARTICIPATE lN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.70 $]92.50 
REVISED TESTIMONY OF R. WOI!NHAS 

6/22/17 MRO P400 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.10 $32.50 
REDRAFT APPLICATION 

6/22/17 MRO P400 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.10 $32.50 
RB MR. PIIILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/22/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCEWITH MS. SEKULA O.IO $32,50 
REAPPLICATION 

--·--
6/22117 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 2.70 $877.50 

DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/22/17 MRO P400 A 106 'IELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. GARCIA 0.20 $65.00 
RB DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/22/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 1.10 $357.50 
VAUGHAN, GARCIA, BUCK, MS. RICHARDSON, AND MS, 
SEKULA TO REVIEW MR. BUCK'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/22/17 MRO P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. BUCK'S 0,80 $260.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

·-·--

( 6/22/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.40 $130.00 
WOHNHAS RE MR. BUCK'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/22/17 MRO P400 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS, 0.90 $292.50 
BUCK, ALLEN, WOHNHAS, MS. RICHARDSON, AND MS. 
SEKULA TO REVIEW THE APPLlCA T!ON 

6/22/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, 0.70 $227.50 
WOHNHAS RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY AND APPLICATION 

612.2117 MRO P400 A106TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ROSQUIST 0.20 $65.00 
RE STATUTORYNOTICEANDTARIFFS 

6/23/17 KGl P400 A!04 REVIEW UPDATED VERSION OF TESTIMONY OF 0.50 $137.50 
K. WALSH 

_,._. __ 
6/23/17 KG! P400 Al 04 REVIEW UPDATED VERSION OF APPLICATION 0.60 $165.00 

6/23/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW REVISED TEST!MONY OF D. BUCK 0.90 $247.50 

6/23/17 KG! P400 A 106 PREPARE FOR, TRAVEL TO AND FROM, AND 4.90 $1,347.50 
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW FILING 
REQUIREMENTS, APPI.ICA T!ON, AND FINANCIAL EXHJBff 

6/23117 MRO P400 AI 06 COMMUNICATE WITH MS. ROSQUIST RE 0.!0 $32.50 
STATUTORYNOT!CEFOR FILING 

6/23117 MRO L250 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0,20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS RE SUBSEQUENT Fll.INGS TO REFLECT 
REFINANCINGS 

i 6/23/17 MRO P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR PHILLIPS' 1.10 $357.50 

' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/23/17 MRO P400 Al 03 REVISE DRAFT APPLICATION !.40 $455,00 
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( 
6/23/17 MRO P400 AI 07 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 0.20 $65.00 

RICHARDSON, MS. ELLIOTT AND MESSRS. ROSS, 
ROGNESS, SHARP, BRUBAKER, HUMMEL, HOLMES TO 
REVIEW RECONCTLIA TION OF RATE BASE AND 
CAPITALIZATION 

6/23/17 MRO L190 A107 COMMUNICATE WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL'S 0,10 $32.50 
OFFICE RE MEETING TO DISCUSS RATE CASE 
APPLICA TJON 

6123/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FILING 0.90 $292.50 
REQUIREMENTS EXHIBITS AT KENTUCKY POWER'S 
OFFICES 

--"''"-· 
6/23/17 MRO 1'400 A106 MUL TJPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 1.60 $520.00 

MESSRS. WOHNHAS, ROGNESS, SHARP, GARCIA, 
HOLMES, VAUGHAN, BUCK, ROUSH, CASH, MS. 
RICHARDSON, MS.SEKULA, AND MS. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW 
DRAFT AI' PLICATION 

6/23/17 MRO P400 AI 06 MEET BY TELEPHONE AND IN pERSON WITH 0.80 $260.00 
MESSRS. VAUGHAN, ROUSH, WOHNHAS, MS. 
RICHARDSON, MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW SECTION IV 
(FINANCIAL EXHIBIT) 

-···-·· 

6/23/17 MRO P400 Al03 REVISE STATUTORY NOTICE 0,10 $32.50 

6/24/17 KG! P400 Al03 REVIEW AND REVISE STATORY NOTICE 0.60 $165.00 
·--

6124/17 KG! P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FINAL DRAFTS OF 2.10 $577.50 
CLEAN AND STRIKETHROUGH TARIFFS 

6/24117 MRO P400 A 103 REVISE APPLICATION TO REFLECT COMMENTS 2.40 $780.00 
RECEIVED ON JUNE 23 AND EARLIER 

6/24/17 MRO P400 A I 03 REVISE AND PREPARE STATUTORY NOTICE 0.50 $162.50 

6/25/17 KG! P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON FILING 1.10 $302.50 
REQUIREMENTS DOCUMENT 

6/25/17 KG\ P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISE DRAFT 0.60 $165.00 
TESTIMONY OF A. VAUGHAN 

6/26117 KG1 P400 AI04 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF M. 2.30 $632.50 
SATTERWHITE 

6/26/17 KG! ?400 A 106 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCES TO REVIEW 1.90 $522.50 
REVISIONS AND COMMENTS ON TESTIMONY OF M. 
SATTERWHITE 

6/26/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE TESTIMONY 0.40 $110.00 
AND EXHIBITS OF B. HALT. 

6/26/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONfERENCE WlTH MESSRS. 0.90 $292.50 
WOHNHAS, SHARP, HORELED, ROGNESS, MS. ELLIOT, MS. 
RICHARDSON, AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW MR. 
SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6126/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MS. ELLIOTT 0,20 $65,00 

( 
6/26/17 MRO 

RE APPL!CA TION 

P400 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, 0,20 $65,00 
ROSQUIST REDRAFT TARIFFS 

-----·· 
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FILE NUMilER: lill057-KE315 PAGE 9 
INVOICE NO: 1337749 

( 
INVOICE DATE; JULY 7,2017 

6/26/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR. 0.20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS RE MR. SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6126/17 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MULTIPLE 2.40 $780.00 
REVISED DRAFTS OF MR. SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

------
6/26117 MRO P400 Al06 PARTICIPATE IN SECOND TELEPHONE 0,50 $162.50 

CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. WOHNHAS, GARCIA, 
ROGNESS, HORELED, AND MS. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW MR. 
SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/26117 MRO Ll90 A I 07 COMMUNICATE WITH MR. CHANDLER RE 0.20 $65.00 
MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE 

6/26117 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0,60 $!95,00 
SATTER WHITE, SHARP, ROGNESS, WOHNHAS, HORELED, 
AND MS. ELLIOTT FOR FINAL REVIEW OF REVISED 
DRAFT OF MR. SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/26/17 MRO F400 A lOG MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH MS. 0.20 $65.00 
ELLIOTT AND MR. JOHNSON RE OFFERING STATEMENTS 

6/26/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. GARCIA 0,20 $65.00 
RE MR. SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/26/17 MRO P400 A 103 REVISE APPLICATION 0.50 $162.50 

6/26/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS o. 10 $32.50 
/ RE APPLICATION I 

6126/17 MRO L120 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS RE MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL'S 
OFFICE 

6127117 KG! L430 A !03 DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION FOR DEVIATION 1,10 $302.50 
FROM FILING REQUIREMENTS 

6/27117 KG! P400 A 104 PARTICIPATE IN FINAL REVIEW OF 5.20 $1,~30.00 
DOCUMENTS TO BE FILED IN CASE 

6/27/17 MRO P400 A I 06 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.70 $227.50 
MS. ELLIOTT AND MR. SHARP REDRAFT APPLICATION 

6/27117 MRO P400 A I 04 FURTHER REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. 0.80 $260.00 
SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

6/27/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITI-1 MESSRS. 0.30 $97.50 
ROSS, HUMMEL, ROGNESS, ROUSH, VAUGHAN, 
BRUBAKER, MS. RICHARDSON, MS. ELLIOTT, MS. WALSH, 
AND MS. SEKULA TO ADDRESS SECTION IV OF 
APPLICATION 

-----
6/27/17 MRO 1'400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON COMPLETE 2.60 $845.00 

APPLICATION, INCLUDING SECTIONS II THROUGH V, AT 
KENTUCKY POWER'S OFFICES 

---· ·---
6/27117 MRO L190 Al07 MEET WITH MS. GOODMAN, MS. NAPIER. AND 1.90 $6l7.50 

MESSRS. CHANDLER AND COOK AT ATTORNEY 

.{ 
GENERAL'S OFFICE TO DISCUSS APPLICATION AND CASE 

6127/17 MRO L190 AIOI PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH ATTORNEY 1.20 $390.00 
GENERAL'S OFFICE TO DISCUSS APPLICATION AND CASE 
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FILE NUMBER: KE057-KE315 PAGE 10 
INVOICE NO: 1337749 
INVOICE DATE: JULY 7, 2017 

f ... ~ .. -·--
\ 6/27/17 MRO P400 A 103 FINAL REVIEW AND REVISION OF DRAFT 0.70 $227.50 

APPLICATION 

6(27/17 KMG P400 A I 04 REVIEW FINAL FILING REQUIREMENTS AND 5.10 $918.00 
EXHIBITS, TESTIMONY, AND APPLICATION EXHIBITS AT 
KENTUCKY POWER IN PREPARATION FOR FILING OF 2017 
RATE CASE 

6/28/17 KGI P400 AI 04 REVIEW FINAL FILING PACKAGE AND READ 1.30 $357.50 
FIRST LETTER 

6/28/17 MRO P400 A 106 MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH MESSRS, 1.90 $617.50 
SHARP AND ROGNESS, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. ROSQUIST 
RE FILING 

-~--------

6/28/17 MRO L310 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. SLOAN RE 0.10 $32.50 
DISCOVERY ISSUES 

6/28/17 MRO L250 AI03 REVISE MOTION TO DEVIATE 0.40 $130.00 

6/28/l 7 MRO L250 A I 03 REVISE READl ST FILE 0.20 $65.00 

6/28/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR 0.20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS RE FILING AND MEETING WlTII ATTORNEY 
GENERAL TO DISCUSS FILING 

6/28/17 MRO L250 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.40 $130.00 
WOHNHAS AND MILLER TO DISCUSS MR. MILLER'S 
DRAFT TESTIMONY. 

{ 6/28/17 MRO L31 0 A I 04 BEGIN REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 0.80 $260.00 
DATA REQUEST RESPONSES 

6/28117 MRO L450 AI OJ BEGIN IDENTIFYING ISSUES FOR CROSS- 0.90 $292.50 
EXAMINATION OF MR. SATTERWHITE 

6/28/17 MR.O L250 AI 06 COMMUNICATE WITH MR. SHARP AND MS. 0.10 $32.50 
ELLIOTT REMOTION TO DEVIATE 

6/28/17 MRO L250 A 1 06 MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH MS. 0.20 $65.00 
ROSQUJST, MR. ROGNESS, AND MR. SHARP RE FILING 
FOR READ I ST FILE 

6/28/17 MRO P400 A!06 ADDRESSES ISSUES RESECTION V OF 0.40 $130.00 
APPLICATIONA104 

6/29/17 KGI L310 A104 REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSES OF J. ROGNESS TO 0.70 $192.50 
FIRST SET OF STAFF DATA REQUESTS 

6/29/17 KGl L310 AI06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.80 $220.00 
DRAFT RESPONSES OF J. ROGJ-,TESS TO FIRST SET OF 
STAFF DATA REQUESTS 

6/29/17 KGI L120 AI04 REVIEW TESTIMONY FOR WITNESS TRAINING l.OO $275.00 
PREPARATIONS 

fi/29/17 MRO L31 0 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.10 $32.50 
RE DATA REQUEST RESPONSES 

6129/17 MRO L31 0 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 0.60 $195.00 

' 
RESPONSES BY MR. ROGNESS TO STAFF'S FIRST SET OF 

I DATA REQUESTS 
' ·--
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INVOICE NO: 1337749 
INVOICE DATE: JULY 7, ~017 

6/291!7 MRO L3l0 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WlTH MESSRS. 0,20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS, GARCIA, ROGNESS, WELSH, AND MS. SEKULA 
TO REVIEW DRAFT DATA REQUEST RESPONSES 

61291!7 MRO P400 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WffH MS. ROSQUIST 0,10 $32.50 
RE FILING REQUIREMENTS 

6/29/17 MRO L250 A l 04 BEGIN REVIEW OF ISSUES FOR MR. MILLER'S 0.40 $130.00 
SUPPLEMENTAL TESTIMONY 

6129117 MRO 1450 A I 01 CONTINUE TO PREPARE BRIEFER'S CARDS FOR 1.70 $552.50 
MR. SATTERWHITE'S CROSS-EXAMINATlON 

6/30/!7 KG! L310AI04llliVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 1.00 $275,00 
RESPONSES TO STAFF DATA REQUESTS FROM J. 
BARTSCH AND J. CASH 

6/30/17 KG! L310 Al06 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 0,50 $137.50 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSES TO STAFF 
FIRST SET OF DATA REQUESTS TO J. BARTSCH AND J. 
CASH 

6/30/!7 MRO L310 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 0.60 $195.00 
RESPONSES TO DATA REQUESTS BY MESSRS. BARTSCH 
AND CASH 

6/30/17 MRO L31 0 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.50 $162.50 
CASH, GARCIA, BARTSCH, SHARP, ROGNESS, MS. 
ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW MESSRS. CASH 
AND BARTSCH'S DRAFT DATA REQUEST RESPONSES 

6/30117 MRO Ll90 AlOI WORK WITH MR. ROSQUIST AND ASSIST WITH 0,90 $292,50 
FILING PAPER COPIES OF RATE CASE APPLJCA TION 

6/30117 MRO L45o A I 01 WORK TO IDENTIFY ISSUES FOR MR. 5.20 $1,690.00 
SATTERWHITE 

6/30117 MRO Ll90 AI07 COMMUNlCATE WITH COUNSEL FOR KIUC 0.20 $65.00 
AND ATTORNEY GENERAL RE NON-DISCLOSURE 
AGREEMENT AND ELECTRONIC COPIES OF APPLICA 'J'ION 

BALANCE $62 929.00 

ADlllTIONAL SERVICES: 
MATTER NO. KE057-KE315 2016 RATE CASE 

AEP LA WP ACK MATTER NO. AEPD053942 

( 
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FILE NUMBER: KEOS7-KE315 
13;37749 
JULY 7, 2017 

INVOICE NO: 
INVOICE DATE: 

06/]5/17 

06/20/17 

SUBTOTAL 

AMOUNT DUE 

SECRETARY OF STATE 

KENNETH G!SH FOR TRAVEL TO AND FROM FRANKFORT, KY ON 
06-06-2017 TO PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 
APPLICATION, TARIFFS AND FILING REQUIREMENTS DOCUMENT 

KENNETH GJSH FOR MILEAGE (59.81 MILES@ $0.535/MILE) TO AND 
FROM FRANKFORT, KY ON 06-14-2017 TO PARTICIPATE IN 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW TREATMENT OF CREDITS FROM FLY 
ASH SALES, APPLICATION, NEWSPAPER ADVERTISEMENT AND 
TARIFFS 

COPIES 23 Copied pages at $0.04 cents/page by OVERSTREET MAR!C 

COPIES 4!00 Copied pages at $0.04 cents/page by Lexington DTI 

KENNETH GISH FOR MILEAGE (59.81 MILES@ $0.535/MILE) TO AND 
FROM FRANKFORT, KY ON 06-23·2017 TO PARTICIPATE IN 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW FILING REQUIREMENTS, APPLICATION, 
AND 1·1NANCIAL EXHIBIT 

KENNETH GISH FOR MILEAGE (59,81 MILES@ $0,535/MILE) TO 
PARTICIPATE IN FINAL REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS TO BE FILED TN 
CASE 

TOTAL ADDlTlON AL SERVICES 

PAGE 12 

$63,261,92 

$63,261.92 
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FILE NUMBER: 
INVOICE NO: 
INVOICE DATE: 

KE057-KE315 
1337749 
JUI..¥7,2017 

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY 

R. OVERSTREET 325.00 101.90 

180.00 24.30 

TOTALS 218.70 

PLEASE INCLUDE ON YOUR CHECK OUR REFERENCE NUMBER 
WHICH APPEARS BELOW THE INVOICE NUMBER ON THIS INVOICE, 

INVOICES ARE DUE ON RECEIPT. 

IF PAYMllNT IS MADE BY WIRE REM ITT ANC£, PLEASE DIRECT TO: 

STITES & HARBISON 
l'NC 
LOUISVILLE, KY. 40202 
BANKABAil: .. 
ACCOUNT#: 

PLEASE REFERENCE YOUR MATTER NO, KE057-KE315, INVOICE NO, 1337749 

PAGE 13 
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STITES Bt HARBISON PLLC 

~-"'''~'oi!t-.;;'(,;&<\',.~ iifl,l,'j~~·tl!it\>ll'll<lt.~~ 

ATTORN€VS 

421 WEST MAIN STREET 
P.O. BOX634 
PRANKFOR'f, KY 40602-9634 
(502) '223-3477 
FAX (502) 223-4124 
WWW.STITES.COM 

KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 
RANIE K. WOHNHAS 
POBOX5190 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602-5190 

RE: 2016 RATE CASE 
AEPLAWPACKMAITERNO. AEPD053942 

KE057-KE315 

MRO 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES, for the period endtl(! 

Fees for legal services rendered in cmmectlon with 

MAY31,2017 

the above captioned matter through MAY 31, 2017 
and as reflected by the attached summary 

Additional Services 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE 

Jl)NE 8, 2017 

INVOICE NO, 133')207 

TAXID;~ 

TEllMSJ PAY ABLE l)PQN RF.Cf!IP'f 

$83,025.50 

$136.00 

$83,161.50 

Alexandria, VA Atlnnta, GA Frankfurt, KY Jefft:rsmwllle, IN Lexington, KY Louisville, KY Nashville, TN Washington, DC 
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STITES &HARBISON PLLC 
p;,~IJ>I!..,_lN'~'<==.'.';r'~..t.!'t. ~tl.'itu.!t.~.e:>l~ 

AITilllNEVS 

421 WEST MAIN STREET 
P.O. BOX634 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602-0634 
(502) 223-3477 
Fax (502) 223-4124 
Yo-'WW.st1tell-.com 

JUNE 8, 2017 
KENTUCKY POWER COMPANY 
RANIE K. WOHNHAS 
PO BOX5190 
FRANKFORT, KY 40602-5190 MRO 

JNYOICB #: 1333207 
OUR REFERENCE#: 5 

OUR TAXID#: 

PIWFESSlONAL SERVICES THROUGH MAY 31,2017 

MATTER NO. KE057-KE315 2016 RATE CASE 
AEP LA WPACK MATTER NO. AEPD053942 

--~-

5/1/17 KG1 L120 A106PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.50 $137.50 
CLASS Sl)BSIDIES 

5/1/17 KOl P400 AIQ4 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 4.50 $1,237.50 
OF TESTIMONY OF S. SHARP IN LIGHT OF REVISED 
TARIFF SHEETS 

5/1/17 KG! P400 A1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED 0.40 $ll0.00 
TESTIMONY OF J. BARTSCH 

5/1/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.10 $32.50 
RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/1/17 MRO Ll20 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. MO $195.00 
SATTERWHITE, WOHNHAS,ROUSH, VAUGHAN, SPAETH, 
SHARP, ROGNESS, MS. SEKULA, AND MS. ELIJOTT TO 

, ADDRESS REVENUE ALLOCATION 

5/1/17 MRO . Ll20 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.20 $65,00 
SATTERWHITE AND WOHNHAS RE RATE CASE 
STRATEGY 

5/1/17 MRO Ll90 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 
WOHNHAS RE POSSIBLE MEETING WITH ATTORNEY 
GENERAL 

5/1/17 MRO L 190 AI 07 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, 0.10 $32.50 
CHANDLERRE POSSIBLE MEETING WITH ATTORNEY 
GENERAL 

5/1117 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MS. OSBORNE'S 0.70 $227,50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

! 

I 

I 
! ' 

I 
l 

I 
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FILE NUMBER: KE~57-KE315 PAGE 2 
INVOICE NO: 1333207 

.. ·· INVOICE DATE: JUNE 8,2Q17 

( 
S/2117 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT o.so $220.00 

TESTIMONY OF p, OSBORNE 

S/2117 KG! P400 A 1 06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.40 $110.00 
REVISED TESTIMONY OF J. l;!ARTSCH 

5/2/17 KG1 P400 Al06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 1.30 $357.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY OF D. OSBORNE 

5/2/17 KG! P400 At 06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 1.40 $385.00 
REVISED DRAFT OF RESPONSE TO COMMENTS 

5!2117 MRO L 190 AI07 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR 0.20 $65.00 
KIUC AND MR. WOHNHAS RE RATE CASE 

5!2117 MRO C300 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR. 0.20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS RE TELEPHONIC MEETING WITH COUNSEL 
FORKIUC 

512/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.40 $130.00 
ROMINE, GARCIA, ROSS, SHARP, ROUSCH, BARTSCH, 
HORELED, ROGNESS, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA TO 
REVIEW MR BARSTCH'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/2/17 MRO P400 A1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 1.40 $455.00 
ROUSH, SHARP, ROMINE, HORBLED, WOHNHAS, 
MCMANUS, ROGNESS, oARCIA, MS. WHITE, MS. 
OSBORNE, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW 
MS. OSBORNE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

~ . 
/ 

5/2117 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. GARCIA 1.40 $455.00 ' \-
RE MR. BARTSCH'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/2/17 MRO P400 A1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ROSQUIST 0.20 $65.00 
RECAP A CITY AND ENERGY TARIFF 

5/3/17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISE)) 2.80 $770.00 
TESTIMONY OF S. SHARP 

5/3117 MRO P400 AJ 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ROSQUlST 0.10 $32.50 
RE CAPACITY AND ENERGY TARIFF 

5/3/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.30 $97.50 
WOHNHAS RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/4117 KG1 P400 Al06 CONFERENCE WITH T, ROSS TO REVIEW 0.70 $192.50 
QUESTIONS ON DRAPT TESTIMONY 

5/4/17 KG1 P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 3.20 $880.00 
TESTIMONY OFT. ROSS 

514117 KG! P400 Al03 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT NEWSPAPER 2.70 $742.50 
ADVERTISEMENT 

5/4/17 MRO P400 A !06 MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH MS. 0.60 $195.00 
ROSQIJIST, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MESSRS. SHARP AND 
ROGNESS RE NEWSPAPER NOTICE AND TARIFFS 

5/5117 KG! P400 A 104 COMPLETE REVIEW OF DRAFT TESTIMONY OF 2.60 $715.00 
A. VAUGHAN 

t_ 515/17 KG! P400 Al04 PREPARE COMMENTS ON DRAFT TESTIMONY 4.10 $1,127.50 
OF A. VAUGHAN 
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HLE NUMBER; KEQ57-KE315 PAGE 3 
INVOICE NO: 13332Q7 
INVOICE OATE; JUNE8,2017 

5/5/17 KG! P400AIQ6 CONFERBNCEWITf[A. VAUGHAN TQREVIEW 0.50 $137.50 
QUESTIONS ON DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/5117 MRO P400 Al06 MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH MR. Q.10 $32.50 
VAUQHAN AND Mi>. ELLIOTT RE ENVIRONMENTAL 
COMPLIANCE PLAN 

5/5/17 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMEN!' ON MR PHILLIPS' o.so $260.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/5/17 MRO Ll90 A 107 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, 0,10 $32,50 
CHANDLERRE MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL'S 
OFFICE 

5/6117 KG! P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND REVISE NEWSPAPER 3.40 $935.00 
ADVERTISEMENT 

5/7/17 KGl P400 A 104 REVIEW AND REVISE NEWSPAPER 2.90 $797.50 
ADVERTISEMENT TO INCORPORATE RATE CHANGE 
INFORMATION 

517/17 MRO P400 Al 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.30 $97.50 
RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/8/17 KGl P400 Al 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 0.60 $165.00 
TESTIMONY OF A. ELLIOTT 

518/l7 KGl P400 A106 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 7.8() $2,145.00 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW AND UPDATE NEWSPAPER 
ADVERTISEMENT 

518117 KG! P400 Al 04 REVIEW AND UPDATE NEWSPAPER AD TO 3.10 $852.50 
INCORPORATE CHANGES FROM CONFERENCE AND 
REOARDING CHANGES IN PROPOSED RATES 

518117 MRO P400 Al 06 MEET WIT!! MS. ELLIOTT, MS. RoSQUIST, AND 6.60 $2,145.00 
MESSRS. SHARP AND ROGNESS TO REVIEW AND 
COMMENT ON NEWSPAPER NOTICE 

518/17 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON VEGETATioN 0.20 $65,00 
MANAGEMENT ISSUE IN MRPHILL!PS' DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

518117 MRO P400 AI 04 BEGIN REVIEW AND COMMENT O}j 0.60 $195.00 
MR.WOHNHAS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/8117 MRO P400 A1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITil MR. 0.20 $65.00 
VAUGHAN RE RATE TABLES FOR LEGAL NOTICE 

5/9117 KG! P400 Al 06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.50 $137.50 
REVISED DRAFT TESTIMONY oF A. ELLIOTT 

519/17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OFT. 0.40 $110.00 
ROSS 

5/9117 KG! P400 A106 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.60 $165.00 
REVISED DRAFT OF TESTIMONY OFT. ROSS 

5/9/17 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE NEWSPAPER 5.90 $1,622.50 
ADVERTISEMENT 

( 
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INVOICE DATE: JUNE8,2Q17 

{ 
5/9/17 MRO P409 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. Q.5Q $11)2,50 

ROSS, ROMINE, SHARP, ()ARCJA, ROGNESS, MS. ELLIOTT, 
AND MS. DIGIOIA PEREZ TO REVIEW MS. ELLIOTT'S 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

--····-·--
5/9/I7 MRO P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. ROSS' DRAFT l.lO $357.50 

TESTIMONY 

5/9[17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.60 $195.00 
ROSS, ROMINE, GARCIA, ALLEN, MITCHELL, WOHNHAS, 
ROGNESS, HOLMES, BRUBAKER, MS. ELLIOTT, MS. 
RICHARDSON, AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW MR. ROSS' 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/9/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 2.40 $780.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/9/17 MRO P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LEGAL 2.80 $910.00 
NOTICE TO BE PUBLISHED IN NEWSPAPERS 

--·--
519/17 MRO P400AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 

VAUGHAN RBK-12 RATES IN DRAFT LEGAL NOTICE 
----· 
5/9/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR- 0.20 $65,00 

ROSQUIST REDRAFT LEGAL NOTICE 

5/1 0/17 KGI P400 A 104 REVIEW REVISED DRAFT TESTIMONY OF S. 0.90 $247.50 
SHARP 

( 
.. 5/10/17 KG1 P400Al06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.70 $192,50 

REVISED DRAFT TESTIMONIES OF S. SHARP AND J. 
ROGNESS 

5/10/17 KGJ P400 A 104 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONIES OF A. 1.70 $467.50 
VAUGHAN AND M. SPAETH 

5/I0/17 KGI P400 Al06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW !.60 $440.00 
REVISED TESTIMONIES OF A. VAUGHAN AND M. SPAETH 

5/10/17 KG1 P400 A I 06 CONFERENCE WITH B. HALL TO REVIEW o.so $137.50 
POTENTIAL CHANGES TO TESTIMONY TO ACCOUNT FOR 
NEW GRANT AWARDS AND NEW ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT ACTIVITIES 

5{!0/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.60 $195.00 
GANT, ROMINE, ROSS, MERTZ, HORELED, ROGNESS, 
SHARP, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW THE 
DRAFT TESTIMONY OF MESSRS. SHARP AND ROGNESS 

5!10/17 MRO Ll20 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.50 $162.50 
WOHNHAS RE RATE CASE STRATEGY 

5/10/17 MRO P400 AI 04 COMPLETE REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. 1.20 $390.00 
PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/10/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 1.70 $552.50 
SPAETH, ROMINE, SHARP, VAUGHAN, ROGNESS, 
BRUBAKER, GARCIA, HORELED, MS. WALSH, MS. 
ELLIOT!', AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW THE DRAFT 
TESTIMONY OF MESSRS. SPAEfH AND VA UOHAN 

{ 5/10/17 MRO P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. WOHNHAS' 2.20 $7!5.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 
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INVOICE OATE: JUNEs~ 2011 

( I ' 5/10/17 MRO P400 A I 04 81;\GlN REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. 0,60 $195.00 ! SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY ! 

5/10/17 MRO P4QO AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTI' 0,30 $97.50 
I 
l 

RE FILING REQUIREMENTS I 
5/ll/17 KGI P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LATEST VERSION 0.80 $220.00 

OF TESTIMONY OF A. ELLIOTT 

5/11/17 KOl P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED VERSION 1.40 ' $3&5.00 
OF TESTIMONY OF S, SHARP 

5/11/17 KOl P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT 1.20 $330.00 
TESTIMONY OF M. SPAETH 

5/1 1/17 MRO P400 AI 03 DRAFT AND REVISE CERTIFICATION OF 0.60 $195.00 
COMPLIANCE FOR. RATE CASE 

5/11/17 MRO P400 AI 04 CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. 5.70 $1,852.50 
SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/11/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 1.00 $325.00 
BELL, WOHNHAS, AND PTIILLIPS TO REVIEW MR. 
PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/ll/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTT 0.20 $65.00 
AND MR ,SHARP RE FILING REQUIREMENTS 

5/11/17 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 0.40 $130.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

I 5112117 KG! P400 Al06 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 6.10 $1,677.50 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW AND l)PDATE FILING 
REQUJREMENTS DOCUMENT AND TARIFFS 

5/12/17 KG! P400 Al04 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 0,80 $220.00 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW REVISED DRAFT TESTIMONY 
OF D. OSBORNE 

5/12117 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. OSllORNE, 0.70 $227.50 
MS. ELLIOTT, MS. SEKULA, MS. WHITE AND MESSRS. 
MITCHELL, ROMINE, ROGNESS, AND SHARP TO REVIEW 
MS. OSBORNE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/12/17 MRO P400 A 106 MEET WITH MESSRS. ROGNESS AND SHARP 2.50 $812.50 
AND MS. ELLIOTT AND MS. ROSQUIST AT KENTUCKY 
POWER'S OFFICES TO REVIEW DRAFT FILING 
REQUIREMENTS 

5/12/17 MRO P400 Al06 MEET WITH MESSRS. ROGNESS AND SHARP 2.80 $910.00 
AND MS. ELLIOTT AND MS. ROSQU!ST AT KENTUCKY 
POWER'S OFFICES TO REVIEW DRAFT TARlFFS 

5/12/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.30 $97.50 
WOHNHAS RE MS. OSBORNE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/12117 MRO P400 A103 REVISE CERTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE 0.40 $130.00 

5/12117 MRO P400AI04 CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. 0.50 $162.50 
SATTER WHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/12/17 MRO L 190 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 
WOHNHAS RE MEETING WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL'S 
OFFICE 
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( 
5/12/17 MRO P400 Al 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MS. OSBORNE'S 0.50 $162.50 

DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/12/17 KMG P400 Al 04 REVIEW DRAFT FILING REQUIREMENTS FOR 5.60 $1,008.00 
2017BASE RATE CASE AND DRAFT TARIFF REVISIONS AT 
KENTUCKY POWER MEETING WITH MARK OVERSTREET, 
KEN GISH, AMY ELLIOTT, JOHN ROGNESS, STEPHEN 
SHARP, AND JUDY ROSQUIST 

5/13117 MRO P400 A 104 COMPLETE REVIEW AND COMMENT ON 2.30 $747.50 
SECOND DRAFT OF MR. SATTERWHITE'S TESTIMONY 

5/13/17 MRO P400 A103 CONTINUE TO DRAFT APPLICATION 1.90 $6!7,50 

5/14/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 3.60 $990.00 
TES'JlMONIES OF M. SPAETH, J. MCMANUS, AND Z, 
MILLER 

~~-.----· 

5/14/17 MRO P400 Al 03 CONTINUE TO DRAFT AND REVISE 3.70 $1,202.50 
APPLICATION 

5/l5/17 KG! P400 Al 06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.40 $110.00 
REVISED TESTIMONY OF Z. MILLER 

5/15/17 KG! P400 Al06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.20 $55.00 
REVISED TESTIMONY OF A. MCKENZIE __ , .. ____ 

5/15/17 KG! P400Al06 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 1.40 $385.00 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONIES OF M. 

{ 
SPAETH AND A. VAUGHAN 

5/15/17 KG! P400 A! 04 REVIEW AND REVISE TESTIMONY OF B. HALL 1.20 $330.00 
TO INCORPORATE UPDATED GRANT INFORMATION 

5/15/17 KG! P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED 2,50 $687,50 
TESTIMONY OF S, SHARP 

5/15/17 KG! P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED 1.70 $467,50 
TESTIMONY OF J. ROGNESS 

5/15/!7 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED 0.60 $165,00 
TESTIMONY OF A MCKENZIE 

5/!5/17 MRO P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LATEST DRAFT OF 3,60 $1,170.00 
MR. PHJLLIPS' TESTIMONY 

5/15/17 MRO P400Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELLRE 0,10 $32.50 
VEGETATION MANAGEMENT PORTION OF MR. PHILLIPS' 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/15/17 MRO P400 AI06 MEET WITH MESSRS. WOHNHAS AND 1.20 $390.00 
SATTERWHITE TO REVIEW MR. SATTERWHJTE'S DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

5/16117 KG! P400 AI06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 1.10 $302,50 
DRAFT TESTIMONIES OF R. WOHNHAS, J. ROGNESS, AND 
S,SHARP 

5/16117 KG1 P400 AI 06 CONFERENCE WITH .f. ROGNESS TO REVIEW 0,40 $110.00 
COMMENTS ON DRAFT TESTIMONY 

( 5/16/17 KGl P400 A 106 CONFERENCE WITH J. COLLEY TO REVIEW 0.40 $!!0.00 
DRAFT TESIMONY AND EXHIBITS OF B. HALL 
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INVOICE I)ATE: JUNE8,2017 I 

\ 5/16/17 KG! P400 A106 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 1.50 $412.50 I 
DRAFT TESTIMONY OF M. SATTERWHITE 

5/]6/17 KG! P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT ().80 $220.00 
TESTIMONY OF R. WOHNHAS 

5/16117 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW ANl) UPDATE DRAFT TESTIMONY OF 4.30 $1,182.50 
M. SATTER WHITE 

5/16/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS 1.20 $390.00 
GANT, SHARP, WOHNHAS, ROUSH, CASH, ROSS, GARCIA, 
BRUBAKER, MITCHELL, ROGNESS, HORELED, MS. 
SEKULA, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. RICHARDSON TO 
REVIEW THE DRAFT TESTIMONIES OF MESSRS. 
WOHNHAS, SHARP, AND ROGNESS 

5/16/17 MRO P400 A 106 FOUR TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR. 0.90 $292.50 
BELL RE MR. PHILLIPS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/16/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 1.50 $487.50 
SATTERWHITE, GARCIA, ROMINE, ROSS, PHILLIPS, 
MITCHELL, BRUBAKER, SHARP, HORELED, BACHA, 
ROGNESS, ROUSH, MS. RICHARDSON, MS. ELLIOTT, AND 
MS, SEKULA TO REVIEW MR. SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

5/16/17 MRO P400 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 
WOHNHAS RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

,( 5/16/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. WOHNHAS' 0.90 $292.50 
t DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/16117 MRO P400 A103 REVISE DRAFT APPLICATION 0.10 $32.50 

5/16117 MRO P400 A1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 4.70 $1,527.50 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

----·--
5117/17 KGI P400A106 PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN 0,60 $165.00 

CONFERENCE TO REVIEW ADDITIONS TO TESTIMONY OF 
A, CARLIN TO ADDRESS REDUCTIONS IN BENEFITS 
EXPENSE 

5/17/17 KGl P400 Al06 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 1.30 $357.50 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONIES OF B. 
HALL, R. WOHNHAS, AND M. SATTERWHITE 

5/17!17 KG! P400 AI 03 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT TESTIMONIES OF 2.50 $687.50 
M. SATTERWHITE AND B. HALL TO INCORPORATE 
CHANGES FROM REVIEW SESSION 

5/17117 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW CHANGES TO GREEN PRICING OPTION 0.50 $137,50 
RIDER 

5/17/17 KGJ P400 AI04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON UPDATED 2.40 $660.00 
VERSION OF TESTIMONY OF A. VAUGHAN 

5/J 7/17 MRO P400 A106 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.60 $195.00 
MR. WOHNHAS RH HIS AND MR. CARLIN'S DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

( 5/l?/17 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR. 0.20 $65,00 
' ROGNESS REAPPLICATION DATA 
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( 
5/17/17 MRO P400 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELL RE 0.10 $32.50 

MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5117/17 MRO !>400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 1.60 $520.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/17/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. !.SO $5&5.00 
SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/17/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.50 $162.50 
GARCIA, WOHNHAS, CARLIN, AND HEALEY TO REVIEW 
MR. CARLIN'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/17117 MRO P400A104 COMMENT ON TARIFF R,P,O, 0.20 $65.00 

5/17/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS, 1.20 $390.00 
l ROMINE, ROSS, WOHNHAS, VAUGHAN, BRUBAKER, ) 

MITCHELL, GARCIA, HORELED, ROGNESS, MS. ELLIOTT, 
MS. RICHARDSON, AND MS. SEKULA TO REVIEW DRAFT 
TESTIMONIES OF MESSRS, WOHNI-IAS, SATTERWHITE, 
AND HALL 

5/17117 MRO P400 A1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 1.20 $390,00 
OF MR WOHNHAS' TESTIMONY 

5/17/17 MRO P400 A!06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ELLIOTT 0.20 $65,00 
RE FILING REQillREMENTS AND LATEST DRAFT OF MR. 
WOHNHAS' TESTIMONY 

t' 
- 5/17117 MRO P400Al04REVIEW AND ADDRESS MR. ROMINE'S 0.60 $195.00 

-- COMMENTS ON MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/18/17 KG! P400Al06 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN REVIEW 4.20 $1,155.00 
SESSION TO REVIEW TARIFFS AND APPLICATION 

5/18/17 KG! P400 AI 06 CONFERENCE WITH A. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW 0.50 $137.50 
CHANGES TO TARIFF PPA 

5/18117 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON REVISED DRAFT 4.30 $1,182.50 
OF TESTIMONY OF A. VAUGHAN 

5/18117 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 
VAUGHAN Rll MR. SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/18/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. SHARF RE 0.10 $32.50 
EXHIBITS TO HIS TESTIMONY 

5/18/17 MRO P400 AI 06 MEET WITH MS. ROSQUIST, MS. ELLIOTT, AND 2.90 $942.50 
MESSRS, ROGNESS AND SHARP AT KENTUCKY POWER'S 
OFFICES TO REVJEW DRAFT TARIFFS 

5/18/17 MRO P400 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.40 $130.00 
CARLIN, WOHNHAS, BRUBAKER, MITCHELL, ROSS, 
ROGNESS, SHARP, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. STRAWSER TO 
REVIEW MR. CARLIN'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5118/17 MRO P400 Al06 MEET WITH MS. ELLIOTT AND MESSRS. 1.60 $520,00 
ROGNESS AND SHARP AT KENTUCKY POWER'S OFFICES 
TO REVIEW DRAFT APPLICATION 

5118117 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELL RE 0.40 $130.00 
MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 
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5/18/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 
WOHNHAS RE HIS DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/!8/17 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO COMMENTS ON MR. 3.60 $1,170.00 
PHILLIPS DRAFT TESTIMONY BY MESSRS. BELL, ROMINE, 

i AND ROSS ! 
I 5/18/17 MRO P400 A 101 REVISE APPL!CA TION BASED ON COMMENTS 0.90 $292.50. ! 

RECEIVED IN MAY 18 MEETING TO REVIEW I I 
5118/17 MRO P400 Al 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. CARLIN'S 0.20 $65.00 ' I ' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

I 
' 5/19/!7 KG! P400 A1 04 FINALIZE COMMENTS ON DRAFT TESTIMONY 0.70 $192,50 ! 

OF A. VAUGHAN 

5/19/17 KGl P400 A l 06 CONFERENCE WITH A. VAUGHAN TO REVIEW 0.30 $82.50 
QUESTIONS ON REVISED DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5119/17 KGl Ll20 A 104 REVIEW LEGAL REQUIREMENTS TO FILE 0,50 $137.50 
APPLICATION WITHIN 90 DAYS OF END OF TEST YEAR 

5/19/17 KG! P400 AI06 CONFERENCE TO REVIEW TESTIMONY OF D. 0.40 $ll0.00 
BUCK AND A. VAUGHAN 

S/19/17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW K·PEGG AND KEAP GRANT 2.80 $770.00 
APPL!CA'ITONS FOR INCLUSION IN EXHIBITS TO 
TESTIMONY OF B, HALL 

( 
.. 5/19/17 KG! P400 AI 03 REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS TO TES'l1MONY 1.80 .$495,00 

OF B, HALL TO INCLUDE INFORMA'ITON ON RECENTLY 
APPROVED K-PEGG AND KEAP GRANTS 

5/19/17 MRO P400 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WfrH MESSRS, 1.40 $455,00 
PHILLIPS AND BELL TO REVIEW MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 

5/19/17 MRO L310 Al07 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. V!NSEL 0.10 $32,50 
RE STAFFFIRSTSETOF DATA REQUESTS 

5/19117 MRO Ll20 AI 06 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.80 $260.00 
MR SATTERWHITE RE RATE CASE STRATEGY 

5/19117 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITil MESSRS, 0.40 $130.00 
ROGNESS, BUCK, ROUSH, ROSS, GARCIA, BRUBAKER, 
WOHNHAS, SHARP, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA TO 
REVIEW DRAFT TESTIMONIES OF MESSRS. VAUGHAN 
AND BUCK 

5/19/17 MRO P400 A1 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 1.60 $520,00 
DRM'T TESTIMONY 

5/19/17 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITII MS. ELLIOTT 0,20 $65.00 
REDRAFT APPLICATION 

5/19117 MRO P400 AI 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON EXffiBITS TO MR. 0.40 $130,00 
PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/19/17 MRO P400 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. ROSQUIST 0.10 $32,50 
RE MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT EXHIBITS 

( 5/19/17 MRO P400 A 106 MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITil MESSRS. 0,50 $162,50 
PHILLIPS, ROMINE, AND BELL RE MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT 
TESTIMONY 
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( -~·· 

5/19/17 MRO P400 A I 04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR, BUCK'S 0.20 $65.00 
DRAFT TESTIMONY 

-·---
5/19/17 MRO L250 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.10 $32.50 

SATTERWHITE REMOTION TO DEVIATE 

5/19117 MRO L310 A106 COMMUNICATE WITH CLIENTSRE STAFF'S 0.10 $32.50 
FIRST SET OF DATA REQUESTS 

5/19117 MRO P400 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. SEKULA 0.10 $32.50 
RE MR. PIDLLIPS' TESTIMONY 

5/19/17 MRO P400 A I 03 REVISE DRAFT APPLICATION 0.50 $162.50 

5/19/17 MRO L25Q A104 REVIEW COMMJSSION PRECEDENT AND 0.40 $130.00 
REGULATIONS RE TEST YEARS 

5/20/17 KG! L430 AI03 DRAFT REQUIRED STATUTORY NOTICE TO 1.10 $302.50 
ACCOMPANY RATE CASE APPLICATION FILING 

5/20/17 MRO L120 Al06 COMMUNICATE WITH MR. SATTERWIDTE RE 0,3Q $97.50 
REVIEW OF 2017 RATE CASE 

-----
5/20/17 MRO L250 A 103 BEGIN DRAFTING MOTION TO DEVIATE 1.90 $617.50 

5/21/17 KG! L430 A 103 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR 1.10 $302.50 
DEVIATION 

5f.ll/17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW AND UPDATE EXHIBITS TO TilE 1.30 $357.50 
TESTIMONY OFB. HALL TO INCLUDE ADDITIONAL 
GRANT RECIPIENTS 

--··· 
5/21!17 KG! P400 A 104 REVIEW AND UPDATE NEWSPAPER AD TO 0.70 $192.50 

ACCOUNT FOR CHANGES MADE IN PUBLICATION AND 
CHANGE IN FILING DATE 

5/21/17 MRO L250 A 103 DRAFT AND REVISE FIRST DRAFT OF MOTION 2.40 $780.00 
FOR LEAVE TO DEVIATE FROM FILING REQUIREMENTS 

-- -><~· 

5/22/17 KG! L430 Al 03 REVIEW, REVISE, AND COMMENT ON MOTION 1.20 $330.00 
FOR DEVIATION 

5/22/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW AND REVISE NEWSPAPER 0,70 $192,50 
ADVERTISEMENT DOCUMENT 

----· 
5!22117 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LATEST DRAFT OF 4.00 $1,100.00 

TESTIMONY OF M. SATTERWHITE 
----
5/22/l7 MRO Ll20 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0,80 $260,00 

ROUSH, ROGNESS, ALLEN, VAUGHAN, WOIINHAS, 
SUNDARARAJAN, SATTERWHITE, MS, ROSQUIST, MS. 
SEKULA, AND MS, RICHARDSON TO REVIEW RATE CASE 
STRATEGY 

5122/17 MRO P400 Al03 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT STATUTORY 0.20 $65,00 
NOTICE 

5/22/17 MRO L250A103 DRAFTREAD1STFILEFORUSE WITH MOTION 0,20 $65,00 
FOR LEAVE TO DEVIATE 

---
5/22/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 2,90 $942.50 

( DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/22117 MRO L250 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0,20 $65,00 
SATTERWHITERE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO DEVIATE 
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i 
'· 5f22117 MRO L25Q A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, GARCIA 0,30 .~97.50 

REMOTION FOR LEAVE TO DEVIATE 

5/22117 MRO L250 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR. 0.20 $65.00 
ROGNESS AND MS. ELLIOTT REMOTION FOR LEA VB TO 
DEVIATE 

5122/17 MRO P400 A 1 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. BELL RE 0,20 $65.00 
MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/22117 MRO L310A106 COMMUNICATE WITH MS. SEKULA, MS. 0,20 $65,00 
ROSQUIST, ANJ) OTHERS RESTAFF'S FIRST SET OF DATA 
REQUESTS 

5{22/17 MRO L310 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. ROGNESS 0.10 $32.50 
RE DUE DATE FOR FIRST SET OF STAFF DATA REQUESTS 

5122117 MRO L250 AI 03 MULTIPLE REVISIONS TO MOTION FOR LEAVE 2.40 $780.00 
TO DEVIATE IN RESPONSE TO CLIENT COMMENTS 

5/23/17 KG! Ll20 Al06 PREPARE FORAND PARTICIPATE IN 0,70 $192.50 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW STEPS TO BE TAKEN AS PART 
OF REVIEW OF APPLICATION 

5/23/17 KG! Ll20 A106 PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN 1,00 $275.00 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW POTENTIAL ADJUSTMENT 
CHANGES 

5123/17 KG! P400 A104 DRAFT COMMENTS ON REVISED TESTIMONY 2,30 $632.50 
OFM. SATTERWHITE 

5123/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF A. VAUGHAN 2.00 $550.00 

5/23/17 MRO L 120 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.40 $130,00 
MILLER, MITCHELL, ROUSH, WOHNHAS, BRUBAKER, 
BARTSCH, ROGNESS, ROSS, CASH, BUCK, ROMINE, 
MCMANUS, SATTERWHITE, MESSNER, VAUGHAN, SJ:lARP, 
PHILLIPS, MS. ELLIOTT, MS. STRAWSER, MS. OSBORNE, 
MS. WALSH, MS. WHITE, MS. BESKE, AND MS. SEKULA TO 
DISCUSS RATE CASE LEGAL STRATEGY 

5/23/17 MRO L310 AI 06 ADDRESS INQUIRY BY MS. SEKULA FOR 0.20 $65.00 
LEGAL ADVICE RESTAFF'S FIRST SET OF DATA 
REQUESTS 

5/23117 MRO C300 Al06 ADDRESS INQUIRY BY MS. SEKULA FOR 0.30 $97,50 
LEGAL ADVICE REAPPLICATION REVIEW PROCESS 

5/23117 MRO P400 AI 04 COMPLETE REVIEW AND COMMENT ON 2,90 $942.50 
LATEST DRAFT OF MR. PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/23/17 MRO C300 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. SEKULA 1.60 $520.00 
RE LEGAL QUESTION ARISING IN REVIEW OF 
APPLICATION 

5123/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS, 1.10 $357.50 
BELTER, SHARP, ROMINE, ROUSH, GARCIA, BARTSCH, 
ROSS, MESSNER, HORELED, ROGNESS, PHILLIPS, 
VAUGHAN, MILLER, CARLIN, ALLEN, WOHNHAS, BUCK, 

( 
BRUBAKER, MS. OSBORNE, MS. WALSH, MS. ELLIOTT, MS. 
RICHARDSON, AND MS, SEKULA TO REVIEW 
APPLICATION, TESTIMONY, AND ADJUSTMENTS 
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FILl': NUMBI<;R: KE057-KE315 PAGE 12 
INVOICF; NO: 1333207 
INVOICI<;J>ATe: JUNes, 2011 

5/23117 MRO Ll90 A I 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. 0.70 $227.50 
RICHARDSON AT REQUEST OF MR. SATTERWHITE 
CONCERNING RATE CASE DEVELOPMENT 

5/23/17 MRO L120 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.80 $260.00 
BACHA AND GARCIARE RATE CASE LEGAL STRATEGY 

5/23/17 MRO P400 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MR. SHARP 0.10 $32,50 
RE REQUEST FOR DEVIATION IN CONNECTION WITII 
PROPOSED CHANGES TO BUDGET PL!I.N 

5/23117 MRO P400 Al06 MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH MS. 0.10 $32.50 
ELLIOT!' REDRAFT APPLICATION 

5/23/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW VEGET ATlON MANAGEMENT 0.30 $97.50 
EXPENDITURES IN CONNECTION WITH REVIEW ON MR. 
PHILLIPS' DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/24117 KG! P400 A 104 CONTINUE REVIEW OF REVISED TESTIMONY 2.90 $797.50 
OF A. VAUGHAN 

5/24/17 KG! P400 Al04 REVIEW AND INCORPORATE CHANGES TO 0,80 $220.00 
EXHIBITS TO TESTIMONY OF B. !!ALL 

5/24117 KG! P400 A104 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF S. SHARI' 0,70 $192.50 

5/24117 MRO L120 AJ06 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.50 $162.50 
MR, WOHNHAS RE RATE CASE LEGAL STRATEGY 

5/24/17 MRO P400 AI 03 REVISE APP!.ICAT!ON BASED ON COMMENTS 2.30 $747.50 
RECEIVED AT MEETING WITH MESSRS. ROGNESS AND 
SHARP AND MS. ELLIOTT 

5/24/17 MRO C300 AI 06 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON ORDER GRANTING 0,10 $32,50 
DEVIATION 

5/24117 MRO C300 AJ06 ADDRESS ISSUE RAISED BY MS. SEKULA 0.30 $97.50 

5/24117 MRO Ll20 Al06 ADDRESS ISSUES RAISED BY MR. GARCIA RE 0,20 $65,00 
RATE CASE STRATEGY 

5124117 MRO P400 A 106 MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 0.30 $97.50 
MR. SHARP REPROPOSED CHANGES TO BUDGET 
PAYMENT PROGRAM FOR APPLICATION 

5/24117 MRO P400 Al04 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LATEST DRAFT OF 2.20 $715.00 
MR. SATTERWHITE'S TESTIMONY 

5/25/17 KG1 P400 A106 CONfERENCE WITH A. ELLIOTT TO REVIEW 0.20 $55.00 
POTENTIAL CHANGES TO TARIFF PPA 

5/25/17 KG! P400 A106 CONFERENCE WITH J, ROSQUIST TO REVIEW 0.10 $27.50 
SCHEDULE FOR COMPLETING NEWSPAPER 
ADVERTISEMENT FOR TIMELY PUBLICA T!ON 

5/25/17 ).<Gl P400 A104 PREPARE COMMENTS ON TESTIMONY OF A. 3,60 $990,00 
VAUGHAN 

5/25/17 MRO Ll90 A106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MS. 0,30 $97.50 
RICHARDSON TO ADDRESS CASE DEVELOPMENT ISSUES 

I 5/25/17 MRO P400 A104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. 2.80 $910.00 1 
SATTERWHITE'S DRAFT TESTIMONY 

5/26/l7 KGI P400 AI04 REVIEW REVISED TESTIMONY OF J. ROGNESS !,]0 $302.50 
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_FILE NUMBER: Kll057-KE315 PAGE 13 
INVOICE NO: 1333207 

.. INVOICE DATE: JUNE 8, 2017 
/ 
\ 5/26/17 KG!· P400 AI 04 PREPARE COMMENTS ON REVISED TESTIMONY 2.10 $577.50 

OF A. VAUGHAN 

5126117 MRO L120 AI06 COMMUNICATE WITH MS. ELLIOTT RE RATE 0.40 $130.00 
CASE STRATEGY 

5/26/17 MRO C300 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. 0.20 $65.00 
WOHNHAS READJUSTMENTS 

5/26/17 MRO P400 A 104 REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MR. PHILLIPS' 2.80 $910.00 
-TESTIMONY IN LIGHT OF MR. ROSS' COMMENTS 

··---~·--

5/26117 MRO P400 AI 03 UPDATE AND REVISE APPLICATION 1.60 $520.00 

5/29117 KG! P400 A 104 FINALIZE COMMENTS ON REVISED DRAFT 2.30 $632.50 
TESUMONY OF A. VAUGHAN 

5130117 KGI P400 Al 04 PREPARE COMMENTS ON REVISED DRAFT OF 3.30 $907.50 
TESTJMONY OF S, SHARP 

5/30/17 KG! L310 Al06 PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.60 $165,00 
PROCEDURES FOR MANAGING DISCOVERY DURING 
CASE 

5/30/17 MRO L3l0 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS. 0.70 $227,50 
VAUGHAN, HOLMES, WELSH, CARLIN, ROSS, BRUBAKER, 
WOHNHAS, GARCIA, SHARP, PHILLIPS, ROMINE, BELL, 
MESSNER, MS. ELLIOTT, MS. ROSQUIST, MS. STRAWSER, 
MS. WHITE, MS. LUTTON, MS. WALSH, AND MS. S_EKULA 
TO REVIEW STAPP'S FIRST SET OF DATA REQUESTS 

5/30/17 MRO P400 Al 04 ADDRESS INQUIRY RE MR. PHILLJPS' DRAFT 0.20 $65,00 
TESTIMONY 

5/31/17 KG! P400 AI06PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE TO REVIEW 0.40 $110.00 
OUTCOME OF REVIEW OF ADJUSTMENTS 

513lfl7 MRO L 120 A 106 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MESSRS, 0.70 $227,50 
PHILLIPS, BUCK, SHARP, MESSNER, MILLER, VAUGHAN, 
ALLEN, 1-IORELED, GARCIA, BACHA, ROGNESS, 
WOHNHAS, MS. WALSH, MS. ELLIOTT, AND MS. SEKULA 
TO REVIEW CASE STRATEGY 

5/31/17 MRO L31 0 AI 06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. SEKULA 0,10 $32,50 
RESTAFF'S FIRST SET OF DATA REQUESTS 

5/31/17 MRO C300 AI06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. GARCIA 0.30 $97.50 
RE RATE CASE EXPENSES 

5/31/17 MRO P400 Al06 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR, 0.20 $65,00 
WOHNHAS RE RATE CASE ADJUSTMENT 

BALANCE $83 025,50 

( 
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FILE NUMBER: KE057-Kll315 
1333~07 
JUNI!S, ~017 

INVOICE NO: 
INVOICE DATE: 

ADDITIONAL SERVICES: 
MATTERNO. KE057-KE315 2016 RATE CASE 

II 0 <; /24117 

05/25117 

05/25117 

SUBTOTAL 

AEP LAWPACK MA TIER NO, AEPD053942 

KENNETH OISII, JR. FOR MILEAGE (59.81 MILES@ $0.535/MILE) TO 
AND FROM FRANKFOR:r, KY ON 05-08-2017 TO PARTICIPATE IN 
CONFERENCE TO REVIEW AND UPDATE NEWSPAPER 
ADVERTISEMENT 

KENNETH GJSH FOR MILEAGE (59.81 MILES @ $0.535/MILE) TO AND 
FROM FRANKFOR:r, KY ON 05-12-2017 TO REVIEW REVISED DRAFT 
TESTIMONY OF D, OSBORNE AND REVIEW/UPDATE FILING 
REQUIREMENTS, DOCUMENT AND TARIPFS 

KENNETH G!SH FOR MILEAGE (59.81 MILES@ $0.535/MILE) TO AND 
FROM FRANKFORT, KY TO PARTICIPATE IN REVIEW SESSION TO 
REVIEW TARIFFS AND APPLICATION 

Reversal from Void Check Number: 866203 Bank ID; MAIN Voucher ID; 
806284 Vendor: KEN GISH 

KENNETH G!SH FOR MILEAGE (59 .81 MILES @ 0.535/MILE) TO AND 
FROM FRANKFORT, KY ON 05-18-2017 TO PARTICIPATEINREVIBW 
SESSION TO REVIEW TARIFFS AND APPLICATION 

SECRETARY OF STATE 

SECRETARY OF STATE 

TOTAL ADDITIONAL SERVICES 

AMOUNT DUE 

PAGE: 14 

$83,16!.50 

$83,161.50 
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( 

JCILE NUMBER: 
INVOICE NO: 
INVOICE DATE: 

I(EQ57-KJ>315 
l3332j)7 
JUNE8,2017 

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY 

PLEASE INCLUDE ON YOUR CHECK OUR REFERENCE NUMBER 
WHICH APPEARS BELOW THE INVOICE NUMEBR ON THIS INVOICE. 

INVOICES ARE DUB ON RECEIPT. 

IF PAYMENT IS MADE BY WIRE REMJTI'ANCE, PLEASE D!RllCT TO: 

STITES & HARBISON 
PNC 
LOUISVILLE, KY. 40202 
BANKABA#·­
ACCOUNT#: 

PLEASE REFERENCE YOUR MATTER NO. KE057·KE315, INVOICE NO, 1333207 

PAGE 15 
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Shipment Receipt: Page #1 of 1 
1HIS IS tlOT A SHlPPit~G LABEL PLEASE SAVE FOR YOUR RECORDS 

SHIP DATE' ~ . SHIPMENT INFORMATION 
Man 10 Jul 2017 ·~--.- UPS NBKl Day Air Com 

0.05 \bs aclual •l 
EXPECTED DELIVERY DATE' LTR Bi I Jed Weigh\ 
TUEll! JUL 2D17 JD,3D AM Carrier LeHer 

SHIP FROM' 
JASON CASH 
149 RUBY RED LANE 
Dela•are OH 43015 
(614) 716·2669 

Tracking Number' lz9El2E3013i69694J 
Shipmen\ ID' MM310YfFDR63P 

SHIP TO: 
BEllY SEKULA 
1 RIVERSIDE PLZ 
COLUMBUS OH 43215-2352 
Business 

IHIPPEO THROUGH' 
The UPI llore 15556 
OAVENPORT.FL 33697-8416 
(663) 420·1476 

S1snalure: 

Ship Ref 1' WENDII 
Snip Ref 2, • • 

DESCRIPTION OF GOODS: 
DOCUMENTS 

SHIPMENT CHARGEs, 
NeKl Oav Air '" 
Service Oplians 
Fuel Surcharge 
CMS Processing Fee 

Tala\ 

37 71 
0. 00 
1.41 
0.20 

$39.32 

Snipmenl ID · MM310YFFOR8JP \\ll\111\\lll\llll\\l\l\ll\llll\lllllll\llllll\lllllllll\ll\111\llllll\1111 
pg.,crod by Hohlp(r) The UPS Store D7ilO,.!Ill"' 05 Sl ~H p.,~lflt: Timu N 

The UPS Stor·e ·· 115556 
109 i\IIIIJer :ow· ot tlay 
Octven~orl, FL 33897 

(863} 420 1476 

07/lil/17 U8;53 Al·l 

i•Je are the orre slop for ctl1 your 
oil 1 ~P llrQ , po:, t ct 1 and bu> lrJe:;" 11eerb . 

Thctnk you tor coni Hille to oupporl 
YDUt locally mured UPS :,tore! 

1111111111111111111111111111111111111111111 illllllllllllllllllllilllll 
OUJ 00\U05 (00\J IU $ J9.32 

flO A 
Tracking» IZ9r/LI3Ul3869684J 

IJ02 033004 (023} t1 $ 1.00 
Scanning 

:Oublota 1 $ 
Sa leo TaA Ill) $ 

lotct 1 $ 

40.1J 
0.117 

40.'39 

f.IASlERCARU .~ 40.38 
ACLOUNl NUt·IBtl1 > 
Appr Code: 078451 (I) 

tNTRY f.II:IHDD: LlilpRead 
1·1001:: Issuer 
AID: A0000Ull01i41 U I u 
TVR: 0000088000 
TSI: E800 
AC: b12f4ADI C089U:U 
ARC: 00 

~, 

,/ ' 

{ ! 

'~-!~~' 

(\ 
I ',. 
I /Jr 
\_/' 

HH<I-H ~HH0928 

Sale 

f~ereq,t ltJ 8illll4Jb.i.J919tJ881134 111r! Ite111s 
CSH: \'IENIJY fran: 135J Reg: UOl 

Join our quarterly rdffles!! 
Ask your dssocictle for delaib 

i•ilratever your trU> ill8oo ctlld pe 1 SOlid 1 
rteedo. we dr e here to :,e, ve you. 

Vle're lrere to help. 
Jam our FREt enrarl progrdlll lu rel:etve 

g1eat offe1s and resull!ces, 

V!l•ii'L tlieupoo t 0 I 8 ,L 0111/ o 1 YIIIIIJ 
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Judy K Rosquist 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

ODOnline@OfficeDepot.com 
Thursday, June 22, 2017 9:07AM 
Judy K Rosquist 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Order Confirmation - Multiple Orders 

This is an EXTERNAL email. STOP. THINK before you CLICK links or OPEN attachments. 

********************************************************************** 
Order Confirmation 

This order contains multiple shipments. Please be sure to review each individual order listed below. 

Thank you for shopping with Office Depot. 

We are confident you will be pleased and look forward to serving you again soon. 

Note that your order will arrive in *multiple* shipments and we have created unique order numb'ers for each, so you 
can track status and delivery of each. 

Note that due to product availability or size, items ordered together may not be shipped together. Shipping confirmation 
emails will provide details on all shipments. 

For your reference, below is a summary of your order. 

Shipment 1 Expected delivery date: 06.23.2017 8:30AM- 5:00 PIVI 

Order Number: 937721183-001 
Account#~ 
Customer Name: JUDY I< ROSQUIST 
Ordered By: JKROSQUIST@AEP.COM 
Last Modified By: JI<ROSQUIST@AEP.COM 
Order Date: 06.22.2017 

1 
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LOC: 1170- DC HAMILTON, OH 
Delivery Type: Delivery 
Delivery Method: 

PO Number: 
Contact: JUDY ROSQUIST 
NAME: JUDY K ROSQUIST 

CC: 11011783 
FLOOR#: 1ST 
ASSET: 
Status: Ready to be loaded 
Payment info: Credit Card (MASTERCARD). 

Tracking: See below 

Comments: 

Shipping to: 
AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER 
101 ENTERPRISE DRIVE 

KENTUCKY STATE OFFICE 
FRANKFORT, KY 40601 

To Be 
SKU . Cust # Ord Shipped B/0 UM. Price Ext 

ACC36251 884387 100 100 0 each 5.010 501.00 

CVR RPTCLR FRNTW/FSTNR 
Eco-Conscious, Eco-Recycled, Best Value 

0810360 810360 10 10 0 pack 5.030 50.30 
Post·it(reg) Durable Filing Tabs, 2", Assorted Colors, Pack Of 24 

Subtotal: 551.30 
Tax: 33.08 

Delivery Charge: 0.00 
Misc.: 0.00 

Total: 584.38 

1 
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********************************************************************* 

Shipment 2 Expected delivery date: 06.27.2017 8:30AM-5:00PM 

Order Number: 937721427-001 
Account#:65771047 
Customer Name: JUDY K ROSQUIST 

Ordered By: JI<ROSQUIST@AEP.COM 
Last Modified By: JKROSQUIST@AEP.COM 
Order Date: 06.22.2017 
LOC: 1165- DC WESTON, FL 
Delivery Type: Delivery 
Delivery Method: 

PO Number: 
Contact: JUDY ROSQUIST 
NAME: JUDY K ROSQUIST 
CC: 11011783 
FLOOR#: 1ST 
ASSET: 
Status: In Process 
Payment info: Credit Card (MASTERCARD). 

Tracking: See below 

Comments: 

Shipping to: 
AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER 
101 ENTERPRISE DRIVE 
KENTUCKY STATE OFFICE 

FRANKFORT, I<Y 40601 

To Be 
SKU Cust # Ord Shipped B/0 UM Price Ext 

6830245 6830245 10 10 0 pack 8.790 87.90 
Office Max Clear-Front Report Covers, Blue 
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Subtotal: 87.90 
Tax: 5.27 
Delivery Charge: O.OD 
Misc.: 0.00 

Total: 93.17 

********************************************************************* 

Grand Total for all orders: $677.55 

Legend 

Ord: Original Quantity Ordered 
To Be Shipped: Ordered Quantity- Backorder Quantity 
B/0: Backorde,r Quantity 
UM: Unit of Measure 
CC: Cost Center 
Price: Price per Individual Unit 
Ext: Ordered Quantity x Price 

You can track delivery of your order online. Log in at https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/tirl7u~https-
3A business.officedepot.com&d-DwiCAw&c-gMbiD-Q9WoaRgoXZKCrSug&r-13RyUdH3kuEWu33jtCS­
MEi550S20 1nPORYd49hRgw&m~3s1iJbt12fploG6ntr3h7v4GgDDt1Pt41SumgDr-7ys&s~khjcPkzliiLCnPjbkrCSIEs73-
Wno86AHI40Gn6wmgs&e~ and go to Order Tracking to track delivery of your order by entering the order number 
shown in this email. 
Subscribe to receive email alerts about exclusive offers at Office Depot. Update your contact information and 
subscription preferences today!. 
Questions? We are taking care of business every day, and we are ready to help: Call888.263.3423 or email us at 
ECSupport@officedepot.com for prompt answers to all your questions. 

For compliance with select California laws and for financial reporting purposes, all sales shipped to California and Texas 
customers are made by eDepot, LLC, a wholly-owned subsidiary of Office Depot, Inc, and are F.O.B. destination point. 
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7/'10/2017 11 :57:0 

***Rapia Pic~UP*** Casnier: Rwia PicK ~P 

1 Mooile Oraer 
1160080 !L:OJ'i'Oll 001 0300!i 1501 

.\}00 Pjct~ creamy Tomato so 
1 1 /2 flacn Tky B rvo Sde1 , , 

No To~ma~tog~~ 

Acct:XXXXXXXX3'166 
AuthCode:09847fl 
Trans»:O 

41.05 

Accuracy Hatters, 
Your· order $hoLdd be co•Tect every tilno. 
If it's not, ;1e '11 fix it r i oht away, and 
give you a free treat ·for your trouble. 

Just let any assoc·iate knov1. 

Cafe Order 920080 
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Judy I< Rosquist 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Panera <noreply@panerabread.com> 
Friday, July 07, 2017 10:48 AM 
Judy K Rosquist 
[EXTERNAL] Order Confirmation: #504 

Thanks for yonr 
order! 
Order number: 

504 

Time Ready: 
12:00 PM:- 12:15 PM 
EDT 

Frankfort- West 
Ridge Drive 
Cafe 11600881 

101 West Ridge Drive 

Frankf01t, KY - 40601 

(502) 223-2224 

Accuracy matters. If 
your order is nnt 
right, please let a 
manager !mow. 
For any other assistance 
with your order, please 
contact us at 855-
JPANERA (855-372-
6372). 

G:;l, 
l_l;IJ 

I 

Name: 
Judy Rosquist 
Email Address: 
ikrosguist@aep.com 
Company: 

M:yPanera #: 

ONLINE-

Date: 7/7/2017 Friday 
Time Ready: 12:00 PM- 12:15 PM 
EDT 

frankfmt, K Y 
40601 

Greek Salad 
1 No Meal Upgrade 
1 Chips 

1 Greens Chx Sal 
1 No Meal Upgrade 
1 Chips 

1 Strwb Poppy Chx Sal 
1 No Meal Upgrade 
1 Chips 

1 Iced Tea 64 oz 
1 Med V eggie Sdw 

.1 No Meal Upgrade 
1 Chips 

1 Grp Crm Tomato Soup 
1 French Baguette Side 

$8.39 

$9.59 

$5.00 
$6.99 

$14.99 

Included in your order: Napkins, utensils, plates 
and/or bowls, etc. for 3 people 

Subtotal 
Delivery Charge 

Tax 
Total 

Payment Type Card Number 

1 

$49.85 
$15.00 

$3.89 
$68.74 

Amount 

l'i II 
I] 
i' 
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credit xxxx~xxxx-xxxx- $
68 7 

Card 3766 ,;, 0
4 

We bake our items fresh daily and will tty our best to fulfill your order exactly as you specif?.. 
However, should cit rz -;-: 7 rj 
an issue occm, we'll do our best to replace, substitute or work with you on arrival to adjust the 
order to xour liking. Your feedback is important to us. Let us know how we can help by 
contacting us here. 

2 
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Thanks for 
your order! 
Order name: 

Delivery 

Order number: 

504 

Order status: 

Stored 

Expected Delivery time: 

12:00 PM -12:15 PM EDT 

Date Received: 

07/07/2017 10:43 AM EDT 

If you need assistance with your order 

please contact: 

Frankfort· West Ridge Drive 

Cafe #: 600881 
101 West Ridge Drive 

Frankfort, KY 40601 

(502) 223-2224 

Name On Order: 

Judy Rosquist 

Email Address: 

jkrosquist@aep.com 

Company: 

ONLINE· PRIMARY 

Pick up Delivery: 

Delivery 

Date: 

0710712017 Friday 

Expected Delivery Time: 

12:00 PM ·12:15 PM EDT 

Event Contact: 

Delivery Instructions: 

Qty Description 

D 1 l/2 G>:eel< Salad 

D 1 No Meal Upgrade 
D 1 Chips 

D :l Greens Chx Sa~ 

D 1 No Meal Upgrade 

D 1 Chips 

D 1 Strwb Poppy Chx Sal 
D 1 No Meal Upgra.de 

D 1 Chips 

D 1 Iced Tea 64 oz 

D l Med 'V'eggie Sdw 

D 1 No Meal Upgrade 
D 1 Chips 

0 1 Grp Crm ~omato Soup 

0 1 French Baguette Side 

Phone Number: 

(502) 696-7011 

MyPanera#: 

Delivery Address: 

101 enterprise drive 
frankfort, KY 40601 

Cafe Phone Number: 

(502) 223-2224 

People Served: 

3 

Price 
$4.89 

$8.39 

$9.59 

$5.00 
$6.99 

$14.99 

Included in your order: Napkins, utensils, plates and/or bowls, etc. for 3 people 

Subtotal 

Delivery Charge 

$49.85 

$15.00 
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Thanks for 
your order! 
Order name: 

Delivery 

Order number: 

504 

Order status: 

Stored 

Expected Delivery time: 

12:00 PM- 12:15 PM EDT 

Date Received: 

07/07/201710:43AM EDT 

If you need assistance with your order 

pleas" contact; 

Frankfort- West Ridge Drive 

Cafe#: 600881 
101 West Ridge Drive 

Frankfort, KY 40601 
(502) 223-2224 

Tax 

Tip 

$3.89 

$0.00 

Total $68.74 

Price Per 
Person 

Payment Type 

Credit Card 

Card Number Amount 

XXXX·XXXX-XXXX-3766 $68.74 

'l,ZJD 
Tip=--------"--1'--v ___ _ 

Totat: ___ ~-&,.~·_7..-..::1-__ 

Signature:-------------

Order Checked By 

Bag ____ ot ___ _ 

- 07/07/2017 10:49:01 AM- Page 2 of 2-

$22.91 
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Thanks for 
your order! 
Ordarname: 
Delivery 

Order number: 

526 

Order status: 

Stored 

Expected Delivery time: 

12:30 PM - 12:45 PM EDT 

Date Received: 

07/1212017 10:47 AM EDT 

If you need assistance with your order 

please contact 

Frankfort - West Ridge Drive 

Cafe #: 600661 
101 West Ridge Drive 

Frankfort, KY 40601 

(502) 223-2224 

Name On Order: 

Judy Rosequist 

Email Address: 

noemail@panerabread.com 

Company: 

Enterprise 

Pick up Dellvt~ry: 

Delivery 

Date: 

07/1212017 Wednesday 

Expected Delivery Time: 

12:30 PM -12:45 PM EDT 

Event Contact: 

Delivery Instructions: 

Qty Description 
0 2 Sig Lunch Sa~ad 

0 2 chicken Cesr Sal 
D 2 Choc Chipper Cookie 

D 2 French Baguette 

0 1. Saqdwich & Sa1ad Box 

0 1 Cup Crm Tomato Soup 

0 1 1/2 BacnTky Brvo Sdw 

0 ne l'eme.ts 

0 1 Choc Chipper Cookie 

0 1 French Baguette 

0 l Sandwich & Salad BQX 

0 1 1/2 Chx Caesar Sal 

0 1 Cup Cr.m Tomato Soup 

0 1 Lemon Drop Cookie 

0 1 French Baguette 

D l Cup Black Bean Soup 

0 1 No Meal Upgrade 

D 1 French Baguette 

D J. Sandwioh & Sal.a.d Bo:n:: 

0 1 Steak Arugula Sdw 

D 1 Cup Crm Tomato Soup 

0 1 Choc Chipper Cookie 

-071121201710:53:13 AM- Page 1 of2-

Phone Number: 

(502) 696-7611 

MyPanera#: 

Delivery Address: 

1 01 Enterprise Drive 
None 
Frankfort, KY 40601 

Cafe Phone Number: 

(502) 223-2224 

People Served: 

6 

Price 
$20.38 

$9.19 

$1.15 

$9.19 
$1.15 

$4.69 

$9.19 
$1.69 
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Thanks for 
your order! 
Order name: 

Delivery 

Order number: 

526 

Order status: 

Stored 

Expected Delivery time: 

12:30 PM ·12:45 PM EDT 

Date Received: 

07/12/2017 10:47 AM EDT 

If you need assistance with your order 

please contact: 

Frankfort- West Ridge Drive 

Cafe#: 600881 
101 West Ridge Drive 

Frankfort, KY 40601 

(502) 223-2224 

0 1 
0 1 
0 1 
0 1 
0 1 
0 1 
0 1 
0 1 

0 1 
0 1 
0 1 

French Baguette 
Sandwich & Sa1ad Box 

Cup Bkd Potato Soup 
Strwb Poppy Chx Sal 
Otml Rasn Berry Cky 
Chips 

Iced Tea 64 oz 
Prem Lunch Sal.ad 

StrwbPoppy Chxsal 
Choc Chipper Cookie 
Chips 

$9.19 

$1.69 

$5.00 
$11.19 

lneluded in your order. Napkins, utensils, plates and/or bowls, etc. for 8 people 

Subtotal $83.70 

Delivery Charge $15.00 

Payment Type 

Credit Card 

Card Number 

XXXX-XXXX-XXXX-3766 

Bag ____ Of ___ _ 

-07/1212017 10:53:13 AM- Page 2 of2-

Tax $5.92 

Tip $0.00 

Total $104.62 

Price Per $13.08 
Person 

Amount 

$104.62 
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Shipping: UPS Page 1 of2 

IJ Shipment Receipt 

Transaction Date: 06Jul2017 Tracking Number: 1ZR5404F0296329900 

(V ADDRI'SS INFORMATION 

Ship To: Ship From: Return Address; 

LU>:ntucky POWef Company Ktmtutky Power Company Kentud<.yPowe>ComJ>ilhY 
KarerJBml; JudyKRo:;qUist JudyKRosqu\st 

1AOOE.M~lnS1md lOlA Ente!j>ri>e.Orlll{l 1111A EfllerprlseOriv" 
HAZARD K'f 417012041 """' Rates 

Tel.,phorw:50Hi96·7011 FRANI(fOfl.TKY 40602 FRIINKFORT [('( 40002 

emcil:jllro~<jUis~ep.~:om Tlll .. phone:!iOL--69$-7011 T e.lep!Joni!:SOZ-696·7011 
emil~:ji<TOsquist~ar.p.com ema1~l:Josqulsl@""''.com 

0 PAd<AGE INFORMATION 

WEIGHT DIMENSIONS/PACKAGING DECLARED VALUE: REFERENCE NUMBERS 

1. 28.01bs 1Bx 11x 10 in. 
(28.0 !bs bll!ab!e} other Packaging 

0 UPS SHIPPING SERVICE AND SHIPPING OPTIONS 

Sctvice: UPS 2nd D~y f>,Jr 

Shipping Fee:; Subtotaf: 48.1l~ uso 
AddltionaiShipp!ng Options 

Transportation 43.82.\ID Quantum View Notify E-mail Notifications: NodlltTJ:l' 

Fuel Surcharge 1.7~USD 1 !l<ro,;qu!st®~ep.rom: IJellvery 

Delivery Area Surcharge E·mall r.~tUurel~o\lflcillion: jkrosqui>l@aep.mm 

Package 1 
2A5USO 

0 PAYMENT INFORMATION 

Bill Shipping Charges to: M<Jsler(Brd lOCX)(l<XXIO'JUU<3766 

Associated shipper's account 5l"ipp~~sA<;mum_ RS404F 

Shipping Charges: 

c£11..-, 'if~ -
Subtotal Shipping Charges: ~ 

Dally rates were applied to this shipment 
Total Charged: ~ .. 

Note: This document is not an invoke. Your final invoice muyvaryfrom the displayed reference rates. 

https:/ /www.ups.com/uis/create? ActionOriginPair=default_PrintWindowPage&key=receL. 7/6/2017 
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Shipping: UPS Page 1 of2 

li1J. Shipment Receipt 

Transaction Dilte: 14Jul 2017 Traddng Number: 1ZR5404F0393688044 
r-··········-···-···-----···-·-··-·····-····--·--------- ········-···-·-·····-···-·····-·-··-·-·····-···-····---·-··--···-····-········ ··-----------] 

(~) ADDRESS INFORMATION 

Ship To: Ship Ftom: Return Address: 1 

l~lll\•O:l<y ~=rColllji~IW 

l<ish•!llum 
1:155 Ceutt•lJWe 
o;,,ih>:/00 

1\SHI/INDKY ~1101/423 

T L'lepll<me:606-3.27-?.fillO 

~•n~il;\1\blumw-"~f'-C<>In 

l<entticl(y Power Company 
Judv K R ... quls.t 
1()1A Ent!!IJ>ri>e D1lve ..... 
FRANI(fORT I<V 40602: 
Tel"!'honc:5()2--li~6-7G11 

emal!:jl<ro>qulsi9<!CV·t:.OIII 

Kcfltud<y Powt>rCompany 
Judy I<Rosqulst 
101AE!ltefj><i>n0tlvc 

'"5 
fiU\NI<fORT\<Y 40602 
Teleph<>n<>:!i02-G9G-'l011 

emaUjkro>quisl@aep.mm 

i 3) UPS SHIPPING SERVICE AND SHIPPING OPTIONS 

Service: 

Guaranteed By: Elld ofDayMonday,Jul17,201'l 

Shipping Fees Subtotal: 

Transportation 

FueL Surcharge 

(o) PICKUP INFORMATION 

Pickup Address 

l<~"ttKky Power (<ot11P~nv 
J<tdy I( Rosqulst 
l lilA Enterptisc Driv~ 

HU\NI<fORT 1<Y 40&02. 
I o•l .. phonc:502.·M6-701l ~m~lljkrosqul~aep.com 

Schedule~ Pid<up 

To tar Pickup Charges 

(~) PAYMENT INFORMATION 

Bill Shipping and Pickup Charges: 

Associated shipper's account: 

12.19 uso 

1L~8USD 

0.61 uso 

Earliest Piclmp Time: 
7111\120173-"llDP.M 

latestP!d<Up Time: 

7/14n017 5:00P.M. 

Pickup Request Number: 
292GU3SSOO 

Sh~'l>e~sArrount R5~MF 

_j 

~ous 

036U'i 

;;~,):l~Lo·~··••"'"'""'"'•••·"'"rz"'"""'""""'·~~tilii~"V~~~~'],~~ 
~- ··~;tippingCh<u·ges: 

Subtotal Shipping Charges: 

Subtotal Plckur Charges: 

D•ll!y rates were applied to this shipment 
Total Charged: 

https://www,ups,com/uis/create?ActionOriginPair=default_PrintWindowPage&key=rec ... 

12.1DUSD 

12.1!1USD 

7.2~USD 

19.45 US!> 

7/14/2017 

/ 
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Shipping: UPS Page 1 of2 

~ Shipment Receipt 

Transaction Date: 12 Ju! 2017 Trad<ingNumber: 1ZR5404FD395302732~~ 1~,tJ ~"' 
1ZR5404F0396126341 -=-" ;z ~--~ ~,. 
1ZR5404F0399032955 ~ ·~~ ,_;f,' 
1ZR5404F0398922567~-"""""" 1:g·, .?f! 
1ZR5404F0395695176=="""'·""" ~;:gt ~ cl.~ 
1ZR5404F0399250782 ~ ~~~-if"'!'# 
1ZR5404F0399489392 _.,,..~· ~t i:Jl 

1 ··,:;;-ADDR~~-;~FO~:;;~;-····------·----···---·---.. ----·---........ -------·------··--·----- ------- ... ,.. . .. l 
Ship To: Ship From: Return Address: 

/lm~rlcon H"-clrk Pnw~r l<entucky Pov<crComp~ny ICenlucky Pow<=r Company 
lJ[!'Jib~Ul Sekula Jttdy I< Rosquis!. JudyKRusqulst 
r'lc>or23 1011\ ~llt"'prls~ Drive 10111~nmrp1l•"- Drive 
One RlversldtlPia~il "'"" Rate• 
COLUMB!JSOH 4~?.152352 FRi\N[(fORfi<Y 40GOZ FIIIINICFORT KY 40!>07. 
lfl~phonc:611l-716-167.!> T dephone:502-6%-70ll Tdephon<>:502-691i·7011 

emoll:jkrosquist@<!ep.~om ~milll~l«osqulst@a"P-t<lm 

L." -- ---------------- ·-·- ---- .. --- -· ... ----- .. ---~ - - -----···· ·-· ......... _ 
(~) PACKAGE INFORMATION 

! WEIGHT DIMI!NSIONS/PACl<AGING DECLARED VALUE REFERENCE NUMBERS 

1. 28.0 lbs 1Bx12x9in. 
(28.0 lbs bill<lble) Other Packaging 

-i 2. 28.0 lbs 18x12x9in. 
(2B.O lbs billable) Other Packaging 

i 3. 28.0 lbs 18x12X9In. 
{28.0 lbs billable) Other Packaging 

i 1. 28.0 lbs 18x12x9in. 

! (28.0 lbs bU!able) Other Packaging 

! 5_ 50.0 lbs 18x12X9In. 
l {50.0 lbs billable} Other Pac)(aglng 

! 6. 13.0 lbs 12x9X9ln. 

I (13,0 lbs billnble) other Pad~ging 
l--- --·- ----- -17. 13.0 lbs 12x9x9ln. 

(13.0 lb.s billable) other Packaging 
--- ---~-·"·--·--···---..------·---······-- ···-------~-~----·-----------------~---·-· ----------------~---~--~---- ------------· ----···-·------------------..... , 

(3'J 
· ... J UPS SHIPPING SERVICE AND SHIPPING OPTIONS 

Service.: UPS Ground S<'(V\(e-

Guaranteed By: l;nd ofDayl'hUJsday,Ju\13, 2017 

Shipping Fees Subtotal: !ID.olUSD 

Transportation !M.lOIJSIJ 

Fuel Surcharge 4.93 USD 

--~-- ·~- -· ~·~~ 

___ , 
-~-~~~- ~-" - -· -"~ 

(~) PAYMENTINFORMATION l 
Bill Shipping Charges to: 

I 

Associated shipper's acco\tnt: S!llpper'!>/kcountR510~F 

https :/ /www. ups.com/uis/ create? ActionOriginPair-default_Pri:nt WindowPage&key=rec ... 7/12/2017 

I 
,tl 

li 
!J 
' 
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Shipping: UPS Page 2 of2 

Subtot<~l Shipping Charges: 

Daily rates were applied-to this shipment 
~"S'tlsf?...;j 

·--·---~--------------------·--·--·-·-·--·-----·---------------·--·-------~~-~---·--·-· .. ,, ___________ ,. __________ ~----------·----------------------····----------·---··-.J 

Note: This document Is not an Invoice. Yourfinal invoke mayvaryfromthe displayed reference rates. 

~ FlH' delivery and gt1arantee Information, seethe UPS Service Guide ({0}). To speak to a customer service representative, ca!ll-800-PICI(-ups for domestic 
!>enJkes and 1-800..782-7892 for international setvke.s. 
Respons!bilityforloss or Damage 
UPS's liability for loss ordam"geto each domestic pacl<ageorinternatlonal shipment is limited to $100 withoutn deci<Jratlon of value, Unless a greater valuei: 
rec.orded in the declared vqluefield of the UPS ~hlpp!ngsystem used, the shipper agrees that the released value of each ~ackage covered by this recelpt ls no 
J:reater than $100, which IS a reasonable value under the circumstances surrounding the transportation. To increase UPS's lfmlt ofllablllty for loss or damage, a 
~hipper may declare a higher value and pay an addltionaf charge. Seethe UPSTariff!ferms and Conditions ofSetvice (HUPS"ferms") ut www.ups.comforUPS's 
lir.lbility limits, maximUhl declared values, and otherterms of service. UPS does not accept for transportation and shippers arc prohibited from shipping, 
pC!<kilge.s with a value Of more than $50.000. The only exception to the $50,000 per package limit Is for a package eligible for the Enhanced Maximum Declare• 
Vi'llL.Ie of $"10,000 per package, as set forth In the UPS Terms. A ~:>ack<lge Is eligible only if it meets the following requirements. The pacl<a.ge must be (I) a domes1 
sllipment; (![)tendered pursuant to shipper's Scheduled Pickup Se!Vice; {!U) a UPS Next Day Alr(R) delivery service is the service level selected; (iv) processed fa 
sllipment using a UPS Shipping System {declarations ofvalue on paper Source Documents are not ellglblefor Enhanced Maximum Declared Value); and (v) do 
not contain hazardous material or a Perishable Commodity. Claims not made within nine months after delivery oft he package (sixty days for international 
shipments), or In the case offailureto make delivery, nine months nftera reasonable time for delivery has elapsed (sixty days for International shipments), sh. 
be deemed waived. The ent1y of a C.O.D. <~mount Is not a dedaratlon ofvalueforcarriage purposes, All checks or othernegotrable instrumP.ntstendered in 
paytnentofCnD. will be accepted by UPS at shipper's risk. UPS shall notbel!ab!e for any spedal, incldent:Jl, or consequential damages. AI! shipments are subj• 
to tl1e terms and conditions contained In the UPS Terms, which can be found atwww.ups.com. 

hltps: //v.rww .nps.com/uis/ create? Action OriginPair=default __ Plint Window Page&key=rec ... 7/12/2017 
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Shipping: UPS 

'I Shipment Receipt 

Transaction Date: 12 Jul2017 Tracking Number: 

G) ADDRESS INFORMATION 

' Ship To: ShipFrc;~m; Return Address: 

Kentu~ky Power t::Pillpany !(entucky !'ower Comp•ny K~n\U{ky Power Coml""nV 
Tri~ha 8!um Judyi<ROSQUM Judy I< Ro~qulst 
855 Central Avo 10111 Enterprl•e Drive 101AEnterprl•e Drive 

ASHLANDl<V 411017423 Rates ,.~ 

Tel"f'hone:lioti-!127·26110 flliii>IKFORT KY 40502 FRI\Ni{FORT K'( 40602 

emai~tnbiUm@ilep.con1 T~lephon~~02-696-7011 Telephone:SOZ-696-7011 

em~itjkro~l.llst@ilep.com emailj!<msqulst@lep.mm 

' 

(Z) PAO<AGE INFORMATION 

WEIGHT OIMENSIONS I PAd(AGING DECLARED VALUE 

1, 28.0\bs 1Bx12x9in. 
(28.0 lbs b!llable) Other \"ad<agit1g 

2. 28.0 lbs 1Bx13x11in. 
(28.0 lbs billable) Other Pad<aging 

3, 28.0 lbs 16xl3X10in. 
(ZB,O lbs billable) Other Packaging 

··-

0 UPS SHIPPING SERVICE AND SHIPPING OPTIONS 

Service: UPS Ground_ 'ie.J'II[m 

Guaranteed By: End of Dill/ 1\l.JI5day, Juli.J, 201'/ 

Shipping Fees Subtotal: 4l.47USD 
Additional Shipping Options 

Transportation 41.31 U~D Quantum View Notify E-mail Notifications: 

Fuel Surcharge 2.16U:ill 1 jkro:;qulsf®aep.mm: '"""' 

0 PICKUP INFORMATION 

Pid<Up Address Earliest Pidmp Time: 

l<cmucky ~owcrComj><uw Ul21l0]7 3:00P.M. 

JudyKRmqui•t latest Pickup Time: 
101AEnlerprise Drive 

7112f'l.Ol7 S;OOP.M. ' 
"'~ 
FRIINKFORTKY 40502 Pickup- Request Number: 
Tclephonn:~02·ij;JG·701l Cfl1'lj[:ji<rnS<jtJISI@a~p.mm 294610GPJGI( 

Schedule a Pickup 

Fuel Surcharge 

Total PidcupCharges 

0 PAYMENT!NFORMATION 

Bill Shipping and PidtupCharges~ M•~terCilrd XXK:<x:o:xxx100766 

Associated shipper's account Slllppc(s 1\ccouot 11.540~F 

Page 1 of2 

7: "14/ 
1ZR5404F0396311006 ..-"" .. ·1 -~ 1,':!f' 
1ZR5404F0399615610 --~ 7l., ":! ~ 
1ZR5404f0399303224 lrf• Cftj' 

REFERENCE NUMBERS 

NoOlarge 

6.90US 

Q36US 

7.2GUS 

i -~~#!iii@\@Wj[l'IT@!lm"·e' ~¥· @@%~ .. , 
https; //www. ups. com/uis/create? Action OriginPair=default_PrintWindowPage&key=rec... 7/12/2017 
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Shipping: UPS 

Shipping Charges: 

Subtotal Shipping Charges: 

Subtotal IJ[ckup ChargeS: 

Dally rates were applied to this shipment 
Total Charged: 

Note;Th!.s document is not an invoke. Yourfinallnvolce mayvaryfromthedlsplayed reference rates. 

Page 2 of2 

f)-3' qu.; ~;,. 
/ 

7.Z6USD 

*For delivery and guarantee information, see the UPS Service Guide ({0}}, To speak to a customer service representative, calll-800-PICK-UPS for domestic 
services and 1-800-782-7892 for international serv!ces. 
Responsibllltyfor Loss or Damage 
UPS's llabllltyfor loss or damage to each domestiC pilc\<age or international shipment Is limited to $100withouta declaration of value. Unless a greater value i: 
recorded in the declared value field of the UPS shipplngsystem used, the shipper agrees that the releilsed value of eilch packilge covered by this receipt is no 
greater than $100, which is a reasonable value underthedrcumstancessurroundlngthe transportation. lo Increase UPS's limltofllabllltyforloss or damage, a 
shipper may declare a higher value and pay an additional charge. See the UPS Tarlfffferms and Conditions of Service ("UPS Terms"} atwww.ups.comfor UPS's 
llabllity limits, maximum declared vulues, and other terms of service. UPS doP.s not accept for transportation and shippers ar-e prohibited frorri shipping, 
packages with a value of more than $50,000. The only exception to the $50,000 pel' package limit is for a puckage eligible for the Enhanced Maximum Declare• 
Value of $70,000 perpackag~ as set forth In the UPS Terms. A pad(age is eligible only if tt meets the folloWing requirements. The pad<age must be (I) a domeS" 
shipment; {il) tendered pursuant to shipper's Scheduled Pickup Service; {iii) a UPS Next Day Alr(R) d€livery service Is the service level selected; (lv) processed fa 
shipment using q UPS Shipping System (declarations of value 011 paper Source Documents are not eligible for Enhanced Maximum Declared Value); and (v) do 
not c.ontoin hazardous material or a Perishable Commodity. Claims not made within nine months after delivery of the package (sixty days for International 
shipments), or In the case of failure to make delivery, nine months after a reasonable tlmefor delivery has e{apsed (sixty days for international shipments), sh 
be deemed W<~lved. The entry of a C.O,D.amountls nota declaration ofva!ueforcarriage purposes. All ched<s orotlier negotiable instruments tendered In 
payment of C.O.D. will be accepted by UPS at shipper's risk. UPS shall not be llablefof any special, lnc!d~ntal, or consequential damages. AU shipments are sub]• 
to the terms and conditions contained in the UPST erms, which can be found atwww.ups.com. 

https://www. ups.com/uis/create?ActionOriginPai:t-default_PrintWindowPage&key=rec... 7/12/2017 
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Shipping: UPS Page 1 of2 

\1 Shipment Receipt 

Transaction Date! 06Jut 2017 TraddngNumber; 1ZR5404F0396662128 

0 ADDRESS INFORMATION 

Ship To: Ship From: Return Address: 

Kerltucky Power Comf'llflY Kentucky Pow..rComf"'llY K"ntlld(y row~• Company 
StevlCot>~m Judy KRosqul'it Jud)'KRosql.d'it 

12333 l(eYin Ave 1011\ Enterpr~ Drtve 101A Enterp~>tt DriV<! 

ASH!ANPKY 41102.8653 Rat.,.. Rat"' 
Telephone:502·6!1~j.1011 FRANKFORT KY 406llZ fHANI(f.ORT KY 40602 
"rn;ill:dkbordefl®ilep.com Telephon!!:50l-6!16-7011 Tel~phon<>:!iOZ-696-7011 

1!111alt)lcro>qu\sl®aep.com emall:~lrosqulsl$/let).Com 

G) PACI<AGE INFORMATION 

WEIGHT DIMENSIONS I PACI<AGING DECLARED VALUE REFERENCE NUMBERS 

1. 28.0!bs 18x11x1Dln. 
(28.0 tbs bl!la ble) Other Packaging 

0 UPS SHIPPING SERVICE AND SHIPPING OPTIONS 

Service: UPS: Ground s~.vice 

Gual'anteed By: End ofDayF~d"Y,Jul7, 2017 

ShippingFelils Subto~l: i4.49US!l 
Add!Uonal Shipping Options 

Transportation 13.77USO Quantum VIew Notify E-mail Notifications: No Charge 

Fuel Surcharge. 0.7ZU50 1 jktO$<Jilisl@a~p.rorn: Dclive<y 

E-rr\aU f:>l)ur~ I~OUH(atlon! ]kros:qu~aep.cum 

0 PAYMENT INFORMATION 

Bill ShippingCh1:1rges to; MasterCard JO>;XI\lQPOCXX)<l(3761i 

Associated shipper's account: Ship!>el's ll=>untR5404F 

Shipping Charges: n,)j!ltJSD 

Subtotal Shipping Charges: 1/}if -Daily rates were applied to this shipment 
Total Charged: ""'"""" 

Note-: This document Is not an Invoice. Your final invoice may vary from the displayed reference rates. 

https ://www. ups.com/uis/ create? ActionOriginPair=default_PrintWindow Page&key=recei... 7/6/2017 
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Shipping: UPS Page 1 of2 

(I Shipment Receipt 

Trans<~ction Date: 06Jul2017 Traddng Number: 1ZR5404F0395304516 

(0 ADDRESSINFORMATION 

Ship To: Ship from: Return Address: 

l<etltl.lcky Power Cnmp~ny Kent11d<y PowerComp~ny l{cnb.!d<V Power Compillly 
Jadde Chaney JUdy'KRQ~qul<t Judy K Rosqukt 
~4!)N,Mayofr~U 101A ~t~rpr)<!! Drive 1!11A Enr..-prlse Drive 

PIKEVILLEK'f ~15013388 '"5 Rate 
Tclephone:~06·4~'/-3827 fAANI(fORT KY 40602 FRANKFORT KV 40W2 
email~rdlilrmy@a~!).rom 'tlllephor~eS02:-696-7011 Tel~phone:502-Ii95-7011 

emsifjkr>:Jsqulst®aep.com cmall:jkrosquil'l@""f'·Cllm 

0 PACKAGE INFORMATION 

WEiGHT DIMENSIONS /llACI<AGING DECLARED VALUE REFfRENCE NUMBERS l 1. 28.0 lbs 18x11x10in, 
(28.0 lbs billable} Other Packaging 

0 UPS SHIPPING SERVKEAND SHIPPING OPTIONS 

Service: Ut'S Ground S..rvke 

Guaranteed By; End ofO~y Hlday,Jul7, 2G17 

Shipping Fees Subtotal: 16.!!:lUSD 
Addltlon!ll Shipping Optlo11s 

Transportation 13.77USD Quantum View Notify EMmail Notifications: No Charge 

FueiSlm:harge 0.84lJSD 1 jkrm<jlll~l@aep.com: Delillll.ry 

Delivery Area Surcharge 
230USD 

E-mail Failure Notllki!tlon: lkro~ut~l®~ep.com 

Package 1 

0 PAYMENT INFORMATION 

Bill Shipping Charges to-: Ma>l~rcmd XI!XI!XI!Xxxxxll.3765 

Assodated shipper's account: Slllpp,-'sArrounlRS404F 

ShlppfngCharges: 

'ef l) 
~ 

/0 Subtotal Shipping Charges: ~1<\l:>B"' 

Daily rates were applied to this shipment 
Total Charged: ,,l)>m.~ttsa= 

Note: This document is not an itwo!c.e. Yourflnal invoice may varyfrotn the displayed reference rates. 

https://www.ups.com/uis/ create? ActionOriginPair=deiim1t_Print Win dow Page&key=orecei... 7/6/2017 
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Oft!ce Supplies: Office Products and Office Furniture: Office Depot 

Shipment Summary 

SJ1ipment 1 Order Number: 942883395-001 EsUmatedArrival By: 07/13/2017 View Order Delails 

Order Information 

Account#: PO NumPer: 
Your Order NUmber Is: 942883395 FLOOR#; GROUND 
Comp:-my Name: AME:RICAN ELECTRIC POWERcost 

Center~ 

NAME; 

11011783 

JUDY K ROSQUIST 
Contact JUDY 

Shipping Information 

I<YSO 
AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER 
10·1 ENTERPRISE DRLVE 
I<ENTUCI<Y STATE OFFICE 
FnANKFORT, KY40601 USA 
jTt~xablv) 

Pnyment lnfonnatlon 

Crectil Card (MASTERCARD) 

Order Summary 

Shipment 1 Order Date; 07/121.2017 

Contact: ROSQUIST 
Conlr1cl Phone: 

Delivery Dato: 07/1312017 {)8!30 AM" 05:00PM Order Number: 942883395-001 

Description 

(502)69!).7011 

Xorox® Vltallty-m Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 92 Brightness, 20 Lb. FSG® 
Certified, 500 Sheels Per Ream, C11sa Of 10 Reams 
Entered Item# 275474 

)(> ·a~h~li; 

Subtotal: $267.60 

Dellvery 
FREE Fgg: 

Miscellaneous $0.00 

Taxes; $16.06 

Tot~!: $283-.66 

https://business.officedepot.com/checkout/confirmRouter.do 

Page 1 of 1 

Your Q"• A II bl 810 To!"l Common'" Pr1ce/unlt "Y· va a e " "' 

$53.52/ 5 
carton 

5 0 $267.60 

7/12/2017 
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Judy K Rosquist 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

ODOnline@OfficeDepot.com 
Monday, July 10, 2017 11:52 AM 
Judy I< Rosquist 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Order Confirmation -Multiple Orders 

This is an EXTERNAL email. STOP. THINK before you CLICI< links or OPEN attachments. 

********************************************************************** 
Order Confirmation 

This order contains multiple shipments. Please be sure to review each individual order listed below. 

Thank you for shopping with Office Depot. 

We are confident you will be pleased and look forward to serving you again soon. 

Note that your order will arrive in *multiple* shipments and we have created unique order numbers for each, so you 
can track status and delivery of each. 

Note that due to product availability or size, items ordered together may not be shipped together. Shipping confirmation 
emails will provide details on all shipments. 

For your reference, below is a summary of your order. 

Shipment 1 Expected delivery date: 07.11.2017 8:30AM-5:00PM 

Order Number: 942203942-001 

Account# ....... . 
Customer Name: JUDY I< ROSQUIST 
Ordered By: JI<ROSQUIST@AEP.COM 
Last Modified By: JI<ROSQUIST@AEP.COM 
Order Date: 07.10.2017 

1 

' i: 

·~ 
I 
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LOC: 1170- DC HAMILTON, OH 
Delivery Type: Delivery 
Delivery Method: 

PO Number: 
Contact: JUDY ROSQUIST 

NAME: JUDY I< ROSQUIST 
CC: 11011783 
FLOOR II: GROUND 
ASSET: 
Status: In Process 
Payment info: Credit Card (MASTERCARD). 
Tracking: See below 

Comments: 

Shipping to: 
AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER 
101 ENTERPRISE DRIVE 
KENTUCKY STATE OFFICE 
FRANI<FORT, KY 40601 

To Be 

SI<U Cust # Ord Shipped B/0 UM Price Ext 

ACC36251 8843.87 100 100 0 each 5.010 501.00 

CVR RPT CLR FRNT W/FSTNR 
Eco-Conscious, Eco-Recycled, Best Value 

AVE11396 920967 12 12 0 set 5.290 63.48 
INDEX, LTR SIDE TAB 51-75 
Eco-Conscious, Eco-Recycled, Recycled 

Subtotal: 564.48 
Tax: 33.87 
Delivery Charge: 0.00 
Misc.: 0.00 

2 
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Total: 598.35 

********************************************************************* 

Shipment 2 Expected delivery date: 07.13.2017 8:30AM- 5:00 PM 

Order Number: 942204256-001 

Account~ 
Customer Name: JUDY I< ROSQUIST 
Ordered By: Li<RQSQUIST@AEP .COM 
Last Modified By: lKROSQ.UIST@AEP.COM 
Order Date: 07.10.2017 
LOC: 6877 ·DC COLUMBUS, OH 
Delivery Type: Delivery 
Delivery Method: 

PO Number: 
Contact: JUDY ROSQUIST 
NAME: JUDY K ROSQUIST 
CC:11011783 
FLOOR ff: GROUND 
ASSET: 
Status: In Process 
Payment info: Credit Card (MASTERCARD). 
Tracking: See below 

Comments: 

Shipping to: 
AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER 
101 ENTERPRISE DRIVE 
I(ENTUCI<Y STATE OfFICE 
FRANKFORT, I<Y 40601 

To Be 
SKU Cust # Ord Shipped B/0 UM Price Ext 

0363792 363792 1 1 0 pack 26.050 26.05 
Scotch( reg) Heavy-Duty Shipping Packing Tape, 1 7 /8" x 54 5/8 Yd., Pack Of 6 Rolls Best Value 

3 
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Subtotal: 26.05 
Tax: 1.56 
Delivery Charge: 0.00 
Misc.: 0.00 

Total: 27.61 

********************************************************************* 

Grand Total for all orders: $625.96 

Legend 

Ord: Original Quantity Ordered 
To Be Shipped: Ordered Quantity- Backorder Quantity 
B/0: Backorder Quantity 
UM: Unit of Measure 
CC: Cost Center 
Price: Price per Individual Unit 
Ext: Ordered Quantity x Price 

You can track delivery of your order online. Log in at https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-
3A business.officedepot.com&d=DwiCAw&c=gMbiD-Q9WoaRgoXZKCrSug&r=I3RyUdH3kuEWu33jtCS-
MEi550S20 1nPORYd49hRgw&m=6PFqh20g4VLWPYYU-DNxHVaBM6bihmELOY3VtHOLGPE&s=PirA8AAjDTz­
tqtl7azkreWBw09JgulmJOTgHiwlxDg&e= and go to Order Tracking to track delivery of your order by entering the order 
number shown in this email. 
Subscribe to receive email alerts about exclusive offers at Office Depot Update your contact information and 
subscription preferences today!. 
Questions? We are taking care of business every day, and we are ready to help: Call 888.263.3423 or email us at 
f(:Support@officedepot.com for prompt answers to all your questions. 

For compliance with select California laws and for financial reporting purposes, all sales shipped to California and Texas 
customers are made by eDepot, LLC, a wholly-owned subsidiary of Office Depot, Inc, and are F.O.B. destination point. 

4 
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0±1lce Supplies: Office Products and Office Furniture: Office Depot 

Shipment Summary 

Shipment 1 Order Number: 941206732-001 Estimated Arrival By: 07/06/2017 View Order Details 

Order Information 

Account#: 3 T PO Number: 
Your Order N'l'l"rfitler is: 941206732 FLOOR#: FRONT 
Company Name: AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER cost 

Center: 11011783 

NAME: JUDY K ROSQUIST 
Contact: JUDY 

Shipping Information 

KYSO 
AMERICAN ELECTRIC POWER 
101 ENTERPRISE DRIVE 
KENTUCKY STATE OFFICE 
FRANKFORT, KY40601 USA 
(Taxable) 

P<~yment Information 

Credit Card (MASTERCARD) 

Credit Card Number:******'********" 

Order Summary 

Shipment 1 Order Date: 07/05/2017 

Contact: ROSQUIST 
Contact Phone: 

Dolivery Date: 07/06/2017 08:30AM-05:00PM Order Number: 941206732-001 

Description 

{502)696-7011 

Xerox® VitalityTM Multipurpose Printer Paper, Letter Size Paper, 98 Brightness, 20 Lb, FSG® 
Certified, Ream Of 500 Sheets 
Entered Item# 345603 

Subtotal: $436.50 

Delivery FREE Fee: 

Miscellaneous $0.00 

Taxes: $26.19 

Total: $462.69 

https://business.o±1lcedepot.com/checkout/confinnRouter.do 

Page 1 of 1 

Your Qt AV"O.i"bi" B/0 Price/unit y. "' '"' " Total Comments 

$8.73/ 50 
ream 

50 0 $436.50 

7/5/2017 
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FINANCIAL CONCEPTS AND APPLICATIONS, INC. 
3907 RED RIVER 

(512) 458-4644 

Mr. Hector Garcia, Esq. 
Legal Department 
American Electric Power 
29th Floor 
1 Riverside Plaza 
Columbus, Ohio 43215 

Consulting Services: 

Professional Time: 

Total 

AUSTIN, TEXAS 78751 

.June 30, 2017 

DUE ON RECEIPT 

fincap2®texas.nli!t 

Fax (512) 458-4768 

Reference No.: 01988 ·~4 ... 
Taxpayer ID No.: _. 
Research, Analysis, and Testimony Preparation 
in Connection with Rate of Return on Equity for 
Kentucky Power before the Kentucky Public 
Service Commission. 

For the Period: 
March 1 through June 30, 2017 

Adrien M. McKenzie 
36.0 hours @ $ 300 $ 10,800 

$ 10,800 
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cc 
July 17, 2017 

INVOICE 17 -000704F 

Hector Garcia 
Senior Counsel 
American Electric Power 
1 Riverside Plaza, 291

h Floor 
Columbus, OH 43215 

RE: Litigation Support 

Research & Planning 

Expenses (detail attached) 

Research and Planning 
July 12-14, 2017 

Research Fees + Expenses Due 

Payment due upon receipt of this invoice, please. 

Research & Planning 

$11,550.00 

2,160.89 

$13.710.89 

CCA provides on-site pre-session research and interviews, conducted by a CCA 
consultant, and off-site writing & planning for these labs. 

RESEARCH includes in-depth interviews conducted by a CCA consultant with 
your experts on case strategy, witness-specific case issues, and 
review of selected documents. 17400 Dallas Parkway, Suite 200 

Dallas, Texas 75287 

972.713.7474 1 office 
972.713.7492 1 fax 

WWW.CCA-CONSULTING.COM 
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