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DOC11R Case Management System - KY Public Service Commission

Regular Cases Before the Commission as of August 05, 2025     

2025-00052 RECEIVED: 04/03/25 FILED: 04/03/25 FINAL: 07/28/25 REOPENED: 
SUSPENSION DATE: 

CASE CODE
Surcharge - Environmental

UTILITIES:
Big Rivers Electric Corporation

INDEX OF EVENTS:
     07/28/25 1. BREC’s request to submit this case for a decision on the existing evidence of record without a

hearing is granted. 2. BREC’s determination that it had no additional over- or under-recovery for the
review period is approved. 3. The amounts billed by BREC through its environmental surcharge for the
six-month billing periods ending January 31, 2024, July 31, 2024, and January 31, 2025, are approved
as reasonable. 4. The amounts billed by the three Member Cooperatives through their respective
environmental surcharge pass-through mechanisms for the six-month billing periods ending January
31, 2024, July 31, 2024, and January 31, 2025, for all customers with dedicated delivery points are
approved as reasonable. 5. The amounts billed by the three Member Cooperatives through their
respective environmental surcharge pass-through mechanisms for the six-month billing periods ending
February 2024, August 2024, and February 2025, for all other non- dedicated delivery point customers
are approved as reasonable. 6. The rates of return determined by BREC for each month of the review
period are approved as  reasonable. 7. This case is closed and removed from the Commission’s
docket.

     06/30/25 Senthia Santana Big Rivers Electric Corporation Request for Decision
     04/28/25 Senthia Santana Big Rivers Electric Corporation Direct Testimony and Responses to Staffs Information

Request pursuant to April 3, 2025, Order
     04/23/25 Senthia Santana Big Rivers Electric Corporation Supplement to Big Rivers April 10, 2025, 807 KAR

5:001 Section 8(10)(b) Certification
     04/10/25 Senthia Santana Big Rivers Electric Corporation 807 KAR Section 8(10)(b) Certificate
     04/03/25 Order Entered: 1. This proceeding is initiated to review BREC’s environmental surcharge and the pass-

through mechanism for BREC’s Member Cooperatives for the billing periods set forth in this Order. 2.
The procedural schedule set forth in Appendix A to this Order shall be followed. 3. BREC and each of
its Member Cooperatives listed in footnote 2 in this Order shall be parties to this case. 4. On or before
the date set forth in the procedural schedule, BREC and each of its Member Cooperatives shall file its
responses to the information requested in Appendix B attached to this Order. 5. BREC and each of its
Member Cooperatives shall respond to any additional requests for information propounded by
Commission Staff as provided in those requests. 6. Unless otherwise ordered by the Commission, the
procedures set forth in 807 KAR 5:001, Section 8, related to the service and electronic filing of papers
shall be followed in this proceeding. 7. Any party filing a paper with the Commission shall file an
electronic copy in accordance with the electronic filing procedures set forth in 807 KAR 5:001, Section
8. Electronic documents shall be in portable document format (PDF), shall be searchable, and shall be
appropriately bookmarked. The Commission directs the parties to the Commission’s July 22, 2021
Order in Case No. 2020-00085 regarding filings with the Commission.

Total Number of Cases:  1


