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2022-00246 RECEIVED: 08/12/22 FILED: 08/12/22 FINAL: 06/12/23 REOPENED: 
SUSPENSION DATE: 02/10/23

CASE CODE
Alternative Rate Filing Adjustment

UTILITIES:
Green-Taylor Water District

HEARINGS:
04/13/23 Informal Conference

INDEX OF EVENTS:
     12/06/23 POST CASE: Robert K Miller Green-Taylor Water District Cover letter and rate sufficiency report.
     06/12/23 Final Order Entered: 1. The recommendations contained in the Commission Staff’s Report, except as

modified in this Order, are adopted and incorporated by reference into this Order as if fully set out in
this Order. 2. Green-Taylor District’s request to not adjust the retail water service rates and the
wholesale water service rates is approved. 3. The nonrecurring charges proposed in the cost
justification sheets filed in this case and that are stated in the Appendix to this Order are approved for
service rendered on and after the date of this Order.  4. Within 20 days of the date of service of this
Order, Green-Taylor District shall file with this Commission, using the Commission’s electronic Tariff
Filing System, new tariff sheets setting forth the rates and charges approved herein and their effective
date, and stating that the rates and charges were authorized by this Order.  5.   Green-Taylor District
shall use the midpoint of the depreciable lives of the National Association of Regulatory Utility
Commissioners ranges, as proposed in the application and agreed upon by Staff, to depreciate water
plant assets for accounting purposes in all future reporting periods. No adjustment to accumulated
depreciation or retained earnings should be made to account for this change in the accounting
estimate.  6.   Green-Taylor District shall be required to establish a policy to perform an annual review
of its rate sufficiency.

     04/21/23 Letter Filing IC Memo into the Record
     04/21/23 John D Henderson Green-Taylor Water District Informal conference supplemental information
     03/29/23 Order Entered: An IC is scheduled on April 13, 2023, at 11 a.m. Eastern Daylight Time.
     03/09/23 John D Henderson Green-Taylor Water District Supplemental Comment to the Staffs Report dated

February 24, 2023
     03/08/23 John D Henderson Green-Taylor Water District Motion for an Informal Conference
     03/08/23 John D Henderson Green-Taylor Water District Comments to the Staff Report dated February 24, 2023
     03/08/23 John D Henderson Green-Taylor Water District Entry of appearance for GTWD.
     02/24/23 NOTICE OF FILING OF COMMISSION STAFF’S REPORT
     12/27/22 Alan Vilines Green-Taylor Water District RFI #4 response
     12/13/22 COMMISSION STAFF’S FOURTH REQUEST FOR INFORMATION TO GREEN-TAYLOR WATER

DISTRICT
     12/13/22 Order Entered: the procedural schedule established in the September 2, 2022 Order be amended as

follows:  1.   Commission Staff may issue additional requests for information, and Green- Taylor shall
respond to any such requests for information within 14 days from the date of service of these requests.
2.   No later than February 25, 2023, Commission Staff shall file with the Commission and serve upon
all parties of record a written report containing its findings regarding Green-Taylor District’s requested
rate adjustment.  3.   All provisions of the Commission’s Order of September 2, 2022, in conflict with
the provisions of this Order are vacated. All other provisions of the September 2,
2022 Order not in conflict shall remain in effect.

     11/14/22 Alan Vilines Green-Taylor Water District RFI #3 Response
     11/08/22 COMMISSION STAFF’S THIRD REQUEST FOR INFORMATION TO GREEN-TAYLOR WATER

DISTRICT
     11/01/22 Alan Vilines Green-Taylor Water District RFI #2 Response
     10/18/22 COMMISSION STAFF’S SECOND REQUEST FOR INFORMATION TO GREEN-TAYLOR WATER

DISTRICT
     09/27/22 Alan Vilines Green-Taylor Water District Response to RFI #1
     09/02/22 Order Entered: 1.   The procedural schedule set forth in Appendix A to this Order shall be followed.  2.

On or before the date set forth in the procedural schedule, Green-Taylor District shall file its responses
to the Commission Staff’s First Request for Information, attached to this Order as Appendix B.  3.   No
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later than the date set forth in the procedural schedule, Commission Staff shall file with the
Commission and serve upon all parties of record a written report (Commission Staff’s Report)
containing its findings and recommendations regarding Green-Taylor District’s requested rate
adjustment.  4.   No later than 16 days after the date of service of the Commission Staff’s Report, each
party 
of record shall file with the Commission:  a.   Its written comments on and any objections to the findings
contained in the Commission Staff’s 
Report; and  b.   Any additional evidence for the Commission to consider.  5.   If Commission Staff
finds that Green-Taylor District’s financial condition supports a rate other than Green-Taylor District
proposes or the assessment of an additional rate or charge not proposed in Green-Taylor District’s
application, Green-Taylor District, in its response to the Commission Staff’s Report, shall also state its
position in writing on whether the Commission should authorize the assessment of the Commission
Staff proposed rate or the additional rate or charge.

     08/25/22 Alan Vilines Green-Taylor Water District Supplemental Information
     08/12/22 No deficiency letter
     08/12/22 Alan Vilines Green-Taylor Water District ARF Application
     08/04/22 Acknowledge Receipt of Filing
     08/04/22 Green-Taylor Water District Notice of Intent to File an Application for a Rate Adjustment pursuant to

807 KAR 5:076 Using Electronic Filing Procedures

Total Number of Cases:  1


