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April 10, 2025 

PARTIES OF RECORD 

Re: Case No. 2024-00359 

Notice is given to all parties that the attached Livingston response and receipt has 
been filed into the record of this proceeding.   

If you have any comments you would like to make regarding the contents of the 
document, please do so within five days of receipt of this letter.  If you have any questions, 
please contact Justin Young, Staff Attorney, at JustinW.Young@ky.gov. 

Sincerely, 

Linda C. Bridwell, PE
Executive Director 

Attachment 



 
 
City of Livingston         April 1, 2025 
P.O. Box 654 
Livingston, KY 40445 
cityoflivingston@windstream.net 
606-453-2061 
 

PSC Response Request 

 

In response to the filing of Woods Creek Water District: 

 

The City of Livingston has issued payment for water bills prior to the due date. The City of 

Livingston had already issued a payment for the water bill due in March on March 13th, 2025, 

which was deposited on March 28th, 2025 by Woods Creek Water District.  

“The Commission finds that to assure adequate, efficient, and reasonable service 

between Wood Creek District and Livingston, Wood Creek District should not terminate 

water service to Livingston so long as Livingston is making a monthly payment addressing 

all or portions of Livingston’s most recently billed water purchase and portions of the 

accrued arrearage, or upon order of the Commission.” (Paragraph 3, sentence 1 of PSC order) 

 
Livingston Municipal Water Works has not failed to make a monthly payment addressing all of 

Livingston’s most recently billed water purchases, and as the order states, Livingston Municipal 

Water Works could make portions for the most recently billed water purchase. However, that has 

not occurred. The Public Service Commission has also not ordered the water service to be 

disconnected as stated in the last section of the statement quoted above. Livingston Municipal 



 
 
Water Works is willing to hand-deliver future payments to avoid future discrepancies or 

arguments on the date of receipt or arrival of payments, for the discretion of accrued late charges.  

Livingston is willing to pay the amount of $1,173.42 in claimed late fees by Woods Creek Water 

District if necessary to avoid a cut-off for the customers of Livingston Municipal Water Works 

and Kentucky American Water Customers. However, we do not feel that the fees are owed or 

that the notice of cut-off has been appropriately issued according to the order given by the Public 

Service Commission. 

 

Thank you, 

 

 

Livingston Municipal Water Works  





This Message Originated from Outside the Organization
This Message Is From an External Sender.

  Report Suspicious   ‌

From: Samantha Smoker <cityoflivingston@windstream.net> 
Sent: Friday, April 4, 2025 2:11 PM
To: PSC Executive Director <PSCED@ky.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Response

This is a follow up from yesterday. I just want to verify that Livingston has fulfilled the request of payment to Wood Creek. The intent is to pay off debts owed and sell the system to an entity capable of maintaining and appropriately operating. 
ZjQcmQRYFpfptBannerStart

ZjQcmQRYFpfptBannerEnd

This is a follow up from yesterday. I just want to verify that Livingston has fulfilled the
request of payment to Wood Creek. 
The intent is to pay off debts owed and sell the system to an entity capable of
maintaining and appropriately operating. 

thank you

From: Samantha <cityoflivingston@windstream.net>
To: KY_PSC <pscfilings@ky.gov>; charles <charles.boland@amwater.com>; Hal
<hholbrook@rockcastlecountyky.com>
Date: Tuesday, 1 April 2025 1:36 PM EDT
Subject: Response

I have called for assistance on filing this formally through efilings but have not
received a call back. Here is a copy in the meantime.

Thank you,
Samantha

https://us-phishalarm-ewt.proofpoint.com/EWT/v1/Db6frn15oIvDD3UI!zRhyQl7wsig6uRc4paHGd10Pe7mk_91zEYaRuDOJQy3xjDOZLNmfer9C_WUfFQyAyfBTP3_JJjVLqggwo2_CWcjZ6ARk4fR-Sf0XIJWsjpQPxf-9AJVd_g$
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mailto:PSCED@ky.gov
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City of Livingston									April 1, 2025

P.O. Box 654

Livingston, KY 40445

cityoflivingston@windstream.net

606-453-2061



PSC Response Request



In response to the filing of Woods Creek Water District:



The City of Livingston has issued payment for water bills prior to the due date. The City of Livingston had already issued a payment for the water bill due in March on March 13th, 2025, which was deposited on March 28th, 2025 by Woods Creek Water District. 

“The Commission finds that to assure adequate, efficient, and reasonable service

between Wood Creek District and Livingston, Wood Creek District should not terminate

water service to Livingston so long as Livingston is making a monthly payment addressing

all or portions of Livingston’s most recently billed water purchase and portions of the

accrued arrearage, or upon order of the Commission.” (Paragraph 3, sentence 1 of PSC order)



Livingston Municipal Water Works has not failed to make a monthly payment addressing all of Livingston’s most recently billed water purchases, and as the order states, Livingston Municipal Water Works could make portions for the most recently billed water purchase. However, that has not occurred. The Public Service Commission has also not ordered the water service to be disconnected as stated in the last section of the statement quoted above. Livingston Municipal Water Works is willing to hand-deliver future payments to avoid future discrepancies or arguments on the date of receipt or arrival of payments, for the discretion of accrued late charges. 

Livingston is willing to pay the amount of $1,173.42 in claimed late fees by Woods Creek Water District if necessary to avoid a cut-off for the customers of Livingston Municipal Water Works and Kentucky American Water Customers. However, we do not feel that the fees are owed or that the notice of cut-off has been appropriately issued according to the order given by the Public Service Commission.



Thank you,





Livingston Municipal Water Works 
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Andrea Bramblett
Cross-Out



 *Denotes Served by Email                                         Service List for Case 2024-00359

*City of Livingston Water Works
City of Livingston Water Works
P. O. Box 654
Livingston, KY  40445

*David Pippen
Kentucky-American Water Company
2300 Richmond Road
Lexington, KY  40502

*Wood Creek Water District
1670 Hal Rogers Parkway
P. O. Box 726
London, KY  40743

*Wood Creek Water District
Wood Creek Water District
1670 Hal Rogers Parkway
P. O. Box 726
London, KY  40743

*Dewayne Lewis
Wood Creek Water District
P. O. Box 726
London, KY  40743

*Kentucky-American Water Company
Kentucky-American Water Company
2300 Richmond Road
Lexington, KY  40502

*John Horne
Office of the Attorney General Office of Rate
700 Capitol Avenue
Suite 20
Frankfort, KY  40601-8204

*Honorable Lindsey W Ingram, III
Attorney at Law
STOLL KEENON OGDEN PLLC
300 West Vine Street
Suite 2100
Lexington, KY  40507-1801

*Honorable Larry G Bryson
318 West Dixie Street
London, KY  40741

*Molly Van Over
Kentucky-American Water Company
2300 Richmond Road
Lexington, KY  40502

*Sarah Gaddis
Director
Kentucky Division of Water
300 Sower Boulevard, 3rd Floor
Frankfort, KY  40601
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