
David R. Bryant 
353 Crandall Dr 
Worthington, OH 
43085-320 1 

September 25,2009 

Executive Directors Office 
Public Services Commission of Kentucky 
PO Box 6 15 
Frankfort, Kentucky 40402 

E F :  Case # 2009-00363--0ur Objection To This Matter, And 
Our Request For Intervention 

To Whom It May Concern: 

This letter is to set forth my, and our, strong objection to the construction of the new 
cellular tower for which Bluegrass Wireless is currently seeking your approval. The 
concerns and objections to this project as stated below are several, but they center 
upon the fact that construction of the tower on the site Bluegrass proposes would 
seriously undermine the residential property values of several homes very near by, 
mine included and as marked on the attached, would damage the value of other 
properties just slightly further away, and would generally debase the beauty and 
appeal of the immediate surrounding neighborhood we call home. 

Please be advised that the hill upon which Bluegrass wants to build the tower is 
already roughly 150 feet in elevation above the residences on Stilesville Road, and 
the proximity of these existing homes, mine included, to the tower is shown on the 
enclosed map. The Bluegrass tower alone is planned to be 240 feet tall by itself. 
Therefore, the height of the hill together with the height of the tower will combine 
to create a massive eyesore in the vicinity of 350-400 feet tall. It is my opinion, as 
well as that of my neighbors, that this enormous, unsightly structure would 
completely impose its unsightly presence upon our residences and our 
neighbarhood, and would inevitably and significantly devalue our homes. No one 
could logically argue that we would not be adversely and materially affected by this. 

Before going further, let me interject a hypothetical question to drive home the point 
of the damage we would incur if the tower is built, and that question is: how many 
of you, personally, or how many of Bluegrass Wireless executives or its 
shareholders would purchase a home or invest in any real estate which was located 
very close to an unsightly, gigantic steel tower. Naturally, the answer is that no one 
would make that investment because such property is universally considered 
undesirable. And that is precisely why, we think, that Bluegrass has a public 
obligation to build their towers in more appropriate, more remote areas where their 



structures are less likely to damage property values and create nearby, glaring 
eyesores. Anyone living in Pulaski County knows that our area literally abounds in 
less damaging potential sites for tower construction. 

Please note on the enclosed Bluegrass map, on which I have made some markings, 
that the map seems to focus upon only a 500 foot radius from the proposed center of 
the tower, and focusing on just a 500 foot radius it, intentionally or not, seems to 
imply that this short 500 foot area should be the only area affected by their tower. In 
doing that, however, it ignores my house, which is right at the 500 foot mark, and 
on which they failed to show that I had a house on my property, and it further 
ignores my immediate neighbors whose homes again are a mere 600-900 feet from 
the proposed tower. 

Each of our homes are part of a growing community called Deep Springs 
subdivision, and each of us selected this community for its natural beauty and, of 
great importance to all of us, because it was a planned community with rules and 
regulations designed to preserve the value of our homes and our neighborhood. 
There are many other homes and home sites not able to be shown on the enclosed 
maps, some already built and occupied, and many other lots sold for future building. 
Therefore, please note the number of adversely affected property owners is much 
geater tixiin just my personal home and that of my immediate neighbors, although 
our specific homes me the ones in the Deep Springs community which are the very 
closest to the proposed tower. We wodd kve, e€ coxwe, never k a g i ~ e d  &at we 
would one day be looking & the prospect ofiul. wmaus  tower bFxilt si&% next to 
ow homes, md on the 
someone believe &ere is only one single ~ Q W X  nearby. Not true at all. 

of ow community. The Bluegrass map would have 

Having now explained to you o w  deep and justifiable concerns on this matter, we 
respectfdy request that you withhold your approval of the construction of this 
facility. 

Respectfblly Submitted, 

David R. Bryant 

Whose property is located at 2777 Stilesville Road, Science Hill, KY 
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