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Hinton, Daniel E (PSC)

From: Johnna DeWitt 
Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2015 1:39 PM
To: Whelan, Chris (PSC)
Cc: Purvis, Marybeth (PSC); Hinton, Daniel E (PSC); Kirtley, Brent (PSC); Debbie Martin
Subject: RE: Shelby Energy Tariff Filing 748

Chris: 
 
Just to clarify on your question about page 6 of the annual report, the Investments in Assoc. Organizations (123) in the 
amount of $21,417,136.61 includes other patronage than East Kentucky, which is the $17,889,538.04.  
 
We hope this answers your question. Please let me know if you have any further questions.  
 
Merry Christmas! 
 
Best regards, 

Johnna DeWitt 
Johnna DeWitt 
Executive Assistant 
Work: 502.633.4420  
Fax: 502.633.2387 
Email:   
 

 
This email message and any attachments are for the sole and confidential use of the intended recipients and may contain proprietary and/or 
confidential information which may be privileged or otherwise protected from disclosure. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is 
strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and delete the original message from your 
computer system and destroy any copies of the message as well as any attachments. Shelby Energy Cooperative cannot guarantee the security of 
the transmission and assumes no responsibility for intentional or accidental receipt by a third party. 
 

From: Whelan, Chris (PSC)   
Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2015 12:00 PM 
To: Johnna DeWitt 
Cc: Purvis, Marybeth (PSC); Hinton, Daniel E (PSC); Kirtley, Brent (PSC) 
Subject: RE: Shelby Energy Tariff Filing 748 
 

Johnna, 
Upon further review, whatever the correct amount for the capital G&T Patronage capital, it shouldn’t change 
the lighting rates because Shelby used the return from the 2009 rate case.  Therefore, I believe Staff is ok with 
the calculations for the lighting rates provided in the revised filing made on 12/17/15.  You should get an e‐
mail regarding approval once we complete our process. 
Merry Christmas, 
Chris 
 

From: Whelan, Chris (PSC)  
Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2015 11:04 AM 
To: 'Johnna DeWitt' 
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Cc: Purvis, Marybeth (PSC) 
Subject: RE: Shelby Energy Tariff Filing 748 
 

Johnna, 
We are ok with this response except for the amounts of G&T Patronage Capital for 2013 and 2014.  The 
amounts do not reconcile with the annual reports (ref. page 6).  Can you explain why they differ from the 
annual report? 
Thanks, 
Chris 
 

From: Johnna DeWitt   
Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2015 10:43 AM 
To: PSC - Tariffs 
Cc: Whelan, Chris (PSC); Debbie Martin 
Subject: Shelby Energy Tariff Filing 748 
Importance: High 
 
Good morning,  
 
Please see the below and attached in response to the additional questions asked by the PSC on 12/22/15.  
 

1. In reference to Exhibit A, page 3 of 4, Box D:  19.8 million and 20.6 million in equity – Where did those numbers 
come from?  
 

Equity Calculation  2013  2014 

Total Margins & Equity (Pg. 8 – Annual Report)  $35,475,435.11  $38,525,785.09 

Less: G&T Patronage Capital  $15,583,611.79  $17,889,538.04 

Equity  $19,891,823.32  $20,636,247.05 

 
2. Need supporting documentation for the cost of the lighting unit. An invoice or email from the vendor is what 

they are looking for. 
 
See Attached 
 
Note: A cobra head light requires the use of an 8’ aluminum arm which cost approximately $105, depending on 
the price of aluminum at the time of purchase.  Additionally, a directional flood light requires the use of a 
mounting attachment that costs approximately $33.  These costs have been included in the cost of the fixture.   

 
3. In reference to page 322 of the tariff, under “Types of Service”: “The lighting unit shall be controlled by a 

photocell to energize the unit from dusk to dawn.” ‐ Explain why there is a full cost need if the sun is providing 
energy as well.  

 
A photocell is used to regulate the flow of current or simply used as an automatic control system.  Energy still 
must be provided in order for the light to work. 

 
Please let us know if you have any further questions.  
 
Best regards, 

Johnna DeWitt 
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Johnna DeWitt 
Executive Assistant 
Work: 502.633.4420  
Fax: 502.633.2387 
Email:  
 

 
This email message and any attachments are for the sole and confidential use of the intended recipients and may contain proprietary and/or 
confidential information which may be privileged or otherwise protected from disclosure. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is 
strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and delete the original message from your 
computer system and destroy any copies of the message as well as any attachments. Shelby Energy Cooperative cannot guarantee the security of 
the transmission and assumes no responsibility for intentional or accidental receipt by a third party. 
 










