
201 Third Street 
P.O. Box 24 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 
270-827-2561 
www.bigrivers.com  

Bi Rivers g ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

January 30, 2014 

Via Overnight or USPS Delivery 

Mr. Jeff Derouen 
Executive Director 
Public Service Commission of Kentucky 
211 Sower Boulevard 
P.O. Box 615 
Frankfort, Kentucky 40602-0615 

In the Matter of: . 
Application of Big Rivers Electric Corporation for a General Adjustment 
in Rates — Case No. 2013-00199 

Dear Mr. Derouen: 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation ("Big Rivers") hereby files an original and ten 
(10) copies of the following in the aforementioned docket: 

1. Seventh Update  to Tab 35 of Big Rivers Application filed June 28, 2013; 
2. Seventh Update  to its responses to Item 43 and Item 54 of the Commission 

Staffs Initial Request for Information dated June 10, 2013; 
3. Fourth Update  to its response to Item 3 of the Commission Staffs Third 

Request for Information dated September 16, 2013. 

Please confirm the Commission's receipt of this information by having the 
Commission's date stamp placed on the enclosed additional copy and returning 
to Big Rivers in the self-addressed, postage paid envelop provided. 

I certify that on this date, a copy of this letter and a copy of the updated 
responses were served on each of the persons on the attached service list by first-
class U.S. Mail. 

Should you have any questions about this matter, please contact me. 

‘ic
Sin erely yours, 

Z. Kamu 
a.  

RECEIVE D  

JAN 3  204 
pus, 

"lc s  cent 04,14,lls  vice 
sioN 

C: 	Billie Richert 
DeAnna Speed 

Your Touchstone Energy Cooperative 

  



Service List 
PSC Case No. 2013-00199 

Jennifer B. Hans 
Lawrence W. Cook 
Assistant Attorneys General 
1024 Capital Center Dr. 
Suite 200 
Frankfort, KY 40601 

Mr. David Brevitz 
3623 SW Woodvalley Terrace 
Topeka, KS 66614 

Mr. lion C. Ostrander 
1121 S.W. Chetopa Trail 
Topeka, KS 66615 

Mr. Larry Holloway 
830 Romine Ridge 
Osage City, KS 66523 

Michael L. Kurt; Esq. 
Kurt J. Boehm, Esq. 
Boehm, Kurtz & Lowry 
36 E. Seventh St., Suite 1510 
Cincinnati, Ohio 45202 

Lane Kollen 
J. Kennedy & Associates 
570 Colonial Park Drive 
Suite 305 
Roswell, GA 30075 

G. Kelly Nuckols 
President and CEO 
Jackson Purchase Energy Corporation 
2900 Irvin Cobb Drive 
P.O. Box 4030 
Paducah, KY 42002-4030 

Melissa D. Yates 
Denton & Keuler, LLP 
555 Jefferson Street 
Suite 301 
Paducah, KY 42001  

Bums Mercer 
Meade County RECC 
1351 Hwy. 79 
P.O. Box 489 
Brandenburg, Kentucky 40108 

Thomas C. Brite, Esq. 
Brite & Hopkins, PLLC 
83 Ballpark Road 
Hardinsburg, KY 40143 

Gregory Starheim 
President & CEO 
Kenergy Corp. 
3111 Fairview Drive 
P.O. Box 1389 
Owensboro, KY 42302-1389 

J. Christopher Hopgood, Esq . 
318 Second Street 
Henderson, Kentucky 42420 

Joe Childers 
Joe F. Childers & Associates 
300 Lexington Building 
201 West Short Street 
Lexington, Kentucky 40507 

Shannon Fisk 
Senior Attorney 
Earthjustice 
1617 John F. Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1675 
Philadelphia, PA 19103 

Thomas Cmar 
Earthjustice 
5042 N. Leavitt Street, Suite I 
Chicago, IL 60625 



Kristin Henry 
Senior Staff Attorney 
Sierra Club 
85 Second Street 
San Francisco, CA 94105-3441 

Laurie Williams 
Associate Attorney 
Sierra Club 
50 F Street, NW, Eighth Floor 
Washington, DC 20001 



BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

VERIFICATION 

I, Billie J. Richert, verify, state, and affirm that I prepared or supervised 
the preparation of the data responses filed with this Verification, and that 
those data responses are true and accurate to the best of my knowledge, 
information, and belief formed after a reasonable inquiry. 

COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY) 
COUNTY OF HENDERSON 

,SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO before me by Billie J. Richert on this 
the dt day of January, 2014. 

7? ail& 
No 	Public, Ky.'State at Large 
My Commission Expires 	 

Notary Public, Kentucky State-At-Large 
My Commission Expires: July 3, 2014 
10421951 



ir/ta 154t 
Not ry Public, Ky. Ste at Large 
My Commission Expires 	 

BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

VERIFICATION 

I, DeAnna M. Speed, verify, state, and affirm that I prepared or 
supervised the preparation of the data responses filed with this Verification, 
and that those data responses are true and accurate to the best of my 
knowledge, information, and belief formed after a reasonable inquiry. 

(3241110-Cel . 	n  
DeAnna M. Speed a 

COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY) 
COUNTY OF HENDERSON 

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO before me by DeAnna M. Speed on this 
the 024.  day of January, 2014. 

ft:tory Putgic, Kentucky State-At-Large 
, 	 I C yncnission Expires: July 3, 2014 

IL) 421951 



RECEIVED 
JAN 3 1 2014 

PUBLIC SERVICE 
COMMISSION 

ORIGINAL 

Bi Rivefs g ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Your Touchstone Energy Cooperative 4> 

COMMONWEALTH OF KENTUCKY 

BEFORE THE PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION OF KENTUCKY 

In the Matter of: 

APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION FOR A ) Case No. 2013-00199 
GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES ) 

Seventh Undated  Response to the Big Rivers Application 
Tab 35 originally filed June 28, 2013 

Seventh Undated  Responses to the Commission Staffs 
Initial Request for Information dated June 10, 2013 

Fourth Undated  Response to the Commission Staff's 
Third Request for Information dated September 16, 2013 

FILED: 	January 31, 2014 

ORIGINAL 



Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Case No. 2013-00199 

Forecasted Test Period Filing Requirements 
(Forecast Test Year 12ME 0141-2015; Base Period 12ME 09/30/2013) 

Tab No. 35 - July 12, 2013 

	

2 	 First Update  Tab No. 36 - July 24, 2013 

	

3 	 Second Update  Tab No. 35 - August 21, 2013 

	

4 	 Third Uvdate  Tab No. 35 - September 20, 2013 

	

5 	 Fourth (Iodate  Tab No. 35 - October 22, 2013 

	

6 	 Fifth Update  Tab No. 35 - November 26, 2013 

	

7 	 Sixth Update  Tab No. 35 - December 23, 2013 
Seventh Update  Tab No. 35 - January 31, 2014 

	

9 	 Filing Requirement 

	

10 	 807 KAR 5:001 Section 16(12)(o) 

	

11 	 Sponsoring Witness: Billie J. Richert 
12 

13 Descrintion of Filing.  Reauirement:  
14 

	

15 	Complete monthly budget variance reports, with narrative 

	

16 	explanations, for the twelve (12) months prior to the base 

	

17 	period, each month of the base period, and any subsequent 

	

18 	months, as they become available. 

19 

20 Response:  
21 

	

22 	Attached hereto is the monthly variance report for November 

	

23 	2013. With its application filed on June 28, 2013, Big Rivers 

	

24 	provided monthly variance reports, with narrative 

	

25 	explanations, for October 2011 through March, 2013. The 

	

26 	April 2013 report was filed with the First Update  on July 24, 

	

27 	2013. The May 2013 report was filed with the 5econd 

	

28 	Update  on August 22, 2013. The June 2013 report was filed 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Seventh Undate  to Tab 35 

807 HMI 5:001 16(12)(o) 
Page 1 of 2 



Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Case No. 2013-00199 

Forecasted Test Period Filing Requirements 
(Forecast Test Year 12AIE 0141-2015; Base Period 12ME 09/30/2014 

Tab No. 35 — July 12, 2013 
2 	 First Update  Tab No. 35 — July 24, 2013 
3 	 Second Uvdate  Tab No. 35 — August 21, 2013 
4 	 Third (Iodate  Tab No. 35 — September 20, 2013 
5 	 Fourth Uvdate  Tab No. 35 — October 22, 2013 
6 	 Fifth Update  Tab No. 35 - November 26, 2013 
7 	 Sixth Update  Tab No. 35 - December 23, 2013 
8 	 Seventh Update  Tab No. 35 - January 31, 2014 
9 	 Filing Requirement 

10 	 807 KAR 5:001 Section 16(12)(o) 
11 	 Sponsoring Witness: Billie J. Richert 
12 
13 response (continued):  
14 

15 	with the Third Update  on September 20, 2013. The July 

16 	2013 report was filed with the Fourth Update  on October 22, 

17 	2103. The August 2013 and September 2013 reports were 

18 	filed with the Fifth Update  on November 26, 2013. The 

19 	October 2013 report was filed with the Sixth Update  on 

20 	December 23, 2013. 

21 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Seventh Update  to Tab 35 

807 KAR 5:00116(12)(o) 
Page 2 of 2 
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,-----  
BigRivers 

ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Your Touchstone Energy' Cooperative Kt> 

Financial Report 
November 2013  
($ in Thousands), 

Board Meeting Date: January 17, 2014 

1 



Big Rivers Summary of Statement of Operations 
YTD — November 

• 	 71 .0  

Revenues 

Cost of Electric Service 

Operating Margins 

Interest Income/Other 

Net Margins - YTD 

2013 2012 

Actual Budget 
Fav/(UnFav) 

Variance 
Fav/(UnFav) 

Actual 	Variance 
523,166 502,867 20,299 520,055 3,111 

502,712 505,010 2,298 508,838 6,126 

20,454 (2,143) 22,597 11,217 9,237 

3,800 3,126 674 808 2,992 

24,254 983 23,271 12,025 12,229 

2 
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Bi 	 Variance Analysis Summary 
FLECTasC CORPORATION 

•... •oss. raid canon. ter 

?Mental Cerfarientart 

Yalta-DS 

• laranbar YID 21113 Mains as 22:1371 Inablo1 budget 

• Rana von lborabla 120.2917 raft as to OSS tans, as all as the a ._&.4 1t atoltatpet. Mary 29111 PSC war, 
weary awl by bow IRa appnal par U. °date 2441 PSC over (se poa 7, $t& IS-22). 

• °war Sabana a mimeos* $7W San by animal paronla somata arost by Salk Naga S lavarlabkt saaon• Pla OS 224. 
• Manlancit Exams al Maas $3,203 party Cluo lo s.Csnay sod SSR mearats h arra Cara, as al as Ms Sara &MO Cana sags Mot peas 2512M. 
• Dayalsilalraost Expansaglhaves larabla SAM anatlyaa to Merest nap an Ma yoid-c• I9133 ratan arena boa OS al as Mona tarantella for 

Coarse Slain par Ma October 2Sith PSC coa ban pop 271 
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Bi Rivers 	Variance Analysis Summary g ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

 

235 

4.000 

2.992 24.254 

1202% 

     

      

Net Patronage Capital or Margins 
November YTD vs. Prior Year 

30,000 

25,000 

20.000 

15.000 

10,000 

2012 	 R.t 	0pSii 	IqIsa 	 t Int. Exp.. 	FL Inane 

	

Tea Otter 	Caw Non- 
Oparanno 

Income PM. 
Men 

5.000 

• Favorable • Unfavorat4e 

• • 	• 

•aao roeboee ease elnyeeke 

6 

Diatebicsrlex 

roarate-Dste 

• Nowtmter T03 2013 margins wan 312,229 berate oarnyenad to 2012. 

• Rear nen leontbe 

 

18,111 ergo, due to CISS len and an Inas* In tataa. mostly dee by bare In MORS YAWNS. (aen page. 7, 9-13, 16-22). 
• Oponalon Expanse woo Intwatta 92311 duo to los LS coat. Sot by New pundlesed paw and @the astable cot 
• Odentonenea Earns lbentio 14 000 dua to re Coeur! and SSR eleatnele00 twin) Senn ad /nod Were eaPenaa.Si 2012.a Plea 24 
• Deneadonedoleat F-q:enearover woo band* 81,796 pinery due to breed once anonatad Nth IRO PS/0g WC Pallagaa ORRNI pan* WM Pei. 271 
• mewed inernwprnspe Imo increbat 92,992 duo to paterepa aped as • neat e de 2012 telininekg and the Intone( 01 0. CFC capital tam cottllabe 

Net P•91a 30 and 33). 



• 	• 	• 

7 

Revenue 
YTD November 

Actual 
2013 

Rudest 
2013 Variance 

Actual 
2012 

2012 
Variance 

MWh Sales 

Rural 2,138,154 

	

2,164,270 	(26,116) 	2,115,337 	22,817.  
854.049'. 	53,922 	883.437. 7-34.534 

5,552,225 . 32,543 8,790,125 (1,205,357) 
1.450.0047 —887.0327 --1,328.7117 1,010.325 

10.030,548 947.381 11,115.810 (137.681) 

Large Industrial _ 
Smelter 

917.9717. 
5,584,788 

Off-System/Other _ 
Total 

2.332.03IC 
10.977.929 

ROintMatz_SISI.13 
Rural 57.03 58.29 (1.26) 50.79 8.24 

. 	._ 48.531, , 	48.3411 _ 	_ (1.78) . 43.1e —71 73.311 
Smelter 50.04 51.68 (1.64) 48.81 1.23 
Off-System/Other _ 31.C111 ' 30.79.1 _ 0.23 ; 29.01 .. 2.01 
Total 47.06 49.80 (2.74) 46.37 0.69 

Etreataut=ilonasesbuttl 
Rural I" 121,941 128,165 (4,224) 107,438 14,503 
Legs- 	Industrial _ 	- _ 	42,1141 - 41.7:1-1,77— 	973 . 	38.117 _ 	. 	4.597 
Smelter 279,457 286,933 (7,476) 331,415 (51,958) 
Off-SystenVOthar 	. . , 	. 	72,488, • _ 44,8404t 27.848._ 38,489. 33.999 
Total 516,600 499,479 17.121 515.459 1.141 

(11  Includes 51.3n of MO 51.4m refroactVe tegustment from January 29th order by the PSC. 

Revenue Price/Volume Analysis 
November 2013 

Mee /Mame 

tz!ss. Ve1swe reSte 
Lent (2.702) (1,511) (4224) 
Large ImhestrIal (1,632) 2,605 973 
Smeller (9,15S) 1,682 (7.476) 
011-Syleeet/Otber 541 27,307 27,S45 

(12.951) 30.072 17,121 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

s.a.e.. seemly 



YarlatagrantinOLOSattatin 
Rural 	 26.17 27.39 1.22 25.77 

an 2139' , 	1.17._  
Smelter 	 26.80 28.09 1.29 ( 26.66 
Off-SystemfOther 	21.35:. . 27.75_ 0.40:.. 25.03: = 
Total 	 26.74 27.83 1.09 28.35 

(0.40) 

(0.14) 
(1.32) 
(0.39) 

VO Cost - Thousands of  
Rural . 
Large Industrial = 
Smelter 
Off-SystemlOther 
Total 

83,910 40238. (73.672) _ 	34.539 
293,604 279,184 (14,420) 292,843 

149,678 	155,988 	6,310 	181,010 	31,332 
(29.371) 

(781) 

55,949 	59,288 	3,339 	54,513 	(1,436) 
24,057. _ 23,670L. 	(39n 	22.781 	(tan 

• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CO IPORATION 

Ras Seism ENTERE 

Variable Operations Cost 
YTD November 

Actual 	Budget 
	

Actual 
	

2012 
2013 
	

2013 	Vatiance 
	

2012 
	

Variance 

Actual 

YTD November 2013 
Variable Operations Expense 

Budget 	Favt(UnFav) 
Price Variance Volume Variance 

FavI(UnFav) 	FavI(UnFav) 	FavI(UnFav) 
Reagent 25,823 26,474 651 171 480 651 
Fuel 224,459 240,593 16,134 11,662 4,472 16,134 
Pirchassi Power 45,326 14,238 (31,088) (561) (30.327) (31,088) 
Non-FAC PPA (Ncn-Smetter) 0,004) (2,121) (117) (137) 20 (117) 

8 293,604 279,184 (14,420) 11,135 (25,555) (14,420) 



Bi Rivers g ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Gross Margin 
YTD November 

gLait 
Rural 
Large kidustrial_ 
Smelter 
Off-SystemfOther 
Total 

	

65,992 	65,877 	(885) 	52,925 	13,067 

	

_ _18,647_ 	 _ 576 	_143367.. T3ii 
129,779 130,945 (1,166) 150,405 (20,626) 
sift 

222,996 
.... 4,402=4,176 

723,295 	2,701 
F. 773,960, 

222,616 
4,626 

380 

PAgnasmbzatth 
Rural 

 Large Industrial _ 
Smelter 

	

30.86 	30.90 	(0.04) 	25.02 	5.84 
73.92,7—(0.61) 	.. 	17.36 	Tits 

	

23.24 	23.59 	(0.35) 	22.15 	1.09 
77, 	arr,_ . 3.04C 0.63.  

	

20.32 	21.97 	(1.65) 	20.02 	0.30 
Off-System/Other 
Total 

• 	• 	• 
• '1 

'I- 'ids Isumwe Csip.mn. pa. 

Actual 
	

Budget 
	

Actual 	2012 
2013 
	

2013 	Variance 	2012 	Variance 

Gross Marna 
Price /Volume Analysis 

November 2013 
Price /Volon 

Price Velem. psi 
Rani (78) (DM (885) 
tarn ladvstrisl (552) 1,128 576 
Smelter (1,934) 768 (1,166) 
Off-Syvteak/Otkor 1,484 Z692 4, 176 

(1,080) 3,781 2,701 

9 



• 

Member Rate Stability Mechanism 
YTD November 

Budget 	2013 	Actual 
2912 	YALIABC2 	202 

2012 
Variance 

Net Revenue - S/1.1Wh 

Actual 
2212 

(7.97) 1.06 	(6.22) (0.69) Rural 50.12 
(7.42) 0.93 4 	(s.221 waif Large Industrial. 7 	40.04: 
(7.81) 1.03 	(6.22) (0.56) Total 47.10 

Net Revenue - Thousands of 
(17,250) 2,480 	(13,156) 	(1,614) Rural 107,171 

7- (6.408) 475-14 - ^- (Mani 7-- (452/ Large Industrial 	_ 	; _ 36,76-07. 
(23,658) 2,934 	(18,658) (2,066) Total 143,931 

Budget 
22131 

2013 
Yarkosta 

Actual 
202 

2012 
lark= 

50.32 (0.20) 44.57 5.55 
44189 _ (0.85) 
47.64 (0.54) 42.32 4.78 

108,915 (1,744) 94,282 12,889 
35.33-37 1,427, 32,615 4,14C 

144,248 (317) 126,897 17,034 

BIR1Ve.  fS 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Temelmen. fact taakse 

Actual 
21/12 

pifftsm - S/PAWh 
Rural 	 (6.91) 
Large Industrial _ 	_ 	(6.49) 
Total 	 (6.78) 

ftiRSM - Thousands of $ 
Rural (14,770) 

ge Lar IndustrIal --.77. _ (5,954) 
Total 	 (20,724) 

10 

Cumulative-to-Date Actual Budget Variance 
Original Deposit $ 	157,000 
Interest Earnings 3,362 
Withdrawals (98,900) 
Ending Balance 11/30/2013 $ 	61,462 $ 	57,386 $ 	4,076 

Year-to-Date 
Beg. Balance 1/1/2013 $ 	80,643 
Interest Earnings 159 
Withdrawals (19,340) 
Ending Balance 11130/2013 $ 	61,462 $ 	57,386 $ 	4,076 



• 	• 	• 
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Bigffivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

lea Sears femme LImummn.. yen 

MWH Sales 
YTD November 

11 

Pia 	 Is Memel 	 *Rat 	 IpOUi Tel 

lin Favorable 
	

• Budget 
• Unfavorable 0 Prior Year 
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BigRivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Vs ..da ...1.~! s 	re 

Revenue - $/MWh Sold 
YTD — November 

NOR 

IMO 

11111.16 

a 

Ran 

Rat Law Inrilalrl•I 	 Illember Awry Mee- 
samismi °11-8POI■• RELIGIORI Asses 

12013 Rural includes $1.3m of the $1.4m retroactive adjustrnentfrOT January 291,  order by the PSC 

12 MI Favorable 

• Unfavorable 

• Budget 

Prlor Year 
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Big Rivers 
ELICTRIC COR•ORATION 

iima t•Ona limme Cane! 

Revenue 
YTD - November 

MO* 

-A. 

124101 an 

leAl• 

a• 11•82 am 

• 

10•••• 	 Logo MONS'S 	 FUNNY 
	

T•11•I 

*2013 Rural includes $1.3m of the $1.4m retroactive adjustment from January 29th order from the PSC 

13 
NI Favorable 

III Unfavorable 

III Budget 

El Prior Year 
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• 	• 	• 

- 

Variable Operations - S/MWh Sold 
g 	rs ELEC TRIC CORPORATION YTD November 

Ono 

tine 

COM 
Ileatble fikmansels1 
	

inalear 
	

Mayor 
	

WeIghled Avg. 

14 
III Favorable 

• Unfavorable 

• Budget 

0 Prior Year 
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agRavers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Yaw 'ruder &mole Ossr■elrm 

Variable Operations Cost 
YTD - November 

Rural 	 Ls., ildralrld 
	

INS 
	

CIFOrsim 	 TRY 

15 
III Favorable 
III Unfavorable 

• Budget 
0 Prior Year 



Bi Rivers g E Li CT R IC CORPORATION 

• 	• 	• 

11a taclises Ism/ tlursomohe 

OLEO 

11311.01 

Gross Margin - $/MWh 
YTD — November 

Ileatber (Nonalaller) 
	

be 
	

011allyrantelher 
	

Iffelghted Avg. 

16 
IS Favorable 

5 Unfavorable 

III Budget 

0 Prior Year 



Bi Rivers g ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

V.— %dm.. &war LIRRanIme Pe!. 

• • 	• 

Gross Margin 
YTD — November 

*MANI 

221201I 2202,5  2225115 

150.405 

129771 130  1.5  

Mon MST? 

62.925 
— 

111647 01.071 1 5.331  
II 5711 

• 402 tiI60 

in- 
11011.105 

Maul LOW IIISISSIS 

 

 

17 17 
U Favorable 

• Unfavorable 
• Budget 
CI Prior Year 



Big-Rive-Ms 
El ECTRIC CORPORATION 

varrair ENTEPCNETERRN 

MRSM - $/MWh 
YTD - November 

• 	• 	• 

Rtnil 
	

Lap Ward 

18 
• Favorable 
• Unfavorable 

• Budget 
0 Prior Year 



BigRivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

ve.ca 	ammwe eswawsse 

MRSM 
YTD - November 

• 	• 	• 

120.000 

$111000 

S10000 

114000 

512.000 

1110.000 

St000 

14.000 

S2,000 

SO 
Rural 
	

Urge hislatrIal 

19 
• Favorable 

• Unfavorable 

• Budget 

CI Prior Year 



360 03 

$50 00 

330 00 

$10 03 

$20 00 

• 	• 	• 

BigRwers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

lima '1 alma Sea/ l'ageOn 

Net Revenue Less MRSM - $/MWh 
YTD — November 

Rural 
	

Law Industrial 

20 
• Favorable 
III Unfavorable 

Budget 
0 Prior Year 



$80.000 

$60.000 

540.000 

$20.000 

$O 

	

Rural 
	

Loge Industrial 

• Favorable 
	

I•1 Budget 

• Unfavorable ID Prior Year 

• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CoR•oRATION 

16. Tatersa 	4..11•MINOW ref 

Net Revenue Less MRSM 
YTD - November 

21 



Variance 
Actual Budget  Fav/ Unfav 

6,564 3,389 	3,175 

2012 	Variance 
Actual Fav/ Unfav 

4,596 	1,968 

• 	• 	• 
- 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

TANIENe ANN" CANANIN PaL 

Other Operating Revenue and Income 

November YTD 

Other Operating Revenue and Income is favorable to budget and prior-year due to 
higher transmission revenue. 

22 



Variance 
Actual Budget  Fav/ Unfav 

56,662 62,712 	6,050 

2012 
	

Variance 
Actual Fav/ Unfav 

59,208 ' 2,546 

• 	 • 

Bi'RiFs 	Non-Variable Production and  
ELECTRIC 

wr Fathas bug,' clas■s:; 	 Other Power Supply — Operations  

November YTD 

Current Year Variances Fav/(UnFav) 
Station-Two Plant O&M 479 
Plant Operations expense non-labor (WL, Gt4, CL) 2,604 
Labor 2,023 
Power Supply transmission reservation 526 
Other (Depreciation, Property TaxesAnsurance) 418 

Non-Variable Production and Other Power Supply- Operations 6,050 

Prior-Year Variances FavI(UnFav) 
Power Supply transmission reservation (259) 
Property insurance (306) 
Labor 3,191 
Other (Depreciation, Property Taxes, Plant Operations expense) (80) 

Non-Variable Production and Other Power Supply - Operations 2,546 
23 



• 	• 	• 
..------.---;_sr_---, 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC COR•ORRTION 

IIRTT.d.L.TERawf EIRe......P_R 

Operation Expense — Transmission  

November YTD 

Variance 
Actual Budget Fav/ Unfav 

9,847 	8,281 	(1,566) 

The unfavorable variance compared to budget is driven by MISO transmission expenses 
(MISO Transmission Expansion Projects and Multi-value Projects). A portion of these 
expenses is budgeted in Other Power Supply. 

24 



2012 
Actual 

37,885 

Variance 
Fav/ Unfav 

3,970 

Variance 
Actual Budget Fav/ Unfav 

33,915 39,699 	5,784 

• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Raw T.ERI.,a Beset L1..n. ilZ.E1 

Maintenance Expense Production  

November YTD 

The favorable variance compared to budget is largely due to the Century and SSR agreements for 
running Coleman as well as the deferral of the Coleman outage, while the prior-year favorable 
variance is driven by the Century and SSR agreements and the 2012 outage at Wilson. 

25 



• 	• 	• 
.---- 	. 	--- 	.-hi _ 

BigRivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

YIN. Rale Ifamper C.......s. Vas 

Maintenance Expense Transmission  

November YTD 

Variance 
Actual Budget  Fav/ Unfav 

4,110 	4,621 	511 

The favorable variance to budget is primarily driven by favorability in right-of-way, line and vehicle 
maintenance at ET&S. 

26 



2012 Variance 
Actual Fav/ Unfav 

41,234 	1,538 

Variance 
Actual Budget  Fay/ Unfav 

39,696 42,341 2,645 

Bieltivers 
ELECTIt C CORPOAT IOW  

Mietdeff■arOmmesk..p ■ 

• 

Interest on Long-Term Debt 

November YTD 

Interest on Long-Term Debt is favorable to budget and prior-year primarily due to 
paying off the 1983 pollution control bonds. 

27 



• 	• 	• 

Bi ------I.--'''-'-'-g Rivers 
Elf CTRIC CORPORATION 

... Toth.... lather c..•••••••1 

Interest Charged to Construction-Credit 

I 

November YTD 

Variance 2012 Variance 
Actual Budget Fav/ Unfav Actual Fav/ Unfav 

(216) 	(596) 	(380) 
	

(722) 	(506) 

Interest Charged to Construction-Credit is unfavorable to budget and prior-year 
primarily due to timing of the MATS project and favorable capital spending. 

28 



Bi Rivers g EL ECTRIC COR•ORATION 

Variance 
Actual Budget  Fav/ Unfav 

1,055 	509 	(546)  

2012 	Variance 
Actual Fay/ Unfav 

424 
	

(631) 

• 	• 	• 

Cmew.n.. 

Other Deductions  

November YTD 

The unfavorable variance as compared to budget and prior-year is due to a write-off associated 
with 1983 Pollution Control bonds' refunding costs, as well as a write-off of unamortized deferred 
debt expense associated with the 2012 CoBank Revolver. 

29 



Variance 
Actual Budget Fav/ Unfav 

2,041 	1,271 	770 

2012 	Variance 
Actual Fav/ Unfav 

58 	1,983 

• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
ELECTP C CO WOW' ON 

Yaw Tadras NNW ONNee lia• 

Other Capital Credits & Pat Dividends 

November YTD 

The favorable variance compared to budget is due to higher than anticipated patronage capital 
associated with the CFC loan. The favorable variance compared to prior-year is due to patronage 
capital associated with the November 2012 refinancing. 

30 



• 	• 	• 

Bre 13WeeThs ELICTRIC CORPORATION 
laeLallame lomat 

Consumer Service & Informational Expense 

November YTD 

2012 	Variance 
Actual Actual Fav/ Unfav 

1,246 	630 	(616) 

Unfavorability as compared to prior-year is driven by an increase of Demand Side 
Management expenses. 

31 



• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Yera•sillweerf °wean.. It. 

Depreciation and Amortization  

November YTD 

2012 	Variance 
Actual Actual Fav/ Unfav 

36,371 37,665 	1,294 

Depreciation and Amortization was favorable to prior-year due to the deferral of Coleman 
Depreciation Expense per the PSC order. 

32 



• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
EL ECTRIC CORPORATION 

Ism Tem:Una Ewe' OrpawANt 

Interest Income 

November 'RD 

2012 	Variance 
Actual Actual Fav/(Unfav)  

1,759 	750 	1,009 

Interest income was favorable compared to prior-year due to interest on CFC capital term 
certificates. 

33 



• 	• 	• 
- 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

5.clur. /SOM.( Clapismioe loaf,  
North Star - YTD November 

Total Cost of Electric Service 
Other Operating Revenues & hcome 
Smelter Avoidable Base Charge 
Off-System Sales/Other 
hterest Income 
Other Non-Operating Inane 
Other Capital Credits & Pat Dividends 

Member MWh 

2013 2012 

Actual Budget 
Fav/(UnFav) 

Variance 
Fav/(UnFav) 

Actual 	Variance 
502,712 505,010 2,298 508,838 6,126 

(6,564) (3,389) 3,175 (4,596) 1,968 
(386) 0 386 (358) 28 

(72,488) (44,640) 27,848 (38,489) 33,999 
(1,759) (1,855) (96) (750) 1,009 

0 0 0 0 0 
(2,041) (1,271) 770 (58) 1,983 

419,474 453,855 34,381 464,587 45,113 

I 	9,788,899 	(1,148,004)f I 	8,640,895 8,580,544 60,351 

I 	0.047461 	(0.001084)J I 	0.048545 0.052894 0.004349 North Star -$/kWh 
34 



• 	• 	• 

BigRivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

TANTel f CANNATA. Ter 	 TIER 

Actual Budget Fav/(Unfav) 

Interest on Long-Term Debt 39,696 42,341 2,645 

Net Margins 24,254 983 23,271 

TIER - YTD November 1.61 1.02 0.59 

TIER (12 months ending 11/30) 1.54 1.14 0.40 

Notes: 

TIER = (Net Margins + Interest on Long-Term Debt) divided by Interest on Long-Term Debt 

35 



• 	• 	• 
„- 

Big Rivers
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Capital Expenditures* 
Year-to-Date 

Actual Budget Favi(linFav) 
IS 1,825 2,600 775 
Generation 18,854 37,615 18,761 
Transmission 4,986 8,409 3,423 
Other 272 2,444 2,172 
ECP 1,129 24,761 23,632 

Explanation: Total 27,088 75,829 48,783 

IS was favorable $775 primarily due to favorability of the Corporate Analytics project, timing of the Hyperion Upgrade, Members' 
Replacement of Hardware/Software and Data Center projects, as well as partial deferral of Oracle R12 Upgrade. 

Generation was favorable by $18,761. Coleman Station was favorable $5,549 largely due to deferral of scheduled outage projects. 
Station-Two was favorable $4,087 largely due to permanent favorability in the Burner Replacement, 4160 V Switchgear, Turbine 
DCS Control, Auger Sampler, Bypass Stack Damper and Coal Pile Pumps projects. Green Station was favorable $2,340 primarily 
due to cancellation of various projects including: Gaitronic Phone System, Reclaim Feeder, Office Building Hot Water Heater, 
Office Building Chiller, Coal Chute Impact Areas, Slaker Controls, as well as favorability in the Heater Exchangers, Caustic 
Pumping System and Boiler Painting projects. The Green favorability was partially offset by the G1 Outage. Wilson Station was 
favorable $6,785 largely due to cancelled outage projects, favorability in the No. 1 Boiler Feed Pump, Landfill Drainage Control and 
Sewage Treatment liner projects. 

Transmission was favorable $3,423 primarily due to the deferral of the White Oak-50 MVA Substation and Buttermilk Falls projects, 
as well as favorability in the Garrett-Flaherty and Hancock County projects. 

Other was favorable $2,172 largely due to deferral of vehicle replacement purchases, the deferral of the PCI Software projects and 
the Reid Gas Conversion project. 

ECP was favorable $23,632 due to the timing and reduced scope of the MATS project. 

36 
	

* Gross of the City's share of Station Two. Includes capitalized interest. 



• 	• 	• 

Big Rivers 
ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

Cash & Temporary Investments  
2012 

Actual Budget Fav/(U nfav)  Actual Fav/ Unfav 
November 30th 	97,062 95,165 	1,897 	112,024 (14,962) 

The November 30, 2013 cash balance compared to budget is favorable due to beginning balance 
favorability of $8.8m, offset by changes in working capital. 

The unfavorable variance to prior-year is driven by paying off the 1983 pollution control bonds, 
partially offset by changes in working capital. 

37 

Lines of Credit 
As of November 30th 

Original Amount $ 50,000 
Letters of Credit Outstanding (8,625) 
Advances Outstanding 0 

Available Lines of Credit $ 41,375 



BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

• APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

Seventh updated  Response to 
Commission Staffs Initial Request for Information 

dated June 10, 2013 

July 12, 2013 
First Undate  July 24, 2013 

Second Update  August 21, 2013 
Third Update  September 20, 2013 
Fourth Undate  October 22, 2013 
Fifth Undate  November 26, 2013 
Sixth Update  December 23, 2013 
Seventh Undate  January 31, 2014 

1 Item 43) As the historical data becomes available, provide detailed 
2 monthly income statements for each forecasted month of the base period, 
3 including the month in which the Commission hears this case. 
4 

5 Response) Big Rivers' detailed monthly income statement for the month ended 

6 December 31, 2013 is attached hereto. Big Rivers will provide detailed monthly 

7 income statements for each month up to and including the month in which the 

8 Commission hears this case, as the historical data becomes available. 
9 

10 

11 Witness) Billie J. Richert 
12 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-43 

Witness: Billie J. Richert 
Page 1 of 1 



• 
UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

RURAL MUTES SERVICE 
FINANCIAL AND OPERATING REPORT 

ELECTRIC POWER SUPPLY 
PART A -FINANCIAL 

BORROWER DESIGNATION 
mon 

PERIOD ENow 
1:44.13 

INSTRUCTIONS • See help h the at* Wien% 

SECTION A. STATEMENT OF OPERATIONS 

ITEM 

YEAR-TO-DATE 
THIS MONTH 

(d) 

LAST YEAR 
(a) 

THIS YEAR 

(0) 
BUDGET 

(c) 

1. Electric Energy Revenues 563,385,131.72 554,831,850.19 511,736,238.00 
0.93 

38,233,199.96 
0.00 2. Income From Leased Property (Net) 000 0.00 

3. Other Operating Revenue and Income 1,957,104 01 7,612,407.78 3,696,500.00 1,018,295.78 
4. Total Operation Revenues & Patronage 

Capital(/ thru 3) 568,342,235.73 561,447,258.27 545,432,73810 

51,283,392.00 

39,281,495.74 

3,588,807.05 
5. Operating Expense - Production - Excluding 

Fuel 18,054,670 68 47,985,339.22 

8. 	Operating Expense - Productbn - Fuel 226,368,922.34 210,115,018.13 227.211 .172.00 
88,837,871.00 

13,237,661.10 
11 778,43948 

810,531.40 
126,184.32 

7, 	Operating Expense - Other Power Supply 111465,356.58 120,770,05038 

8. Operating Expense -Transmission 10,118,765.89 10,687,506.25 9,003,645 00 
9. Operating Expense - RTO/1SO 2,262,434.76 2,210,763.25 2,053,239.00 
10. Operating Expense - Distribution 0.00 000 0.00 0.00 
11. Operating Expense - Customer Accounts 297,191.47 268,709.82 0.00 59,66220 
12. Operating Expense - Customer Service & 

Information 886,167.75 1,721,120.28 1,533,477.00 475,088.12 
13. Operating Expense • Sales 191,205.48 151,056.38 142,706.00 40,054.52 

15,227,317.53 

45,374,045.71 

14. Operating Expense - AdmInIstratNe & General 26,428,74415 39,014,414.15 28,332,053.00 

408,397,555.00 15. Total Operation Expense (5 thru 14) 426,073,459.80 432,924,278.06 
18. Maintenance Expense - Production 41,169,861.77 36,788,552.80 41,727,579.00 2,873,545.89 

412,236.03 
000 

17. Maintenance Expense - Transmissbn 4,607,997.61 1,521.866.10 5,012,442 00 
18. Maintenance Expense - RTOIISO 000 000 000 
19. Maintenance Expense - Distribution 0.00 0.00 000 0.00 
20. Maintenance Expense - General Plant 184,30137 253,949.20 214,494 00 24,684.93 

3,310,464.85 
3,053,450.44 

0.00 

21. Total Maintenance Expense (16 thru 20) 45,962,160.98 41,564,368.30 46,954,515.00 
12,311,179.00 22. Depredation and Amortization Expense 41,090,390.70 39,424,690.00 

23. Taxes 3,810.88 2,336.04 885.00 
24. Interest on Long-Term Debt 45,032,787.47 43,048,802.11 46,303,686 00 3,352,341.56 

<10,03700> 25. Interest Charged to Construction - Credit <766,677.00> <226,243.00> <772,744.00> 
28. Other Interest Expense 147,499.02 187.24 000 14 60 
27. Asset Retirement Odigations 0.00 000 0.00 0.00 
28. Other Deductions 516,328.23 1,053,330.14 576,918.00 <622.20> 
29. Total Cost Of Electric Service 

(15 + 21 thru 28) 558,085,760.08 557,791,749.19 543,776,994.00 

1,655,744.00 

55,079,607.97 

-115,795,11223> 

179,810.30 

30. Operating Margins (4 less 29) 10,252,475.65 4,655,509318 

31. Interest Income 963,130.32 1,939,371.19 2,019,000.00 
32. Allowance For Funds Used During Construction 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
33. Income (Loss) from Equity Investments 0.00 000 0.00 000 
34. Other Non-operating Income (Net) 000 0.00 0.00 0.00 
35. Generation & Transmission Capital Credits 000 0.00 0.00 0.00 
38. Other Capital Credits and Patronage DWIdends 61,485.01 2,044,610.71 1,271,325 00 3,328.38 
37. Extraordinary Items 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 
38. Net Patronage Capital Or Margins 

(30 gnu 37) 11,277,090.98 8,639,49018 4,944,069.00 <15,614,97335> 
Revision Data 2010 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment for &tenth Undated  Response to PSC 143 

Witness: Billie J. Richert 
Page 1 of 1 

5 	R1.13 Financial and Operating Report Electric Power supply Part A - Financial 



BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

• APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

Seventh Undated  Response to 
Commission Staffs Initial Request for Information 

dated June 10, 2013 

July 12, 2013 
First Update  July 24, 2013 

Second Update August 21, 2013 
Third Uvdate  September 23, 2013 
Fourth ilvdate October 22, 2013 
Fifth Update November 26, 2013 
Sixth Uvdate December 23, 2013 
Seventh Undate January 31, 2014 

1 Item 54) Provide the following information concerning the costs for the 
2 preparation of this case: 

3 

• 
4 
5 

a. A detailed schedule of expenses incurred to date for the 

following categories: 
6 (1)Accounting; 

7 (2)Engineering; 

8 (3)Legal; 

9 (4)Consultants; and 

10 (5) Other Expenses (Identify separately). 

11 For each category, the schedule should include the date of 

12 each 	transaction; 	check 	number or other document 

13 reference; the vendor, the hours worked; the rates per hour; 

14 amount, a description of the services performed; and the 

15 account number in which the expenditure was recorded. 

16 Provide copies of contracts or other documentation that 

17 support charges incurred in the preparation of this case. 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-54 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 1 of 3 



BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

• APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES • 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

Seventh Undated  Response to 
Commission Staffs Initial Request for Information 

dated June 10, 2013 

July 12, 2013 
First Urn/ate  July 24, 2013 

Second Undate  August 21, 2013 
Third Update  September 23, 2013 
Fourth Update  October 22, 2013 
Fifth Update  November 26, 2013 
Sixth Update  December 23, 2013 
Seventh Update  January 31, 2014 

	

1 	 Identify any costs incurred for this case that occurred 

	

2 	 during the base period. 

	

3 	 b. An itemized estimate of the total cost to be incurred for this • 	4 	 case. Expenses should be broken down into the same 

	

5 	 categories as identified in (a) above, with an estimate of the 

	

6 	 hours to be worked and the rates per hour. Include a 

	

7 	 detailed explanation of how the estimate was determined, 

	

8 	 along with all supporting workpapers and calculations. 

	

9 	 c. Provide monthly updates of the actual costs incurred in 

	

10 	 conjunction with this rate case, reported in the manner 

	

11 	 requested in (a) above. Updates will be due when Big 

	

12 	 Rivers files its monthly financial statements with the 

	

13 	 Commission, through the month of the public hearing. 

14 

15 Response) 

	

16 	 a. Copies of invoices supporting additional charges incurred are 

	

17 	 attached hereto. 

	

18 	 b. There is no change to the response provided on July 12, 2013. 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-54 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 2 of 3 



BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

• APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

Seventh Updated  Response to 
Commission Staffs Initial Request for Information 

dated June 10, 2013 

July 12, 2013 
First Undate  July 24, 2013 

Second Update  August 21, 2013 
Third Update  September 23, 2013 
Fourth Undate  October 22, 2013 
Fifth Update  November 26, 2013 
Sixth Update  December 23, 2013 

Seventh Update  January 31, 2014 

1 	 c. Please see Big Rivers' response to Item 54a above. Also, Big 
2 	 Rivers attaches hereto an updated schedule of rate case costs 
3 	 incurred-to-date through December 31, 2013. 

4 

5 Witness) DeAnna M. Speed 
6 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-54 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 3 of 3 



Direct questions to: 
Kim Fuhrmann at ACES 317.344.7046 

1.31 Dot 1-.6 

CH Transfer, 
Account Name: ACES Power Marketing 
Account 1:8666323358 
AM Routing ff: 071000039 
Bank Name: Bank of America 
Bank Address: Chicago, Illinois • 

ACES 
excellence In energy 

4140 West 99th Street Cannel, IN 46032 

Invoice 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
PO Box 24 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 

A 043 —  PPM 

Mean -Rcbe att. 
400003 	 Consulting Fees per Task Order 

No. 3 dated December 13, 2013 

Invoice ft: 13/6892-IN 
Invoice Date: 12/20/2013 

Due Date: 12/30/2013 
For the month of: November 2013 

Fax K: 270-827-2558 

$896.00 

Attention: Billie Richert 

• anitmiztter 

I964519 E9D 
ca311A 
0999 

   

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: 

 

$896.00  

    

Remit Payment via: 

Wire Transfer (Please use ACH If oossIblel; 
Account Name: ACES Power Marketing 
Account 1: 8666823358 
ABA Routing ft 026009593 
Bank Name: Bank of America 
Bank Address: New York, New York 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to 5emnth Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 1 of 48 
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• 	• 	• 
Big Riven Electric Corporation 
Protein Code 609 
Task Order No. 3 -State Regsgatory Support 

ErnalaYse Period Hours Rate Total Description 
Annan Brian 11/07/13 3.00 $ 112.00 $ 	336 00 Rate case support - review the interveners answers to Big Riven' 

questions/ interveners analysis of things like Carbon Costs / converting 
coal an to Combined Ontle 

Azman Brian 11/08/13 3 .00  $ 112.00  $ 	336.00  Rate an  Support - review the Interveners answers to Big Rivers' 
questions / Interveners analysis of things like Carbon Costs/ converting 
coal nen to Combined CVde as. 

Martell° Scott 11/12/13 1.00 $ 	112.00 $ 	112.00 81g Rivers asked about getting • oantact at Wood Mackenzie to talk 
about how they (WM) develops Melt long-term price curves. Scott 
helped put Big Rivers a WM together, Indudhur a conical between the 
3 companies. 

Martell° Scott 11/15/13 1.00 $ 112.00 $ 	112.00 Big Rivers asked about getting 	contact at Wood Madtenzie to talk 
about how they (WM) develops their long-term price curves. Scott 
helped put Big Rivers & WM together, induding a cod call between the 
3 companies. 

Subtotal 8.0 S 	$9600 

Travel Expenses 	 - 

Other Expenses 

Total Hourly Fees & Expenses __Jaw_ jusE") 
Title 	 Hourly Billing Rate 

Company Officer 	 $ 	 1113.00 
Executive Director 	 $ 	 12100 
Other Staff 	 $ 	 112.00 



TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $224.00 

  

OR alusiir 
met, 5196° 

ACES 
excellence In energy 

4140 West 99th Street, Cannel, IN 46032 

Attention: Billie Richert 

Invoicet 13/69004N 

Invoice Date: 1/15/2014 
Due Date: 1/27/2014 

For the month of: December2013 

Fax I: 270-827-2558 

Invoice 

Big Riven Searle Corp. 
PO Bon 2A 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 

400003 	 Consulting Fees per Task Order 
	

S2u.00 
No. 3 dated December 13, 2013 

Direct questions to: 
Kim Fuhrmann at ACES 317.344.7046 

Remit Payment via: 

ACH Transferz 
Account Name: ACES Power Marketing 
Account 1:8666823358 
ABA Routing II: 071000039 
Bank Name: Bank of America 
Bank Address: Chicago, Illinois 

Wire Transfer (Please use ACH if inossIble) z 
Account Name: ACES Power Marketing 
Account t 8666823358 
AM Routing II: 026009593 
Bank Name: Bank of America 
Bank Address: New York, New York 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Beventh El:Mated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 3 of 48 
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Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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3308 Haddon Road 
Louisville, KY 40241 

(502) 599-1739 
johnwolfrarn@catalystcllc.com  

INVOICE 

Date: 	December 31, 2013 Invoice #: 	172 

aient 	• 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
201 Third Street 
Henderson, Kentucky 42420 

Project 

2013 Rate Case (2) - Alcan 
Case No. 2013-00199 

For Services Provided in December 2013 

# Item Description Qty Rate Amt 

1 Consulting 
Services 

John Wolfram — consulting support for 
Alcan rate case. Draft rebuttal 
testimony. Develop case strategy. 
Emails, calls, and meeting with Big 
Rivers' staff and counsel on same. 
Participate at Big Rivers in witness 
preparation for hearing. 

83.5 
hours 

$175.00 $ 14,612.50 

2 Consulting 
Services 

In Hurst — consulting support for 
Alum rate case. Draft and review 
rebuttal testimony. 

16.5 
hours 

$150.00 $ 2,475.00 

3 Expenses See attached. $ 441.28 

TOTAL $ 17,528.78 

Please remit payment to Catalyst Consulting LLC at the address listed above. Thank you. 

C EOV  

ORA A twirl 
/ 64/Joey 
ce 

cin 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-154a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 5 of 48 
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3308 Haddon Road 
Louisville, KY 40241 

(502) 599-1739 
johnwolfram@catalystellc.com  

• 

EXPENSE DETAIL 

JOHN WOLFRAM 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
2013 Rate Case (2) — Alan 

Case No. 2012-00199 
December 2013 

Item Description Qty Rate AS 

Mileage 12/16-17 roundtrip to hotel, Big Rivers 308 0.565 $ 174.02 
Meal 12/16 Breakfast, Dinner 1 48.60 $ 48.60 

3 Meal 12/17 Lunch -JW, Mark Bailey, Jim 
Miller, Tyson Kamuf, Tip Depp 

1 42.23 $ 4223 

4 Meal 12/17 Meal 1 5.08 $ 5.08 
5 Hotel 12/16-17 Hampton Inn 1 171.35 $ 17135 

TOTAL $44j.2$ 

Case No. 2013 -00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 144a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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DINSMORE & SHOHL LLP 

Charleston WV 'Cincinnati Olf Columbus Ok Dayton OH Frankfort la Ledtgton xr 
Louisville ICY . Morgantown WV Philadelphia PA l'Ittsbutgh PA Washington DC Wheeling WV 

Federal I.D.: 31-0263070 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
201 Third Street 
P.O. Box 24 
Henderson KY 42419-0024 

Januar/ 13, 2014 
Invoice #3140288 

Billing Attorney - Edward Tip Depp 

Client Number -75569.4 
Matter. In the Matter of The Application of Big Rivers 
Electric Corporatism for a Oeneral Adjustment In Rates, 
Kentucky PSC Case No. 2013-00199 (Alan Rate Case) 

Remittance Advice 

For Professional Services Rendered Through December 3112013: 

Current Fee for Hours Worked 	 $ 124,838.00 
Attorney Costs 	 $408.16 

Total Due for Professional Services 	 $ 125,246.16 

Payment Due on Receipt 
Please Return a Copy of this Remittance Advice with your Payment to: 

Dinsmore and Shohl LISP 
P.O. Box 640635 

Cinchmad, Ohlo 45264-0635 

or 

We accept Visa, Mastercard, American E:xprem and Discover 
Plane call (513)977-8131 to Inkkas credit card payment. 

gdnislir 
6645oob 

poi 4 
pent 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment to $eventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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hum/ 13, 2014 
DInsmore & Shohl LLP Invoice Al 31402101 
Client Number— 75569.4 
Metter: In Me Matter of The Application of BM Rivers Ritchie Corporation fore General Adjustment In 
Rates, ICentsmicy PSC Can No. 2013-08199 (Akan Rate Can) 

• 

Summary of Current Hours Worked 

111111131881 	 filiaLsand 	Hoini 	3at2 	 Amasmt 

Edward Tlp Depp 	Partner 	 154.80 	300.00 	$46,440.00 
Michelle 'Ripper Butler 	Of Counsel 	25.40 	265.00 	$6,731.00 
Joseph A Newberg 	Associate 	77.40 	205.00 	$ 15,867.00 
Kurt R Hunt 	 Associate 	22320 	250.00 	$55,800.00 

Total Hours / Fees 	480.80 	 $ 124,838.00 

Summary of Current Attorney Costs Incurred 

Business Meals 	 $ 5.36 

Photocopies 	 $ 12.60 
Hotel Expense 	 $121.26 

Travel Mileage 	 $ 268.94 

	

Total Attorney Costs 	$408.16 

	

Current Amuunt Due This Invoice 	$125,246.16 

Case No. 2013-00189 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 8 of 48 



January 13, 2014 
Dinsmore & Shah! LLP 	 Invoice 0 31402111 

• Client Numba -75569.4 
Matters In the Matter 0Th. Application of Mg Riven Electric Corporation for a General Adjesaunt te 
Rates, Kratuety PSC Can No. 211340199 (Alm Rate Con) 

Detail of Carnal Doers Worked 

flak 	JIM 1-.1taaildial 	 Ball 	filtilE1 Ausaml 
12/02/13 	Ell) Case No. 2013-00199: Review and wait on 	300.00 	4.80 1,440.00 

rebuttal testimony; review intervenor responses 
to data requests 

12102/13 	KRH 20134199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	2.50 625.00 
tesdmony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same; prepared 
for and drafted post-hearing brief. 

12/03113 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and wale on 	300.00 	5.80 1,740.00 
rebuttal testimony. 

12103/13 	JAN Itevbed Rebuttal Testimony of DeAnna Speed 205.00 	4.90 1,004.50 
Alcan Rate Case, PS C. Case No. 2013- 

00199. Wanel conversations with Mr. Hint 
regarding seine. 

12/03/13 	ICRH 2013-0199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	6.80 1,700.00 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same; prepared 
for and drafted post-hearing briet 

12104/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00413: Review and work ai 	300.00 	10.20 3,060.00 
rebuttal testimony. 

12104/13 	KRH 2013-0199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	9.30 2,325.00 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same; prepared 
for and drafted post-hearing brief. 

12105/13 	E173 Case No. 2013-00199: Review end work on 	300.00 	9.60 2,880.00 
rebuttal tesdmaw. 

12/05/13 	KR!! 20134199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	6.50 1,625.00 
testimony; reviewed relevant doamsera; 
communications with team re: same; prepared 
for and drafted post-bearing briet 

12/06/13 	E7D Case No. 2013-00199: Work on modest for 	300.00 	7.20 2,160.00 
leave to withdraw motion for darificatiau 
review and respond to emalls with Mr. ICamuf 
regarding sex; review and work on rebuttal 
testimony. 

12106113 	KR!! Drafted and revised rebuttal testimony; reviewed 250.00 	8.10 2,025.00 
relevant documents; communications with team 
re: same;Fepared for and drafted post-hearing 
brief. 

12/07/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and work on 	300.00 	0.80 240.00 
rebuttal testimony. 

12/07/13 	KRH 2013-199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	2.60 650.00 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same. 

12/08/13 	ETD Case No.2013-00199: Review and work on 	300.00 	9.80 2,940.00 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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January 13, 2014 
Dinsmore & SUM LLP Invoke 0314021$ 
Client Number-75569.4 
Matter In the Matter of The Application of Mg Myer Matra Owponne for • Cement Adjutant le 
Rates, Kentadty PSC Cue No. 201344199 (Akan Rate Case) 

rebuttal testimony. 

12/08113 	KAN 2013-199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	5.50 1,375.00 
testhnony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same. 

12/09/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and work on 	300.00 	2.40 720.00 
rebuttal tesdmony. 

12/09/13 	JAN Prepared rebutnd testimony in Alcan Rate Case, 205.00 	1.40 287.00 
P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199. 

12/09/13 	KRH 2013-019% Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	1330 3,32100 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: nine. 

12/10/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and work on 	300.00 	2.70 810.00 
rebuttal tesdmony. 

12/10/13 	KRH 2013-0199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	9.20 2,300.00 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same. 

12/11/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and work on 	300.00 	230 690.00 
rebuttal testimony. 

12/11113 	10tH 2013-019% Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	12.10 3,025.00 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same. 

12/12/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and wait on 	300.00 	3.40 1,020.00 
rebuttal testimony. 

12/12/13 	JAN P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199: Prepared rebuttal 205.00 	030 	6130 
testimony in rate case. 

12/12/13 	ICRR 2013-0199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	9.80 2A50.00 
testimony, reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: same; travel 
from Henderson to Cinchmati; prepared for, 
researched for, and drafted post-bearing brit 

12/13/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-0019% Review and week on 	300.00 	13.10 3,930.00 
rebuttal testimony; trawl to/from Henderson 
reprding same. 

12/13/13 	KRH 2013-0199: Drafted and 'gybed rebuttal 	250.00 	&50 2,125.00 
tesdmony; reviewed relevant documents; 
communications with team re: sanse; prepared 
for, researched for, and drafted post-bearing 
brief. 

12/14/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Review and work on 	300.00 	8.40 2,520.00 
finalizing rebuttal testimony. 

12114113 	KRH 2013-0199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 	250.00 	6.50 1,62100 
testimony; reviewed relevant documents; 
commomicatiore with team re: same; prepared 
fix, researched for, and drafted post-hearing 
briet 

12/15/13 	ETD Case No. 2013-0019% Review and work on 	300.00 	0.70 210.00 
finalizing rebuttal testimony. 

12/16113 	ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Wits= preparation; 	300.00 	13.20 3,960.00 
prepare for bearing attend public comment 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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January 13, 2014 
Dinsmore & Sbohl 112 Invokel 31402ES 
alord Number-75569.4 
Kitten In the Matter .1 7%. Applicable et Big Riven Merle Corporates bra Cenral Adjutant le 
Rates, Karteity LW Case Ns. 2013-N199 (Alen Rats Cu.) 

12/16913 	JAN 

12/16/13 	KRH 

12/17/13 	ETD 

12/17/13 	JAN 

12/17/13 	KRH 

12/18/13 	ETD 

12/18/13 	JAN 

12/18/13 	KRH 

12/19/13 	ETD 

12/19/13 	JAN 

12/19/13 	KRH 

12/19/13 	MID 

12/20/13 	ETD 

12/20/13 	JAN 

12/20/13 	KIM 

12/20/13 	MTB 

12/21/13 	ETD 

12/21/13 	JAN 

12121/13 	KM 

meeting travel to Henderson regarding  all  of 
SaMe. 
?S.C. Cue No. 2013-00199: Cornmunicadons 
with Mr. Hunt regarding post-hearing brief in 
Akan Rate Case. Draft post-hearing brief. 
2013-0199: Drafted and revised rebuttal 
testimony, communications with team re: same; 
prepared for, reached for and drafted post-
hearing brief. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Witness preparation; 	300.00 
prepare for hearing trawl back from Henderson. 
P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199 -drafted post- 	205.00 
hearing brief in Alcan Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brie& 	250.00 
cannumicadons with team re: same, case 
strategy. 
Cue No. 2013-00199: Teleconference with Mr. 300.00 
Miller regarding hearing preparation; review and 
respond to emaib with counsel regarding 
witness order. 
P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199 - Drafted post- 	205.00 
hearing brief in Akan Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brie& 	250.00 
communications with team re: same, case 
strategy. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Review and respond to 300.00 
emalb with Mr. Hurd regarding work on post- 
hearing brig MP= for heat& 
P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199- drafted post- 	205.00 
hearing brief in Al can Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brief, 	250.00 
communiattlons with team re: same, case 
strategy. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Work at post-hearing 	265.00 
brief 
Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearing. 	300.00 

P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199 - drafted post- 	205.00 
hearing brief in Mean Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brief, 	250.00 
communications with team re: same, OM 
strategy. 
2013-00199: Work on post-bearing brief. 	265.00 

Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearing. 	300.00 

P.S.C. Case No. 2013-00199 - drafted post- 	205.00 
bearing brief in Alan Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brie& 	250.00 
commtmications with team re: same, case 

11.40 3,420.00 

830 1,742.50 

12.40 3,100.00 

0.50 150.00 

3.50 717.50 

12.20 3,050.00 

5.20 1,560.00 

11.60 2,378.00 

12.30 3,075.00 

3.60 954.00 

4.40 1,320.00 

13.10 2,685.50 

13.60 3,400.00 

4.20 1,113.00 

2.70 810.00 

6.90 1,414.50 

7.70 1,925.00 

	

205.00 	4.20 861.00 

	

250.00 	8.50 2,125.00 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to $eventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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Dinsmore & Shobl LLP 
Client Number -75569.4 
?flatten lathe Matter of lb Application of Mg Riven Ritchie Corporation hr • Cams 
Rates, Kestselq PSC Case Na 20134141199 (Alma Rate Cam) 

;away 13,2014 
Invoice I 31402118 

Adjustment Is 

12/22/13 	JAN 

12/22113 	KRH 

12/23/13 	ETD 

12/23/13 	JAN 

12/23/13 	KIM 

12/23/13 	MTE1 

12/24/13 	KRH 

12/24/13 	MTB 

12/26/13 	ETD 

12/26/13 	JAN 

12/26/13 	KRH 

12/27/13 	ETD 

12/27/13 	JAN 

12a7/13 	KRH 

12/28/13 	ETD 

12/28/13 	KRH 

12/29/13 	ETD 

12129/13 	KRH 

12/30/13 	ETD 

strateu. 

2013-00199 - Drafted pod-bearing brief in 	205.00 
Ala Rate Cast 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing tde4 	250.00 
communications with team re: nut, case 
strategy. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for heading 	300.00 
review and respond to smalls with Mr. Berry 
regarding potential cross-examination exhibits 
review and respond to emalls with Mr. Hunt and 
Mr. Newberg regaling work at post-hearing 
brie 
PS.0 Case No. 2013-00199 - drafted post- 	205.00 
hearing brief in Alcan Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brief, 	250.00 
communications with team m: sant, CM 
strategy. 
2013-00199: Work on post-hearing brief 	265.00 

2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brief, 	250.00 
conumatications with team re: same, case 
stratev. 
2013-00199: Work on post-hearing brief. 	265.00 

Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearing. 	300.00 

Case No. 2013-00199 - drafted post-hearing 	205.00 
brief In Alan Rate Case. 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing br1e4 	250.00 
communications with team re: same, case 
strategy. 
Case No.2013-00199: Prepare for hearing. 	300.00 

Case No. 2013-00199 - drafted post-hearing 	205.00 
brief In Alam Rate Case- 
2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brief, ' 	250.00 
commtmicadons with team re: same, case 
stratev. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearing,. 	300.00 

2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brief 	250.00 
come:tit:adorn with team re: same, Case 
strategy. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearing. 	300.00 

2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing bdef, 	250.00 
commtmications with team re: same, cam 
stratev. 
Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearinw 	300.00 
work with Mr. Hunt regarding post-hearing brief 
strategy. 

8.90 1,824.50 

11.50 2,875.00 

8.30 2,490.00 

4.30 881.50 

7.20 1,800.00 

4.40 1,166.00 

0.10 	25.00 

2.80 74100 

3.30 990.00 

4.30 881.50 

7.60 1,900.00 

2.50 750.00 

5.50 1,127.50 

5.80 1,450.00 

5.70 1,710.00 

3.90 975.00 

2.10 630.00 

2.30 575.00 

4.00 1,200.00 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54 a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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January 13,2014 
Dinsmore & Shohl LLP Invoice ft 3140228 
CUMNumb& —75569.4 
Matten In the Matter of The Application of Mg Riven Electric Corporatin fora Goma! Aeliastment le 
Rates, Kenticky PSC Can No. 2013-00199 (Akan Rote Can) 

12/3W13 KRH 2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing brie 
communications with team re: same, case 
strategy. 

250.00 820  2,200.00 

12130/13 MTH 2013-00199: Work on post-hearing Wet 265.00 7.70 2,04030 

12/31/13 ETD Case No. 2013-00199: Prepare for hearing. 300.00 10.30 3,090.00 

12/31/13 WI 2013-0199: Drafted post-hearing Wet 
communications with team re: same, case 
strategy. 

250.00 8.60 2,150.00 

12131/13 MTh 2013-00199: Work on post-hearing brie 265.00 2.70 	715.50 

Thal Hours 400.80 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-154a 

Witness: DeAnna Id. Speed 
Page 18 of 48 



baynesboone 

Invoice Number: 21050982 
Client/Matter Number: 0050450.00003 

December 16,2013 

Big Riven Electric Corporation . 
Attn: Mc Billie Richert 
P.O. Box 24 
	

Tax Idenlikation No. 75-1312888 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 

Billing Attorney: Robert D. Albergottl 

For Professional Services Through November 30, 2013 

0050450.00003 
Akan Rate Case acna-49199 

Profesdonal Fees • 	plts Timekeeper 
	

pescrlotlog 
	 Han 

Prepare materials for Mr. Mabeys review; calls and email, with Mr. Miller re 
Mabey as expert witness; prepare mutiny through documents and testimony for 
Mr. Mabey; mails to Mr. Mabey; forward testimony and documents to Mr. 
Mabey 

Assemble testimony binders from both Century and Akan rate cases for expert 
witness; assemble binder of company financials and critical documents. 

Work on Mabey testimony for Akan Case; review intervenor testimony 

Receipt, review and finalize form of engagemeM letter with Mr. Mabey and his 
firm; calls with Mr. Mabey and Ms. Haudistel (Stutrnan Triester associcate) to 
review materials provided to Mr. Mabey 

Extended call with Stutman attorneys re outline for preparation of rate case 
testimony. 

Assemble unredacted testimony for both Century and Akan rate eases and update 
testimony binders with same; letter to Mr. Mabey forwarding unredacted 
testimony; upload additional documents to database. 

11/01/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11101/13 ICimberly Morzak 

11104/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/05/13 Robert D. Arbergotti 

11106/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/06/13 Kimberly Morzak 

4.00 

3.40 

1.30 

1.70 

0.80 

3.30 

• 
Case No. 2018-00199 

Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 
Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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December 16,2013 
Page 2 

Correspondence to Ms. Fineman forwarding additional materials In connection 
with preparation of expert report. 

Review of testimony 

work on topics for Mabey expert testimony; review filed testimony 

Review Century rate documents and Mabey articles in preparation for drafting of 
Mabey report. 

Review of documents. 

Extended call with Ma. Richert re rebuttal testimony 

Preparation for and participation in call with client regarding financials. 

Review Big Rivers direct testimony for Alcan ease as part of prep of expert 
witness 

Big Riven Electric Corporation 
Invoice Number: 21050982 
Client/Matter Number: 0050450.00003 

11/07/13 Kimberly Morzak 

11/07/13 Robin E. Phelan 

11108/13 Robert D. /Masotti 

11/08/13 Ian T. Peck 

11/08/13 Robin E. Phelan 

11/11/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/11/13 Robin E. Phelan 

11/12/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

0.20 

6.30 

1.20 

1.50 

2.10 

1.40 

1.60 

3.40 

11/12/13 Ian T. Peck Review Snyder testimony and other materials in preparation for Mabey testimony 
draft 

2.50 

Work on preparation of issues for Mr. Mabey expert testimony. 	 430 

Review materials and work on draft of Mabey testimony. 	 4.00 

Continue work on themes for expert testimony; calls with Mr. Mabey; calls with 	6.50 
Stamen lawyers 

Continue work on draft of Mabey testimony; participate in telephone conference 	2.00 
with Quick personnel regarding terms of indenture and related documents. 

Finalize draft outline of testimony themes; review prior rulings in 1996-97 BREC 	3.40 
bankruptcy 

Work on revisions to draft Mabey report; discuss same with Mr. Albergoni. 	 1.20 

Continue review of 1996 BREC bankruptcy issues and prepare outline for 	 3.30 
discussion with Mr. Mabey re tame; calls to Mr. Miller re draft of expert witness 
issues; revise narrative 

Revise Mabey report based on comments from Mr. Miller. 

Work on expert witness issue outline; analyze scope of liens in indenture; 
conference call with Mr. Mabey, Stutman and Messrs Miller and Fiorella to 
review 1996 bankruptcy issues. 

On-line research regarding BREC, 1997 bankruptcy proceeding. 

Compile and review additional materials for Mabey report; telephone conference 
with Haynes and Boone, Stutman, and BREC personnel regarding daft 

Preparation for and participation in call with client regarding submission. 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 15 of 48 

11/13/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/13/13 Ian T. Peck 

11/14/13 Robert 17. Albergotti 

11/14/13 Tan T. Peck 

11/15/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/15/13 lin T. Peck 

11/18/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/18/13 Ian T. Peck 

11/19/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/19/13 Kimberly Monak 

11/19/13 lan T. Peck 

11/19/13 Robin E. Phelan 

1.80 

2.00 

0.30 

1.40 

1.30 



Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Invoice Number: 21050982 
Client/Mauer Number: 0050450.00003 

11/20/13 Ian T. Peck 

11/21/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/22/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/25/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/25/13 Ian T. Peck 

11/26/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

11/27/13 Robert D. Albergotti 

December 16. 2013 
Page 3 

Compile materials for professional fee burn rate info in Mabey testimony and 
discuss time With Stutman personnel. 

0.80 

Confer with Stutman team on testimony; work on revisions of Mabey narrative 	 1.60 

Work on changes to Mr. Mabey narrative 	 1.40 

Numerous calls with Stutman; exchange drafts of revisions to Mabey narrative; 	 5.00 
review various credit documents and analyze cash collateral issues for discussion 
In Mabey narrative; calls to Mr. Miller. 

Telephone conference with Ms. Fineman regarding edits to draft expert report; 	 1.10 
review and revise expert report. 

Additional WOth on Mabey testimony and first draft of Ms. Richert supplemental 	7.80 
testimony to support Mabey conclusions. 

Continue work on Mr. Mabey expert testimony and emails to Snifter] team 	 3.00 

Chargeable Hours 

Total Fees 

Adjustment (Attorney Blended Rate Variance) 

Total Adjusted Fees 

87.10 

$54,230.70 

($11.116.20) 

543,114.50 

Timekeeper 

Robert D. Albergotti 
Ian T. Peck 
Robin E. Phelan 
Kimberly Morzak 

Timekeeper Summary 

Hours 	Rritt 

52.30 $695.00 
16.30 $549.00 
11.30 $695.00 
7.20 $150.00 

Amount 

$36,348.50 
$8,948.70 
$7,853.50 
$1 080.00 

$54,230.10 Total Professional Summary 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment to Stazialaulata Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 16 of 48 
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Invoice Number: 21050982 
Client/Matter Number: 0050450.00003 

December 16,2013 
Page 4 

Expenses 

cQt pest-dotter( Amount 

11101/13 	PRO 	I Photocopies 30.15 

11/01/13 	FedEx Federal Express Corporation -To: itutnum Treister & Glatt PC Attn: Ralph Mabey Airbind: $46.66 
797063891507 Sender Robert D. Albergotti 

11101/13 	PRO 	I66 Photocopies $24.90 	' 

11/06/13 	PRO 	170 Photocopies $25.50 

11106/13 	PRO 	1 Photocopies S0.15 

11/06/13 	FeciEx Federal Express Corporation • To: SMtman Treister & Glatt PC Attn: Ralph Mabey AirbilIN: $20.65 
797094310120 Sender Kimberly Morzak 

11/06/13 	P1-IC 	69 Color Photocopies $10.35 

I1/06/13 	PRO 	20 Photocopies $3.00 

11/06/13 	P1-IC 	4 Color Photocopies $0.60 

11/06/13 	PRO 	7 Photocopies S1.05 

11/06/13 	P1-IC 	6 Color Photocopies S0.90 

11/06/13 	PRO 	16 Photocopies $2.40 

11108/13 	PTC 	2 Color Photocopies $0.30 

Total Expenses $136.61 

Expenses Summary 

pewit:Molt 	 Amount 

Photocopy 	 $57.15 
Federal Express 	 567.31 
Photocopy Expense Color 	 311.85 
Prints Expense Color 	 $0.30 

Total Expenses 	 $136.61 

Total Fees and Expense. Due 543,251.11 

Total Amount Due USD $43,251.11 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Uvdated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Invoice Number. 21050982 
Client/Matter Number: 0050450.00003 

December 16, 2013 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Attn: Mt Billie Richert 
P.O. Box 24 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 

ClIent/Matter: 0050450.00003 
Alan Rate Case 
Billing Attorney: Robert D. Albergotti 

Remit to: 

REMITTANCE PACE 
For Projenlonol Services Through November 30, 2013 

Haynes and Boone IL? 
P.O. Box 841399 
Dallas, TX 75284-1399 

Total Fees 

Adjustment (Attorney Blended Rate Variance) 

Total Adjusted Fees 

Total Expenses 

Total Fees and Expenses 

Invoice Balance Due 

$54,230.70 

(511,116.20) 

543,11430 

5136.61 

$43,251.11 

USD $43,251.11 

 

WIRINUINSTRUCTIONS FOR OPFRATINO ACCOUNT 
My beak wire Sea sit. teemeesteloy GPM Nader. 

BANK OF AMERICA 100 Wer 33rd Sowd New York, NY 10001 
For Credit le the Amaral of HAYNES AND BOONE. UP • 

ABA NO. 0260-0959-3 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4 

SWIFT Address: B0FAUSS0( 

For ACH Payments 
For Credit to the Account of HAYNES AND BOONE, LLP 

ABA NO. 111-000-025 Operating Account No.: 018-08-3729-4 
rime Mimes In*. Number 2105119112 
ResponsBle Aunty: Robin D. Albereete1 

Client Mauer Number 005045041003 

A dm.stir 
1 $70 fr5ooD 
OOP/ 
099q 

Case No. 2018-00199 
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haynesboone 

Invoke Number: 21053263 
ClIcat/Matter Number: 0050450.00000 

kaway 06, 2014 

Big Rivers Electric Corpontke 
Atm Ms. Billie Moist 
P.O. Box 24 
Henderson, KY 424154024 

*btu Ihnicasan No.731312381 

DWI's Attorney: Reber? ft Athergottl 

For Pries:SS Unica 71roch Mambas 31, 2013 

0050450.00003'  
Akan Rate Can 

alii70/5-*Obl  

Prolenkaal Fees 

• ats Mgt= 

12/02113 Robert D. Akerson' 

12/02/13 Kimberly Mona 

12102113 Robin B. Phelan 

12103/13 Robed D. Merged 

12/03/13 Edward Plk M 

12/04/13 Robert D. Albetgotd 

12/05/13 Robert]). Albertan' 

12/06113 Roble Pheko  

Rauld12a 

Work on flunk' opens of Macy tedium; revision of draft testimony. 	 3.00 

Upload additions' documents to database. 	 0.30 ' 

Review of reekekk. 	 320 

Calla with thuhum calls with Mr. Miller; revision to draft; review ondit 
	

4.60 
documents. 

Renard: and compile publicly reported kformation an Miran Caporedoe, 
Pacific On & Electric Company and El Paso Electric; analyze results with Mr. 
AlbergrotL 

Watt on &Obey aon exoninatIonpreperatka and outline interveneInnen bk 	4.10 
lestmooy. 

Work on Rkhert teWimany; revelw comma from Mr. Bailey end Ms. Richert 	5.00 
all lauds call to review testimony; call to Stutonag resin pen Mb. of bury an 
valuation Sties call with Ms. Richert re financial analyds for rebuttal testknotty. 

Analysis of Intimany. 	 1.60 , 

RiiesSIoc. UP , 
Morays and Camas 

2505 NA Flare IDASt a33) 
PADS% boa 7.50524101 

Ph= 972.6037550 
Vac W2240.7331 

nvalonnowocan 
Case No. 2018-00199 
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• Big Riven Heads Corporation 
Invoice Number: 21053263 
Client/Matter Number: 0050450.00003 

January 06,2014 
Page 2 

121011113 Robin E. Pheba Review of proposed testimony. 230 

12109113 Robert D. Marra Waken Ma. Richert rebuttal; conference call with team to review reburial 
testimony; calls to Mr. Miller. 

4.50 

12109113 Robin IL Phelan Furtha review of proposed tesdmrmy. 4.10 ; 

12/10/13 Robert D. Abased Work on Mabey and Richest rebuttal; work on cross examinetion prep; calls to 5.00 
Mr. Kraut calls to Stutman. 

12/10/13 Robin E. Phelan Ravi.' 	Ica of testimony. 2.20 

12/11/13 Robert D. Mewed Mabey witness freprattea and drafting testimony. 3.40 

12/11/13 Kimberly Morale Work on updates to binder with financial and loan documentx update database. 0.40 

12/11/13 Ian T. Pedc Participate in telephone conference to review draft Mercy testimony. 0.50 

12/11/13 Robin E. Phelan Review of testimony. 2.60 

12/12/13 Robat D. Albergoni Outline issues ibr Mabey witness preposition; work on Issues to discuss with 160 
Orrick on neat agreanenta. 

12/12/13 Kimberly Morak Work on witness prepastion for rate bearings by listening to examination of 2.50 
Snyder during Century rate case and maldng notes on line of questkaing. 

12/12/13 Ian T. Peck Review allied draft Mak),  testimony; camp& and review materials suppordng 
bankruptcy cost portion of Mabry testimony. 

1.30 

12/12/13 Robin B. Phelan Review of testimony. 0.80 

12/13/13 Robert D. Albagotd Work on Mabey testimony and Mabey witness preparation. 6.00 

12/13/13 Robin E. Phelan Further analysis oftesthnony. 020 

12/15/13 Rabat D. Albergotd Prepare eras examination of Mr. Mabey. 3.50 

12/16/13 Robat D. Marvel Attend witness preparstion meeting. 9.00 

12/20/13 Kimberly Marge Assemble Mabry witness file in preparation for January rate bearings. 0.80 

12/23/13 Kimberly Morale Scan and upload BREC rebuttal testimony into Sabine. 0.80 

12/30/13 Robot D. Albagotti Mabey witness preparation. 6.00 

Chargeable Horn 	$6.00 

Total Plea 356,40L20 

Adjustment (Patna rote capped ® $495) ($11,940.00) 

Adjustment (Partner ate capped ® 2495) ($3,740.00) 

Adjustment (Penner rate capped 41) $495) (39720) 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Uvdated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 

Big Riven Beetle Corporation 
Invoice Number 21053263 
Client/Matter Number: 0050450.00003 

Total Atli cited Fees 

January 06, 2014 
Page 3 

540,04.00 

Timekeeper Summary 

Timekeeper Elk 1111111 Bate MAUI 

la T. Peek Penner 1.80 $549.00 8988.20 
Robed D. Albergetti Penner 59.70 $695.00 $4149130 
Robin B. Phebm Penner 18.70 $695.00 $12,996.50 
Kimberly Morzek Pralepl 4.80 $150.00 8720.00 
Edward Fik III SST 1.00 $205.00 8205.00 

Total Professional Summary $56,401.20 

• 
Case No. 2018-00199 

Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a. 
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Big Rivas Electric Corporation 
Invoice Number. 21053263 
Mont/Matta Number: 0050450.00003 

January 06, 2014 
Page 4 

Expenses 

Mitt 	rids 	 Pmdathm 	 and 

12/10/13 	P110 20 Photocopies  

12110/13 	PHO 10 Photocopies 	 11.50 

12/11/13 	TRY Robat D. Albergotti Cur Rental/Fuel Only - Rabat D. Albageal • Trip to Kentucky hr Rake 	$15.42 
Mabey tatimary prep mkt 

12/11/13 	TEV Robert D. Albergottl Airfare - Robert D. Abergotti - Tra to Kentucky tor Ralph Macy testbnony 	$456.90 
FP session. 

12/111/13 	TRV Rabat D. Albergotti Paning - Rabat D. Albergotti - Trip to Kenticky for Ralph Mabey testimony 
prep session. 

12/11/13 	ita Robed D. Albergotti -Hotel - Darter - Robert D. Albergati • Trip to Kentucky fir Ralph Mabey 
testimony prep session. 

12/11/13 	7KV Robat D. Albergotti - Car Rental/Peel Only -Robert D. Albergotti - Trip to ICenindry for Ralph 	$41.00 
Mabry testimony prep torsion. 

12/11/13 	'IRV Robert D. Mbergotti Mitre • Robert D. Albergotti - Tdp to Kentucky for Ralph Mabey testimony 	$422.40 
prep session. 

12/11113 	IITL Robert D. Albargotti - Lodging - Robert D. Alberti - Trip to Kentucky for Ralph Mabey testimony 	$13229 
prep session. 

• 12/18/13 	PHO 19 Photocopies 	 $2.85 

12/18/13 	HTL Rabat D. Alborgottl - Lodging - RobertD. Albergotd- Trip to Kimtucky for Raalt Msbey testimony 	$20820 
prep session. 

1211t1I3 	TRIP Robert D. Albertan!. Car Rental - Robert D. Albergotti - Trip to ICentucky far Ralph Mabry 	 1130.14 
testimony prep session. 

12119113 	PHO 36 Photocopies  

Total Expenses 	 $1,488.40 

Expenses Summary 

antailos Am oat 

Travel Expense 11,114.56 
Math and Entertainment S20.00 
Hotel Expense $341.09 
Photocopy $12.75 

Total Expenses $1,418.40 

• 
Case No. 2018-00199 

Attachment to Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-154a 
Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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Big Rivas Electric Caporatice 
Invoke Number 21033263 

410 Clicet/Nfatter Number 0030450.0=3 

Total Foes and Expenses Dm 

konny 06,2014 
Feiss 

642412.40 

Total Amount Dna 	 1:11512:11.-ah 

ZeRzfittsfir 
if44,519eb 

pap/ 
ow? 
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Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 28 of 48 



Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
201 Third Street 
P.O. Box 7024 
Henderson, KY 42420 
Attn: Billie Richert, CPA, C1TP 
Vice President Accounting, Rates and CFO Orrick Contact: Carl F. Lyon 

December 31, 2013 
Client No. 8814 

Invoice No. 1453836 

0 
ORRICK 

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through December 31. 2013 in connection 
with the matters described on the attached pages: 597.00 

LESS CLIENT DISCOLNT (44.78) 
SUBTOTAL 552.22 
DISBURSEMENTS as per attached pages: 0.00 

TOTAL CURRENT FEES & DISBURSEMENTS (Pay this Amount): 552.22 

Matter(s): 8814/1 Rate Case 	Akira, aola -oclif 

• 	DUE UPON RECEIPT 	

ARAALsar 

/6465-0670 
 paPe 

In order to ensure proper credit to your account, 
please reference your INVOICE and CLIENT numbers on your remittance. 

For inquiries, call: (304)231-2701. Fax (304)231-2501. 

REMITTANCE COPY - PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT 

• 

REMITTANCE ADDRESS: 

Orrick. Ilerrutron it Sunlit UP 
Inaba? 0774619 

4619 Solutions Center 
Chicago. IL 60677-1006 

Reference. 5314 Invoice: 1453836 

ELECTRONIC FUNDS 
TRANSFERS: 

ACH & Hire Transfers: 
4114 Number 121000248 

SWIFT CODE: WF1S1US6S 
Account Number: 4123701088 

lie!?: Fargo 
470 Alontgomen. Street 

San Frandrel, CI 94104 
.1ccouni 

Orrick. Ilerengton 6 Sutcliffe  UP 
Rectum 8814 Invoice 1453836 

P.II N.91-195262" 

OVERNIGHT DELIVERY: 

Orrick. IlerrIngion 4 Sutcliffe LLP 
c often, Fargo 

Ann: I (*Aka 0774619 
350 East Devon Avenue 

hasca. II 60143 
12131 614-3248 

Referrer 6814 Invoice 1453336 

Case No. 201840199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated Response to PSC I-154a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 0 
ORRICK 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
201 Third Street 
P.O. Box 7024 
Henderson, KY 42420 
Attn: Billie Richert, CPA, CITP 
Vice President Accounting, Rates and CFO 

December 31, 2013 
Client No. 8814 

Invoice No. 1453836 

Orrick Contact: Carl F. Lyon 

For Legal Services Rendered Through December 31 1 2013 in Connection With: 

Matter: 1 — Rate Case 

12/09/13 C. Lyon Review and respond to e-mail it Rate Case. 0.30 298.50 

12/13/13 C. Lyon Conference call with counsel. 0.30 298.50 

Total Hours 0.60 
Total For Services $597.00 
Less 7.5 t6 Discount (44.78) 
Total Fees 0.60 $552.22 

Timekeeper Summary Hours Rate Amount 

Carl F. Lyon 0.60 995.00 597.00 

Total All Timekeepers 0.60 $597.00 
Less Discount (44.78) 

Total Fees $552.22 

Total For This Matter 	 $552.22 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Stegnaligthitid Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 	
ORRICK 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
201 Third Street 
P.O. Box 7024 
Henderson, KY 42420 
Attn: Billie Richert, CPA, CITP 
Vice President Accounting, Rates and CFO 

December 31, 2013 
Client No. 8814 

Invoice No. 1453846 

Orrick Contact: Carl F. Lyon 

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through December 31 1 2013 in connection 
with the matters described on the attached pages: 	 61,090.50 

LESS CLIENT DISCOUNT 	 (4,581."8)  
SUBTOTAL 
	

56,508.72 
DISBURSEMENTS as per attached pages: 

	
41438 

TOTAL CURRENT FEES & DISBURSEMENTS (Pay this Amount): 	 56 923.30 

Matter(s): 8814/10 — Century Sebree Negotiations V-- Aidet 4— *Ra. Oat ,  • 	DUE UPON RECEIPT 

6R64L607 -  ieboacia capit 0941? 
15141, 6  er / 11879.34/0  CC/it Oen' 	0-5,6-55.av 

• 
- 

In order to ensure proper credit to your account, 
please reference your INVOICE and CLIENT numbers on your remittance. 

For Inquiries, can: (304) 231 -2701. En (304) 231-2501. 

REMITTANCE COPY -PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT 

• 

REM ITTANCE ADDRESS: 

Orrick. llerrutgton & Sutcliffe LI P 
Lockhot 11 —'4619 

4619 Solutions Center 
Chicago. II. 606"-4006 

Reference: 8814 Amour: 1453846 

ELECTRONIC FUNDS 
TRANSFERS: 

AC!! el Wire Transfers: 
ABA Number 121000248 

SWIFT CODE: WFBIUS6S 
Account Number: 4123701088 

Wells Fargo 
420 Alantgontely Street 

Son Francisca CA 94104 
Account of 

Orrick IletrInvon & Sutchtle L1.1' 
Reference: 8814 Invoice 1453546 

U.N. 94-29526r 

OVERNIGHT DELIVERY: 

Orrick Herrington & Sutelfffe LLP 
CoWells Fargo 

Attn: Lica= 1274619 
350 East Devon demur 

Itasca. IL 60143 
12131 614-3248 

Reerence: 8814 Invoice: 1453846 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 	ORRICK 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
201 Third Street 
P.O. Box 7024 
Henderson, KY 42420 
Attn: Billie Richert, CPA, CITP 
Vice President Accounting, Rates and CFO 

December 31, 2013 
Client No. 8814 

Invoice No. 1453846 

Orrick Contact: Carl F. Lyon 

For Legal Services Rendered Through December 31,2013 in Connection With: 

Mitten 10- Century Sebree Negotiations 

Redacted - not charged to rate case 

• 

12113/13 	F. Gottlieb Akan Rate Case Rebuttal Testimony - review 
of questions; review of documents; conference 
call with It Albergotti re same. 

1.80 	1,368.00>  acatilhail 
	SaMt+itti  

	4 9-5 0 4F 

Redacted - not charged to rate case 

Case No. 2018-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 	
ORRICK 

Big Riven Electric Corp. -8814 
Page 2 

December 31, 2013 
Invoice No. 1453846 

Redacted - not charged to rate case 

• 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment to Seventh Undated  Response to PSC 1 -54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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ORRICK 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. .8814 
	

December 31, 2013 
Page 3 
	

Invoice No. 1453846 

Redacted • not charged to rate case 

• 

Total Hours 
	

7920 
Total For Services 
	

$61,090.50 
Less 7.5 % Discount 
	

(4,581.78)  
Total Fees 
	

79.20 	$56,508.72 

0 
Timekeeper Summary Hours Rate Amount 

Kyle W. Drefke 5430 865.00 46,969.50 
F. S. Gottlieb 2.40 760.00 1,824.00 
Anderson C. Lankford 2.20 550.00 1,210.00 
Leo D. Owens 20.00 550.00 11,000.00 
Jose L. DeJesus 0.30 290.00 87.00 

Total All Timekeepers 79.20 $61,090.50 
Less Discount (4,581.78) 

Total Fees $56,508.72 

Disbursements 

Document Reproduction 	 369.80 
MA Expense 	 42.50 
Telephone 	 228 • 

Total Disbursements $414.58 

Case No. 201340199 
Attachment to Seventh Updated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 	0 • 
ORRICK 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 	8814 
Page 4 

Disbursement Details: 

December 31, 2013 
Invoice No. 1453846 

11/19/13 Telephone VENDOR: Arkadin / Conference Plus, Inc. 2.28 
INVOICEN: 191663112013 DATE: 
11/30/2013 

ORDER ID 36170730- Kyle W. DrefIce .93 
minutes By: K. Drefke 

11/22/13 Taxi Expense VENDOR: Owens. Leo; INVOICEN: 42.50 
112213; DATE: 11/22/2013 - 
dc/dd/s1/174603/bm - Taxi 11/14/13 - 
11/18/13 By L Owens 

12/20/13 Document Reproduction By: K. Dreflce; 3,698 page(s) @0.10 369.80 

Disbursements Total $414158 

Total For This Matter 
	

856,923.30 

Case No. 201840199 
Attachment to Seventh Update •  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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Stutman, Treister & Glatt 
Professional Corporation 
1901 Avenue of the Stars 

12th Floor 
Los Angeles, California 90067 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Billie J. Richert 
Vice President Accounting, Rates and Chief Financial Officer 
201 Third Street P.O. Box 24 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 
billiesichert©bigrivers.com  

November 30, 2013 

08518-0000-RRM 

Invoice Number 37880 

Invoice for Penod Through November 30, 2013 

A /e..AA- 7ka aut - Rol 5 —CO/ff 
Legal Services Regarding: Big Rivers Electric Corporation 

10/03/13 Telephone conference with Robert Albrigotti and Robin Phelan 
regarding possible expert testimony; review direct testimony of W. 

RRM 020 

Snyder. 
10/07/13 Telephone conference with Robert Albergotti and Robin Phelan 

regarding possible retention issues. 
FtRM 0.30 

11/01/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re Big Rivers expert witness matter KJB 0.20 
11101/13 Prepare and draft retainer letter for Big Rivers matter (0.70 hrs. WC) KJB 0.00 
11/01/13 Research re recent utility company bankruptcies and Cajun Electric KJB 0.50 

C838 
11/04/13 Prepare and draft retainer letter for expert witness KJB 1.80 
11/04/13 Review and revise retainer letter KJB 0.80 
11/04/13 Review retainer agreement draft and edit MF 0.30 
11/05/13 . Analyze documents re Big Rivers provided by Bob Albergottl PUB 1.10 
11/05/13 Confer with Marina Fineman and Ralph R. Mabey re Big RIMS 

matter (0.30 hrs. WC) 
PUB 0.00 

11/05/13 Conference call with Marina Fineman and Bob Athergotti re Big KJB 1.00 
Rivers bankruptcy, background and relevant documents 

11/05/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re Big Rivers matter (0.20 hrs. WC) KJB 0.00 
11/05/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey and Katherine J. MF 0.30 

Baudistel re beginning review of case background 
11/05/13 Telephone conference with Bob Albergotti and Katherine J. MF 1.00 

Baudistel re background of Big Rivers case and need for rate hike 
11/05/13 Review various background documents sent by Bob Albergotti and MF 1.00 

Ralph R Mabey re case background and issues to focus on 
11/05/13 Review edits by BREC of retention letter and forward for firm 

approval. (0.20 hrs. N/C) 
FtRM 0.00 

11/05/13 Reviese and edit draft retention letter and send to Robert Albergotti 
for his suggestions. 

RRM 0.70 

reDEC I. °VEIT)) 
tru IMAM L1-3 

) 
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 08518-0000-RRM 

11/05/13 Telephone conference with Robert Abergotti regarding expert 
consultation. 

RRM 0.20 

1105/13 Read Cajun summary report. FtRM 0.40 
11/05/13 Telephone conference with Katherine Baudistel respecting review of 

 documents of expert consultation. 
RRM 0.30 

11/08/13 Analyze documents re Big Rivers Including Snydees testimony and KJB 2.80 
KoIlen's testimony; listening to Big Rivers case introduction and 
background summary 

11/08/13 Analyze and assist Manna Fineman In organizing documents from KJB 0.00 
Big Rivers for review (1.0 hrs. WC) 

11/08/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re Expert Report MV 0.30 
11/08/13 Begin review of direct testimony files; correspond with Bob Albergotti 

re same (2.0 hrs. N/C) 
MF 0.00 

11/08/13 Review, sign and send retention letter. (0.20 hrs. WC) FtRM 0.00 
11108/13 Telephone conference with Robert Albergotti regarding expert 

consultation. 
RRM 0.10 

. 11/08/13 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman regarding expert 
consultation. 

RRM 0.30 

11/08/13 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman regarding expert 
consultation. (0.20 hrs. N/C) 

RRM 0.00 

11/07/13 Analyze documents re reading and taking notes on direct testimony 
from July rate case hearing; watching and taking notes on Snyder's 
cross-examination In July rate case hearing (4.3 hrs. PS/C) 

KJB 0.00 

11/07/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re Report MV 0.30 
11/07/13 Analyze correspondence from Ralph R. Mabey re Report (0.20 hrs. MF 0.00 

N/C) 
11/07/13 Review Snyder's direct testimony and transcribe MF 2.60 
11/07/13 Begin to review written testimony submitted to cornmission (2.0 hrs. MF 0.00 

WC) 
11/08/13 Review testimony filed by Big Rivers and by Intervenors; review MV 7.00 

Cajun summary reports, financials provided for BREC, etc. 
11/08/13 Read materials. RRM 1.40 
11/10/13 Listen to Snyder's testimony from July rate case and take notes 1(JB 3.40 
11/10/13 Review financials and Reply Brief. RRM 0.80 
11/11/13 Listen to Snydees expert testimony from July rate case and take 

notes 
KJB 0.80 

11/11/13 Read and analyze documents In preparation for conference call with KJB 2.70 
CFO and Bob Albergotti; including testimony of Lane KoIlen, BREC 
reply brief; financials of BREC, Marco testimony of Ralph R. Mabey 

11/11/13 Conference call with Ralph R. Mabey, Marina Fineman and Bob KB 0.00 
Albergotti, CFO Billie Richert, Tim, Robin (1.4 hrs. WC) 

11/11/13 Confer with Marina Fineman and Ralph R. Mabey re document 
review and preparation of Ralph R. Mabey's expert testimony (0.30 
hrs. WC) 

KJB 0.00 

11/11/13 Analyze documents re retrieving Cajun docket (0.20 hrs. N/C) KJB 0.00 
11/11/13 Conference call with Billie, Bob, Ralph, Jim and Katherine re BRECs MV 

financial position, debt obligations, etc. 
1.40 

11/11/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re Report preparation MV 0.30 
(2x) 

11/11/13 Telephone conference with Ian re narrative draft (2x) MV 0.30 
11/11/13 Begin review of Cajun docket (1.0 hrs. N/C) 	 . MV 0.00 
11/11/13 Continue review of testimony submitted to the commission MF 1.50 
11/11/13 Telephone conference with David Rubin regarding background of RRM 0.20 

Cajun case 
11/11/13 Read materials. RRM 0.70 

Case No. 2018-00199 
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Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 

11/11/13 	Telephone conference with Billie Richert regarding background. 	RRM 
11/11/13 

	

	Telephone conference with Marina Fineman and Katherine Baudistel RRM 
regarding expert report (0.20 hrs. N/C) 

06518-0000-RRM 

1.40 
0.00 

11/12/13 Analyze documents re published Cajun cases and noting Issues that 
might arise In connection with BREC's bankruptcy filing (3.6 hrs. 

KJB 0.00 

WC) 
11/12/13 Correspond with David Rubin re various Cajun pleadings and files; 

coordinate Report (0.30 hrs. N/C) 
MF 0.00 

11/12/13 Review and analyze Cajun disclosure statement, etc. (3.0 hrs. N/C) MF • 0.00 
11/12/13 Respond to emalls regarding scheduling and provision of materials. RRM Q.10 
11/13/13 Reading and taking notes on documents including Cajun published 

cases, testimony of Ralph R. Mabey from Mario case, Ralph R. 
KIB 0.00 

Mabey article on utility companies In chapter 11(1.7 hrs. N/C) 
11/13/13 Research re dockets, disclosure statements and other relevant 

documents from previous utility company bankruptcies (2.3 hrs. WC) 
1(16 0.00 

11/13/13 Review disclosure statements and other relevant readings from 
other energy company bankruptcies 

MF 3.50 

11/13/13 Review disclosure statements and other relevant readings from 
other energy company bankruptcies (3.0 hrs. N/C) 

MF 0.00 

11/14113 Research re previous utility bankruptcy cases, Including Cajun, El KJB 0.30 
Paso Electric, and Columbia Gas Systems 

11/14/13 Read and take notes on relevant documents Including Cajun 
published cases, Ralph R. Mabey article on utility company chapter 

IQB 4.70 

11 cases, Cajun pleadings/docket, disclosure statement 
11/14/13 Conference call with Bob Albergotti, Billie Richert, Ralph R. Mabey, 

Marina Fineman, Robin Phelan, Jim Miller re expert testimony and 
KM 0.00 

Indentures/credit documents (1.2 hrs. N/C) 
11/14/13 Read and review initial draft of Ralph R. Mabey's proposed 

testimony (0.50 hrs. N/C) 
KJB 0.00 

11/14/13 Confer with Marina Fineman and Ralph R. Mabey re draft of 
proposed testimony (0.70 hrs. N/C) 

K4I3 0.00 

11/14/13 Conference call with Big Rivers and Its corporate counsel and Bob MF 1.20 
Margot° and Ralph R. Mabey re debt structure and indenture, etc. 

11/14113 Confer with Ralph R. Mabey and Katherine J. Baudistel re initial 
draft of testimony 

MF 0.70 

11/14/13 Confer with Katherine J. Baudistel re research of Cajun docket MF 0.00 
Issues to Report (0.30 hrs. WC) 

11/14/13 Telephone conference with Bob Albergotti re first point of Ralph R. MF 0.70 
Mabeys testimony re why rate Increase Is necessary to avoid 
bankruptcy 

11/14/13 Continue to review pleadings and documents to determine possible MF 0.00 
Issues based upon a bankruptcy filing by Big Rivers and adverse 
case review (4.0 hrs. N/C) 

11/14/13 Telephone conference with Big Rivers and counsel regarding 
background. 

RRM 120 

11/14/13 Review draft testimony. RRM 0.40 
11/14/13 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman and Katherine Baudistel 

regarding draft testimony. 
RRM 0.70 

11/15/13 Read and analyze Cajun pleadings re major utility bankruptcy issues KJB 5.20 
11/15/13 Reading and reviewing draft of Ralph R. Mabeys proposed 

testimony (1.4 hrs. N/C) 
KJB 0.00 

11/15/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re changes to Ralph Ft. Mabey's 
proposed tesfimony (010 hrs. N/C) 

KJB 0.00 

11/15/13 Begin revisions to Expert Report draft MF 3.00 
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 06518-0000-RRM 

11/15/13 Confer with Katherine J. Baudistel re research for Expert Report MF 0.00 
(0.50 hrs. WC) 

11/15/13 Begin revisions to Expert Report draft (3.0 hrs. N/C) MF 0.00 
11117/13 Read and analyze Cajun pleadings re executory contracts and cash 

collateral issues 
KJB 2.20 

11/18/13 Read and analyze Cajun pleadings re major utility company Issues KJB 6.80 
In bankruptcy 

11/18/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re changes to draft of Ralph R. KJB 0.30 
Mabey's testimony 

11/18/13 Confer with Marina Fineman and Ralph R. Mabey re changes to 
draft of direct testimony 

KJB 0.60 

11/18/13 Conference call with Ralph R. Mabey and Katherine J. Baudistel re 
testimony report 

MF 0.60 

11/18/13 Review Big Rivers's indenture and analyze same MF 1.50 
11/18/13 Review prior Big Rivers bankruptcy case (2.0 hrs. WC) MF 0.00 
11/18/13 Edit report draft and input Ralph R. Mabeys edits MF 3.00 
11/18/13 Work on expert testimony. (2.6 hrs. WC) RRM 0.00 
11/15/13 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman and Katherine Baudistel RRM 

regarding expert testimony. 
0.60 

11/19/13 Read and analyze Cajun pleadings and other previous utility 
bankruptcy cases 

KJB 0.50 

11/19113 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman, Ralph R. Mabey, Bob KJB 0.00 
Albergotti, Jim, Mike and Billie re BREC's 1996 
bankruptcy/background (1.2 hrs. NC) 

11/19/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re changes and additions to direct 
testimony (0.10 hrs. N/C) 

KJB 0.00 

11/19/13 Conference call with the team re Big Rivers bankruptcy case in 1996 MF 1.20 
11/19/13 Correspond with Bob Albergottl re various legal issues relating to MF 0.30 

BREC 
11/19/13 Continue to draft Expert Testimony in BREC (3.5 hrs. WC) MF 0.00 
11/19/13 Telephone conference with Counsel and Billie Richter regarding 

background. 
RRM 1.10 

11/19/13 Review materials. FtRM 0.20 
11/20/13 Read and analyze documents including Cosent, Mirant and PG&E 

disclosure statements, omnibus declaration from 1996 BREC 
bankruptcy and attorney's fees chart (6.0 hrs. NC) 

KJB 0.00 

11/20/13 Confer with Ian Peck re statistics from prior bankruptcies and exhibit 1(JB 0.10 
A from Snyder% rebuttal testimony 

11/20/13 Review and revise Ralph R. Mabey's proposed testimony re state 
regulatory interference during Utility Co. bankruptcies (1.2 hrs. N/C) 

KJB 0.00 

11/20/13 Continue to draft Expel Testimony MF 5.00 
11/21/13 Read and analyze documents re issues related to Utility Company 

bankruptcies including industry restructuring Information documents, 
disclosure statements 

1(JB 2.90 

11/21/13 Research information to supplement/add/revise Ralph R. Mabey's 
proposed testimony including bankruptcy case duration, fees, fee 
estimations, litigation In Cajun, regulatory Interference (2.0 hrs. WC) 

KJB 0.00 

11/21/13 Review and revise Ralph R. Mabey's proposed testimony (4.1 hrs. I(JB 0.00 
N/C) 

11/21/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re changes to draft of Ralph R. KJB 0.00 
Mabey's testimony (0.10 hrs. Nit) 

11/21/13 Finish initial draft of expert testimony (5.5 hrs. N/C) MF 0.00 
11/21/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re Expert Testimony MF 0.20 
11/21/13 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman regarding Expert RRM 0.20 

Testimony. 
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11/21/13 Read further materials. RFtM 1.60 
11/22/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re Ralph R. Mabey's comments on 

testimony and changes to be made (0.20 hrs. N/C) 
KJB 0.00 

11122/13 Review and revise draft of Ralph R. Mabey's proposed testimony 
based on his comments (3.9 hrs. N/C) 

KJB 0.00 

11/22/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re edits to expert 
testimony 

MF 0.30 

11/22/13 . Telephone conference with Ian re testimony draft MF 020 
11/22/13 Begin first wholesale redraft of Mabeys expert testimony MF 6.00 
11/22/13 Revise draft report. RRM 2.70 
11/24/13 Review and revise draft of Ralph R. Mabeys testimony KM 2.90 
11/24/13 Further revise Ralph R. Mabey's expert testimony MF 3.60 
11/25/13 Review and revise Ralph R. Mabey's proposed testimony KJEI 6.10 
11/25/13 Read Ralph R. Mabey's article to verify its consistency with his 

proposed testimony (0.30 hrs. N/C) 
KJEI 0.00 

11/25/13 Conference call with Marina Fineman, Bob Albergotti, Ian Peck re 
revisions to current draft of Ralph R. Mabey's testimony 

KJB 1.30 

11/25/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re draft and changes to Ralph R. KJB 0.20 
Mabeys testimony 

11/25/13 Telephone conference with Ian Deck, Bob Albergottl and Katherine MF 1.30 
J. Baudistel re most recent testimony 

11/25/13 Telephone conference with Ralph It Mabey re most recent expert 
testimony draft 

MF 0.20 

11/25/13 Further edit revised draft of expert testimony; discuss same with MF 3.50 
Katherine J. Baudistel 

11/25/13 Review and edit draft testimony. RRM 3.10 
11/26/13 Review and revise draft of Ralph R. Mabey's testimony and 

incorporate Ralph R. Mabey's comments (6.4 hrs. N/C) 
KJB 0.00 

11/26/13 Conference call with Orrick, Bob Albergotti, Ralph It Mabey and ICJB 0.00 
Marina Fineman re indenture (0.80 hrs. N/C) 

11/26/13 Conference call with Bob Albergotti and Marina Fineman re changes 
to draft 

108 0.20 

11/26/13 Conference call with Orrick, Bob Albergotti and Ralph R. Mabey re MF 0.80 
Indenture and cash collateral issues 

11/26/13 Telephone conference with Bob Albergottl re logistics of Ralph R. MF 0.20 
Mabeys expert testimony 

11/26/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re expert testimony 
draft 

MF 0.20 

11/26/13 Further edit and finalize draft expert testimony for Billie's review MF 2.50 
11/26/13 Confer with Katherine J. BaudIstel re draft of expert testimony MF 0.40 
11/26/13 Telephone conference with Marina Fineman regarding testimony. RRM 0.10 
11/26/13 Telephone conference with attorneys regarding testimony. RRM 0.70 
11/27/13 Review and revise Ralph R Mabel?, testimony based on Ralph R. ICJB 0.00 

Mabeys and Bob's changes (1.6 hrs. WC) 
11/27/13 Review draft testimony and email edits. RRM 0.30 

Summary 

Rate Time Amount 
Marina Fineman 555.00 56.20 31,191.00 
Marina Fineman (Billed at N/C) 555.00 30.30 18,818.60 
Ralph Mabey 1,065.00 20.00 21,300.00 
Ralph Mabey (Billed at N/C) 1,065.00 3.40 3,621.00 
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 

Rate lime 

08518-0000-RRM 

Amount 
Katherine J. Baudistel 270.00 49.20 13,284.00 
Katherine J. Baudistel (Billed at N/C) 270.00 47.90 12,933.00 

Fees —This Invoice 99,145.50 
Fees Billed at No ChargeMrite-Offs (33,370.50) 

Subtotal Fees - This Invoice D5 775.0Q  • 

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 
Total Costs by Category 

Copy Production 	 458.50 
Long Distance Telephone 	 35.09 
Total 	 491.59 

Subtotal Fees - This Invoice 
	

85,775.00 
Subtotal Costs and Disbursements - This Invoice 

	
491.59 

TOTAL- THIS INVOICE 
	

66,266.69 

16, 44LS tir 

/ IMZPSOOD 
o3/ 31W 
o4,   
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Stutman, Treister & Glatt 
Professional Corporation 
1901 Avenue of the Stars 

12th Floor 
Los Angeles, California 90067 

Big Rivers Electric Corporation 
Billie J. Richert 
Vice President Accounting, Rates and Chief Financial Officer 
201 Third Street, P.O. Box 24 
Henderson, KY 42419-0024 
bfilitrichertabigrivers.com  

January 14, 2014 

06518-0000-RRM 

Invoice Number 37893 

Invoice for Period Through January 9, 2014 

Legal Services Regarding: Big Rivers Electric Corporation 

12/02113 Analyze new draft of Ralph R. Mabey's proposed testimony and KJB 0.50 
Billie's testimony 

12/02/13 Research/verify length of plan confirmation process in Cajun and 
professional fees based on Cajun docket (4.90 hrs. WC) 

PUB 0.00 

12/02/13 Review travel proposals and respond to Bob Albergotti. RRM 0.20 
12/03/13 Research/verify professional fees in Cajun based on docket (2.40 

hrs. WC) 
PUB 0.00 

12/03/13 Review changes to testimony made by Bob Albergotti (0.10 hrs. KJB 0.00 
N/C) 

12/03/13 Review and analyze Billie Richert rebuttal testimony (0.40 hrs. P4/C) MF 0.00 
12/03/13 Review and analyze edits to Ralph Mabey's expert testimony MF 0.50 
12/03/13 Analyze correspondence from Bob Alberpotti re expert testimony MF 020 
12/03/13 Review materials. RRM 0.10 
12/04/13 Review fee applications from Cajun case to verify total amount of 

professional fees and BV of assets (2.70 Hrs. WC) 
KJB 0.00 

12/04/13 Review and revise draft of Ralph R. Mabey's testimony PUB 210 
12/05/13 Review and revise draft of Ralph R. Mabeys testimony based on KJB 3.10 

Bob Albergotti's and Billie R. comments 
12/05/13 Conference call with Bob, Ralph, Marina and Billie re Ralph's 

testimony (0.90 hrs. N/C) 
KJB 0.00 

12/05/13 Conference call with Billie Richert, Bob Albergotti, Ralph R. Mabey 
and Katherine J. Baudistel re Company's comments to first draft of 

MF 0.90 

Ralph R. Mabey's testimony 
12/05/13 Review and further revise Ralph R. Mabey's direct testimony; post-

call with Billie Richert 
MF 2.50 

12/05/13 Telephone conference with client regarding expert testimony. RRM 0.40 
12/06113 Review fee application In Cajun to obtain/verify total amount of 

professional fees In case (2.40 In. WC) 
PUB 0.00 

12/08/13 Revise draft of Ralph R. Mabey's proposed testimony KJB 0A0 
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12/06/13 Review and edit draft testimony. RRM 1.00 
12109/13 Review and revise Ralph R. Mabey's testimony pursuant to Billie's 

changes, based on conference call and discussions with Marina 
KID 2.00 

Fineman 
12/09/13 Conference call with Marina Fineman, Rob Morgan', Biro Richert, 

Jim Miller and Tyson Kermit re Ralph R MabeYs testimony (0.60 
hrs. N/C) 

KJB 0.00 

12/09/13 Retrieve and send materials to Ralph R. Mabey in preparation for 
arrival In Kentucky for witness preparation (0.60 hrs. WC) 

KID 0.00 

12/09/13 Telephone conference with Billie Richert edits to Ralph R. Mabey's 
testimony 

MF 020 

12/09/13 Conference call with Billie Richert, Bob Albergotti, Katherine J. MF 0.80 
Baudistel and Jim re Ralph R. Mabeys testimony 

12/09/13 Review and analyze Billie Richerrs edits to testimony by Ralph R. MF 0.00 
Mabey (0.30 hrs. WC) 

12/09/13 Further revise Ralph R. Mabeys expert testimony MF 2.50 
12/10/13 Review and revise draft of Ralph R. Mabey's testimony KM 3.50 
12/10/13 Continue to review Inserts to Ralph R. Mabey's testimony; 

restructure all of the headings Into question format correspond and 
confer with Bob Margot(' and Katherine J. Baudistel re various 

MF 3.00 

Issues and changes 
12/11/13 Review and revise Ralph R Mabeys testimony KJB 1.90 
12/11/13 Conference call with Marina Fineman, Bob Albergotti, Tyson Kamuf, 

Billie Richert, Jim Miller re Ralph R. Mabeys testimony and 
proposed changes 

KJB 0.50 

12/11/13 Team conference call re further edits to Ralph R. Mabey's testimony MF 0.00 
(0.50 hrs. N/C) 

12/11/13 Further revise testimony; edit question format MF 1.00 
12/12/13 Review and revise final draft of Ralph R. Mabey's testimony KJB 6.70 
12/12/13 Conference call with Marina Fineinan, Bob Albergotti, and Tyson KID 0.20 

Kamuf re final changes to draft and Ralph's execution of testimony 
12/12/13 Telephone conference with Bob Albergottl re testimony edits MF 0.20 
12/12/13 Telephone conference with Bob and Tyson Karnus re Ralph R. MF 020 

Mabey's testimony edits 
12/12/13 Review and revise and finalize Ralph R. Mabeys testimony MF 2.00 
12/13/13 Review documents and prepare issues to be covered at Ralph R. MF 4.00 

Mabeys witness preparation sessions 
12/13/13 Confer with Bob Afoorgottl MF 020 
12/13/13 Review Jim Miller December 3 memo re prior Big Rivers bankruptcy 

etc. 
RRM 0.40 

12/14/13 Revise Ralph R. Mabers rebuttal testimony pursuant to comments 
from Tip Depp, Marina Fineman and Ralph R. Mabey 

KM 5.80 

12/14/13 Coordinate final edits to Ralph R. Mabeys testimony MF 0.50 
12/14/13 RenrIew expert testimony and nil comments. RRM 1.60 
12/15/13 Revise Ralph R. Mabers testimony (0.40 hrs. N/C) KID 0.00 
12/15/13 Read submitted testimonies, my article and review my testimony. RRM 2.30 
12/16/13 Analyze Ralph R. MabeYs testimony and prior utility bankruptcy 

cases to identify potential areas for cross examination 
KiEl 1.70 

12/16/13 Correspond with Ralph R. Mabey re witness preparation MF 0.20 
12/18/13 Meeting with Robert Albergotti and then meeting with Big Rivers 

regarding expert testimony. 
RRM 8.50 

12/17/13 Analyze documents to identify potential areas for cross-examination 
of Ralph R. Mabey (including Bob Albergotti's witness preparation 
notes, Snyder's rebuttal testimony, cross-examination of Snyder) 

KIB 0.00 

(0.70 hrs. N/C) 
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12/17/13 Review and edit billing statement (1.0 hrs. N(C) MF • 0.00 • 
12/18/13 Analyze documents re identification of potential areas for cross- 

examination of Ralph R. Mabey at rate hearing (including article on 
utility company, bankruptcies and report of trustee In Cajun Electric 
case) 

PUB 1.80 

12/19/13 Analyze documents re Identifying potential areas of cross- 
examination of Ralph R. Mabey based on his rebuttal testimony 

PUB 2.20 

12/20/13 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re preparation session, 
etc. 

MF 0.20 

12/20/13 Begin review and analysis of rebuttal testimony by other witnesses 
for BREC 

MF 1.00 

12124/13 Analyze pleadings re Big Rivers rate case rebuttal testimony and PUB 1.90 
Identify potential questions for cross examination 

12124/13 Begin review of rebuttal testimony provided MF 1.00 
12128/13 Review materials in preparation of session to prepare Ralph R. MF 4.00 

Mabey for testimony 
12/27/13 Analyze Big Rivers rebuttal testimony KJB 2.00 
12127/13 Prepare questions for cross-examination of Ralph R. Mabey KJB 1.10 
12128/13 Prepare questions for cross-examination of Ralph R. Mabey PUB 2.80 
12/30/13 Conference call with Marina Fineman. Ralph R. Mabey and Bob KJB 2.10 

Albergotti re Ralph R. Mabey's expert testimony and questions for 
cross examination 

12/30/13 Confer with Marina Fineman re Ralph R. Mabey's cross examination 
questions (0.10 hrs. WC) 

PUB 0.00 

12/30/13 Prepare questions and answers for Ralph R. Mabey's cross 
examination 

KJB 3.70 

12/30/13 Prep call with Bob Albergotti, Katherine J. Baudistel and Ralph R. MF 2.00 
Mabey re testimony 

12/30/13 Review and revise testimony point summary for Ralph R. Mabey MF 0.00 
(2.0 hrs. N/C) 

12/30/13 Telephone conference with counsel regarding preparation for 
testimony. 

RRM 2.00 

12/31/13 Review and revise questions for cross-examination of Ralph R. PUB 0.50 
Mabey 

12/31/13 Telephone conference with Katherine J. Baudistel re edits to Ralph MF 0.00 
R. Mabey's testimony; edit testimony (1.0 hrs. N/C) 

01/02/14 Review and revise cross-examination questions for Ralph R. Mabey PUB 0.90 
01/03/14 Prepare witness Ralph R. Mabey re Issues In Cajun bankruptcy case PUB 0.30 
01/03/14 Review Invoice of fees for November (0.10 hrs. N/C) I(JB 0.00 
01/03/14 Review revised BREC Bill; confer with Bob Albergotti re same (0.20 

hrs. WC) 	 . 
MF 0.00 

01/03/14 Read materials and listen to testimony In preparation for hearing. RRM 4.00 
01/04/14 Review materials In preparation for hearing. FtRM 2.00 
01/05/14 Review materials to prepare for cross examination. RRM 1.20 
01M8/14 Review materials to prepare for cross examination. RRM 5.50 
01/07/14 Attend Big Rivers PSC hearing. RRM 7.50 
01/08/14 Confer with Marina Fineman re Ralph R. Mabey's testimony in rate 

case 
PUB 0.50 

01/08/14 Telephone conference with Ralph R. Mabey re testimony on Big MF 0.50 
Rivers report 

01/08/14 Confer with Katherine J. Baudistel re Ralph R. Mabey testimony in MF 0.00 
Big Rivers report (020 hrs. N(C) 

01/08114 Attend hearing and testify. RRM 5.50 

Case No. 2013-00199 
Attachment to &moth Updated  Response to PSC 1-54a 

Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
Page 89 of 48 



Big Rivers Electric Corporation 	 08518-0000-RRM 

Summary 

Marina Fineman 
Marina Fineman (Billed at N/C) 
Ralph Mabey 
Ralph Mabey 
Katherine J. Baudistel 
Katherine J. Baudistel (Billed at P1/C) 
Katherine J. Baudistel 
Katherine J. Baudistel (Billed at N/C) 

Fees - This Invoice 
Fees Billed at No Charge/Write-Offs 

Subtotal Fees -This Invoice 

	

Rate 	lime 

	

655.00 	27.40 

	

555.00 	5.80 

	

1,085.00 	18.40 

	

1,095.00 	25.70 

	

270.00 	0.50 

	

270.00 	4.90 

	

285.00 	47.70 

	

285.00 	11.0 

Amount 
15,207.00 
3,108.00 

17,488.00 
28,141.50 

135.00 
1,323.00 

13,594.50 
3,135.00 

82,110.00 
(7,588.00) 

7.1111.14 

January 2014 
Total 
December 2013 
Total 
January 2014 
Total 
January 2014 
Total 
December 2013 
Total 
December 2013 
Total 
January 2014 
Total 
January 2014 
Total 
January 2014 
Total 

Air Fare 
Copy Production 
Federal Express 
Hotel 
Long Distance Telephone 
Online Research 
Parking Expense 
Taxl/Limo Services 
Travel Expenses 
Total 

2,703.70 
2,703.70 

309.00 
309.00 

32.09 
32.09 

444.87 
444.87 

6.56 
5.68 

48.85 
48.85 

168.00 
188.00 
40.00 
40.00 

225.87 
225.87 

2,703.70 
309.00 
.32.09 

444.87 
5.58 

48.85 
188.00 
40.00 

225.87 
3,975.74 

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 
Air Fare 

Copy Production 

Federal Express 

Hotel 

Long Distance Telephone 

Online Research 

Parking Expense 

Taxi/Limo Services 

Travel Expenses 

Total Costs by Category: 

A AgAtst /7 
Subtotal Fees-This Invoice 	 74,544.00 
Subtotal Costs and Disbursements - This Invoice 	 3.975.74 	/ 544,500 
TOTAL - THIS INVOICE 	 78,519.74 	 OOP" 

• oqin 2.teem itit 10 a 6 itildited■ 4  441000. 17/ - aa.tatC. 

aliatua.41, Ito Pi ou4t4c24.) 	t.3 A 5/ f.03 	 Case No. 2018-00199 
if 71 	are  nt to Seventh thniated  Response to PSC 1-Ma 
..y------ 	 Witness: DeAnna M. Speed ,  
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Big Rivers Electric Corporation 	 08518-0000-RRM 

Prior Balance 	 68,288.59 
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 
	

144186.23 

AGED ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLR 

Balance Due 	0-30 Dave 	3140 Dave 	81-90 Dave 	91-120 Dave 121+ Dave 

144,788.33 	144,788.33 	0.00 	0.00 • 	0.00 	0.00 

%21t C.tifljiUC. IUDE3  

MF 	at.? x 	 plfiaciszt 
RIM /4.v X 40167PD • 17)4tIllo .0 01 

 1.4T ad 	alo.o0 	13.57ao 

1C7-4 Lit ax Agtoloo 	/3.1/0,  

tit  4 3 a  h• 110, .0 
• g at of That! ?Was- , 	 1-3 W.  a 1  

Cu (nits -fried 	Alkoot1/ 

20/41  

MF 	x etistrro 	a.77.57) 

RPM 075:1 Y 	Mai' 1 9, PM sa 
lea b7 A ons:14 — 

tt 
97 8,903. 5-0 

amid Writt Enzetitrata  

akaktraif 	
d '3fl't 03 
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• 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
17356 	- 120,948 • 

Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
Mn: Mlle Richert 
VP Accounting, Rates & CFO 
P. 0. Box 24 
Henderson, KY 42419-002 

Page 	28 

InvoiceD 120,948 
Our Ale ft 17358 	00504 

Billing through 12131/2013 

Rate Casa 2013 - 2013.00199 

BALANCE SUMMARY 

Balance Forward As Of Last Invoice $27,890.00 
Payments Applied Since Last Invoice 427,890.00 
Total current charges 	' $37,795.50 
BALANCE DUE $37,795.50 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED 

12i0112013 JMM Review, research for and revise draft rebuttal 
testimony. 

0.70 220.00 154.00 

1210212013 JMM Review and respond to inquiries le rebuttal and other 
case preparation Issues and logistics. 

1.40 220.00 308.00 

1210212013 TAK Review Intervenor data request responses In Case No. 7.50 170.00 1,276.00 
2013-00199; work on rebuttal testimony. 

1210312013 JMM Research for and attention to rebuttal testimony and 
hearing preparation. 

7.30 220.00 1,606.00 

1210312013 MAP Further work on rebuttal testimony 0.25 ' 190.00 47.60 

120312013 TAK Calls with DeAnna Speed regarding Case No. 8.10 170.00 1,037.00 
2013-00199; work on rebuttal testimony. 

1210412013 JMM Research for and attention to rebuttal testimony 
preparation. 

3.80 220.00 838.00 

121042013 TAX Call with Ted Kelly and John Summerville regarding 4.70 170.00 799.00 
Case No. 2013-00199; work on rebuttal testimony. 

1210512013 JMM Review rebuttal issues. 0.30 220.00 68.00 

1210512013 MAF Further work on rebuttal testimony 0.20 190.00 38.00 

1210512013 TAX VVorIc on rebuttal testimony In Case No. 2013-00199. 720 170.00 1,224.00 

1210812013 TAX Work on rebuttal testimony in Case No. 2013-00199. 2.80 170.00 442.00 

1210812013 JMM Review research for and comment on draft rebuttal 
testimony. 

7.70 220.00 1,694.00 

1210812013 YAK Work on rebuttal testimony In Case No. 2013-00199. 3.80 170.00 848.00 

1210912013 JMM Review and comment on rebuttal drafts; conference 
call re same. 

2.70 220.00 594.00 

Case No. 201340199 
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Big Rivers Electric Corp. 
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• 
1210912013 TAX 

1211012013 JMM 

1211012013 TAX 

1211112013 JMM 

141112013 TAX 

. 1211212013 JMM 

1211212013 TAX 

1211312013 JMM 

1211312013 TAX 

• 
1211412013 JMM 

• 4211412013 TAX 

1211512013 JMM 

1211512013 TAX 

1211812013 JMM 

1211612013 TAX 

1211712013 JMM 

1211712013 TAX 

1211812013 JMM 

• 1211812013 TAX 

Page 	27 

8.40 170.00 1,428.00  

3.00 220.00 660.00 

3.40 170.00 578.00 

8.130 220.00 1,936.00 

3.70 170.00 629.00 

5.80 220.00 1278.00 

8.90 170.00 1,513.00 

8.10 220.00 1,342.00 

12.10 170.00 2,057.00 

2.60 220.00 572.00 

7.10 170.00 1,207.00 

2.30 220.00 608.00 

8.30 170.00 1,411.00 

8.10 220.00 1,782.00 

10.50 170.00 1,785.00 

5.80 220.00 1,232.00 

11.10 170.00 1,887.00 

1.30 220.00 286.00 

4.50 170.00 765.00 

Conference calls regarding Case No. 2013-00199; call 
with John VVolfram; work on rebuttal testimony. 

Review, research for, comment on and assistance In 
drafting of rebuttal testimony. 

Draft notice of hearing In Case No. 2013-00199; work 
tie publishing notice; call with Chris Warren; work on 
rebuttal testimony. 

Review, research for, comment on, assistance in 
drafting and participation In conference calls regarding 
rebuttal testimony. 

Work on rebuttal testimony In Case No. 2013-00199; 
calls with John Wotfram; conference calls. 

Review, research for, comment on and participation In 
conference calls regarding rebuttal testimony. 

INoric on rebuttal testimony In Case No. 2013-00199; 
calls with John VVolfram, Bob Albergotti, DeAnna 
Speed, Kurt Hunt conference calls. 

Attention to review and comment on redrafts of 
rebuttal; conferences throughout day with team 
members. 

Work on rebuttal testimony In Case No. 2013-00199; 
drive to and from Henderson. 

Review and comment on latest drafts of rebuttal 
testimony and exhibits; prepare for witness preparation 
session. 

Preparation for witness preparation session In Case 
No. 2013-00199; work on rebuttal testimony. 

Prepare for witness preparation sessions; review of 
final drafts of rebuttal testimony. 

Preparation for witness preparation session In Case 
No. 2013-00199; work on finalizing rebuttal testimony; 
meet with DeAnna Speed. 

Attend witness preparation session in Henderson. 

Whets preparation session for Case No. 2013-00199; 
drtve to and from Henderson for same; work on 
finalizing rebuttal testimony. 

Attend witness preparation session In Henderson. 

Witness preparation session for Case No. 2013-00199; 
drive to and from Henderson for same; review 
memorandum front John Wolfram. 

Follow up on issues raised during witness preparation 
In preparation for hearing. 

Review updated data request responses In Case No. 
Case No. 2013-00199 

Attachment to Seventh !Tr:gated  Response to PSC 1-54a 
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2013-00199; hearing preparation. 

1211912013 	JMM 	Review and respond to various messages related to 
hearing preparation. 

2.10 220.00 462.00 

1211912013 	TAX 	Review data request updates In Case No. 2013-00199 
and work re same; hearing preparation. 

2.80 170.00 42.00 

1212012013 	JMM 	Research for hearing preparation effort 0.90 220.00 . 198.00 

1212012013 	TAX 	Hearing preparation for Case No. 2013-00199; review 2.80 170.00 478.00 
PSC memorandum re public meeting; review public 
comments. 

1212312013 	TAX 	Hearing preparation for Case No. 2013-00199. 1.30 170.00 221.00 

1212712013 	JMM 	Review rate ease Issues raised in messages. 0.30 220.00 88.00 

1213012013 	TAX 	Healing preparation for Case No. 2013-00199. 8.40 170.00 1,088.00 

1213112013 	TAX 	Hearing preparation for Case No. 2013-00199. 7.20 170.00 1,224.00 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
JMM 	Miller, James 70.80 $220.00 15,578.00 
MAF 	Florella, Michael 0.45 $190.00 85.50 
TAX 	Kamuf, Tyson 13020 $170.00 22,134.00 

Total fees for this matter 37,795.50 

MILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $37,795.60 
TOTAL OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES $0.00 
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $37,795.50 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE UPON RECEIPT $37,795.60 

Case No. 2013-00199 
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OUT OF POCKET EXPENSES 

1210212013 	SECR Secretarial Overtime paid to Elaine Johnson on 11/17/13. (.5 hrs. x 
24.00/hr) ' 12.00 - A 

1213012013 SUP 

1213112013 	CC 

Cash paid to Ohio Circuit Clerk for postage for hearing tape. Fat/ r..crat.mnsatt 5.00 

Cash paid to BroadData Conferencing for conference calls. 	 83.91 4-4  
Ovemite shipping charges to Jeff Derouen from Tyson Kamuf 	 8.67 et 
Cash paid to Meade County Clerk for copy LP40-651. Loot dr /3t cv"-C'S 4°42.00 Zat  Cash paid to Holiday Inn In Corydon for lodging on 12/05/13. (BR)Les41 	 110.99 23-4  
Ovemite shipping charges to Mark Bailey from Jim Paler 	 19.20 J2.4  
Ovemite shipping charges to Edward T. Depp from Jim Miller 	 8.34 44  
Cash paid to Meade Circuit Court for filing fee/jury fee - Begley Ala eri3kir7'236.0071'd 
Ovemlte shipping charges to Meade Circuit Court from Frank Stainback frea 11.03 Ted 
Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/13/13. (Alcan Rate Case) (TAX) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/16/13. (Akan Rate Case) (TAX) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/17/13. (Alcan Rate Case) (TAX) 
Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/10/13 re Century Sebree. (JMM) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/11/13 re Century Sebree. (JMM) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/12/13 re Century Sebree. (JAAM)  
Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/13/13 re Alain Rate Case. (JMM) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/16/13 re Alcan Rate Case. (JMM) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/17/13 re Akan Rate Case. (JMM) 

Mileage to & from Henderson on 12/20/13 for board meeting. (JMM) 

Mileage to Big Rivers on 12/10/13 to work on Requests for Production In_Frat 	37.29 23.15. Oicford.Casq.  (FS) 
74.0catifint  

Mileage to Brandenburg, Meade County Clerk on 12/03/13. (BR)1.41•11 87/3XP.05090.40 'Ada 
As ow Mileage to Brandenburg, Meade County Clerk on 12/10/13. (BR) 4441 	 90.40 Z-a 

Ovemite shipping charges to Administrator, Rural Utilities Service from Jim Miller. 

Ovemite shipping charges to Power Supply Division from Jim Miller. 	 12.32 414  

Photocopies Through Billing Date. 
730.05 it 

Case No. 2018-00199 
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1213112013 	COL 	Color photocopies through billing date. 

1213112013 PO 	Postage Expenses Through Mang Date. 99.88 44( 

    

Total Disbursements: 	81,958.48 
BILLING SUMMARY 

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 
TOTAL OUT-OF-POCKET EXPENSES 
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGE  
NET BALANCE FORWARD 

TOTAL BALANCE DUE UPON RECEIPT 

  

$0.00 
$1,958.48 z 

_81 958.48 it 
-tithrfigir—_zird  maga -?d aboic 

$14,547.11 

  

  

     

• 
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• 	Big Rivers January 2014 Invoice 
Date January 10, 2014 

Date Description flours Total 

e etc/7;kt 

go /3 

e, -15-12 

12/26/2013 
12/27/2013 
12/28/2013 
12/30/2013 
12/31/2013 

Compile notes and schedules 
Organize data and schedules 
Review testimony 
Review testimony and check data 
Review testimony 

6 hrs 
7 hrs 
7 hrs 
7 hrs 
6 hrs .3,3 hits € 4,5-S4t 

1/1/2014 Review testimony 5 hrs 
1/2/2014 Review testimony 7 hrs 
1/3/2014 Review testimony and check notes 7 hrs 
1/4/2014 Review testimony 6 hrs a-a418 
1/5/2014 Review testimony 6 hrs 1-04 
1/6/2014 Meeting 7 hrs 
1/7/2014 Hearing 8 hrs 662. At5 e 5527Ati-= .5"tato 
1/8/2014 Hearing 10 hrs 
1/9/2014 Organize files 6 hrs 
Total 95 hrs $23,750.00 

Expenses (See attached page) 11,0522_3 — Ca_na.ect Rvici 

Total Invoice 
	

$24,803.00 

Thanks for the opportunity to do business with Big Rivers 

Daniel Walker 
7106 University Drive 
Richmond, Virginia 23229 

41t4ALI5gr 

cla&S-00 0 	• 

C4114 
001  

Case No. 2013-00199 
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• Big Rivers Hearing Expenses: 
COVA- 5-  101 7-e °1474.  

Milage from Richmond, Va to Frankford, Kentucky. 514@.50 $257.00 
Wage from Frankford, Kentucky to Richmond, Virginia 514P.50 $257.00 
Motel 5539.00 

Total $1,053.00 

• 
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Page' 1 111,17.1)-”li s' 	- or: ' 
irji .1 Jo, iiIl 
S  L. t ia AM Our Mission: Make Our Clients Successful 

• 

&way 15, 2014 
RISS ID: MEM 

Caere Python Order: 
BMcD knoice: 7C000-5 

BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORP 
ERIABLICKSUPJ4--a-' 
201 THIRD ST 
HEt4DERSON KY 42420 

SEND PAYMENT TO: . 

P.O. Sox 411883 
Kangas City, 110 84141-1883 

Reference Medal Number vAth Payrnert 

TERMS: PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT-
LATE CHARGE AFTER 30 DAYS 

WIRE INSTRUCTIONS: 

McRoucMpuritn 
SWIFT 

1010 Grand 
KANSAS CITY, MO 84141 
51181400-7000 

   

Professional Erseneering Santee bag Myers 2012 Depredation Ride Study 

SERVICE THROUGH: 
LAWS 

31-0ioN2013 

Regular Regubr 
alkali= a thin as Amount 

Assistant I 8.00 111.00 888.00 
Senior 13 107.00 172.00 15404.00 
Assodste 17 10000 207.00 20,700.0Q 

213.00 39,770.00 

EXEENSE 
(See Attached) MOW 

I TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE 
	

843,178.37 USD I 

Agreed Maximum 8121,414.97 
Less Total Ned b Date 8107,173.57 
Rimini's; Fes 814241.30 

Thank you for your business. We appreciate the opportunity to serve you. 

• BlAc0 Project Menem Jon Summer/Me 818.822-4354 jeurnmsnAbolturnemol.com  
Invoice Inquiry: Kan 	818-8224298 lattrendeburnsmcdtom 

eis144-/hr Avstran 

Czon-colt . 
Aka-Plow -  aititaiguir tionin oarV 	4443.* 

dititoolt Ignetireno AW era 'It  417,7107 
adirr73,1z-cosm 

r.., "".• 	Tra''ts • .r.••—•••••• 	•••••• • ••• ••••••r 	 • 	 ittia wan,. amil.a........a.0....sotessr.ar.sm4r.n. 	• . 

Engineering, Architecture, Construction, Environmental and Consulting So o o. 201340199 9400 Ward Pertain 1 Kansas City, MO54114 I Phone: 818433-9400 I Fax: 010 399-3090 have 
Attachment to Beneath Undated  Response to PSC 1-54a 
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Invoice 70000-6 

Ras Nom Prem. Hon Number Nom 11111 WM amelfleedon 
Assletere 

6.00  12646 Feuer. Peul 6 107.00  6823 Surnmervile, Jon 19 Senior 100.00  4744 KAMM Tiwl 17 Anacleto 213.00 

Teohneklev Cane  
Han Re Tote Technober Memo 219.09 9,95 2.119.36 

P-119.35 
Tonnoloor Chun Toed 213.00 

a 
•  

Expendthr• Type Coal Madam/ 
MetSown 

BIS MV311111 
Kely. Ted.  AIRLINE 540.60 10% 594.66 Key. Ted  GROUND TRANSPORTATION 200.11 ' 10% 220.12 MN. Ted WOOING 323.61 10% 355.97 Keav. Tod 	•  MEALS - TRAVEL 39 95 10% 43.95 KS. Ted  PARKING/TOUS 26.00 10% 30.00 Kett Ted PERSONAL MILEAGE 39.50 10% 43.52 MN* Expense Tod 1.17133 1.269,02 

I  Total Expense: 	
3,408.37 I 

Case No. 2013-00199 
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• 	• 
Big Rivers Electric 

Case No. 
Seventh Monthly Update of Schedule 

Corporation 
2013-00199 
of Rate Case Costs Incurred-To-Date 

Line 
No. 

Month 
Booked 

Check 
Number Vendor 

Invoice 
Number Amount Account Description Base Period 

No 1 
December 

2013  53011 ACES Power Marketing 1316892-IN $ 	896.00 186 Consulting 

2 
December 

2013 53073 ACES Power Marketing 1316900-IN 224.00 186 Consulting No 

3 
December 

2013 537531 Catalyst Consulting LLC 172 17,528.78 186 Consulting 	. No 

4 
December 

2013  537552 Dinsmore & Shohl LLP 3140288 125,246.16 186 Legal No 

5 
December 

2013  536921 Haynes & Boone LLP 21050982 43,251.11 186 Legal No 

6 
December 

- 2013 537553 Haynes & Boone LLP 21053263 42,112.40 186 Legal No 

7 
December 

2013 537543  Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP 1453836 552.22 186 Legal No 

8 
December 

2013 537554 Orrick, Herrington & Sutdiffe LIZ 1453846 1,368.00 186 Legal No 

9 
December 

2013 537555  Stutman, 'rreister & Glatt 37860 66,266.59 186 Consulting No 

10 
December 

2013 537555 Stutman, Treister & Glatt 37893 46,001.71 186 Consulting No 

11 
December 

2013 537556 Sullivan, Mountjoy, Stainback & Miller 120,948 38,019.24 186 Legal No 

Case No. 2012-00199 
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Witness: DeAnna M. Speed 
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• 	• 
Big Rivers Electric 

Case No. 
Seventh Monthly Update of Schedule 

Corporation 
2013-00199 
of Rate Case Costs Incurred-To-Date 

Line 
No. 

Month 
Booked 

Check 
Number Vendor 

Invoice 
Number Amount Account Description Base Period 

12 
December 

2013 537551 Daniel M. Walker Big Rivers-December 
Invoice 

8,250.00 186 Consulting No 

13 
December 

2013 

Accrued/ 
To be paid in 

February 
2014 

Burns & McDonnell Engineering Co., Inc. 70000-5 2,463.40 186 Engineering No 

14 Total - December 2013 392,179.61 
15 Total To-Date November 2013 654,686.80 
16 Total To-Date December 2013 $ 	1,046,866.41 

Notes(s): Costs associated with this Rate Case are currently booked to a deferred debit account on the balance sheet pending approval from the l(PSC 
to defer costs in a regulatory asset to be amortized over three years. 

Case No. 2012-00199 
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BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

• APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

Fourth Undated  Response to 
Commission Staffs Third Request for Information 

dated September 16, 2013 

September 30, 2013 
First Undate  October 22, 2013 

Second Undate  November 26, 2013 
Third Undate  December 23, 2013 
Fourth Undate  January 31, 2014 

1 Item 3) 	Refer to the response to Item 10 of Staff's Second Request. 

2 

	

3 	 a. Refer to the response to pan a. Provide the reserve funds 

	

4 	 balances as of August 31, 2013. Consider this a 

	

5 	 continuing request to provide the updated balances of • 	6 	 each of the reserve funds on a monthly basis throughout 

	

7 	 this proceeding. 

	

8 	 b. Refer to the response to part b. The response states that 

	

9 	 the offset for the Rural class would be $23.76 per MWh. 

	

10 	 Confirm that the offset for the Large Industrial class 

	

11 	 would be $15.80 per MWh. If this cannot be confirmed, 

	

12 	 provide the amount and how it was calculated. 

	

13 	 c. Refer to the attachment to the response to part c, page 2 of 

	

14 	 3, the Wholesale columns. Explain why the "Rate After 

	

15 	 Depletion" would not be the same under each of the three 

	

16 	 scenarios shown. 

17 

18 Response) 

	

19 	 a. As of December 31, 2013, the balance of the Economic Reserve is 

	

20 	 $59,691,374.67 and the balance of the Rural Economic Reserve 

411 Case No. 2013-00199 
Fourth Undated  Response to PSC 3-3 

Witness: Billie J. Richert 
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BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 

APPLICATION OF BIG RIVERS ELECTRIC CORPORATION 
FOR A GENERAL ADJUSTMENT IN RATES 

CASE NO. 2013-00199 

Fourth Undated  Response to 
Commission Staffs Third Request for Information 

dated September 16, 2013 

September 30, 2013 
Firnt Update  October 22, 2013 

Second Update  November 26, 2013 
Third Update  December 23, 2013 
Fourth Update  January 31, 2014 

1 	 is $65,382,758.49. Big Rivers will provide monthly updates 

2 	 throughout this proceeding. 

3 	 b. Big Rivers' prior response, filed on September 30, 2013, remains 

4 	 unchanged. 

5 	 c. Big Rivers' prior response, filed on September 30, 2013, remains 

6 	 unchanged. 

• 7 
8 

9 Witness) Billie J. Richert 
10 

• 	 Case No. 2013-00199 
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