From: Cermack, Trish

To: Depaull, Tom

CC: Early, John

Sent: 1/20/2009 9:43:43 AM

Subject: FW: Credit Review of Invenergy
Hello Tom.

I am working on the credit review of Invenergy and could not find any public financials. Would
you like for me to contact one of their BD folks to see if I can get this information?

Just let me know.
Thanks,

Trish Cermack

Credit Analyst

E.ON U.S. LLC

220 West Main Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 627-2862
trish.cermack@eon-us.com

————— Original Message—-———-—

From: Early, John

Sent: Tuesday,; January 20; 2009 9:15 AM
To: Cermack, Trish

Subject: Re: Credit Review of Invenergy

I would say yes but please check with Tom DePaull.

————— Original Message —-——--—-—

From: Cermack, Trish

To: Early, John

Sent: Tue Jan 20 09:07:27 2009

Subject: FW: Credit Review of Invenergy

I just starting looking at this company and there are no ratings or public financials
available. Do you want me to contact one of their BD folks listed on the attachment for

financials?

Trish Cermack

Credit Analyst

E.ON U.S. LLC

220 West Main Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 627-2862
trish.cermack@eon-us.com

————— Original Message————-—

From: Early, John

Sent: Thursday, January 15, 2009 2:25 PM
To: Cermack, Trish

Subject: FW: Credit Review of Invenergy

Next on the list.

————— Original Message————-—

From: Depaull, Tom

Sent: Thursday, January 15, 2008 1:43 PM
To: Early, John

Cc: Schetzel, Doug

Subject: Credit Review of Invenergy

John,

Attached you will find the contact information for our possible Wind Energy Supplier,

LGE-KU-1007858



Invenergy. This is the Company I left you the wvoice mail about the other day. Feel free to
contact them if you need additional information for Credit Review. We haven’t seen a draft
contract yet so we don't know what form the Letter of Credit might take.

Please reply if you need anything further.

Thanks.

Tom

LGE-KU-1007859



