From: Depaull, Tom

To: Singery, Debbie

CcC: Schetzel, Doug

Sent: 4/7/2009 2:54:16 PM

Subject: RE: Status of these items
Debbie,

The $120,000 was a combination of the two requisitions.

Tom

From: Singery, Debbie

Sent: Tuesday, April 07, 2009 11:52 AM
To: Depaul, Tom

Cc:  Schetzel, Doug

Subject: RE: Status of these items

Tom,

As we discussed this morning, | will enter the requisition for $50,000 this afternoon after | complete a project I'm working on;

also, | will have the Change of Dislirbution Reguest form ready for Doug's approval.

You had mentioned yesterday about a requisition for the amount of $120,000, but after looking in Outlook, | did not find any

information.

Deb Singery

ebbie gmyﬂﬂf/
E.ON U.S. LLC

Senior Secretary

Generation Services

T 1-502-627-3513

F 1-502-217-2039
debbie.singery(@eon-us.com
<< File: Singery, Debbie.vcf >>

From: Depaul, Tom
Sent: Tuesday, Apri 07, 2009 9:55 AM
To:  Singery, Debbie
Cc:  Schetzel, Doug

Subject: Status of these tems

<< Message: Qracle Requisition request for PJM >> << Message: RE: Change of Disbursement from NBU to Wind Power >>

<< Message: Change of Disbursement from NBU to Wind Power >>

Debbie,

What is the status of these items? Please reply and let me know.

Thanks.

Tom
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