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Fitts, Michelle

Customer Name: Fitts, Michelle
Customer Type: Main Phone: || G
Company Name: Gary R & Mary Swarlz Work Phone:

Billing Address: Michelle Fitts Moabile:
27 W Airview
Elizabethtown, KY 42701 Fax:

Main Email:
CC Email:
Website:
Other I:
Terms: Net 20
Price Level: 28.45

Notes:

Gary R & Mary Swartz

134 Copper Medallion Dr

Elizabethtown, KY 42701

11/10/2010: Talked to Larry: sent $135 in mail on 9th; will send $150-200 next week; sending in $100 tomorrow,
27 W Airview Drive

11/24/08 Atty letter sent

12/02/2008: Auty letter returned undeliverable

5/712014 12:07:50 PM: Rec'd check from Gary Swartz

7/27/2014 10:45:39 AM: Called to check on bill. Said not receiving bills. Her toilet won't flush as wel! as her neighbors. Is tht becausz she's been
ﬁisconnected. Will pay bill on Aug 15th when she gets her check.
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Airview Utilities
7/5/11 @ 6:21 P.M.
Sewer problem call from Liz Looten — 82 Tall Oaks Court — ||| | Gz

She said that she had been having a sewer problem and called a plumber to come to her
house. He ran a snake from the house and after he did his work water really started
backing up in the house — tub.

6:24 P.M. — 1 called Joe Murphy
Joe dispatched Troy to go to the Tall Oak address.

Joe called me at 8:45 P.M. to let me know that Troy was there but was having trouble
finding a manhole that should have been close to the Lootens.

9:26 P.M. Joe called me back to let me know that Troy still was not able to find the
manhole but was able to run a cable from a neighbors house clean our into the sewer
main and cleared the blockage.

9:56 P.M. — Joe called me back to let me know that Troy said there was damage in the
house.

7/6/11 @ 9:25 A.M. - Italked to Joe and Troy this moming and I understand from them
that the water started pouring in when the plumber took the toilet up. He got a plug to put
in the drain under the toilet but by then the sewage had come up into the bathroom and
the hall. Troy said that the bathroom and the hall were the only places he saw water
damage.

I talked to Mr. Looten this morning and he wants us to do the clean up. I told him he
would have to get someone to do the clean up and then he could forward the bill to us
which we would then in turn send to the insurance company for their determination.

11:15 A.M. I just spoke with Mr. Looten again and told him that I understood that Davis
Restoration is very expensive but he said that they were on the way to his house already.
I said again to him what the procedure would be on payment and that I could not

guarantee anything.



Sep 1714 03:56p Linda Wood 5022391796 p.8
- Location:

2nd Floor of City Hall

« Address:

P.Q. Box 550
200 West Dixie Avenue
Elizabethtown, KY 42701

From: Tracy Brown

Sent: Monday, March 11, 2013 4:57 PM
To: Linda Wood

Subject: RE: RE..164 E. AIRVIEW DR.

AND IF THIS IS NOT A SEWER PROBLEM. WHAT PROBLEM DOES HE SUGGEST IT 1S??7?

[ CONTACTED WHO YOU SAID NEEDED TO BE NOTIFIED

On Mar 11, 2013 4:21 PM, "Linda Wood" <} dQ3ENERAA > V- ot<:

>

> Tracy. [’ve made contact with the owner of Airview Utilities; I’ve sent him your complaint, picture. and the
report from PSC. He has viewed the picture and information. This is not a sewer problem and Airview Utilities
is not responsible for the correction. Therefore, your sewer account is due and needs to be paid in full by March
27th or you will be subject 1o disconnection.

>

>

>

> Lind Wood

>

>

>

> From: Tracy Brown

> Sent: Monday, March 11, 2013 2:15 PM

> To: Linda Wood

> Subject: RE: RE..164 E. AIRVIEW DR.

>

>

>

> | did make contact and they said they would send some one out to correct the standing water in street and
ditch..l informed them that bill is being disputed until this matter is resolved! That area never dries and 1 will
not pay to get West Nile Virus..Thanks for you're help, Sincerely...Tracy VanMeter

-

> On Mar 11, 2013 1:17 PM, "Linda Wood" _> wrote:

>

> Tracy, Did you contact KYY Public Service Commission? Did they tell you who is responsible for this
drainage problem?

>
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>

>

> Linda Wood

o

>

>

> From: Tracy Brown
> Sent: Monday, March 11, 2013 12:33 PM
> To:
> Subject: RE..164 E. AIRVIEW DR.

>

P

>

> Linda, also with this amount of standing water..Its going to cause a serious bug problem come spring and
summer. WILL HAVE TO CONTACT HEALTH DEPARTMENT
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G #1

Linda Wood

From: Smith, Virginia L (PSC) [vismith@ky.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, April 24, 2013 4:39 PM

To: Linda Wood

Subject: RE: RE..164 E. AIRVIEW DR.

Linda,

Thank you so very much for all this information.
Have a good evening.

Ginny

From: Linds Wood (|
Sent: Wednesday, April 24, 2013 4:20 PM

To: Smith, Virginia L (PSC)

Subject: FW: RE..164 E. AIRVIEW DR.

Jenny, Thisis the email wherein | gave Tracy the information of where she could receive help with her situation. This is
the last | have heard from her. She has yet to pay her account.

Linda Wood
From: VLinda Wood
Sent: Monday, March 18, 2013 10:27 AM

To: Tracy Brown'
Subject: RE: RE..164 E. AIRVIEW DR.

Tracy, The problem you are having is due to stormwater drainage. | have contacted the City of Elizabethtown to
confirm that this is 2 problem they need to look into. However, you need to call them te explain your situation and to
get their help. |talked to Beclcy.

- Contact:
City of Elizabethtown

Stormwater Department

Robert Bush, P.E. Director of Stormwater Management
Rebecca Heitz, Administrative Assistant

« Phone:
I
» Hours:

Mon-Thurs, 8am-5pm; Friday, 8am-4:30pm
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Julian, R

Customer Name: Julian, R

Customer Type: Rental Main Phone: ||| N

Company Name: Clinkenbeard Ex. Group (Mgmt Co) Al Phore: [N
Billing Address: Raymond Julian Mobile:

[7 Walnut Way

Elizabethtown, KY 42701 Fax:

Main Enil:
cc Email: 454

Website: Clinkenbeard Ex. Group (Mgmt Co)

Other L | <rric/ Memt Co

Terms: Net 20
Price Level: 28.45

Notes:

04/29/2013: Moved in May 1, 2013.
Alan B Brown, Jr, owner

102 Clover Drive
Vine Grove, KY 40175

Management company: Remax of Elizabethtown

7/28/2014 3:50:03 PM: Received a call from Mrs. Julian to pay her bill which she did. She said when ever it rains & they flush the commode, it
gurgles in the sink. However, this last time it backed up into their tub,

She also said there are 3 clean outs around her house and the one between her house & the house on E Airview Drive has toilet tissue, etc. around
it.

She also said there was a lady circulating a petition because everyone's sewer is backing up and that the charge was going up to $42 next month.

9/15/2014 6:58:35 PM: Ms. Julian called again; same problem with gurgling in toilet or sink with sewage coming up in bathlub.
Called Larry: he called Shawn who will be down there within the hour to check it out.

Called Ms. Julian back o tell her Shawn was coming down and he would either check with her or report ...
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P

Masterson, B

Customer Name: Masterson, B

Customer Type: Residential Main Phone: ||| N
Company Name: Work Phone:
Billing Address: Brooklyn Masterson Mobile:

45 W Airview Dr

Elizabethtown, KY 42701 Fax:

Main Email: |||
cc email: |
Website:
Other 1:
Terms: Net 20
Price Level: 28.45

Notes:

Check rec'd from Brooklyn Masterson 1-12-11
Tara Birkla formerly owned and then Bank took it over.
10/15/2013 : Rec'd message on answering machine of an emergency sewer problem, Larry had already received info and dealt with situation.

11/27/2013 11:00:23 AM: Larry advised: Ms Masterson's father cleaned up under house from back up. Larry agreed to reimburse him $600 for
materials 10 be paid $200 / month.
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Complaint Airview Estates 5/23/14

Kendra Julian
17 Walnut Way

=l

Last week rain event — drain gurgled when commode flushed. They put main line cleaner
in clean out and that seem to stop it. This week after rain event, happened again. Need
someone to check it out.

Joe Murphy called them and left messages on both phones on Friday evening. Called
them on Sat am and they said everything was fine. He explained if in their line, they
would pay. They felt it was ok.
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